
Procurement Services Department

CITY OF FORT LAUDERDALE BID TABULATION 

EVENT 540- Prospect Lake Clean Water Center Chemicals

Sourcing 
EventLine Item Quantity

UOM. 
UnitOf 

Measure Chemrite, Inc
 Extended 
Amount 

Brenntag Mid-South, 
LLC  Extended Amount 

Odyssey 
Manufacturing 

Company
 Extended 
Amount Morton Salt, Inc

 Extended 
Amount 

Hawkins Water 
Treatment Group 

d/b/a Hawkins Inc.  Extended Amount 
1 HYDROCLHORIC ACID 1720.00 GA 4.84 8,324.80$  5.52 9,494.40$  
2 LIQUID AMMONIUM SULFATE (FULL TRUCK LOAD) 196000.00 GA 2.39 468,440.00$                     
3 LIQUID AMMONIUM SULFATE (NON-TRUCKLOAD) 1.00 GA 3.17
4 SODIUM CHLORIDE (FULL TRUCKLOAD) 3616.00 TN 245 198 715,968.00$           
5 SODIUM CHLORIDE (NON-TRUCKLOAD) 1.00 TN 1300
6 SODIUM BISULFITE (FULL TRUCKLOAD 39800.00 GA 2.38 94,724.00$                    2.85 113,430.00$             
7 SODIUM BISULFITE (NON-TRUCKLOAD) 1.00 GA 3.12 3.95
8 CITRIC ACID (FULL TRUCKLOAD) 3835.00 GA 8.26 31,677.10$         6.54 25,080.90$                    19.36 74,245.60$  
9 CITRIC ACID (NON-TRUCKLOAD) 1.00 GA 10.22 19.36

10 FERRIC CHLORIDE (FULL TRUCKLOAD) 55000.00 GA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
11 FERRIC CHLORIDE (NON-TRUCKLOAD) 1.00 GA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
12 CALCIUM CHLORIDE (FULL TRUCKLOAD 156220.00 GA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
13 CALCIUM CHLORIDE (NON-TRUCKLOAD) 1.00 GA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Award Amount Award line 9 Awarding lines 1,6,7,8 128,129.70$                 No award Awarding line 4 715,968.00$           Awardng lines 2 and 3 468,440.00$                     
Total Aggregate award 1,312,537.70$  
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