
Description 
Open Date 

Vendor

City, State

Variances or Comments
P-Card Payment

Local Business Price Preference
Protected Class Vendor

# Item Description Qty. U/M Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension

Mowing Service 2,625,000 square foot 0.01$         26,250.00$      0.0178$     46,725.00$      0.02$         52,500.00$             0.0188$     49,350.00$      0.03$         78,750.00$      0.02$         52,500.00$      
Debris Removal Services 1,750 cubic yard 17.00$       29,750.00$      9.99$         17,482.50$      12.00$       21,000.00$             11.28$       19,740.00$      12.00$       21,000.00$      45.00$       78,750.00$      
Pool Treatment Sevices 75 each 30.25$       2,268.75$        19.99$       1,499.25$        10.00$       750.00$  30.08$       2,256.00$        31.50$       2,362.50$        50.00$       3,750.00$        
Tire Paint Batteries Hazardous Waste Removal Sevices 75 each 18.00$       1,350.00$        9.99$         749.25$           5.00$         375.00$  4.70$         352.50$           5.00$         375.00$           200.00$     15,000.00$      
Emergency / Services Same Day 15 each 95.00$       1,425.00$        30.00$       450.00$           50.00$       750.00$  141.00$     2,115.00$        150.00$     2,250.00$        50.00$       750.00$           
Next Day Service 15 each 45.00$       675.00$           25.00$       375.00$           40.00$       600.00$  75.20$       1,128.00$        80.00$       1,200.00$        25.00$       375.00$           
Call-Out Fee 5 each 25.00$       125.00$           19.99$       99.95$             10.00$       50.00$  50.00$       250.00$           50.00$       250.00$           25.00$       125.00$           

SUB-TOTAL 61,843.75$      67,380.95$      76,025.00$            75,191.50$      106,187.50$    151,250.00$    
Local Business Price Preference N/A N/A 10% (7,602.50)$             5% (3,759.58)$      N/A 5% (7,562.50)$      
TOTAL 61,843.75$      67,380.95$      68,422.50$             71,431.93$      106,187.50$    143,687.50$    
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Vendor

City, State

Variances or Comments
P-Card Payment

Local Business Price Preference
Protected Class Vendor

# Item Description Qty. U/M Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension

Mowing Service 2,625,000 square foot 0.01$         26,250.00$      0.15$         393,750.00$    25.00$       65,625,000.00$      0.01$         26,250.00$      0.0115$     30,187.50$      
Debris Removal Services 1,750 cubic yard 95.00$       166,250.00$    70.00$       122,500.00$    40.00$       70,000.00$             50.00$       87,500.00$      500.00$     875,000.00$    
Pool Treatment Sevices 75 each 350.00$     26,250.00$      600.00$     45,000.00$      55.00$       4,125.00$  30.00$       2,250.00$        NO BID
Tire Paint Batteries Hazardous Waste Removal Sevices 75 each 350.00$     26,250.00$      70.00$       5,250.00$        45.00$       3,375.00$  50.00$       3,750.00$        NO BID
Emergency / Services Same Day 15 each 500.00$     7,500.00$        350.00$     5,250.00$        115.00$     1,725.00$  500.00$     7,500.00$        500.00$     7,500.00$        
Next Day Service 15 each 350.00$     5,250.00$        350.00$     5,250.00$        90.00$       1,350.00$  NO BID 500.00$     7,500.00$        
Call-Out Fee 5 each 150.00$     750.00$           120.00$     600.00$           80.00$       400.00$  NO BID 100.00$     500.00$           

SUB-TOTAL 258,500.00$    577,600.00$    65,705,975.00$     127,250.00$    920,687.50$    
Local Business Price Preference N/A N/A N/A N/A 10% (92,068.75)$    
TOTAL 258,500.00$    577,600.00$    65,705,975.00$      127,250.00$    828,618.75$    
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None None None None None

Yes No Yes

Visa MC or Visa
Class D Class D Class D Class D Class A - 10%

No Yes No 

Miami, FL Miami, FL Opa Locka, FL Miami Gardens, FL Miramar, FL

VisualScape Inc. Clean Out Expert BNB Distributors Co. Kita Corp. BACM Solutions llc

No Yes Yes

Visa Visa
Class A - 10% Class D C Class - 5%

None None None

PMC Corporation Creative Lawn 
Maintenance, LLC

Miami, FL Bay Harbor Islands, FL Pompano Beach, FL

YRY Homes LLC C&M LANDSCAPING INC Ruff Ruff Repairs

12354-803 - Lot Clearing Services
1/7/2020

Monroe Lawn Care Service

Miramar, FL Fort Lauderdale, FL

None None None

Fort Lauderdale, FL

MC or Visa Visa MC
Class D Class D Class C - 5%

MC or Visa

Late Bids:

Protected Class Vendors* Received:
No Bids:

Number of bids received:

** Apparent Low Bid

Yes No

Visa MC Visa
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