CITY OF FORT LAUDERDALE
GRANT PRE-APPLICATION FORM

GRANT PROGRAM INFORMATION

Grant Agency:

Florida Inland Navigation District

Grant Program Title

Grant Period:

Waterways Assistance Program

October 1, 2017 to September 30, 2019

Application Due Date:

Grant Website:

Open

aicw.org

Grantor Contact:
Address:

Phone:

Fax:

Email:

PROJECT INFORMATION

Project Title:

Grant Administration
(Direct Costs):
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Janet Zimmerman, Assitant Executive Director

1314 Marcinski Road, Jupiter FL 33477

561-627-3386

561-624-6480

jzimmerman@aicw.org

Bill Kieth Preserve - Shoreline Stabilization PH | - Design
and Permitting
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GRANT PRE-APPLICATION FORM

Brief Project Summary: The Shoreline at Blll Kieth Preserve is eroding. There is
concern from the neighborhood that the rate of shoreline loss will increase with
increased boat traffic. This project will design and permit a shoreline
stabilization plan. Grants for construction will be applied for after the completion
| of this project once permits are in hand.

Grant Amount Requested: $60,000

Match Amount and Source: | $60,000 - General Fund Grants

Grant Project Budget: $120,000

Proposed Grant Budget by Line Item. Include any allowable Direct
Administrative Costs

Revenue Expenses
$60,000 $
$60,000 $
$120,000 $120,000
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GRANT PRE-APPLICATION FORM

Project Manager:
Other department(s) impacted by grant:

Has the City received this grant in the past?
Yes [] No &

Major Conditions and Deliverables: Permits will need to be in hand prior to
reimbursement of expended granteligble expenses.

Jonathan Luscomb

Pub. Works - Project Mgmt é—{:)}q /‘Zﬁ” v
T Pt e

Year: [ — Amount:$l 20 9 (161,

Originating Department Comments:

Prepared by:

Approved by (Department Director):
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Jonathan Luscomb
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GRANT PRE-APPLICATION FORM

DEPARTMENT REVIEW/APPROVAL

City Attorney's Comments:

Signature: l , , , Date: l

Budget Division Comments:

A0 Gl T wd ok N M
Fhon purypeh u onek An e CLE -

RIS | (O v (¢ Iy Y o @772

Grants Administration Comments:

Grant cost share is 50% of total project costs.

' 09/19/2016
Signature: l/@ﬁoﬂ’ Fandet Date:

City Manager Comments:

@P?/ Wt

Y,

Signature: ‘ //’/

Date:l ?//‘?//é
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Rupa Pandit

From: Alan Dodd

Sent: Friday, September 16, 2016 4:26 PM

To: Jonathan Luscomb; Rupa Pandit

Subject: RE: Emailing - Grant Pre-Application Form - Bill Keith Preserve Shoreline

Stabilization.pdf

| don’t have any problems with the grant; as long as we have funding to execute and manage the project when required.

alan

VR/

Alan Dodd

Assistant Public Works Director for Engineering

City of Fort Lauderdale

O: (954) 828-5609 C: (910) 988-0144 F: (954) 828-5074

From: Jonathan Luscomb

Sent: Friday, September 16, 2016 3:52 PM

To: Alan Dodd; Rupa Pandit

Subject: FW: Emailing - Grant Pre-Application Form - Bill Keith Preserve Shoreline Stabilization.pdf

Alan:

Is it OK with you if we move ahead with this Grant? Thanks

\ Jonathan B. Luscomb
| Supervisor of Marine Facifities
| P:954-828-5343

S . W

P}\&Q A T S
RECREAIT*N i
RTTI e jluscomb@rfortlauderdale.gov

From: Jonathan Luscomb

Sent: Thursday, September 08, 2016 3:38 PM
To: Alan Dodd

Cc: Rupa Pandit; Paul Berg

Subject: RE: Emailing - Grant Pre-Application Form - Bill Keith Preserve Shoreline Stabilization. pdf

Alan:

No reason for you to do anything yet. | will draft a CAM asking if | may apply for the first March 2017
Commission meeting. The next grant cycle with FIND will open early January 2017 and close March

31(ish). This project should be included in the 2018 CIP budget and funding will be identified via resolution
which must be included with the grant application. | Have discussed it with our County’s FIND Commissioner
already, but say hi to Mark and Janet.

| just wanted to give you a heads up that a PM will need to run the project once we receive the grant.
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Thanks

2‘5 Jonathan B. Luscomb
P nrs b, & VU Supervisor of Marine Facilities

FONg | P: 954-828-5343
ggr? ‘F F‘Eﬂémxlknﬁ | Jluscombiifortiauderdale.gov

|
i

From: Alan Dodd

Sent: Thursday, September 08, 2016 3:29 PM

To: Jonathan Luscomb

Cc: Rupa Pandit; Paul Berg

Subject: RE: Emailing - Grant Pre-Application Form - Bill Keith Preserve Shoreline Stabilization.pdf

Thanks,

Will you be creating a CIP project for this? And is there any FY17 funding for it, or are we going to wait until Oct
17 to fund design, etc through your FY18 budget. We will be seeing Janet and Mark Crossley next Wednesday, so will
discuss with her.

alan

VR/

Alan Dodd

Assistant Public Works Director for Engineering

City of Fort Lauderdale

O: (954) 828-5609 C: (910) 988-0144 F: (954) 828-5074

From: Jonathan Luscomb

Sent: Thursday, September 08, 2016 3:22 PM

To: Alan Dodd

Cc: Rupa Pandit; Paul Berg

Subject: FW: Emailing - Grant Pre-Application Form - Bill Keith Preserve Shoreline Stabilization.pdf

Alan:

Attached is a grant pre application form | wanted to make you aware of as the project we are seeking grant
funds will need PW assistance to manage it. | will be applying to FIND in the first quarter of next year and if
awarded, the project can begin in October 2017. Please let me know you are now aware, and let me know if
you have any concerns.

Thanks

Jonathan B. Luscomb
Suparvisor of Marine Facilities
P: 954-828-5343
jluscomb@fortlauderdale.gov

n il R eodardsio u @ proy inudardiute
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& City of Fort Lancterchode
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From: Carolyn Bean (Smith)
Sent: Thursday, September 08, 2016 1:52 PM
To: Rupa Pandit

Cc: Jonathan Luscomb
Subject: Emailing - Grant Pre-Application Form - Bill Kieth Preserve Shoreline Stabilization.pdf

Please see attached.

arelyn Bean

\ g
g : :
\ Assistant fo the Director

! P: 954 8285348

"
- PARKSH{%g
?g,?ﬁﬁﬁi;;ﬁ Chean@fortiauderdale.qov

CAM 17-0137
Exhibit 1
Page 7 of 7





