Gregory Durden, P.A.

Trial Lawyers Building, Suite 4F 633 Southeast Third Avenue Fort Lauderdale, FL 33301

Invoice submitted to: Robert McKinzie

February 10, 2016

File: McKinzie, Robert

Invoice #11090

Professional Services

1 1010	3000/ICI 00171000		
•	·	Hours _	Amount
11/8/2014 GD	Telephone conference with client regarding lawsuit	0.30	90.00
11/9/2014 GD	Received and reviewed fax from client with lawsuit attached review complaint	1.50	450.00
11/10/2014 LC	Research on Injunctive Relief	3.00	255.00
GD	Reviewed administration order and on began preparing for hearing	1.50	450.00
GD	Initial review of research on injunction.	1.20	360.00
GD	Initial draft of Motion to Deny Request for Emergency Hearing by Plaintiff.	2.50	750.00
GD	Finalize draft and Notice of Appearance	0,30	90.00
GD	Consultation with law clerks on strategy to respond to lawsuit	0.90	270.00
GD	Telephone conference with client regarding response to suit	0.20	60.00
LC	Worked onprinting e-mailed complaint and exhibits for MDurden. Read and reviewed complaint and exhibits. Discussed case with MrDurden. Began to research legal authoritycited in complaint. Downloaded & printed legal authority. Discussed research with MrDurden. Worked on Notice of Appearance.	7.70	654.50

		<u>Hours</u>	Amount
	Worked on Defendant's Motion to Deny Injunction with Mourden.		
11/10/2014 MS	Worked on setting up new file	1.00	50.00
LC	Worked on determining case number and assigned judge at the courthouse	0.50	42.50
11/11/2014 LC	E-filed & served Notice of Appearance with court E-filed & served Motion to Deny Injunction with court Researched Rule of Judicial Administration 2.516 Downloaded and printed rule. Discussed Rule of Judicial Administration 2.516 with MDurden Discussed case with MrDurden	3.00	255.00
LC	Continued to research injunctive relief. Continued to work on Motion to Dismiss Injunctive Relief	2.00	170.00
11/12/2014 LC	Worked onresearchinglegal authority on candidate residency requirements. Downloaded and printed research. Discussed research with MrDurden Discussed emergency hearing with Mr. Durden	3.40	289.00
GD	Attend Hearing	0.70	210.00
GD	Worked on response to injunction	3,00	900.00
GD	Received andreviewed email attaching proposed Order from Attorney Robert Nichols. Received and reviewed email from AlaiBolleau regarding language of proposed order from Attorney Nichols. Received and reviewed email from Attorney Robert Nicholsgarding language of proposed order.	0.50	150.00
· GD	Prepared for emergency hearing.	0.70	210.00
GD	Received and reviewed Notice of Emergency Hearing	0.10	30.00
MS	Received and indexed Notice of Emergency Hearing	0.10	5.00
11/13/2014 GD	Email to Alain Boileau, Assistant City Attorney, regarding language in the proposed order. Email from Email to AlairBoileau, Assistant City Attorney, regarding	0.30	90.00

		Hours _	Amount
	language in the proposed order.		
11/14/2014 GD	Email to Attorney Robert Nichols regarding the proposed order. Email from AlainBoileau to Attorney Robert Nichols attaching the proposed order for review and approval. Email from AlainBoileau, City Attorney approving the wording for the proposed order. Email to Attorney Robert Nichols and Alaißoileau, City Attorney regarding the language of the proposed order.	0.50	150.00
GD	Drafted letter to the Judge. Hand delivered letter to Judge Rodriguez attaching the proposed order.	0.30	90.00
1/13/2015 MS	Received and indexed Plaintiff's Amended Emergency Motion for Injunctive & Declaratory Relief.	0.20	10.00
MS	Received and indexed Notice of Emergency Hearing	0.20	10.00
1/16/2015 GD	Telephone conference with Alain regarding motion	0.20	60.00
GD	Review of Plaintiff's Amended Emergency Motion for Injunctive & Declaratory Relief and City's Response	1.50	450.00
1/17/2015 GD	Reviewed research on Plaintiff's Amended Motion	2.00	600.00
1/19/2015 GD	Prepared for hearing	1.20	360.00
ĞD	Reviewed City's Amended Response	1.50	450.00
1/20/2015 MS	Received and indexed order from hearing.	0.10	5.00
GD	Attend Hearing on January 20, 2015 regarding Amended Emergency Motion For Injunctive and Declaratory Relief. Filed response.	1.80	540.00
2/4/2015 GD	Accepted service for RoberMcKinzie's summons	0.10	30.00
2/23/2015 GD	Worked on research and response with law clerk	1.50	450.00

		Hours	Amount	
2/23/2015 GD	Email to opposing counsel requesting an extension to respond to complaint	0.10	30.00	
GD	Continued to research Declaratory Judgment	1.50	450.00	
2/24/2015 GD	Began to work on Motion to Dismiss	2.50	750.00	
2/25/2015 GD	Continued to edit and work on Motion to Dismiss	4.50	1,350.00	
GD	Email to Alain Boileau, Assistant City Attorney a copy of the Motion to Dismiss draft. Email from AlainBoileau, Assistant City Attorney regarding the Motion to Dismiss draft.	0.20	60.00	
2/26/2015 GD	Worked onediting and finalizing motion to file.	2.00	600.00	
GD	Prepared response to City's question about residency	0.20	60.00	
2/28/2015 LC	E-filed Defendants' Motion to Dismiss	0.20	17.00	
3/2/2015 MS	Received and indexed Defendant, City of Fort Lauderdale's Motion to Dismiss Plaintiffs' Complaint	0.20	10.00	
3/17/2015 MS	Received andindexed Plaintiff's Response and Motion To Strike Defendant Robert McKinzie's Motion To Dismiss & Memorandumof Law. Received and indexed Plaintiff's Response and Motion To Strike Defendant City of Fort Lauderdale's Motion To Dismiss & Memorandumof Law	0.30	15.00	
GD	Reviewed Plaintiff's Response and Motion To Strike Defendant Robert McKinzie's Motion To Dismiss & Memorandumof Law. Reviewed Plaintiff's Response and Motion To Strike Defendant City of Fort———Lauderdale's Motion To Dismiss & Memorandumof Law	0.40	120.00	
5/12/2015 MS	Email exchangebetween all parties to set the deposition fodonda Joseph.	0.50	25.00	
5/13/2015 MS	Email exchangebetween all parties to set the deposition fodonda Joseph.	0.40	20.00	
6/2/2015 GD	Prepare for hearing	2.50	750.00	

		<u>Hours</u>	Amount
6/3/2015 GD	Attend Hearing	1.20	360.00
6/4/2015 MS	Sent a copy of the executed order from the hearing on 6/3/15 to Minzie	0.10	5.00
MS	Reviewed the calendar for MrDurden's availability for Jonda Joseph's deposition.	0.20	10.00
	Sent an email to all parties regarding MrDurden's availability for Jonda Joseph's deposition		
12/14/2015 GD	Email to Attorney Nichols inquiring about the Voluntary Dismissal	0.20	60.00
12/18/2015 GD	Email to Attorney Bob Nichols regarding Voluntary Dismissal. Drafted Voluntary Dismissal and sent a copy to Attorney Nichols	0.80	240.00
12/30/2015 GD	Follow up email toAttoreny Nichols regarding Voluntary Dismissal	0.10	30.00
GD	Email from Attorney Nichols regarding Voluntary Dismissal	0.10	30.00
1/28/2016 GD	Email to Attorney Nichols regarding a new complaint filed. Email from Attorney Nichols regarding no knowledge of a new complaint filed.	0.20	60.00
2/3/2016 GD	Received and reviewed Notice of Dropping Party. Received and reviewed Motion to Withdraw.	0.30	90.00
MS	Received and indexed Notice of Dropping Party Received and indexed Motion to Withdraw	0.20	10.00
2/4/2016 GD	Email to Attorney Nicholsregarding dismissing thecase. Email from Attorney Nicholsregarding dismissing thecase.	0.20	60.00
2/9/2016 GD	Received andreviewed Voluntary Dismissal	0.10	30.00
2/10/2016 MS	Received and indexed Voluntary Dismissal	0.10	5.00
For	professional services rendered	64.80 \$	14,283.00

Additional Charges:

		Amount
11/10/2014 phototcopies	······································	2.00
Photocopies		6.00
11/11/2014 Photocopies		1.00
11/13/2014 Photocopies		7.60
Total additional charges		\$16.60
Total amount of this bill		\$14,299.60
Balance due	· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·	\$14,299.60
Name Timekeeper Summary	Hours Rate	Amount
Gregory Durden Law Clerk Michelle	41.40 300.00 19.80 85.00 3.60 50.00	\$12,420.00 \$1,683.00 \$180.00

1

		Se	election Criteria			
Clie.Selection Clie.Classification	Include: Open	McKinzie, Robert				
Client Last bill Last charge	Billable: Fees Costs Hours	Unbiliable: Fees Costs Hours	Interest Fin charge Tax fees Tax costs	Wrt up fees Wrt up cost Wrt dn fees Wrt dn cost	Payments Credits Wrt offs Refunds	Prior bal New charges New A/R New bal
McKinzie, Robert 2/10/2016 11090	14283.00 16.60 64.80	0.00 0.00 0.00	0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	0.00 14299.60 0.00 14299.60
Grand Total	14283.00 16.60 64.80	0.00 0.00 0.00	0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00	0.00 14299.60 0.00 14299.60