
XIV. PRODUCTS

CAIEGORY A (SELECTIVE HERBICIDES)

Item 1: Drive XLRS selective herbicide for the control of many broadleaf and grass
weeds.

Active Ingredients:
Quinclorac: 3,Tdichloro-8-quirrolinecarboxylic acid
Inert Ingredients

585 9"1".
1/2 gal. containers
$ s7.00 /L/2sa1.

4x.59 # containers/carton

Manufacfurer and Trade Name Quali-Pro Quinclorac 1.51

Item 2: Rodeo. A selective herbicide used in the conkol of weeds. NO
SUBSTITUTIONS WILL BE ACCEPTED FOR T}IIS PRODUCT.

Active Iagredients:
Isopropyl,amine salt of glyphcate
lnert lngedients

15.E3%

u.w%

Approximate annual usage
Preferred Packaging
Net Unit Price
Packaging: container size

Manufacturer and Trade Name

1200 gals.
?1/2 gal. container
g No Bid / sal.

53.5%
6.5%

# containers/ carton

-6-

Approximate annual usage
Preferred Packaging
Nct Unit Price
Packaging container size
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Item 3: Sencor turf label or approved equal. A selective herbicide used in the
control of goosegrass and some broadleaf weeds.

Active lngredients:
Metribuzin
lnert Ingredients

75.0%
25.0%

Approximate annual usage
Preferred Packaging
Net Unit Price
Packaging. container size

Approximate annual usage
Prelerred Packagng
Net Unit Price
Packagin6 container siz-e

Manufacturer and Trade Name

# containers/ carton

1050 lbs.
5 lb. container
$ 19.80 /lb.

4x5#

Manulacturer and Trade Name UPI Tricor 75DF

Item 4: Roundup ProMax. A non-selective herbicide used for the control or
destruction of most herbaceous plants. NO ST BSTITUTIONS WILL BE
ACCEFTED FOR THIS PRODUCT.

Active lngredients:
Glyphosate, N-(phosphonomedryl) glycine
In the form of its potassium salt
Inert Ingredients

48.7'A

51.3%

1400 gals.
1.67 sal container
$ 3o'0 

7gut.
2x 1.679 # containers/carton

Monsanto RoundupPromax

-7
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Item 5: Roundup ProMax. A non-selective herbicide used for the control or
destruction of most herbaceous plants. NO SLJBSTITUTIONS WILL BE
ACCEPTED FOR THIS PRODUCT. NOTE: Same as above item but different
packaging.

Active Ingredients:
Glyphosate, N-(phosphonomethyl) glycine
In the form of its potassium salt
lnert Ingredients

Approxirnate annual usage
Preferred Packaging
Net Unit Price
Packaging: container size

1000 gals.
30

$ 4 drum
40

3 gal # containers/ carton

ManuJacfurer and rrade Name Monsanto Roundup Ptornax

Item 6: Ranger Pro. A complete broad+peckum postemergence professional
herbicide for industrial, turf, and omamental weed control. NO
SUBSTITUTIONS WILL BE ACCEPTED FOR THIS PRODUCT.

Active lngredients:
Glyphosate, N-(phosphonomethyl) glycine,
ln the form of its isopropylamine salt
Inert Ingredients (induding surfactant)

48.7"i

51,3%

47.0%

59.0%

Approximate annual usa ge
Pre{erred Packaging
Net Unit Price
Packaging: container size

Manujacturer and Trade Name

2 1/2 sal container
s l3;?r* tza

# containers/carton

3180 gafs.

Monsanto Ranger Pro

-8-
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Item 7: Ranger Pro. A complete broad-spectrum postemergence professional
herbicide for industrial, turf, and ornamental weed control. NO
SUBSTITUTIONS WILL BE ACCEPTED FOR THIS PRODUCT. NOTE Same
as above item but different packaging,

Active lngredienb:
Glyphosate, N-(phosphonomethyl) glycine,
In the form of its isopropylamine salt
Inert Ingredienb (irrcluding surfactant)

41.4%

59.0%

Approximate annual usage
Preferred Packaging
Net Unit Price
Packaging: container size # containers/carton

Manujacturer and Trade Name
Monsanto Ranger Pro

Item 8: Garlon 3A or approved equal. A selective herbicide used for the control of
weeds.

630 gulr.
30 sal drum
S Y3.50 / .,a1..-mEtrrrum"

Active Ingredients:
Acetic acid, (triclopyr), butory ethyl ester
Inert lngredients

Approximate annual usage
Prefened Packaging
Net Unit Price
Packaging container size

61.6%

fi.4%

110 gals.
21/ 2 gal. container
$ No Elid /gat.

# containers/ carton

Manufacturer and Trade Name

-9-
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Item 9: 2AD or approved equal. A selective herbicide used for the control of
many b,roadleaf weeds.

Active Ingredienb:
2,tl-D Dimethoxyacetic Acid
Inert lngredients

47.4%
52.6%

Manufacturer and Trade Name NuFarm Weedar 64

Item 10: Three-Way or approved equal. Broad specuum wc'ed killer used for the
conkol of weeds in Bermuda grass.

Approximate annual usage
Preferred Packaging
Net Unit Price
Packaging: container sizr

Approximate annual usa ge
Preferred Packaging
Net Unit Price
Packaging: container size

240 gds.
2 1/2 gal container
g 13.98 laal.TtzsE',' # containers/carton

Active Ingredients:
Dimethylamine Salt of 2.4 dichlorophenoxyacetic acid
Dimethylamine Salt of 2-propionic acid
Dimethylamine Salt of Dcambia
Inert Ingredients

32.67%
16.X'A

L82OA

48.75%

400 gal".
2 1. / 2 sal. containers
, 25.10 

1gat.
2 x2.5 o # containers/ carton

Manufacturer and Trade Name NuFarm Triplet SF

-10-
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Item 11: lmage or approved equal. A selective herbicide for use on Bermuda
grass.

Active Ingredients:

Ammonium Salt of imazaquin
Inert Ingredients

17.3%
82.7%

Approxiuute annual usage
Preferred Packaging
Net Unit Price
Packaging container size

460 oz-s,

11.43 oz. bottles
g No Bld 7f 1.43 oz. bottle

# containers/carton

Manufacfurer and Trade Name

Item 12: Surflan or approved equal. A selective herbicide for use in controlling
most annual grass and certain broadleaf weeds.

Active Ingredients:

Oryzalin
lnert Ingredients

Approximate aru1'ral usagg
Preferred Packaging
Net Unit Itice
Packaging: container size

Approximate annual usage
Preferred Packaging
Net Unit Price
Packa ging:container size

100 gals-
2l /2 gal. container
$ 54.20 /sal.
2VZ.EI'" # containers/carton

40.4%

59.6%

Item 13: Ronstar granular or approved equal. A selective herbicide for use on
Bermuda and St. Augustine grass.

Active Ingredients:

Oxadiazon
lnert Ingredients

2.0%

9t3.0%

S

75,500 lbs.
il)l9Fe" /tb.cu ro oag

# containers/carton

Quali-Pro Oxadiazon 2GManufacturer and Trade Name

-11-

Manufacturer and Trade Name UPI Surflan AS T&O
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Item 14: Baricade or approved equal. A selective herbicide used for the control of
weeds.

Active lngredients:
Prodiamine
Inert Ingredienb

Approximab annual usage
Preferred Packaging
Net Unit Price
Packaging container size

Approdmate annual usage
Preferred Packaging
Net Unit Price
Packaging: container size

# containersr/carton

55.0%
3s.0%

850 tbs.
10 lb. bas
S 9.85 -
7x51t /tb.

Manufacturer and Trade Name Advan Cavalcade

Item 15: Basagran or approved equal. A selective herbicide used Ior the post
emergcrrce control of many broadleaf weeds.

Active lngredients:
Bentaz-on
Inert lngredierrts

Approximate annual usage
Preferred Packaging
Net Unit Price
Packagin6 container size

100 gals.

Active Ingredients:
Pendimethalin
Inert Ingredients

42.0%

58.0%

1 cal. container
* 

"l.to Bid 7ga.
# containers/ carton

ManuJacfurer and Trade Name

Item 16: Pre-M or approved equal. Pre-emergent weed killer used for the control
of weeds in Bermuda grass.

ffi.00a
40.0%

400 gals.
2 1/z sal. container
$ %'n 

1sat.
4x1.259 # containers/ carton

Drexel PinDee T&OManufacturer and Trade Name

-'t2 -
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Item 17: Pre-M or approved equal. Pre-emergent weed killer used for the control
of weeds in Bermuda grass.

Active Ingredients:
Pendimethalin
Inert Ingredients

Approximate annual usage
Ileferred Packaging
Net Unit Price
Packaging: container size

Active lngredients:
Dibromide
Inert lngredients

Approximate armual usage
Preferred Packaging
Net Unit Price
Packaging: container size

Approxinnte arurual usage
Prefered Packagrng
Net Unit Price
Packaging: container size

2,7N gals.

;,638 ")T;:"*
4x1q # containers/ carton

@.0%
N.0%

500lbs.
 0 lb. bags
$ No Hd /lb.

# containers/carton

Manu facturer and Trade Name

Item 18: Reward (fornrerly diquat) or approved equal. A selective herbicide used
for the conkol of many aquatic weeds.

35.30A

a.7%

Item 1* Sedgehammer or approved equal. Selective herbicide used for the control
of nutsedge and other weeds in turfgrass.

Active lngredienb:
MethylL{ (46dimthoxy-2-pyrimidinyl) aminol carbonylaminasulf onyl}
-3-clilorel-methyl-7 -H-pyt azole4-carborylate
Inert Ingredients

75.00/"

25.4%

900 ozs.
71/3 oz. container
g 69.70 /'1, 1, / 3 oz. container

16x tSSz # containers/carton

Manufacturer and Trade Name Gowan Sedgehammer

-13-

Manufacfurer and Trade Name Rotam Row Runner
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Item 20: Solitaire or approved equal. Selective werd control in turf irrcluding
residential, commercial and institutional lawns, athletic fields, commercial sod
farms, golf courses, and other non<rop sites..

Active Ingredienb:
Sulfentrazone
Quincloracc
Inert lngredienb

78.75%
%.25%

25.0%

50 lbs.
1 lb. container
$ 112.25 /1Ib. container

10 x 1LB # containers/carton

Manufacturer and Trade Name FMC Solitaire

Item 21: Trimec Plus or approved equal. A selective herbicide.

Active Ingredients:
Monosodium Acid Methanearsonate
Dimethylamine Salt of Z&Dichlorophenoxyacetic Acid
Dimethylamine Salt of 2-(2-methyl+[ clrlorophenoxyl) Propionic Acid
Dimethylamine Salt of Dicambia (3,6 Dichloro0anisic acid)
lnert Ingredients

Approximate annual usage
Preferred Packaging
Net Unit Price
Packaging: container size

Approximate annual usage
Prefurred Packaging
Net Unit Price
Packaging: container size

Approximate annual usage
Preferred Packaging
Net Unit Price
Packaging container size

160 gals.
21/2 gal. containers
$ No Bia /gd.

18.00%
5.83%
5.86%

1,.6%
68.85%

100 gals.
21/2gal.containers
S No BitC /sal.

# containers/carton

Manufactu rer and Trade Name

Item 22: Finale or approved equal. A non-selcrtive water soiuble herbicide for
application as a foliar spray lor control of a broad spectrum of emerged annual
and perrenial grass and broadleaI weeds.

Active lngredients:
GluJosinate-ammonium
Inert Ingredients

11.33%
8.67%

Maaufacturer and Trade Name

-14-

# containers/ carton
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Item 23: Pendulum 3.3 EC or approved equal. A selective herbicide for control of
most annual grasses and certain broadleal weeds in non-cropland areas.

Active Ingredients:
Pendimethalin
lnert Ingredients

Approximate annual usage
Preferred Packaging
Net Unit Price
Packaging: container size

Active Ingredients:
Sulfentrazone
Inert Ingredients

Approximate annual usage
Preferred Packaging
Net Unit Price
Packaging: container size

Active Ingredients:
Sulfenhazone
Imazethapyr
Inert Ingredients

3,300 ozs.
6 oz. bottles
g 67.80 /6o2.I'Zx6z', boftle

# containers/ carton

37 .4o/.

62.6%

320 gals.
2 1/2 gal containers
S 28.N lpal-

4 x 125o # containers/ carton

Manufacturer and Trade Name Drexel PinDee T&O

Item 24: Dismiss or approved equal. A selective weed control in turf sites
including residential and institutional lawru attrletic fields, commercial sod farms,
goU course fairways and roughs.

Manufacfurer and Trade Name
FMC Dismiss

Item Dismiss South or approved equal. A selective weed control in turf sites
including residential and irrstitutional lawru atlrletic fields, commercial sod farms,
golf course fairways and roughs. For use on warm season turfgrass, excluding St.

Augustine.

39.6%

@.4%

33.33%
6.67%
60.0%

Approximate annual usage 200 ozs.
Preferred Packagrng 16 oz -5ca. bottles
Netunitprice S 170.29 /eW 16ozbotfle
Packaging container size 8 x 16 oz # conhiners/carton

Manufacturer and Trade Name FMC Dismiss South

-15-
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Item 26: Revolver or approved equal. A herbicide for the control of annual and
peremrial grasses in bermudagrass, zoysiagrasg and buffalograss.

Active lngredierrts:
foramsulfuron
Inert lngredients

Approximate armual usage
Preferred Packaging
Net Unit Price
Packagin6 container size

Active Ingredients:
SuUosulfuron
lnert Ingredients

Approximate annual usage
Preferred Packaging
Net Unit Price
Packagrng container size

Approximate annual usage
Preferred Packaging
Net Unit Price
Packaging: container size

Active lnggedients:
Flurprimidol: (1-methylethyl) {(rl-trifl uoromethory)
Phenyt)-l.pyrimidinemethanol
Irert lngredients

32Ooz.
1.25 oz. bottles
g 67.X) /7.2Soz.boute

'10 x 'l -25o2 # containers/carton

5000 lbs.
21 lb. bucket
$ 6.90 /rb.

21 tb # containers/ carton

2.34%
97.6%

36,L75 ozs.
87 oz. containers
$ No Bid /oz

# containers/ carton

Manufacturer and Trade Name

Item 27: Certainty or approved equal. A selective herbicide for the coatrol of
annuai and perennial grasses and broadleaf weeds in higlrly managed tud site.

75.N%
25.00oA

Manufacturer and Trade Name Monsanto Certainty

Item 28: Cutless 0.33G or approved equal. A s1'stemic landscape growth regulator
{or terrninal grovvth suppression in woody omamental plants and pereanial
ground covers, resulting in a more compact growth form and reduced trimming.

033%
99.67%

Manufacturer and Trade Name SePro Cutless 0

-16-
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Item 29: Hydrothol 191 or approved equal. A liquid concentrate soluble in water
that is a highly effective aquatic he&icide and algicide.

Active Ingredients:
Mono (N, N-dimethylalkylamine) salt of endothall
lnert Ingredients

53.0%

47.0%

# containers/ carton

Manufacfurer and Trade Name

Item 30: Snapshot 2.5 TG or approved eqlal. A selective preemergence herbicide
for conrol of certain broadleaf weeds and annual grasses.

Approxirnate annrra.l usatg€

Pre{erred Packaging
Net Unit Price
Packaging: container size

Approxirnate annual usage
Preferred Packaging
Net Unit Price
Packagrng: container size

Approximate annual usage
Preferred Packaging
Net Unit Price
Packaging container size

100 g"l.
2 % sal containers
g lto BU/gat.

Active Ingredients:
Trifluralin: trifl uoro.26dinito-N,
N{ipropyl-p-toluidine
Isoxaberr N-[3-(1 -ethyl-l -methylpropyl[a
Isoxazolyl]-|6dimethorybenzamide and isomers
lnert lngredients

2.0%

0.5%
y7.5%

8550 lbs.
50 lb. bags

5 1.41 /tb.
5O lb baq # containers/carton

Manufacturer and Trade Name Quali-Pro T/l 2.5G

Item 31: Ronstar Flo or approved equal. Preemrgence herbicide for the control oI
annual grasses and broadleaf weeds in turf and orna.rruretals.

Active Ingred ients:
Oxadiazon [2-tert-butyl-4{2,t1-dich]oro-}
Isopropoxyphen yl) -1,3,*oxzdtazolin-lone]
Inert Ingredients

34.144

65.90A

30 gd.
2 7r sal containcrs
$ 15s.oo /sat.

2x2.59 # containers/ carton

Manufacturer and Trade Name Quali-Pro Oxadiazon SC

-17-
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Item 32: Pennant Maga.um or approved equal. Weed control in nurseries, turf,
and landscape plantings.

Active I ngedierrts:
metolachlor

lnert Ingredients
83.7%

16.3%

Manufacturer and Trade Name Sytgenta Pennant Magnum

Item 33: Tribute or approved egual. Weed control in nurseries, turf, and
landscape plantings.

Active Ingredients:
Thiencarbazone'methyl cas number 31781183-1
Foramsulfuron cas number 1 73159 -57 4
Halosulfu ron-methyl cas number'10784-N-1
lnert Ingredients

150 oz.
5 oz. bottles
5 No eid lbottle

# containcrs/carton

Manufacturer and Trade Name

Item 34: Sureg-uard or approved equal. Weed control in nurseries, turf, and
landrape plantingp.

Active lngredients:
Flumioxazin (2- [7-fl uoro-3,tt-dihydro-]oxo4-(2-propynyl)
-217-7,4-bervoxazn4yll4,5,,6,7-tetrahy&o-1H-isoindole-1,3plI)-dione)
Inert Ingredients

Approximate annual usage
Preferred Packaging
Net Unit Price
Packaging container size

Approximate annual usage
Preferred Packaging
Net Unit Price
Packaging: container size

Approximate annual usage
Prefered Packaging
Net Unit Price
Packaging: container size

N Br1.
1 gal. containers
s"N'8 lnul.
-rrE'" # containers/carton

79.9%

19.8%
30,8%
39.5%

51.0%

49.0%

165 lbs.
1 lb. containers
s 141.55 /b.z;ftE '

# containers/ carton

Manufacturcr and Trade Name Valent tq!@

-18-
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Item 35: Celsius WG or approved equal. For control of annual and perennial
broadleaf weeds and grasse in warm season turf.

8.7%
't.9%

57.4%
3L0%

?loozs.
10 oz. bottles
$ No nia /bottle

# containers/ carton

ManuJac turer and Trade Name

Item 35: Quicksilver T & O or approved equal. For control of broadleaf weeds
and silvery thread moss in turfgrass.

Active I ngredients:
Carlentrazone-ethyl
lnert Ingredients

Approx irnate annual usage
Preferred Packaging
Net Unitltice
Packaging container size

Approximate annual usage
Preferred Packaging
Net Unit Price
Packaging: container size

Active Ingredients:
Glyphosate, N-(phosphonomethyl) glycine in the form of ammonium salt
Diquat dibromide (6.Tdihydrodipynde 9l )-a:2,1-e)
pyrazinedium dibromide
Inert Ingredients

Approximate annual ',sage 240 ozs.
Preferred Packaging 6.8 Ib f,6r!66gtss
Net Unit price g Sg.ffi /bottle
Packaging container size 4 x 6.8 lb # containers/carton

Manufacturer and Trade Name MorEanto Rorndup Quick Pro

2't.3%
787%

1fi) ozs.
8 oz. bottles
s 145.ff) /bottle

Manufacturer and Trade Name

32x8oz # containers/carton

FMC Qubk Sliver

73.3%

2.9%
8.8%

-'19-

Active lngredients:
Thiencarbazone,methyl (CAS number 317815{}1
Iodosulfumn-methyl-sodium (CAS number 317&154}'1)
Dicamba (CAS number 191&tX)-9
lnert Ingredients

Item 37: Roundup Quik Pro or approved equal. A non-selective herbicide used
for the control or destruction oI most herbaceous plants.

CAM # 16-0654 
Exhibit 4 

Page 14 of 30



CATEGORY B (INSECTICIDESIPESTICIDES)

Item 1: Orthene .97 or approved equal. An insecticide used Ior the control of mole
crickes.

Active krgredients:
Acephate
krert Ingredients

Approximate annual usage
PreJerred Packaging
Net Unit Price
Packaging: container size # containers/carton

Manufacturer and Trade Name
UPI Acephate9TUp

Item 2: Sevin SL or approved equal. An insecticide used for the control o{ sod
webworms, arm,'worrrs, grassloopers, white grubs and biJlbugs.

Active Ingredients:
Carbaryl
Inert lngredients

75.O%

25.0%

300lbs.
7.73lb.bag
S 6.22 /tb.

2 x I[l56ag

43.0%

57.0%

Approximate annual usagc
Preferred Packagrng
Net Unit Price
Packaging: container size

200 gals.
21h gal. container
$ 44.90 lsat.ziz6' " # containers/carton

Manufacturer and Trade Name Drexel Cabarg 4L

-20-
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Item 3: Top Choice mole cricket bait. An insecticide used for the conhol of
Southern Chinch Bugs, sod webworrns, armyworurs, grassloopers and rnole
crickets. NO SUBSTITUTIONS WILL BE ACCEPTED FOR THIS PRODUCT.

Active Ingredients:
Friponil
lnert Ingredients

Approximate annual usage
Pre{ered Packaging
Net Unit Price
Packaging: container size

Approximate annual usage
Preferred Packaging 4x 1

Net Unit Price
Packaging: container size

?f70 ozs.
.6Oaz:corrtairars

$ 2'4 /or.
4x'|..6 oz # containers/carton

10,0%
90.0%

Approximate annual usage
Preferred Packagrng
Net Unit Price
Packaging: container size

/lb.
30 lb bag # containers/ carton

ManuJacturer and Trade Name Quali-Pro Fipronil Broadcast

Item 4: Merit WSPor approved equal. Wettable powder for foliar and systemic
insect control in furfgrass, landscape ornamentals and plantscapes.

Active Ingredients:
Imidacloprid 1 -(6<hloro-lpyadiacyl)
methyl)-N-nitro-] imidazolidinimine
Inert Ingredients

58,500 lbs.
50 lb. bas
s 1.65 "

75.004

25.0%

Manufacfurer and Trade Name Primera One lmidacloprid 75 wsp

Item 5: Cygon or approved equal. Used for the control of insects.

Active Ingredients:
Dimethoate
Inert lngredients

100 gals

23.0%

n.o%

2Y, eal. container
g +S.og 7sat.

2 x2.5o # containers/ carton

Manufacturer and Trade Name Drexel Dimethoate 4EC

-21 -
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Item 6: Demand G or approved equal. Insecticide used for the conlrol of adult
mole crickeb in turfgrass.

Active Ingredients:
Lambda Cyhalothrin
Inert Ingredients

12.0%

88.0%

Approximate annual usage
Preferred Packaging
Net Unit Price
Packaging container size # containers/ carton

Quali-Pro tambda GC€
Manufacturer and Trade Name

Item 7: Talstar or approved equal. Flowable insecticide/miticide for agricultural
and commerciai uses.

80 qts.
1 ot. container
s'57.80 /ot.T'iTM' '

Active Ingredients:
Bifenthrin (2-methyl [1,1-biphenyl]-]yl) methyl-]
(2-chlore 3,ltrifl uorc'1-propenyl)-2,2dimethylrydopropane carborylate
Inert Ingredients

7.9%

921%

Manulacturer and rrade Name UPI Upstar Gokysc

Item 8: Talsar granular or approved egual. Granular insecticide/miticide for
agricultural and commercial uses.

Active Ingredients:
Bifenthrin (2-methyl [,1-biphoryl]-3-yl) methyl-]
(2-chloro-3"!trifl uoro-l -propenyl|2"2-dimethylcydopropane carboryla te
Inert Ingredients

Approximate annual usage
Prcferred Packaging
Net Unit Price
Packaging: container size

Approximate annual usage
Preferred Packaging
Net Unit Price
Packaging: container size

500 gals.
1 sal. container
S"28.35 /pat.-4xT0-'"

# containers/ carton

7.9%

92.7%

48,500lbs.
50 Ib. bags
$ No Bld /lbs.

Manufactu rer and Trade Name

22-

# containers/ carton
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Item 9: Triple Crown Golf or approved equal. For use to control pests on golf
courses.

Active lngredients:
Zeta{ypc'rmethrin
Bifenthrin
Imidacloprid
Inert Ingredierrts

20 gals.
1 gal. conl
g 195.00 /gals4x1g 

- # containers/carton

Manufacturer and Trade Name

Item 10: Merit 0.5C granular or approved equal. Granular systemic insect control
in turfgrass and landrape om;rmentals.

Approximate amual usage
Preferred Packaging
Net Unit Price
Packaging: container size

Active lngredients:
Imidacl oprid, 1-{(6-chloro-}pyridinyl) methyl}-N-nitro
-2-imirra zolidinimine
Inert Ingredients

2.70%
7.87%

13.83%
75.fi%

0.5%

99.5"4

Manulacturer and Trade Name Quali-Pro lmidrcloprid O.5G

Item 11: Dylox 6.2 granular or approved equal. Granular control of white grubs,
mole crickets, sod webworms and cutworms, and other pests of turfgrass.

Approximate annual usage
Preferrcd Packaging
Net Unit Price
Packaging: container size

Approximate annual usage
Preferred Packaging
Net Unit Price
Packaging container size

Z900lbs.
30 lb. bass
s .87 " .llb".

--S(rrb_5:ig
# containers/carton

Active lngredients:
Triclrlorforu Dimethyl (2,2p-aichlotel-hydrory-ethyl) phosphonate
lnert Ingredients

13,mlbs.
30 lb. bags
SNo Bid

Manufacturer and Trade Name

-23 -

/lbs.
# containers/ carton

6.2%
83.8%

CAM # 16-0654 
Exhibit 4 

Page 18 of 30



Item 12: Avid 0.15EC or approved equal. For control of lea{miners and miies and
suppression of aphidl whiteflie, and thrips on ornamental plants.

Active Ingredients:
Abamectin (CAS number 651941i6-4 and 6519'55-3)
Inert Ingredients

2.0%

1)8.0%

Manufacturer and Trade Name Rotam Lucid

Item 13: Croes Check PIus or approved equal. To control pests indoor and
outdoors on residential, institutional, and public areas.

Active Ingredients:
Bifenthrin
Inert Ingredients

Approximate annual usage
keferred Packaging
Net Unit Price
Packaging container size

Approximate annual usage
Preferred Packaging
Net Unit Price
Packaging: container size

Approximate annual usage
Preferred Packaging
Net Unit Price
Packaging container size

50 gals.
1 gal. containersg 175.@ 1",a1.

4x1q # containers/carton

7.qJ%
92.10%

275 gals.
1 sal. containers
,28.35 7,gat

4x1q # containers/carton

Manufacturer and Trade Name UPI UpStar Gold/SC

Item 14: Acephate or approved equal. To control mole crickets.

Active Ingredienb:
Acephate: (O, $Dimethyl acetylphosphoramidothioate)
Inert Ingredients

v7.0%

3.0%

25 lbs.
1 lb. containers
$ 8.7s /1b.

12x1lb # containers/ carton

Manufacturer and Trade Name UPI Acephate 97Up

-24 -
CAM # 16-0654 

Exhibit 4 
Page 19 of 30



Item 15: Arena . To control cut worms and mole crickets. NO SUBSTITLIIIONS
WILL BE ACCEFTED FORTIIIS PRODUCT.

Active Ingredients:
Clothianidin
Inert Ingredients

Approximate annual usage
Preferred Packaging
Net Unit Price
Packaging: container size

9ffiozs.
40 oz. conhiners
, 5.4675 y oz.

40 oz bottle # containers/ carton

50.0%

50.0%

Manufacturer and Trade Name Valent Arena 50WDG

-25-
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CATEGORY C (FUNGICIDES)

Item 1: Daconil wether stick or approved equal. Fungicide used for the control of
diseases in turf grass.

Active Ingredients:
Chlorothalonil (Ietrachloroisophthalonitrile)
Inert kgredients

il.0%
46.4"4

210 gals.
21/2 gal. container
g 36.30 /gat.
2x2.& # containers/ carton

Manufacturer and Trade Name Primera One Chlorthalnil

Item 2: SuMue or approved equal. Fungicide used to control pythium blight and
pythium root rot.

Approximate annual usage
Preferred Packaging
Net Unit Price
Packaging: container size

Active Ingredients:
Metalaxyl
lnert Ingredients

Approximate annual usage
Preferred Packaging
Net Unit Price
Packaging: container size

A pproxirnate annual usage
Preferred Packaging
Net Unit Price
Packaging: container size

110 gals.
1 qal. container
g"384.@ 7.ui.-zTlE-

# containers/ carton

251,%
749%

Manufacturer and Trade Name QualFPro Melenoxam 2AQ

Item 3: Mancozeb or approved equal. Used for the control of fungus and algae.

Active lngredients:
Mancozeb
Inert lngredients

75.0%
25.0%

120 gals.
21,/2gal.container
g 43.60 /gat.

2x2.5s # containers/carton

UPI Manzate FL T&O
Manufacfurer and Trade Nalrre
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Item 4: Alliette powder or approv"d eqr.I. Used for the control of fungus and
algae.

Active Ingredients:
Aluminum tris (O-ethyl phosphonate)
lnert lngredients

80.0%
20.0%

20 lbs.
5 lb. container
s 1s.84 /lb.

4x5.5 lb # containers/ carton

Manufacturer and Trade Name Quali-Pro Fosetyl-Al

Item 5: Armada or approved equal. For conkol of certain foliar, stem, and root
diseases of turfgrass.

Active Ingredients:
Trifloxystrobin (CAS No. 747517-21-7)
Triadimefon (CAS No. 43121433)
Inert lngredients

Approximate annual usage
Iteferred Packaging
Net Unit Price
Packaging: container size

Approximate annual usage
Preferred Packaging
Net Unit Price
Packaging: container size

Active Ingredients:
Myclobutanil: a-butyl-a-(chloropheryl)-1H-1 ,2,4, tiazol*l-propanenitrite
Inert Ingredients

8.33%
41,.67%

50.00%

2oozs.
3 oz. container
, No Bid 

7oz.
# containers/carton

Manufacturer and Trade Name

Item 5: Eagle 20EW. A systemic protectant and curative fungicide for disease
control in established turfgrass, landrape omamentals, and greenhouse and
nursery omamentals. NO SUBSTITUTIONS WILL BE ACCEPTED FOR THIS
PRODUCT.

19.7%

80.3%

Approximate annual usage
Preferred Packaging
Net Unit Price
Packaging: container size

50 pts.
1 pint container
S tto girt

Manufacturer and Tradc Name

-27 -
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Item 7: Fore 80WP. A fungicide used on golf courses. NO SLTBSTITUTIONS
WILL BE ACCETTED FOR THIS PRODUCT.

Active Ingredients:
Mancozeb: A coordination product of zinc ion and
lv{anganese ethylene bisdithiocarbamate
ln which &e ingredients are:
Manganese M.A%
Zinc 2.ffi%
Ethylenebisdithiocarbamateion 62.0%
Inert lngredients

80.0%

20.4"k

Approximate annual usage
Preferred Packaging
Net Unit Price
Packaging: container size

80 lbs.
1.5 Ib. container
s 5.25--6 i6- /rb.

# containers/ carton

Manufacturer and Trade Name UPI Manzate Prostick

Item 8: Heritage TL. A broad spectn:m fungicide for control of plant disease. NO
SUBSTITUTIONS WILL BE ACCEPTED FOR TI{IS PRODUCT.

Active lngredients:
Azoryskobin: methyl (E)-2{2-{6.(2-cyanophenoxy)
Pyrimidina yloryl-3-methoxyacrylate
Inert lngredients

Approximate annual usage
Preferred Packaging
Net Unit Price
Packaging: container size

225 gals.

Manufacturer and Trade Name

8.8%
97.20A

1 gal. container
g T.lo Bid 7gal.

# containers/ carton

-28 -
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Item 9: Insigni or approved equal. A broad spectrum fungicide for control of plant
disease.

Active Ingredients:
IJrraclostrobin (carbamicacid, 2-1-4 chlorophenyl-1H-pyrazol-3yl
Oxymettrlphenylmethoxy-, methylester
lnert lngredients

20.0%

80.0%

50 gals.
5 gal. container
$ No Bid /8aI.

# containers/carton

Manufacturer and Trade Name

Item 10: Caravan G or approved equal. For systemic control of both insect pests
and diseases with one product applied to turl grasses on residentral Lawas and
commercial grounds

Approximate annual usage
Preierred Packaging
Net Unit Price
Packaging: conbiner size

Active Ingredients:
Azoxyskobin (CAS number 1318@33€)
Thiamethoxam (CAS number 1$n9-2Ml
Inert Ingredients

0.31%
0.2%

99.47%

Approximate annual usage
Preferred Packaging
Net Unit Price
Packaging: container size

Approximate annual usage
Preferred Packaging
Net Unit Price
Packaging: container size

;%ry;:,
260 ga1s,

# containers/ carton

Manufacturer and Trade Name

Item 11: Chlorothalonil or approved equal. For control of diseases in tulf grass.

Active Ingredients:
Chlorothalonil (tetradrloroisophthalonitrile)
Inert lngredients

54.0%

46.0"A

275 gals.
2.5 sal. container
$ 96.30 /sat.

2x2.5g # containers/carton

Primera One ChlorthalnilManufacfurcr and Trade Name

-29 -
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Item 12: Thiophanate'methyl or approved equal. For prevention and control of
diseases in turf grass.

Active lngredients:
Thiophanate-methyl (dimethyl {4-o-plrenylenebis pthioallophanatel
Inert Ingredienb

47.25%
58.7504

2x2. # containers/carton

Manufacturer and Trade Name Primera One TM 4.5L

Item 13: Propiconazole or approved equal. Broad spectrum and systemic disease
control for twf.

Approxirna te annual usage
Preferred Packaging
Net Unit llrice
Packaging: container size

Approximate annual usage
Iteferrcrl Packaging
Net Unit Price
Packaging: container size

Active Ingredients:
Propiconazole (CAS number 60207-90-1)
Inert Ingredients

60 gatr.
25 ml. container
g 53.m /sd.

20 gals.
2 gal. container
$ 63.90 /oa7.---Z x fs" # containers/ carton

130 lbs.
3 lb. container
* no Bid 7ru.

# containers/ carton

1.4.3%

85.7%

Manufacturer and Trade Name
Primera One Propiconazole

Item 14: Pro Star 70 WDG. Systemic fungicide to control fairy ring, brown patch.
NO SUBSTITUTIONS WILL BE ACCEPTED FORTHIS PRODUCT.

Active Ingredients:
Flurolanil: N-[](1-methylethory)
lnert lngredients

Approximate annual usage
f,refurred Packagrng
Net Unit Price
Packaging: container size

70.00a

30.0%

Manufacturer and Trade Name

-30-
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Item 15: Bayleton 50. Systemic fungicide to conkol fairy ring dollar spot, and
brown patch. NO SLTBSTITUTIONS WILL BE ACCEPTED FOR TI{IS
PRODUCT.

Active Iagredients:
Triadimenfon 1-(4-ctrlorophenoxy!3,ldimethyl-1-
(lH-l 2*trtazal-1-yl)-2-butanone
Inert Ingredients

il.0%
50.0%

Approximate annual usage
Preferred Packaging
Net Unit Price
Packaging: container size

1m lbs.
5.5 lb. container
g No Etid/lb.

# containers/carton

Manufac hrrer and Trade Name

CATEGORY D (FIRE ANT APPLICATIONS}

Item 1: Amdro or approved equal. Insecticide used in the conkol of fire ants.

Active Ingredients:
Hydramethalone
Inert Ingredients

1.tr)%
98.%%

Approximate annual usage
Preferred Packaging
Net Unit llrice
Packaging: container size

3,600 lbs.
25lb.bag
s 5.40 /lb.-2516-E-a(I

# containers/ carton

Manufacturer and Trade Name Wellmark Pro Bait

Item 2: Amdro or approved equal. Insecticide used in the control of fire ants.
NOTE: Same as above item but different packaging.

Active Ingredients:
Hydramethalone
Inert Ingredients

1,.tr)%
98.98%

Approximate annual usage
PreferredPackaging 4'5
Net Unit Price
Packaging: container size

--!**aas 5.58 715.
4 x45lF'

50 lbs.
lb

# containers/ carton

Manufacturer and. Trade Name Wbllmark PnoBait
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Item 3: Logic/Award or approved equal. Insecticide used in the rontrol of fire
ants.

Active lngredients:
Phenoxycarb
Inert Ingredients

1.0%

9.0%

Approximate annual usage
Preferred Packagrng
Net Unit Price
Packaging: container size

Active lngredients:
Indoxacarb
lnert InSredienb

Approximate annual usage
Preferred Packaging
Net Unit Price
Pmkaging: container size

25 lb. bag
$ No Bkt /tb.

Z4O0 lbs.

# containers/ carton

Ma nufacturer and Trade Name

Item 4: Advion fire ant bait or approved equal. For control of imported fue ants,
bigheaded ants, and pavement ants on lawns, recreational areas, goll courses, and
other noncrop/no grazed areas.

0.04s%
9.055%

# containers/carton

Manufacturer and Trade Name Syngenta Advircn Fire Ant Bait

CATEGORY E G AGENTS)

Item 1: A generic wetting agent used to increase water efficiency. Product may
not contain any alcohol or petroleum and must have a low photo toxicity.

Active Ingredients:
2-butoxyelthanot, polyoxyethyleng polyproporypanol, silicone defoamer
Inert Iagredienb

87.6%

12.4%

Approximate annual usage
Preferred Packaging
Net Unit Price
Packaging container size

170 gals.
21/2 pal. container
, fuo Bid 7ga.

Manufacturer and Trade Name

-32-

# containers/ carton

250 lbs.
12 lb baos
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25 lb bag
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Active Ingredients:
2-butoryelthanol, polyoryethylene, polyproporylpanol, silicone defoamer
Inert lngredients

87.6%
12.4%

Approximate arurual umge
MerredPackaging
Net Unit Price
Packaging: container size

Approximate annual usage
Prelerred Packaging
Net Unit Price
Packaging: container size

ManuJac turer and Trade Name

# containers/carton

1m0lbs,
50 lb. bass
s 1.n " /b.

50 lb bag

Manufacturer and Trade Name Aqua Aid Granular WettinS Agert

Item 1: An additive to herbicide or turf chemicals used to higtrlight areas that have
been sprayed. Non-hazardous, non-toxic. No special compounds are required.
Normal mixture calls for a ratio of 16 oz. per 100 gal. of liquid.

680 gals.
21/ 2 gal. container
S No Bid / pal.

# containers/carton

Manu factu rer and Trade Name

Item 2: An additive to herbicide or turf chemicals used to highlight areas that have
been sprayed. Non-hazardous, non-toxic. No spec'ial compounds are required.
Normal mixture calls for a ratio oJ 16 oz. per 100 gal. of liquid. NOTE Same as
above item but different packaging

200 gals.
1 gal. container
S i,lo Bid /gal.

# containers/carton

-33-

Item 2 A generic wetting agent in granular form used to increase water efficiency.
Product may not contain any alcohol or petroleum and must have a low photo
toxicity.

CATEGORY F ffRACKERS)

Approximabe annual usage
Preferred Packaging
Net Unit Price
Packagin g: container size
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CATEGORY G (SPREADETVSTICKER)

Item 1: A biodegradable liquid non-ionic surface active agent used as a wetting
agent and soil penetrant.

Active lngredients:
a(pnonylptenyllw-hydmrypoly (oxyethylene)
poly (mahylene pnonylpherory
polyorypropylent propanol)
Alkyl (Cl&20) Fatfy acids
Inert lngredienS

40.0%
33.8%

5.0%
22.4%

1,100 gals.
21 /2 gal. container
5 No Bid /gat.

# contairrers/carton

M anufacturer and Trade Name

Item 2: Methylated Spray Oil or approved equal. Modified vegetable oil
concentrate.

Active Ingredients:
Methylated vegetable oil, alkylphenol ethoryIate

Approximate annual usage
heferred Packaging
Net Unit Price
Packaging: container size

Approximate annual usage
Preferred Packaging
Net Unit Price
Packaging: container size

100.0%

50 9"1r.
1,/2 sal.
14.q)

2
q,

conhiner
gal-

x # containers/carton

Manufacturer and Trade Name Diamond R MSO
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CATEGORY H (DEFOAMERS)

Item 1; Foam buster or approved equal. A silicone defoamer for use in aqueous
solutions.

Active Ingredients:
Dimethylopolysiloxane
Constituents irrcffective as adjuvants

Approximate annual usage
Preferred Packaging
Net Unit Price
Packaging: container size # containers/carton

10.0%
90.0%

290 qts.
1 ot. container
,'ttoBtdTqt

BIDDER Diamond R Fertilizer Co., lnc.

4'l0O Glades Gutoff Road
ADDRESS

BY

Fort Pierce, FL 34981

Signature

Thom Chester

DATE 3-1-16

PHONE 772-2O1-o[€€

FAX 772-4U-93M

e-MAIL ADDRESS

Will your fi
circle o

thomchester@comcast.net

yment via Town of Davie Visa procurement card? Please
NO

You must submit a completed W-9 Form, a completed Bidder/Vendor Disclosure
Form and a completed e-Verify form with you bid.

YES

-35-
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