CITY OF POMPANO BEACH -- BID TABULATION

Bid #: E-34-15 Title: Mulch, Cooperative Bid

Date 7/15/15

Amerigrow Recycling - Bliss Products and
Advanced Mulch Inc, P.O. |Adwood, Inc, 4670 NW. |Delray, L.P., 10320 W. Services, Inc 6831 S.
Box 32943, Palm Beach |69th Avenue, Miami, Fl Atlantic Avenue, Delray Sweetwater Road, Lithia

Bidder. ~ |Gardens, FL 33420 33166 Beach, FL 33446 Springs, Fa 30122
1., Mulch, red, delivered in bulk, per S e R e e R e S =i
cy. ~_|no bid __$15.00f $15.75/no bid
| Total for 18,950 cy: ~_|nobid [ $284,250.00 _  $298,462.50inobid 4‘
# of yards per truckload - 100 yards 100 yards E
[minimum order - ~_|100yards _ ~_|100 yards N R
2., Muich, brown, delivered in bulk,
per cy: nobd | %1300  $15.95[nobid .
|Total for 3250 CY: no bid $42,250.000 ~$51,837.50/no bid
# of yards per truckload | 100 yards 100 yards
minimum order - __|100yards 100 yards N -
3., Muich, red, delivered in bags,
perbag: no bid nobd ~  ipobd nobd
| Total for 12,680 bag: __nobid nobid no bid no bid
#of bags perpallet E | - B
| minimum order i i l TS
4., Mulch, brown, delivered in bags, i T
perbag: no bid ~ mobd  |nobid ) no bid
Total for 5,060 bag: no bid _ ~|nobid _|nobid no bid
# of bags per pallet I i )
minimum order S (e I R i
5., Muich, melaleuca, delivered in T
bags, per bag: ~_ |nobid no bid _ $1.49(no bid
| Total for 16,350 bag: ~__|nobid ~___ |no bid $24,361.50|no bid B
# of bags per pallet 00 0 |iobags 0000 | S -
minimum order N i 20 pallets

E |
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CITY OF POMPANO BEACH -- BID TABULATION

Bid #: E-34-15 Title: Mulch, Cooperative Bid

Date 7/15/15
Miller Recreation

Eastcoast Mulch, P.O. Forestry Resources Inc, |Equipment & Design, Inc, |Superior Mulch, 9621 S.R.

Box 1352, Jupiter FL 4353 Michigan Link, Fort 2017 91st Street NNW., #7, Boynton Beach, FL
Bidder: _ |33468 _|Myers,FL33916 |Bradenton, Fl 34209 |33472
1., Mulch, red, delivered in bulk, per
cY: no bid no bid - no bid $16.50
Total for 18,950 cy: ) no bid ~ |nobid no bid $312,675.00
# of yards per truckload ] B - _ B _ 100 cubic yards
minimum order o __ - B _ ~|100 cubic yards
2., Mulch, brown, delivered in bulk, a
per cy: : ) no bid no bid ~ |no bid _ __$17.00
Total for 3,250 CY: i no bid no bid no bid _ $55,250.00
# of yards per truckload ' ] ] 100 cubic yards
[minimum order - : 1100 cubic yards I
3., Muich, red, delivered in bags, o o
per bag: no bid no bid no bid $1.59
Total for 12,680 bag: ~ |no bid no bid no bid i $20,161.20
# of bags per pallet 80 bags
minimum order ) ' o B 1600 bags
4., Mulch, brown, delivered in bags,
per bag: _ i no bid no bid no bid $1.59
Total for 5,060 bag: no bid nobid no bid _ $8,045.40
# of bags per pallet - ) o 70 bags ]
|minimum order i - ~ [1400 bags
5., Mulch, melaleuca, delivered in | I -
bags, per bag: no bid | - $1.79|no bid _ _$1.50
Total for 16,350 bag: no bid - - $29,266.50|no bid i - $24,525.00
# of bags per pallet 100 cubic yards o 80cubicyards |
minimumorder N o 100 cubic yards - 1760 cubic yards
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CITY OF POMPANO BEACH -- BID TABULATION

Bid #: E-34-15 Title: Mulch, Cooperative Bid

Date 7/15/15

Amerigrow Recycling - Bliss Products and
Advanced Muich Inc, P.O. |Adwood, Inc, 4670 NW. |Delray, L.P., 10320 W. Services, Inc 6831 S.
Box 32943, Palm Beach |69th Avenue, Miami, Fl Atlantic Avenue, Delray  |Sweetwater Road, Lithia
Bidder: Gardens, FL 33420 33166  |Beach,FL 33446  |Springs, Fa 30122
6., Mulch, melaleuca, delivered in -
bulk, per cy: no bid $13.50 $14.75|no bid
Totalfor1,100cy:  ~ [nobd ~ $14850.000 = $16,225.00{nobid
# of yards per truckload ' 100 cubic yards ) 90 cubic yards i ' ]
minimumorder 1~~~ [100cubicyards |90 cubic yards -
7., Mulch, rubber, delivered in bags, ' —_
per super sack: no bid no bid no bid $569.00
Total for5supersack: ~ [nobid ~ |nobid  |pobid ~ $2,845.00
[minimum order 1 per pallet
8., Fibar Engineered Wood Fiber, o - T
installed, per cy: o |nobid ~_|nobid I ~$54.50
Total for 1,500 cy: - - no bid no bid $81,750.00)
minimumorder ~~~ [no bid - 100 cubic yards '
9., Playground Safety Wood Chips, | i
installed, per cy: $30.45|no bid no bid $54.07
Totalfor4,075cy: | $12408375nobid  |pobd $220,335.25
|minimum order ~|[20wbicyads |1 100 cubic yards
10., Mulch, brown, bulk, installed, | S
per cy: $21.41|no bid $28.00|no bid
Totalfor6,300cy: | $134883.00/nobid | $17640000jnobid
minimum order 20 yards o 60 cubic yards R
11., Mulch, red, bulk, installed, per f‘ S ST S o ]
cy. $21.41|no bid $28.00{no bid
Totalfor8,550cy: 7L - $183,055.50(no bid $239,400.00/no bid Nl
[minimum order — |20 cubicyards ' 60 cubicyards ———
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CITY OF POMPANO BEACH -- BID TABULATION

Bid #: E-34-15 Title: Mulch, Cooperative Bid

Date 7/15/15

Miller Recreation

Eastcoast Mulch, P.O. Forestry Resources Inc, |Equipment & Design, Inc, |Superior Mulch, 9621 S.R.

Box 1352, Jupiter FL 4353 Michigan Link, Fort 2017 91st Street N.W., #7, Boynton Beach, FL
Bidder: 33468 Myers, FL 33916 Bradenton, FI 34209 33472
6., Mulch, melaleuca, delivered in - N
bulk, per cy: no bid $16.90|no bid $15.50
Total for 1,100 cy: no bid $18,590.00{no bid _ ~ $17,050.00
# of yards per truckload 80 bags 100 bags
minimum order 80 bags i o 100 bags
7., Mulch, rubber, delivered in bags i N
per super sack: no bid no bid no bid no bid
Total for 5 super sack: no bid no bid no bid | no bid
minimum order ) - B B e ) Al
8., Fibar Engineered Wood Fiber, B
installed, percy: $35.00 $56.61|no bid g
Total for 1,500 cy: $52,500.00 $84,915.00/no bid
minimum order ) - B 100 cubic yards - )
9., Playground Safety Wood Chips, -
installed, per cy: $31.50 $56.61|no bid
Total for 4,075 cy: e ~ $128,362.50 ] $230,685.75/nobid
minimum order N - 100 cubic yards
10., Mulch, brown, bulk, installed,
per cy: - B $21.00|no bid no bid no bid
Total for 6,300 cy: i '$132,300.00|no bid no bid no bid 2l
minimum order 25, 50 or 100 cubic yards |
11., Mulch, red, bulk, installed, per S l
Cy: $21.00|no bid no bid no bid
Total for 8,550 cy: B $179,550.00|no bid no bid no bid Dl
minimum order 25 cubic yards e
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CITY OF POMPANO BEACH -- BID TABULATION

Bid #: E-34-15 Title: Mulch, Cooperative Bid

Date 7/15/15

Advanced Mulch Inc, P.O.
Box 32943, Palm Beach

Adwood, Inc, 4670 N.W.
69th Avenue, Miami, FI

Amerigrow Recycling -
Delray, L.P., 10320 W.
Atlantic Avenue, Delray

Bliss Products and
Services, Inc 6831 S.
Sweetwater Road, Lithia

Bidder: _ |Gardens, FL33420  |33166 Beach, FL 33446 Springs, Fa 30122

12., Mulch, gold, delivered in bulk, ' ' ' i

per cy: no bid $15.00{no bid no bid

Total for 1,000 cy: nobid N | $15,000.00|no bid no bid ]
# of yards per truckload ] 100 yards B

minimum order N 100 yards

13., Mulch, cypress, brown, i N o (i

delivered in bags, per bag: no bid no bid no bid no bid

Total for 4,050 bag: no bid no bid ~ _|nobid no bid

# of bags per pallet R

minimum order RN N R R
Bulk/Bagged Delivery time a.r.o..  [n/a o 10 calendar days 3 calendar days 10-15 calendar days

Installed Delivery time a.r.o.

14 calendar days

21 calendar days

10-15 calendar days |

| Vendor accept Purchase Card

no

no

|yes

N_O{GSZ
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CITY OF POMPANO BEACH -- BID TABULATION

Bid #: E-34-15 Title: Mulch, Cooperative Bid

Date 7/15/15

|
Miller Recreation

{Eastcoast Mulch, P.O. Forestry Resources Inc, |Equipment & Design, Inc, |Superior Mulch, 9621 S.R.

Box 1352, Jupiter FL 4353 Michigan Link, Fort |{2017 91st Street N.W., #7, Boynton Beach, FL
Bidder: 33468 Myers, FL 33916 Bradenton, FI 34209  |33472
12., Mulch, gold, delivered in bulk,
per cy: o no bid no bid no bid ) $17.50
| Total for 1,000 cy: no bid ____|nobid ~___|no bid $17,500.00
# of yards per truckload 100 yards
minimum order I | B 1100 yards o
13., Mulch, cypress, brown, P i
delivered in bags, per bag: {no bid no bid no bid _ $1.50
Total for 4,050 bag: lnobid nobid ~ |nobid - _ $6,075.00]
# of bags per pallet - 80 bags
minimum order N o - . - ) __|1760 bags
Bulk/Bagged Delivery time a.r.o..  |n/a 5-7 calendar days 7calendardays ~ [1-2 calendar days
Installed Delivery time a.r.o. 2-3 calendar days |5-7 calendar days |7 calendar days |n/a
Vendor accept Purchase Card |no o yes o
Notes: " |bidder did not state Additional Stops: $75.00

|minimum orders for items |per Stop

8and 9
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