
452-11636 Tabulation, Clamps Service Saddle (Annual Contract)

Item # Item Qty Unit Price Total Model ManufacturerPrice Total Model ManufacturerPrice Total Model Manuf.

1 Clamp1-1/2" (1" tap) 40 each 46.29$ 1,851.60$       SSB6 089803 SKINNER 42.60$   1,704.00$         SSB6 SKINNER No Bid No Bid no bid no bid

2 Clamp 2" (1-1/2" tap) 50 each 58.28$ 2,914.00$       SSC8 089794 SKINNER 53.65$   2,682.50$         SSB8 SKINNER No Bid No Bid no bid no bid

3 Clamp 2" (1" tap) 100 each 32.07$ 3,207.00$       R202N ROMAC 32.40$   3,240.00$         202NS ROMAC 33.69$  3,369.00$    DR2S0235IP100MUELLER

4 Clamp 4" (2" tap) 75 each 35.24$ 2,643.00$       R202N ROMAC 35.50$   2,662.50$         202NS ROMAC 43.91$  3,293.25$    DR2S0447IP200MUELLER

5 Clamp 6" (1" tap) 200 each 37.16$ 7,432.00$       R202N ROMAC 37.50$   7,500.00$         202NS ROMAC 35.78$  7,156.00$    DR2S0659IP100MUELLER

6 Clamp 6" (2" tap) 500 each 40.36$ 20,180.00$    R202N ROMAC 40.50$   20,250.00$       202NS ROMAC 45.47$  22,735.00$  DR2S0659IP200MUELLER

7 Clamp 6" (1-1/2" tap) 600 each 40.36$ 24,216.00$    R202N ROMAC 40.50$   24,300.00$       202NS ROMAC 46.82$  28,092.00$  DR2S0659IP150MUELLER

8 Clamp 8" (1" tap) 200 each 43.22$ 8,644.00$       R202N ROMAC 43.50$   8,700.00$         202NS ROMAC 38.88$  7,776.00$    DR2S0854IP100MUELLER

9 Clamp 8" (1-1/2" tap) 300 each 46.07$ 13,821.00$    R202N ROMAC 46.50$   13,950.00$       202NS ROMAC 48.88$  14,664.00$  DR2S0854IP150MUELLER

10 Clamp 8" (2" tap) 300 each 46.07$ 13,821.00$    R202N ROMAC 46.50$   13,950.00$       202NS ROMAC 48.93$  14,679.00$  DR2S0854IP200MUELLER

11 Clamp 10" (2" tap) 50 each 56.25$ 2,812.50$       R202N ROMAC 56.50$   2,825.00$         202NS ROMAC 71.39$  3,569.50$    DR2S1064IP200MUELLER

12 Clamp 12" (2" tap) 50 each 65.05$ 3,252.50$       R202N R202N14387265.35$   3,267.50$         202NS ROMAC 70.27$  3,513.50$    DR2S1262IP200MUELLER

TOTAL 104,794.60$  105,031.50$     Non Responsive

Local Preference Class C - 5% N/A

Total with Local Preference 99,554.87$    
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Lehman Pipe & Plumbing Supply Inc. HD Supply Waterworks Ltd. Corcel Corp.

Item # Item Qty Unit Prod CodePrice Total Model ManufacturerPrice Total Model ManufacturerPrice Total Model

1 Clamp1-1/2" (1" tap) 40 each 89803 50.00$            2,000.00$      SSB6 SKINNER 50.06$               2,002.40$       Skinner 89803 No Bid -$                N/A

2 Clamp 2" (1-1/2" tap) 50 each 89787 62.25$            3,112.50$      SSC8 SKINNER 63.03$               3,151.50$       Skinner 89794 No Bid -$                N/A

3 Clamp 2" (1" tap) 100 each 33.53$            3,353.00$      DR2S MUELLER 33.76$               3,376.00$       MuellerDR2S0235IP100 45.88$          4,588.00$      3417DI

4 Clamp 4" (2" tap) 75 each 43.69$            3,276.75$      DR2S MUELLER 44.01$               3,300.75$       MuellerDR20659IP100 52.59$          3,944.25$      3417DI

5 Clamp 6" (1" tap) 200 each 35.60$            7,120.00$      DR2S MUELLER 35.86$               7,172.00$       MuellerDR2S0659IP100 42.94$          8,588.00$      3417DI

6 Clamp 6" (2" tap) 500 each 45.24$            22,620.00$    DR2S MUELLER 45.57$               22,785.00$     MuellerDR2S0659IP200 56.24$          28,120.00$    3417 DI

7 Clamp 6" (1-1/2" tap) 600 each 46.58$            27,948.00$    DR2S MUELLER 46.92$               28,152.00$     MuellerDR2S0659IP1500 56.24$          33,744.00$    3417 DI

8 Clamp 8" (1" tap) 200 each 38.69$            7,738.00$      DR2S MUELLER 38.97$               7,794.00$       MuellerDR2S0854IP100 46.61$          9,322.00$      3417 DI

9 Clamp 8" (1-1/2" tap) 300 each 48.64$            14,592.00$    DR2S MUELLER 48.99$               14,697.00$     MuellerDR2S0854IP150 58.59$          17,577.00$    3417 DI

10 Clamp 8" (2" tap) 300 each 48.69$            14,607.00$    DR2S MUELLER 49.04$               14,712.00$     MuellerDR2S0854IP200 58.82$          17,646.00$    3417 DI

11 Clamp 10" (2" tap) 50 each 71.03$            3,551.50$      DR2S MUELLER 71.54$               3,577.00$       MuellerDR2S1064IP200 87.88$          4,394.00$      3417 DI

12 Clamp 12" (2" tap) 50 each 69.92$            3,496.00$      DR2S MUELLER 70.42$               3,521.00$       MuellerDR2S1262IP200 84.35$          4,217.50$      3417 DI

TOTAL 113,414.75$  114,240.65$  Non Responsive

Local Preference N/A Class C - 5%

Total with Local Preference 108,528.62$  
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