
Tabulation Of Bids
Event # : 64

Version: 1

Name: Fireworks and Drones Light Show - 4th of July

Description: The City of Fort Lauderdale, Florida (City) is seeking bids from qualified, experienced, and licensed firm(s),
hereinafter referred to as the Contractor or Bidder, to provide the July 4th fireworks and drones light show off
Fort Lauderdale Beach for the City, in accordance with the terms, conditions, and specifications contained in
this Invitation to Bid (ITB). Contractors can bid on fireworks or drones or both.

The initial contract term shall commence upon date of award by the City and shall expire 1 year from that
date. The City reserves the right to extend the contract for three, additional one-year terms, providing all
terms conditions and specifications remain the same, both parties agree to the extension, and such
extension is approved by the City.

Open Date: 03/10/2023 04:00:00 PM Close Date: 03/29/2023 02:00:00 PM

Event Currency: USD

Supplier Bid Amount

Pyrotecnico
Fireworks, Inc.

655,930.00

299 Wilson Road
New Castle, PA 16101

Sky Elements LLC 148,000.00

3819 Rufe Snow Drive
Suite 2023
North Richland Hills, TX 76180

* * Supplier has responses with a no bid

* * Supplier has responses with a no charge

Items

Item: FIREWORKS DISPLAY
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Description: 4th of July Fireworks Display

Unit of
Measure:

DO Quantity: 1.0000

Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount

Pyrotecnico Fireworks, Inc. 1.0000 86,500.00000000 86,500.00

Sky Elements LLC (No bid) 0.0000 0.00000000 0.00

Item: DRONES LIGHT SHOWS - 200 DRONES
Description: 4th of July Drones Light Show

Unit of
Measure:

DO Quantity: 1.0000

Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount

Pyrotecnico Fireworks, Inc. 1.0000 112,000.00000000 112,000.00

Sky Elements LLC 1.0000 54,000.00000000 54,000.00

Item: DRONES LIGHT SHOW - 400 DRONES
Description: 4th of July Drones Light Show

Unit of
Measure:

DO Quantity: 1.0000

Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount

Pyrotecnico Fireworks, Inc. 1.0000 155,580.00000000 155,580.00

Sky Elements LLC 1.0000 94,000.00000000 94,000.00

Item: PRICE FOR POSTPONMENT OF SHOW
Description: PRICE FOR POSTPONMENT OF FIREWORKS SHOW

Unit of
Measure:

DA Quantity: 1.0000

Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount

Pyrotecnico Fireworks, Inc. 1.0000 34,600.00000000 34,600.00

Sky Elements LLC (No bid) 0.0000 0.00000000 0.00

Item: CHARGE FOR CANCELLATION OF SHOW
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Description: CHARGE FOR CANCELLATION OF FIREWORKS SHOW

Unit of
Measure:

DO Quantity: 1.0000

Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount

Pyrotecnico Fireworks, Inc. 1.0000 43,250.00000000 43,250.00

Sky Elements LLC (No bid) 0.0000 0.00000000 0.00

Item: PRICE FOR POSTPONMENT OF SHOW
Description: PRICE FOR POSTPONMENT OF DRONES SHOW

Unit of
Measure:

DA Quantity: 1.0000

Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount

Pyrotecnico Fireworks, Inc. 1.0000 112,000.00000000 112,000.00

Sky Elements LLC (No charge) 1.0000 0.00000000 0.00

Item: CHARGE FOR CANCELLATION OF SHOW
Description: CHARGE FOR CANCELLATION OF DRONES SHOW

Unit of
Measure:

DO Quantity: 1.0000

Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount

Pyrotecnico Fireworks, Inc. 1.0000 112,000.00000000 112,000.00

Sky Elements LLC (No charge) 1.0000 0.00000000 0.00
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