
Tabulation Of Bids
Event # : 291

Version: 4

Name: South Side Cultural Arts Center - Manual Transfer Switch (MT

Description: The City of Fort Lauderdale, Florida (City) is seeking bids from qualified bidders, hereinafter referred to as the
Contractor, to provide Electrical Construction and Commissioning services to install a Manual Transfer Switch
for the City's Parks and Recreation Department, in accordance with the terms, conditions, and specifications
contained in this Invitation To Bid (ITB).

This Project is located at the South Side Cultural Arts Center, 701 S. Andrews Ave. in the City of Fort
Lauderdale. The work includes, but is not limited to, the supply, installation and commissioning of a manual
transfer switch including all associated equipment, cabling, and infrastructure for complete turnkey project.

Open Date: 06/24/2024 01:00:00 PM Close Date: 08/15/2024 02:00:00 PM

Event Currency: USD

Supplier Bid Amount

Imperial Electrical
Inc

196,000.00

11821 nw 11 street
plantation, FL 33323

Miller Electric
Company

264,851.00

354 SW 12th Ave
Deerfield Beach, FL 33442

RG Legacy
Construction LLC

0.00

8281 NW 7 Street
Miami, FL 33126

* * Supplier has responses with a no bid

Mills Electric Service 219,850.00

830 NE 57 Court
Fort Lauderdale, FL 33339
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Rexel USA, Inc. 0.00

3625 SW 30th Ave.
Fort Lauderdale, FL 33312

* * Supplier has responses with a no bid

Items

Item: DEMOLITION
Description: Demolition

Unit of
Measure:

JA Quantity: 1.0000

Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount

Imperial Electrical Inc 1.0000 2,500.00000000 2,500.00

Miller Electric Company 1.0000 3,800.00000000 3,800.00

RG Legacy Construction LLC (No bid) 0.0000 0.00000000 0.00

Mills Electric Service 1.0000 2,000.00000000 2,000.00

Rexel USA, Inc. (No bid) 0.0000 0.00000000 0.00

Item: INSTALLATION
Description: Installation

Unit of
Measure:

JA Quantity: 1.0000

Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount

Imperial Electrical Inc 1.0000 35,000.00000000 35,000.00

Miller Electric Company 1.0000 203,940.00000000 203,940.00

RG Legacy Construction LLC (No bid) 0.0000 0.00000000 0.00

Mills Electric Service 1.0000 150,850.00000000 150,850.00

Rexel USA, Inc. (No bid) 0.0000 0.00000000 0.00

Item: TRANSFER SWITCH (COMPLETE)
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Description: Transfer Switch (Complete)

Unit of
Measure:

EA Quantity: 1.0000

Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount

Imperial Electrical Inc 1.0000 30,000.00000000 30,000.00

Miller Electric Company 1.0000 41,805.00000000 41,805.00

RG Legacy Construction LLC (No bid) 0.0000 0.00000000 0.00

Mills Electric Service 1.0000 25,000.00000000 25,000.00

Rexel USA, Inc. (No bid) 0.0000 0.00000000 0.00

Item: CIRCUIT BREAKER (COMPLETE)
Description: Circuit Breaker (Complete)

Unit of
Measure:

EA Quantity: 1.0000

Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount

Imperial Electrical Inc 1.0000 15,000.00000000 15,000.00

Miller Electric Company 1.0000 9,705.00000000 9,705.00

RG Legacy Construction LLC (No bid) 0.0000 0.00000000 0.00

Mills Electric Service 1.0000 25,000.00000000 25,000.00

Rexel USA, Inc. (No bid) 0.0000 0.00000000 0.00

Item: ALL OTHER MATERIALS
Description: All Other Materials

Unit of
Measure:

JA Quantity: 1.0000

Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount

Imperial Electrical Inc 1.0000 108,500.00000000 108,500.00

Miller Electric Company 1.0000 1.00000000 1.00
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Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount

RG Legacy Construction LLC (No bid) 0.0000 0.00000000 0.00

Mills Electric Service 1.0000 15,000.00000000 15,000.00

Rexel USA, Inc. (No bid) 0.0000 0.00000000 0.00

Item: COMMISSIONING/STARTUP/OPERATE
Description: Commission and Startup - Minimum One Week of  Operation

Unit of
Measure:

JA Quantity: 1.0000

Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount

Imperial Electrical Inc 1.0000 5,000.00000000 5,000.00

Miller Electric Company 1.0000 5,600.00000000 5,600.00

RG Legacy Construction LLC (No bid) 0.0000 0.00000000 0.00

Mills Electric Service 1.0000 2,000.00000000 2,000.00

Rexel USA, Inc. (No bid) 0.0000 0.00000000 0.00
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