Bid: 543-11355
Title: Earthwork Improvements Parcels B-C-D
Opened: 2/10/14

JMS Construction
Services

Marks Brothers Inc.

Ryan Inc.

Bergeron Land
Development

Conalvias USA LLC

Plantation, FL Medley, FL Deerfield Beach, FL Fort Lauderdale, FL Fort Lauderdale, FL
PARCELS B-C-D
Item Qty  Unit |Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total
1|Parcels B C & D Site Preperation Lump Sum Price 1leach | $ 1,225,945.00 [ $ 1,225,945.00| $ 1,731,713.75|$ 1,731,713.75| $ 1,315,500.00 | $ 1,315,500.00 | $ 2,003,772.97 | $ 2,003,772.97 | $ 2,304,741.08 | $ 2,304,741.08
2|Permit allowance for Parcels B C & C lleach | $ 10,500.00 | $ 10,500.00 | $ 10,500.00 | $ 10,500.00 | $ 10,500.00 | $ 10,500.00 | $ 10,500.00 | $ 10,500.00 | $ 10,500.00 | $ 10,500.00
3|Parcel D Fill Pile Unsuitable Material Disposal 12150[ton | $ 350 | S 42,525.00 | $ 9.20|$ 111,780.00| $ 47.00|$ 571,050.00 | $ 14.11|$ 171,436.50) $ 15.66 | $  190,269.00
$ 1,278,970.00 $ 1,853,993.75 $ 1,897,050.00 $ 2,185,709.47 $ 2,505,510.08
PARCEL B ONLY
| 4|Parce| B ONLY Site Preperation Lump Sum Price 1|each $ 274,487.00|$ 274,487.00|$ 401,013.00($ 401,013.00|$ 295,000.00 | $ 295000.00|$ 631,936.49|S 631,936.49|S 753,646.04 |S 753,646.04
| 5|Permit allowance for Parcel B ONLY 1|each S 3,500.00 | $ 3,500.00 | $ 3,500.00 | $ 3,500.00 | $ 3,500.00 | $ 3,500.00 | $ 3,500.00 | $ 3,500.00 | $ 3,500.00 | $ 3,500.00
$  277,987.00 S 404,513.00 S 298,500.00 S  635,436.49 $  757,146.04
PARCEL C ONLY
| 6|Parce| C ONLY Site Preperation Lump Sum Price 1|each $ 1,070,087.00 [ $ 1,070,087.00|$ 954,813.70$ 954,813.70| $ 805,000.00 | $ 805,000.00 | $ 1,073,372.94 | $ 1,073,372.94 | $ 1,499,183.35|$ 1,499,183.35
| 7|Permit Allowance for Parcel C Only 1|each S 3,500.00 | $ 3,500.00 | $ 3,500.00 | $ 3,500.00 | $ 3,500.00 | $ 3,500.00 | $ 3,500.00 | $ 3,500.00 | $ 3,500.00 | $ 3,500.00
$ 1,073,587.00 $  958,313.70 $  808,500.00 $ 1,076,872.94 $ 1,502,683.35
PARCEL D ONLY
8|Parcel D ONLY Site Preparation Lump Sum lleach |$ 357,007.00[$ 357,007.00|$ 424,813.05|$ 424,813.05|$ 275,000.00|$ 275000.00|$ 607,003.11|$ 607,003.11|$ 847,067.21|$ 847,067.21
9|Permit Allowance for Parcel D ONLY lleach | $ 3,500.00 | $ 3,500.00 | $ 3,500.00 | $ 3,500.00 | $ 3,500.00 | $ 3,500.00 | $ 3,500.00 | $ 3,500.00 | $ 3,500.00 | $ 3,500.00
10|Parcel D Fill Pile Unsuitable Material Disposal Parce| 12150{ton | $ 350 (S 42,525.00 | $ 9.20|$ 111,780.00| $ 47.00|$ 571,050.00 | $ 14.11|$ 171,436.50) $ 15.66 | S 190,269.00
S 403,032.00 $  540,093.05 S 849,550.00 $ 781,939.61 $ 1,040,836.21
Triple R Paving Inc. Florida Engineering Arbor Tree & Devland Site Inc. JVA Engineering
& Development Corp Land Inc. Contractor Inc.
Fort Lauderdale, FL Hialeah Gardens, FL Lake Worth, FL Lake Worth, FL Miami, FL
PARCELS B-C-D
Item Qty  Unit |Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total
1|Parcels B C & D Site Preperation Lump Sum Price 1leach | $ 2,094,042.00 [ $ 2,094,042.00 | $ 2,902,000.00 | $ 2,902,000.00 | $ 3,408,858.63 | $ 3,408,858.63 | $ 2,464,843.63 | S 2,464,843.63| S 3,586,425.00 | $ 3,586,425.00
2|Permit allowance for Parcels B C & C lleach | $ 10,500.00 | $ 10,500.00 | $ 10,500.00 | $ 10,500.00 | $ 10,500.00 | $ 10,500.00 | $ 10,500.00 | $ 10,500.00 | $ 10,500.00 | $ 10,500.00
3|Parcel D Fill Pile Unsuitable Material Disposal 12150[ton | $ 61.00 | $ 741,150.00 | $ 45.00| S 546,750.00 | S 3.00 S 36,450.00 | S 8.10 S 98,415.00 No Bid
$ 2,845,692.00 $ 3,459,250.00 $ 3,455,808.63 $ 2,573,758.63 $ 3,596,925.00
PARCEL B ONLY
| 4|Parce| B ONLY Site Preperation Lump Sum Price 1|each $  485,075.00 [ $ 485,075.00| $ 500,000.00 | $ 500,000.00|$ 788,818.00|$ 788,818.00|$ 548,196.89|S$ 548,196.89|$ 1,022,536.00 | $ 1,022,536.00
| 5|Permit allowance for Parcel B ONLY 1|each S 3,500.00 | $ 3,500.00 | $ 3,500.00 | $ 3,500.00 | $ 3,500.00 | $ 3,500.00 | $ 3,500.00 | $ 3,500.00 | $ 3,500.00 | $ 3,500.00
S 488,575.00 $  503,500.00 S 792,318.00 $  551,696.89 $ 1,026,036.00
PARCEL C ONLY
| 6|Parce| C ONLY Site Preperation Lump Sum Price 1|each $ 1,503,958.00 | $ 1,503,958.00 | $ 1,864,000.00 | $ 1,864,000.00 | $ 1,849,764.25|$ 1,849,764.25 No Bid $ 1,728,917.00 | $ 1,728,917.00
| 7|Permit Allowance for Parcel C Only 1|each S 3,500.00 | $ 3,500.00 | $ 3,500.00 | $ 3,500.00 | $ 3,500.00 | $ 3,500.00 | $ 3,500.00 | $ 3,500.00 | $ 3,500.00 | $ 3,500.00
$ 1,507,458.00 $ 1,867,500.00 $ 1,853,264.25 S 3,500.00 $ 1,732,417.00
PARCEL D ONLY
8|Parcel D ONLY Site Preparation Lump Sum lleach |$ 585,065.00 | $ 585,065.00|$ 538,000.00 | $ 538,000.00|$ 882,290.50|$ 882,290.50 No Bid $  834,972.00|$ 834,972.00
9|Permit Allowance for Parcel D ONLY 1leach | $ 3,500.00 | $ 3,500.00 | $ 3,500.00 | $ 3,500.00 | $ 3,500.00 | $ 3,500.00 | $ 3,500.00 | $ 3,500.00 | $ 3,500.00 | $ 3,500.00
10|Parcel D Fill Pile Unsuitable Material Disposal Parce| 12150{ton | $ 61.00 | $ 741,150.00 | $ 45.00|$ 546,750.00 | S 3.00 S 36,450.00 | $ 8.10 S 98,415.00 No Bid
$ 1,329,715.00 $ 1,088,250.00 S 922,240.50 $ 101,915.00 S 838,472.00

*Exclusion relates to additional
unsuitable material not listed on specs

will be additional charge.

*Did not use revised cost page

included with addendum

EXHIBIT 1
14-0388
Page 1 of 1





