
Bid 452-11496 Chlorine, Liquid in Cylinders & Calcium Hypochlorite

Item Description

 Dumont 

Company 

 Allied 

Universal  Brenntag  F2 Industries 

 DPC 

Enterprises  Chenrite 

1 Chlorine in One Ton Cylinders No-Bid 448,500.00$   513,500.00$ No-Bid 507,000.00$  No-Bid

2 Chlorine in 150 lb. Cylinders No-Bid 18,322.60$     13,438.50$   No-Bid No-Bid Bo-Bid

3 Calcium Hypochlorite 39,216.00$    36,480.00$     44,688.00$   35,689.60$   No-Bid 39,124.80$ 

4

Calcium Optional extra delivery 

charge Zero $ Fee 10,000.00$     7,500.00$      Zero $ Fee No-Bid 5,000.00$   

Minimum Quantity, not to exceed 4 0 4 4 16 4

Total Items 3 & 4 39,216.00$    46,480.00$     52,188.00$   35,689.60$   No-Bid 44,124.80$ 

For evaluation purposes, items 3 and 4 are added together to determine the lowest bidder for Calcium Hypochlorite . 

F2 Industries is non-responsive because they require a minimum order of 16 drums. Specifications state that they can not exceed 4 drums. 
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