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Tabulation Of Bids

Event # :
Version:
Name:

Description:

Open Date:

Event Currency:

246
1
Generator & Automatic transfer switch for Public Works Bldg

The City of Fort Lauderdale, Florida (City) is seeking bids from qualified bidders, hereinafter referred to as the
Contractor, to provide generator and associated appurtenances services & ATS Service Switch at Public
Works Administration Building for the City's Public Works Department, in accordance with the terms,
conditions, and specifications contained in this Invitation to Bid (ITB).

The Manufacturer/Supplier shall furnish, and acceptance test a complete and operable standby electric
generating system, including all devices and equipment as well as the ATS Service Switch with five-year
maintenance plan, as shown on the drawings and per specs, and as required for the service. Materials and
equipment shall be new and delivered to the job site (FOB Destination) factory tested and ready for
installation (Installation shall be performed by others under a separate contract).

The engine/generator set Manufacturer/Supplier and/or local Dealer shall provide a 5-year preventive
maintenance proposal to the Owner and Engineer for review. The maintenance proposal shall include all
maintenance, testing, and minor repairs for the complete generator system deemed to be suitable for
coverage under this maintenance.

This project is located at 949 NW 38th Street Fort Lauderdale, FL 33309, in the City of Fort Lauderdale. The
work to be accomplished under this contract includes, but is not limited to, furnish and deliver generator and
associated equipment as well as automatic Transfer Switch as required by specifications.

01/11/2024 05:00:00 PM Close Date: 02/02/2024 02:00:00 PM

usb

Supplier Bid Amount

February 7, 2024

Advanced Power 0.00
Technologies

1501 Veterans Memorial Pkwy E
Lafayette, IN 47905

* * Supplier has responses with a no bid

Stewart & Stevenson 252,322.00
FDDA LLC

4141 SW 30th Avenue
Fort Lauderdale, FL 33312

Pantropic Power 418,990.00
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Tabulation Of Bids For Event # 246: Generator & Automatic transfer switch for Public Works Bldg

8205 NW 58th Street
Miami, FL 33166

Cummins Inc. 0.00

6350 NW 167th Street
Miami Lakes, FL 33014

* * Supplier has responses with a no bid

Items

Item: 246- GENERATOR & TRANSFER SWITCH

Description: Generator and Transfer switch for the public works admin bld

Unit of EA Quantity: 1.0000
Measure:

Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
Advanced Power Technologies (No bid) 0.0000 0.00000000 0.00
Stewart & Stevenson FDDA LLC 1.0000 252,322.00000000 252,322.00
Pantropic Power 1.0000 418,990.00000000 418,990.00
Cummins Inc. (No bid) 0.0000 0.00000000 0.00
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