
Description: Event 335 - Disposal of Construction and Demolition Debris & Yard Waste
Open Date: 8/6/2024

Vendor
City, State

# Item Description Qty. U/M Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension

1 Infrastructure (Stormwater) Silts (Tons) 1704 TN 100.00$       170,400.00$     47.74$         81,348.96$       -$             No Bid

2 Infrastructure (Stormwater) Silts (CY) 3120 CY -$             No Bid 59.68$         186,201.60$     -$             No Bid

3 Yard Waste Residential 16800 TN 49.50$         831,600.00$     50.92$         855,456.00$     -$             No Bid

4 Land Clearing Debris (Tons) 250 TN 49.50$         12,375.00$       50.92$         12,730.00$       -$             No Bid

5 Land Clearing Debris (CY) 400 CY -$             No Bid 12.73$         5,092.00$         -$             No Bid

6 Yard Waste Rolloff (Tons) 1200 TN 49.50$         59,400.00$       50.92$         61,104.00$       -$             No Bid

7 Yard Waste Rolloff (CY) 5000 CY -$             No Bid 12.73$         63,650.00$       13.50$         67,500.00$    

8 Mixed Construction and Demolition Debris 7800 TN 68.00$         530,400.00$     63.39$         494,442.00$     74.60$         581,880.00$  

9 Clean Concreate 600 CY -$             No Bid 4.24$           2,544.00$         -$             No Bid

10 Concrete with Rebar 600 CY -$             No Bid 9.02$           5,412.00$         -$             No Bid

11 Unscreened Seaweed 1500 CY -$             No Bid -$             No Bid -$             No Bid

12 Clean Soil 8400 CY -$             No Bid 46.68$         392,112.00$     -$             No Bid

GRAND TOTALS 1,604,175.00$  2,160,092.56$  649,380.00$  

** Apparent Lowest Bid

Notes
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Addendum 1  

Non-Discrimination 

Affidavit of Compliance with Foreign Entity Laws  

E-Verify

Boca Raton, FL Boca Raton, FL Fort Lauderdale, FL
Coastal Waste & Recycling Inc. Waste Management Inc. of FL Panzarella MRF, LLC

Late Bids:

Protected Class Vendors* Received:
No Bids:

Number of bids received:

** Apparent Low Bid

Anti-Trafficking Affidavit



P-Card Payment  - MC or Visa

References

Non-Collusion 

To be signed To be signed To be signed

** 1, 2, 5, 7, 8, 9, 10, 12





 



None

** 3, 4, 6

 







 - Visa





 - MC or Visa

No response for #11 - 
Unscreened Seaweed

None

No response for #11 - 
Unscreened Seaweed

None

Bid Certification 



Items highlighted in green are 
lowest bid.



Items highlighted in green are 
lowest bid.

Variances or Comments

No response for #11 - 
Unscreened Seaweed

Addendum 2

FINANCE DEPARTMENT
CITY OF FORT LAUDERDALE BID TABULATION
Rev: 1 | Revision Date: 8/31/2015 | Print Date: 0/0/0000

Approved by Glenn Marcos, Chief Procurement Officer
Uncontrolled in hard copy unless otherwise marked.
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