

Bid #452-11620 Flexible Couplings, Cast Iron and Brass Threaded Fittings

		HD Supply Waterworks Ltd.					HD Supply Waterworks Ltd. (alternate)					Lehman Pipe & Plumbing Supply			
Item	Qty	Unit	Price	Total	make offer	model offered	Price	Total	make offered	model offered	Price	Total	make offered	model offered	
1	100	each	\$ 18.50	\$ 1,850.00	Fernco	1001-66SR	\$ 28.00	\$ 2,800.00	Mission	MR01-66ARC	\$ 28.00	\$ 2,800.00	Mission	MR0166ARC	
2	50	each	\$ 25.00	\$ 1,250.00	Fernco	1001-88SR	\$ 42.00	\$ 2,100.00	Mission	MR01-88ARC	\$ 41.57	\$ 2,078.50	Mission	MR0188ARC	
3	75	each	\$ 4.50	\$ 337.50	Fernco	1002-44	\$ 4.50	\$ 337.50	Mission	MR02-44	\$ 3.34	\$ 250.50	MISSION	MR0244	
4	500	each	\$ 9.00	\$ 4,500.00	Fernco	1002-66	\$ 9.00	\$ 4,500.00	Mission	MR02-66	\$ 7.13	\$ 3,565.00	MISSION	MR0264	
5	75	each	\$ 15.00	\$ 1,125.00	Fernco	1002-86	\$ 15.00	\$ 1,125.00	Mission	MR02-86	\$ 14.14	\$ 1,060.50	MISSION	MR0286	
6	40	each	\$ 12.50	\$ 500.00	Fernco	1002-88	\$ 12.50	\$ 500.00	Mission	MR02-88	\$ 10.98	\$ 439.20	MISSION	MR0288	
7	425	each	\$ 5.00	\$ 2,125.00	Fernco	1056-44	\$ 5.00	\$ 2,125.00	Mission	MR56-44	\$ 3.34	\$ 1,419.50	MISSION	MR5644	
8	325	each	\$ 10.00	\$ 3,250.00	Fernco	1056-64	\$ 10.00	\$ 3,250.00	Mission	MR56-44	\$ 8.39	\$ 2,726.75	MISSION	MR5664	
9	700	each	\$ 9.00	\$ 6,300.00	Fernco	1056-66	\$ 9.00	\$ 6,300.00	Mission	MR56-66	\$ 7.15	\$ 5,005.00	MISSION	MR5666	
10	50	each	\$ 5.00	\$ 250.00	Fernco	NH44	\$ 5.00	\$ 250.00	Mission	MR-C400C	\$ 2.48	\$ 124.00	MISSION	C400C	
11	600	each	\$ 10.75	\$ 6,450.00	Fernco	NH-66	\$ 8.00	\$ 4,800.00	Mission	MR-C600C	\$ 6.25	\$ 3,750.00	MISSION	C600C	
12	250	each	\$ 14.50	\$ 3,625.00	Fernco	7.38-6-6.380REB	\$ 9.00	\$ 2,250.00	Mission	MR03-66	\$ 7.33	\$ 1,832.50	MISSION	MR0366	
13	50	each	\$ 20.00	\$ 1,000.00	Fernco	9.65-8.500R	\$ 19.00	\$ 950.00	Mission	MR0508	\$ 17.80	\$ 890.00	MISSION	508416	
14	50	each	\$ 20.00	\$ 1,000.00	Fernco	9.650-9.05R	\$ 19.00	\$ 950.00	Mission	MR0508424	\$ 17.80	\$ 890.00	MISSION	508424	
15	55	each	\$ -	No Bid	NB	NB	\$ -	\$ -	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 27.21	\$ 1,496.55	CHARLOTTE	NH22	
16	300	each	\$ -	No Bid	NB	NB	\$ -	\$ -	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 74.73	\$ 22,419.00	CHARLOTTE	NH22	
17	50	each	\$ -	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ -	\$ -	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 7.36	\$ 368.00	CHARLOTTE	NH52	
18	400	each	\$ -	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ -	\$ -	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 16.86	\$ 6,744.00	CHARLOTTE	NH52	
19	75	each	\$ 12.50	\$ 937.50	Lee Brass	256280780	\$ 12.50	\$ 937.50	Lee Brass	256280780	\$ 4.82	\$ 361.50	LEE	25-628	
20	10	each	\$ 12.50	\$ 125.00	Lee Brass	256290780	\$ 12.50	\$ 125.00	Lee Brass	256290780	\$ 4.68	\$ 46.80	LEE	25-629	
21	400	each	\$ 23.00	\$ 9,200.00	Lee	256280975	\$ 23.00	\$ 9,200.00	Lee	256280975	\$ 9.36	\$ 3,744.00	LEE	25-628	
22	150	each	\$ 25.00	\$ 3,750.00	Lee Brass	256290975	\$ 25.00	\$ 3,750.00	Lee Brass	256290975	\$ 9.14	\$ 1,371.00	LEE	25-629	
23	75	each	\$ -	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ -	\$ -	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 8.32	\$ 624.00	CHARLOTTE	NH14	
24	100	each	\$ -	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ -	\$ -	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 9.33	\$ 933.00	CHARLOTTE	NH12	
25	100	each	\$ -	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ -	\$ -	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 22.39	\$ 2,239.00	CHARLOTTE	NH14	
26	75	each	\$ -	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ -	\$ -	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 20.66	\$ 1,549.50	CHARLOTTE	NH12	
				\$ 47,575.00				\$ 46,250.00				\$ 68,727.80			

Ferguson Enterprises, Inc.						
Item	Qty	Unit	Price	Total	make offer	model offered
1	100	each	\$17.68	\$ 1,768.00	FERNCO	F100166SR
2	50	each	\$23.97	\$ 1,198.50	FERNCO	F100188SR
3	75	each	\$ 3.46	\$ 259.50	FERNCO	F100244
4	500	each	\$ 7.36	\$ 3,680.00	FERNCO	F100266
5	75	each	\$13.72	\$ 1,029.00	FERNCO	F100286
6	40	each	\$11.37	\$ 454.80	FERNCO	F100288
7	425	each	\$ 3.45	\$ 1,466.25	FERNCO	F105644
8	325	each	\$ 8.64	\$ 2,808.00	FERNCO	F105664
9	700	each	\$ 7.36	\$ 5,152.00	FERNCO	F105666
10	50	each	\$ 3.44	\$ 172.00	PROFLO	PFNHCP
11	600	each	\$ 8.64	\$ 5,184.00	PROFLO	PFNHCU
12	250	each	\$12.49	\$ 3,122.50	FERNCO	SP-F7.38-6.38ER
13	50	each	\$18.38	\$ 919.00	FERNCO	SP-F9.65-8.500R
14	50	each	\$18.38	\$ 919.00	FERNCO	SP-F9.65-9.050R
15	55	each	\$34.91	\$ 1,920.05	TYLER UNII	NHCOMBP
16	300	each	\$92.47	\$27,741.00	TYLER UNII	NHCOMBU
17	50	each	\$ 9.37	\$ 468.50	TYLER UNII	NHCOP
18	400	each	\$21.22	\$ 8,488.00	TYLER UNII	NHCOU
19	75	each	\$ 5.69	\$ 426.75	PROFLO	PFBP5RHN
20	10	each	\$ 6.11	\$ 61.10	PROFLO	PFBP5CSKN
21	400	each	\$12.74	\$ 5,096.00	PROFLO	PFBP5RHS
22	150	each	\$17.17	\$ 2,575.50	PROFLO	PFBP5CSKS
23	75	each	\$10.69	\$ 801.75	TYLER UNII	NH2P
24	100	each	\$11.67	\$ 1,167.00	TYLER UNII	NH4P
25	100	each	\$28.69	\$ 2,869.00	TYLER UNII	NH2U
26	75	each	\$25.73	\$ 1,929.75	TYLER UNII	NH4U
				\$81,676.95		