CITY OF FORT LAUDERDALE BID TABULATION
1Q Event No. 177
TITLE: Soccer Officiating Services

Opened: 9/27/2023
3PS Soccer Pros LLC Friendly Issoulaimani Management
Vendor John Inc.
Location Weston, FL NO BID Fort Lauderdale, FL
P-Card MC/Visa NO BID MC/Visa
Yearly
Quantity . X . .
(est. Unit Price | Extended Price | NO BID Unit Price Extended Price
games)
Soccer Officials 4-, 5- and 6-year-old division 250 $25.00 $6,250.00/ NO BID $30.00 $7,500.00
Soccer Officials 7- & 8-year-old division 600 $25.00 $15,000.00/ NO BID $30.00 $18,000.00
Soccer Officials 9- and 10-year-old division 400 $27.50 $11,000.00/ NO BID $35.00 $14,000.00
Soccer Officials 11- and 12-year-old division 480 $30.00 $14,400.00/ NO BID $35.00 $16,800.00
Soccer Officials 13- and 14-year-old division 420 $32.50 $13,650.00] NO BID $35.00 $14,700.00
Soccer Officials 15-, 16- and 17-year-old division 150 $35.00 $5,250.00/ NO BID $35.00 $5,250.00
YEARLY TOTAL $65,550.00 S0 $76,250.00
TOTAL - INITIAL 2-YEAR CONTRACT TERM $131,100 $152,500
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