CITY OF FORT LAUDERDALE TABULATION
ITB Event No. 305
TITLE: Event Equipment Rental (Re-bid)

All Star Bounce Inc.

South Florida Event Rental, Inc.

*Squadlix Corporate Solutions

Vendor:
Location: Fort Lauderdale, FL Fort Lauderdale, FL Fort Lauderdale, FL
P-Card: Visa MC/Visa Visa
Local Vendor: Class C Class A Class B pending
DBE Class 3 N/A N/A
REQUIRED ITEMS
Item # Item Quantity| Unit Price Total Price Total Price Total
1 Chairs, A. Folding, plastic, color white (first choice), tan or brown (with chair cart) 8,000 EA S 200|$  16,000.00 | $ 1913 15,280.00 | $ 3713 29,680.00
2 Chairs, B. Folding, Resin, white with padded seat (with chair cart) 3,000 EA S 4.00|¢$  12,000.00 | $ 298 |$ 8,940.00 | $ 413 |3 12,390.00
3 Chairs, C. Padded stacking chair (no folding) 100 EA S 6.00 | $ 600.00 | S 4.00]|$ 400.00 | S 6.60 | $ 660.00
GROUP (CHAIRS): SUBTOTAL S 28,600.00 $ 24,620.00 S 42,730.00
6 Tables, A. 8' folding table (with cart, 1 cart per 25 tables) 2,500 EA |$ 12.00 | $  30,000.00 | $ 1055 | $ 26,375.00 [ $ 1650 | 41,250.00
7 Tables, B. 6' folding table (with cart, 1 cart per 25 tables) 2,000 EA S 10.00 [ $  20,000.00 | S 10.00 | $ 20,000.00 | $ 13.20 | $ 26,400.00
8 Tables, C. 30" round X 42" high, Formica high top table 150 EA S 10.00 | $ 1,500.00 | $ 11.00 | $ 1,650.00 | $ 13.20 | $ 1,980.00
9 Tables, D. 36" round, cafe-style table 150 EA S 12.00 | $ 1,800.00 | S 9.50 | $ 1,425.00 | $ 13.20 | $ 1,980.00
10 Tables, E. 36" round X 42" high Cocktail table 150 EA S 12.00 [ $ 1,800.00 | $ 1350 | $ 2,025.00 | $ 13.20 | 1,980.00
11 Tables, F. 48" round table with hole for umbrella 300 EA S 14.00 | $ 4,200.00 | $ 9.15| S 2,745.00 | S 13.20 | $ 3,960.00
12 Tables, G. 54" round table 40 EA S 14.90 | $ 596.00 | $ 10.00 | $ 400.00 | S 13.20 [ $ 528.00
13 Tables, H. 60" round table 50 EA S 15.00 | $ 750.00 | $ 10.80 | $ 540.00 | $ 16.50 | $ 825.00
GROUP (TABLES): SUBTOTAL S 60,646.00 $ 55,160.00 S 78,903.00
14 Tents, A. 10'X10' tent 50 EA S 90.00 | $ 4,500.00 | $ 130.00 | S 6,500.00 No Bid No Bid
15 Tents, B. 16'X16' tent 5 EA S 200.00 | $ 1,000.00 | $ 245.00 | $ 1,225.00 No Bid No Bid
16 Tents, C. 10'X20' tent (Marquee) 20 EA S 175.00 | $ 3,500.00 | $ 250.00 | 5,000.00 No Bid No Bid
17 Tents, D. 20'X20' tent 15 EA S 300.00 | $ 4,500.00 | $ 255.00 | $ 3,825.00 No Bid No Bid
18 Tents, E. 20'X30' tent 10 EA S 400.00 | $ 4,000.00 | $ 450.00 | $ 4,500.00 No Bid No Bid
19 Tents, F. 20'X40' tent 5 EA S 475.00 | $ 2,375.00 | $ 600.00 | $ 3,000.00 No Bid No Bid
GROUP (TENTS): SUBTOTAL S 19,875.00 S 24,050.00
20 Linens, A. 7' poly table skirt in variety of colors 15 EA S 2565 | S 384.75 No Bid No Bid S 33.00 | $ 495.00
21 Linens, B. 4' poly table skirt in a variety of colors 15 EA S 2565 | S 384.75 No Bid No Bid S 2475 | $ 371.25
22 Linens, C. 120" round poly table cover in variety of colors 50 EA S 19.05 | $ 95250 | $ 1745 | $ 87250 | S 2475 | $ 1,237.50
23 Linens, D. 60"X120" rectangular poly table cover in a variety of colors 20 EA S 13.10 [ $ 262.00 | S 12.00 | $ 240.00 | $ 2475 | $ 495.00
24 Linens, E. 90"X132" rectangular poly table cover in a variety of colors 20 EA S 18.05 | $ 361.00 | $ 16.50 | 330.00 | $ 28.05 | $ 561.00
GROUP (LINENS): SUBTOTAL S 2,345.00
26 Staging, A. 4'x4' section, 15" or 20" high, setup included 50 EA S 50.00 | $ 3,750.00 | $ 36.00 | S 1,800.00 [ $ 165.00 | $ 8,250.00
27 Staging, B. Stage steps, 4' wide with hand rails. 5 EA S 85.00 | $ 425.00 [ S 18.00 | $ 90.00 | $ 123.75($ 618.75
28 Staging, C. Stage Skirting, 7' sections 10 EA $ 2565 | S 256.50 | $ 7.00|$ 70.00 | $ 8250 | $ 825.00
GROUP (STAGING): SUBTOTAL S 4,431.50 S 1,960.00
29 Spandex A. Spandex Table Cover, for 8' tables 40 EA S 4260 | S 1,704.00 | $ 1350 | $ 540.00 | $ 11.55|$ 462.00
30 Spandex B. Spandex Table Cover, for 36" round high boy tables 75 EA S 3590 | $ 2,692.50 | $ 20.00 | S 1,500.00 | $ 1155 | $ 866.25
GROUP (SPANDEX): SUBTOTAL S 4,396.50 S 2,040.00
33 Lighting, C. 10'X10' Light Kit, hung inside tent 10 EA S 25.00 | $ 250.00 | $ 100.00 | $ 1,000.00 | $ 49.50 | $ 495.00
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34 Lighting, D. 20'X30' Light Kit, hung inside tents 5 EA S 35.00 | $ 175.00 | $ 150.00 | $ 750.00 [ $ 165.00 | $ 825.00
GROUP (LIGHTING): SUBTOTAL S 425.00 S 1,750.00
OPTIONAL ITEMS
36 Miscellaneous, A. Rolling Portable Bar 5 EA $ 110.00 550.00| $ 95.00 | $ 475.00 | $ 330.00 |3 1,650.00
4 Chairs, D. Barstool, wooden with padded seat 200 EA S 8.00 1,600.00( $ 6.00 | $ 1,200.00 | S 16.50 | $ 3,300.00
5 Umbrellas, A. Clean white with stand. Must fit 48" round table 150 EA S 20.00 3,000.00| $ 18.00 | $ 2,700.00 | S 49.50 | $ 7,425.00
25 Group V: Linens, F. Table Sash in a variety of colors 20 EA S 10.50 210.00| $ 250 (S 50.00 | S 19.80 | $ 396.00
31 Lighting, A. Hurricane lanterns, candles with glass covers 20 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
32 Lighting, B. 4 PAR 64 Light Trees 5 EA No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
35 Flooring, A. Outdoor flooring, 4'X8' sheets 40 EA S 54.00 [ $ 2,160.00 [ $ 34.00 | $ 1,360.00 | S 49.50 | $ 1,980.00
GROUP (OPTIONAL ITEMS): SUBTOTAL 7,520 $ 5,785.00 S 14,751.00
AWARD GROUP TOTAL $ 22,645.00 $ 89,565.00 SEE COMMENTS
Comments:
*NON-RESONSIVE:
Vendor conditioned bid response with
a minimum order quantity which was
not a requirement of the ITB.
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