CITY OF FORT LAUDERDALE
GRANT PRE-APPLICATION FORM

GRANT PROGRAM INFORMATION

Grant Agency:

Florida Inland Navigation District

Grant Program Title

Waterways Assistance Program

Grant Period:

October 1, 2024 - September 30, 2026

Application Due Date:

April 1, 2024

Grant Website:

www.aicw.org

Grantor Contact:

Chris Kelly, Assistant Executive Director

Address:

1314 Marcinski Rd. Jupiter, Fl 33477

Phone:

561-627-3386

Fax:

N/A

Email:

PROJECT INFORMATION

ckelly@aicw.org

Project Title:

Riverland Woods Boat Launch Ramp Improvements PH1

Grant Administration
(Direct Costs):
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GRANT PRE-APPLICATION FORM

Riverland Woods Boat Launch Ramp was given to the City in 2009 via a grant
from Broward County. In 2011 some ramp improvement were completed
including a new ramp, new staging docks and repaving of the access road and
turning area. The use of this launch ramp has increased since then and the
City has been asked by the Lauderdale Isles Civic improvement Association to
improve the ramp by widening it and adding floating staging docks.

Grant Amount Requested: $75,000

Match Amount and Source: | $75 000 + $30k Eng. Fees - City Grant Match
Grant Project Budget: $180,000

Proposed Grant Budget by Line Item. Include any allowable Direct
Administrative Costs

Revenue Expenses
$75,000 FIND $150,000 Grant and Match
$75,000/ Gen Fd Match Acc $ 30,000 Int. Eng Fees

$ 180,000 Project Budget
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GRANT PRE-APPLICATION FORM

Major Conditions and Deliverables:

The funding provided for Phase | Design and Permitting of the Riverland
Woods Launch Ramp improvements of $75,000 Grant Funds. A $75,000 City
Match and internal engineering fees of $30,000 (not grant eligible) will be
required.

Per the grant requirements, land based development project shall be dedicated
for public recreational and use must be dedicated for 25 years.

A municipality shall approve the submission of an application by official
resolution of the City Commission.

Project Manager: Jonathan Luscomb

Other department(s) impacted by grant: Public Works Engineering

Has the City received this grant in the past? 1.5M

Yes™ No [ Year: | 2023 Amount:$‘

Originating Department Comments:

If awarded, this grant will be available for use in October 1, 2024.

Prepared by: Jonathan Luscomb

Approved by (Department Director): MW 2,
DEPARTMENT REVIEW/APPROVAL
Page 3 (Rev. Jan 2016) CAM é;‘h?;f?

Page 3 of 6



GRANT PRE-APPLICATION FORM

City Attorney's Comments:

Signature: Date:

Budget Division Comments:
- The City will only be reimbursed for this planning grant if the project is constructed. There is
no funding in place for the construction of the project.
- The grant match for this project includes the following General Fund requirements:
- $105,000 - Phase 1 Design Grant ($75K for the grant, $30K for project management fees)
- $280,000 - Potential Phase 2 Construction Grant ($200K Grant; $80K Project Management)

Signature: ‘ k(JJUJ N\Qﬁg\iﬂkﬁ Date: | 1/29/2024

Grants Administration Comments:
The grant requires a 50% grant match from the General Fund if we are awarded this

grant. This project will require engineering fees that cannot be covered by the grant award
- this will also require funding from the General Fund. The funding will be made available
for expenditure on Oct 1st, 2024.

Recommend approval.

| Tomdeka MeGibbon Date: | 01/23/2024

Signature:

City Manager Comments:

7 Date: |Feb 7,2024

S|g n atu re: leregthavarria (Feb 7,2024 23:07 EST)
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From: Tamieka McGibbon

To: Yvette Matthews

Subject: FW: Riverland Grant Pre Application
Date: Wednesday, January 24, 2024 9:51:24 AM
Attachments: image001.png

Please see below responses from Jonathan and Enrique for the Riverland project. Jonathan’s

conservative estimate is $400,000.

Regards,

Tamieka McGibbon

Principal Budget and Management Analyst

City of Fort Lauderdale

Office of Management and Budget — Budget/CIP & Grants

954-828-5927 | cell 954-559-0372 | tmcgibbon@fortlauderdale.gov

From: Enrique Sanchez <ESanchez@fortlauderdale.gov>

Sent: Wednesday, January 24, 2024 9:49 AM

To: Jonathan Luscomb <JLuscomb@fortlauderdale.gov>; Tamieka McGibbon
<TMcGibbon@fortlauderdale.gov>

Subject: RE: Riverland Grant Pre Application

It is not. We would be seeking grants for construction as well and as of now would need grant
match dollars to assist with the match.

From: Jonathan Luscomb <JLuscomb@fortlauderdale.gov>
Sent: Wednesday, January 24, 2024 8:55 AM

To: Tamieka McGibbon <TMcGibbon@fortlauderdale.gov>
Cc: Enrique Sanchez <ESanchez@fortlauderdale.gov>
Subject: RE: Riverland Grant Pre Application

That would be and Enrique question. | don’t know.

From: Tamieka McGibbon <TMcGibbon@fortlauderdale.gov>
Sent: Wednesday, January 24, 2024 8:54 AM
To: Jonathan Luscomb <JLuscomb@fortlauderdale.gov>

Cc: Enrique Sanchez <ESanchez@fortlauderdale.gov>
Subject: RE: Riverland Grant Pre Application

Thanks Jonathan. Would you be able to advise if fundingis in place?

Tamieka McGibbon

Principal Budget and Management Analyst

City of Fort Lauderdale

Office of Management and Budget — Budget/CIP & Grants

954-828-5927 | cell 954-559-0372 | tmcgibbon@fortlauderdale.gov
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