Tabulation Of Bids

Event # :

Version:

Name

Description

386
6

Turf Grass Maintenance SW

hereinafter referred to as the Contractor or Bidder, to provide turf grass maintenance services for the

: The City of Fort Lauderdale, Florida (City) is seeking bids from qualified, experienced, and licensed firm(s),

southwest quadrant for the City, in accordance with the terms, conditions, and specifications contained in

this Invitation to Bid (ITB).

To be considered for award, Contractor must bid on all lines for the full quantity of each line. Contractor

must bid on all items. Partial bids will not be considered.

Open Date: 10/21/2024 10:00:00 AM Close Date: 11/05/2024 02:00:00 PM
Event Currency: USD
Supplier Bid Amount
SFM Landscape 516,887.50

November 8, 2024

Services, LLC.

7500 NW 74 Avenue
Medley, FL 33166

VisualScape, Inc. 464,334.70

17801 NW 137th Ave
Miami, FL 33018

NJ&S Pressure 0.00
Washing and
Painting, LLC

3564NW 39th Street
Lauderdale Lakes, FL 33309-4843

** Supplier has responses with a no bid

Rock & Rose Lawn 209,368.00
Care LLC

26251 sw 187th ave
homestead, FL 33031
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Tabulation Of Bids For Event # 386: Turf Grass Maintenance SW

Items
Item: MOW SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: Broward Blvd medians from 1-95 to 441
Unit of EA Quantity: 26.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 26.0000 2,880.000 74,880.00
VisualScape, Inc. 26.0000 258.000 6,708.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 26.0000 45.000 1,170.00
Item: HEDGE SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: Broward Blvd medians from [-95 to 441
Unit of EA Quantity: 15.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 15.0000 324.000 4,860.00
VisualScape, Inc. 15.0000 1,332.800 19,992.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 15.0000 260.000 3,900.00
Item: ADDT'L WEED & TRASH SVC-SEE NOTE
Description: Broward Blvd medians from I-95 to 441
Unit of EA Quantity: 11.0000
Measure:
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Tabulation Of Bids For Event # 386: Turf Grass Maintenance SW

Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 11.0000 280.000 3,080.00
VisualScape, Inc. 11.0000 222.000 2,442.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 11.0000 65.000 715.00

Item: FERTILIZER SERVICE - SEE NOTES

Description: Broward Blvd medians from |-95 to 441

Unit of EA Quantity: 2.0000
Measure:

Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 2.0000 864.000 1,728.00
VisualScape, Inc. 2.0000 225.000 450.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 2.0000 60.000 120.00

Item: PRE-EMERGENT SERVICE - SEE NOTES

Description: Broward Blvd medians from I-95 to 441

Unit of EA Quantity: 1.0000
Measure:

Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 1.0000 864.000 864.00
VisualScape, Inc. 1.0000 360.000 360.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 1.0000 40.000 40.00

Item: MULCHING SERVICE - SEE NOTES

Description: Broward Blvd medians from 1-95 to 441
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Tabulation Of Bids For Event # 386: Turf Grass Maintenance SW

Unit of EA Quantity: 2.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 2.0000 2,380.000 4,760.00
VisualScape, Inc. 2.0000 2,499.000 4,998.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 2.0000 175.000 350.00
Item: MOW SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: W Broward Blvd & 1-95 ROWs & Swales
Unit of EA Quantity: 26.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 26.0000 72.000 1,872.00
VisualScape, Inc. 26.0000 172.000 4,472.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 26.0000 70.000 1,820.00
Item: HEDGE SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: W Broward Blvd & I-95 ROWs & Swales
Unit of EA Quantity: 15.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 15.0000 72.000 1,080.00
VisualScape, Inc. 15.0000 166.600 2,499.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 15.0000 70.000 1,050.00
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Tabulation Of Bids For Event # 386: Turf Grass Maintenance SW

Item: ADDT'L WEED & TRASH SVC-SEE NOTE

Description: W Broward Blvd & I-95 ROWs & Swales

Unit of EA Quantity: 11.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 11.0000 35.000 385.00
VisualScape, Inc. 11.0000 37.000 407.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 11.0000 20.000 220.00
Item: PRE-EMERGENT SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: W Broward Blvd & I-95 ROWs & Swales
Unit of EA Quantity: 1.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 1.0000 48.000 48.00
VisualScape, Inc. 1.0000 90.000 90.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 1.0000 80.000 80.00
Item: FERTILIZER SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: W Broward Blvd & I-95 ROWs & Swales
Unit of EA Quantity: 2.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 2.0000 48.000 96.00
VisualScape, Inc. 2.0000 90.000 180.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
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Tabulation Of Bids For Event # 386: Turf Grass Maintenance SW

Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 2.0000 220.000 440.00
Item: MULCHING SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: W Broward Blvd & I-95 ROWs & Swales
Unit of EA Quantity: 2.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 2.0000 8.500 17.00
VisualScape, Inc. 2.0000 714.000 1,428.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 2.0000 85.000 170.00
Item: MOW SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: Broward Blvd medians from I-95 to Andrews Ave
Unit of EA Quantity: 26.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 26.0000 792.000 20,592.00
VisualScape, Inc. 26.0000 172.000 4,472.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 26.0000 70.000 1,820.00
Item: HEDGE SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: Broward Blvd medians from I-95 to Andrews Ave
Unit of EA Quantity: 15.0000
Measure:
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Tabulation Of Bids For Event # 386: Turf Grass Maintenance SW

Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 15.0000 1,008.000 15,120.00
VisualScape, Inc. 15.0000 333.200 4,998.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 15.0000 135.000 2,025.00

Item: ADDT'L WEED & TRASH SVC-SEE NOTE

Description: Broward Blvd medians from 1-95 to Andrews Ave

Unit of EA Quantity: 11.0000
Measure:

Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 11.0000 70.000 770.00
VisualScape, Inc. 11.0000 222.000 2,442.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 11.0000 35.000 385.00

Item: PRE-EMERGENT SERVICE - SEE NOTES

Description: Broward Blvd medians from 1-95 to Andrews Ave

Unit of EA Quantity: 1.0000
Measure:

Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 1.0000 384.000 384.00
VisualScape, Inc. 1.0000 180.000 180.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 1.0000 150.000 150.00

Item: FERTILIZER SERVICE - SEE NOTES

Description: Broward Blvd medians from 1-95 to Andrews Ave
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Tabulation Of Bids For Event # 386: Turf Grass Maintenance SW

Unit of EA Quantity: 2.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 2.0000 384.000 768.00
VisualScape, Inc. 2.0000 180.000 360.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 2.0000 400.000 800.00
Item: MULCHING SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: Broward Blvd medians from 1-95 to Andrews Ave
Unit of EA Quantity: 2.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 2.0000 297.500 595.00
VisualScape, Inc. 2.0000 2,856.000 5,712.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 2.0000 250.000 500.00
Item: MOW SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: Davie Blvd medians, swales, and ROW
Unit of EA Quantity: 26.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 26.0000 2,160.000 56,160.00
VisualScape, Inc. 26.0000 2,064.000 53,664.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 26.0000 925.000 24,050.00
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Tabulation Of Bids For Event # 386: Turf Grass Maintenance SW

Item: HEDGE SERVICE - SEE NOTES

Description: Davie Blvd medians, swales, and ROW

Unit of EA Quantity: 15.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 15.0000 504.000 7,560.00
VisualScape, Inc. 15.0000 833.000 12,495.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 15.0000 385.000 5,775.00
Item: ADDT'L WEED & TRASH SVC-SEE NOTE
Description: Davie Blvd medians, swales, and ROW
Unit of EA Quantity: 11.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 11.0000 280.000 3,080.00
VisualScape, Inc. 11.0000 296.000 3,256.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 11.0000 75.000 825.00
Item: PRE-EMERGENT SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: Davie Blvd medians, swales, and ROW
Unit of EA Quantity: 1.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 1.0000 2,400.000 2,400.00
VisualScape, Inc. 1.0000 360.000 360.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
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Tabulation Of Bids For Event # 386: Turf Grass Maintenance SW

Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 1.0000 360.000 360.00
Item: FERTILIZER SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: Davie Blvd medians, swales, and ROW
Unit of EA Quantity: 2.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 2.0000 2,400.000 4,800.00
VisualScape, Inc. 2.0000 270.000 540.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 2.0000 850.000 1,700.00
Item: MULCHING SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: Davie Blvd medians, swales, and ROW
Unit of EA Quantity: 2.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 2.0000 1,785.000 3,570.00
VisualScape, Inc. 2.0000 1,428.000 2,856.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 2.0000 2,400.000 4,800.00
Item: MOW SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: State Road 7/441 medians from Riverland Road to Davie Blvd
Unit of EA Quantity: 26.0000
Measure:
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Tabulation Of Bids For Event # 386: Turf Grass Maintenance SW

Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 26.0000 432.000 11,232.00
VisualScape, Inc. 26.0000 688.000 17,888.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 26.0000 308.000 8,008.00

Item: HEDGE SERVICE - SEE NOTES

Description: State Road 7/441 medians from Riverland Road to Davie Blvd

Unit of EA Quantity: 15.0000
Measure:

Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 15.0000 9.000 135.00
VisualScape, Inc. 15.0000 166.600 2,499.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 15.0000 1.000 15.00

Item: ADDT'L WEED & TRASH SVC-SEE NOTE

Description: State Road 7/441 medians from Riverland Road to Davie Blvd

Unit of EA Quantity: 11.0000
Measure:

Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 11.0000 35.000 385.00
VisualScape, Inc. 11.0000 111.000 1,221.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 11.0000 18.000 198.00

Item: PRE-EMERGENT SERVICE - SEE NOTES

Description: State Road 7/441 medians from Riverland Road to Davie Blvd
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Tabulation Of Bids For Event # 386: Turf Grass Maintenance SW

Unit of EA Quantity: 1.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 1.0000 288.000 288.00
VisualScape, Inc. 1.0000 90.000 90.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 1.0000 85.000 85.00
Item: FERTILIZER SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: State Road 7/441 medians from Riverland Road to Davie Blvd
Unit of EA Quantity: 2.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 2.0000 288.000 576.00
VisualScape, Inc. 2.0000 135.000 270.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 2.0000 460.000 920.00
Item: MULCHING SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: State Road 7/441 medians from Riverland Road to Davie Blvd
Unit of EA Quantity: 2.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 2.0000 4.250 8.50
VisualScape, Inc. 2.0000 714.000 1,428.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 2.0000 515.000 1,030.00
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Tabulation Of Bids For Event # 386: Turf Grass Maintenance SW

Item: MOW SERVICE - SEE NOTES

Description: State Road 84 medians ROWS and swales from 1-95 to Andrews

Unit of EA Quantity: 26.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 26.0000 1,944.000 50,544.00
VisualScape, Inc. 26.0000 1,720.000 44,720.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 26.0000 772.000 20,072.00
Item: HEDGE SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: State Road 84 medians ROWS and swales from 1-95 to Andrews
Unit of EA Quantity: 15.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 15.0000 792.000 11,880.00
VisualScape, Inc. 15.0000 666.400 9,996.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 15.0000 309.000 4,635.00
Item: ADDT'L WEED & TRASH SVC-SEE NOTE
Description: State Road 84 medians ROWS and swales from 1-95 to Andrews
Unit of EA Quantity: 11.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 11.0000 280.000 3,080.00
VisualScape, Inc. 11.0000 333.000 3,663.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
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Tabulation Of Bids For Event # 386: Turf Grass Maintenance SW

Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 11.0000 75.000 825.00
Item: PRE-EMERGENT SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: State Road 84 medians ROWS and swales from 1-95 to Andrews
Unit of EA Quantity: 1.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 1.0000 576.000 576.00
VisualScape, Inc. 1.0000 720.000 720.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 1.0000 690.000 690.00
Item: FERTILIZER SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: State Road 84 medians ROWS and swales from [-95 to Andrews
Unit of EA Quantity: 2.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 2.0000 576.000 1,152.00
VisualScape, Inc. 2.0000 225.000 450.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 2.0000 690.000 1,380.00
Item: MULCHING SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: State Road 84 medians ROWS and swales from 1-95 to Andrews
Unit of EA Quantity: 2.0000
Measure:
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Tabulation Of Bids For Event # 386: Turf Grass Maintenance SW

Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 2.0000 892.500 1,785.00
VisualScape, Inc. 2.0000 6,426.000 12,852.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 2.0000 950.000 1,900.00

Item: MOW SERVICE - SEE NOTES

Description: SW 4 Ave medians from SW 9 St. to SW 34 Avenue

Unit of EA Quantity: 26.0000
Measure:

Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 26.0000 1,008.000 26,208.00
VisualScape, Inc. 26.0000 1,032.000 26,832.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 26.0000 465.000 12,090.00

Item: HEDGE SERVICE - SEE NOTES

Description: SW 4 Ave medians from SW 9 St. to SW 34 Avenue

Unit of EA Quantity: 15.0000
Measure:

Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 15.0000 7.200 108.00
VisualScape, Inc. 15.0000 41.650 624.75
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 15.0000 19.000 285.00

Item: ADDT'L WEED & TRASH SVC-SEE NOTE

Description: SW 4 Ave medians from SW 9 St. to SW 34 Avenue
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Tabulation Of Bids For Event # 386: Turf Grass Maintenance SW

Unit of EA Quantity: 11.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 11.0000 140.000 1,540.00
VisualScape, Inc. 11.0000 148.000 1,628.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 11.0000 39.000 429.00
Item: PRE-EMERGENT SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: SW 4 Ave medians from SW 9 St. to SW 34 Avenue
Unit of EA Quantity: 1.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 1.0000 1,440.000 1,440.00
VisualScape, Inc. 1.0000 180.000 180.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 1.0000 175.000 175.00
Item: FERTILIZER SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: SW 4 Ave medians from SW 9 St. to SW 34 Avenue
Unit of EA Quantity: 2.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 2.0000 1,440.000 2,880.00
VisualScape, Inc. 2.0000 112.500 225.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 2.0000 500.000 1,000.00
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Tabulation Of Bids For Event # 386: Turf Grass Maintenance SW

Item: MULCHING SERVICE - SEE NOTES

Description: SW 4 Ave medians from SW 9 St. to SW 34 Avenue

Unit of EA Quantity: 2.0000
Measure:

Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 2.0000 595.000 1,190.00
VisualScape, Inc. 2.0000 714.000 1,428.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 2.0000 1,445.000 2,890.00

Item: MOW SERVICE - SEE NOTES

Description: SW 2 Ave medians, from State Road 84 to SW 33 St

Unit of EA Quantity: 26.0000
Measure:

Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 26.0000 360.000 9,360.00
VisualScape, Inc. 26.0000 344.000 8,944.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 26.0000 155.000 4,030.00

Item: HEDGE SERVICE - SEE NOTES

Description: SW 2 Ave medians, from State Road 84 to SW 33 St

Unit of EA Quantity: 15.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 15.0000 7.200 108.00
VisualScape, Inc. 15.0000 83.300 1,249.50
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
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Tabulation Of Bids For Event # 386: Turf Grass Maintenance SW

Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 15.0000 1.000 15.00
Item: ADDT'L WEED & TRASH SVC-SEE NOTE
Description: SW 2 Ave medians, from State Road 84 to SW 33 St
Unit of EA Quantity: 11.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 11.0000 35.000 385.00
VisualScape, Inc. 11.0000 74.000 814.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 11.0000 20.000 220.00
Item: PRE-EMERGENT SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: SW 2 Ave medians, from State Road 84 to SW 33 St
Unit of EA Quantity: 1.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 1.0000 288.000 288.00
VisualScape, Inc. 1.0000 90.000 90.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 1.0000 85.000 85.00
Item: FERTILIZER SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: SW 2 Ave medians, from State Road 84 to SW 33 St
Unit of EA Quantity: 2.0000
Measure:
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Tabulation Of Bids For Event # 386: Turf Grass Maintenance SW

Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 2.0000 288.000 576.00
VisualScape, Inc. 2.0000 90.000 180.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 2.0000 230.000 460.00

Item: MULCHING SERVICE - SEE NOTES

Description: SW 2 Ave medians, from State Road 84 to SW 33 St

Unit of EA Quantity: 2.0000
Measure:

Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 2.0000 127.500 255.00
VisualScape, Inc. 2.0000 357.000 714.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 2.0000 1.000 2.00

Item: MOW SERVICE - SEE NOTES

Description: SW 17 Street, medians from Andrews Ave to SW 4 Ave

Unit of EA Quantity: 26.0000
Measure:

Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 26.0000 144.000 3,744.00
VisualScape, Inc. 26.0000 86.000 2,236.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 26.0000 39.000 1,014.00

Item: HEDGE SERVICE - SEE NOTES

Description: SW 17 Street, medians from Andrews Ave to SW 4 Ave
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Tabulation Of Bids For Event # 386: Turf Grass Maintenance SW

Unit of EA Quantity: 15.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 15.0000 36.000 540.00
VisualScape, Inc. 15.0000 41.650 624.75
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 15.0000 20.000 300.00
Item: ADDT'L WEED & TRASH SVC-SEE NOTE
Description: SW 17 Street, medians from Andrews Ave to SW 4 Ave
Unit of EA Quantity: 11.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 11.0000 35.000 385.00
VisualScape, Inc. 11.0000 37.000 407.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 11.0000 20.000 220.00
Item: PRE-EMERGENT SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: SW 17 Street, medians from Andrews Ave to SW 4 Ave
Unit of EA Quantity: 1.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 1.0000 288.000 288.00
VisualScape, Inc. 1.0000 45.000 45.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 1.0000 44.000 44.00
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Tabulation Of Bids For Event # 386: Turf Grass Maintenance SW

Item: FERTILIZER SERVICE - SEE NOTES

Description: SW 17 Street, medians from Andrews Ave to SW 4 Ave

Unit of EA Quantity: 2.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 2.0000 288.000 576.00
VisualScape, Inc. 2.0000 45.000 90.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 2.0000 117.000 234.00
Item: MULCHING SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: SW 17 Street, medians from Andrews Ave to SW 4 Ave
Unit of EA Quantity: 2.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 2.0000 63.750 127.50
VisualScape, Inc. 2.0000 178.500 357.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 2.0000 100.000 200.00
Item: MOW SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: SW 28 Way canal end at SW 17 Street
Unit of EA Quantity: 26.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 26.0000 72.000 1,872.00
VisualScape, Inc. 26.0000 43.000 1,118.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
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Tabulation Of Bids For Event # 386: Turf Grass Maintenance SW

Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 26.0000 20.000 520.00
Item: MOW SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: SW 6 St medians between Riverland Rd and Riverland Dr
Unit of EA Quantity: 26.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 26.0000 36.000 936.00
VisualScape, Inc. 26.0000 172.000 4,472.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 26.0000 75.000 1,950.00
Item: HEDGE SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: SW 6 St medians between Riverland Rd and Riverland Dr
Unit of EA Quantity: 15.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 15.0000 18.000 270.00
VisualScape, Inc. 15.0000 83.300 1,249.50
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 15.0000 45.000 675.00
Item: ADDT'L WEED & TRASH SVC-SEE NOTE
Description: SW 6 St medians between Riverland Rd and Riverland Dr
Unit of EA Quantity: 11.0000
Measure:
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Tabulation Of Bids For Event # 386: Turf Grass Maintenance SW

Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 11.0000 35.000 385.00
VisualScape, Inc. 11.0000 37.000 407.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 11.0000 20.000 220.00

Item: PRE-EMERGENT SERVICE - SEE NOTES

Description: SW 6 St medians between Riverland Rd and Riverland Dr

Unit of EA Quantity: 1.0000
Measure:

Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 1.0000 48.000 48.00
VisualScape, Inc. 1.0000 90.000 90.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 1.0000 87.000 87.00

Item: FERTILIZER SERVICE - SEE NOTES

Description: SW 6 St medians between Riverland Rd and Riverland Dr

Unit of EA Quantity: 2.0000
Measure:

Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 2.0000 48.000 96.00
VisualScape, Inc. 2.0000 45.000 90.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 2.0000 117.000 234.00

Item: MULCHING SERVICE - SEE NOTES

Description: SW 6 St medians between Riverland Rd and Riverland Dr
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Tabulation Of Bids For Event # 386: Turf Grass Maintenance SW

Unit of EA Quantity: 2.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 2.0000 4.250 8.50
VisualScape, Inc. 2.0000 178.500 357.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 2.0000 87.000 174.00
Item: MOW SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: SW 2 St medians
Unit of EA Quantity: 26.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 26.0000 144.000 3,744.00
VisualScape, Inc. 26.0000 172.000 4,472.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 26.0000 75.000 1,950.00
Item: HEDGE SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: SW 2 St medians
Unit of EA Quantity: 15.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 15.0000 9.000 135.00
VisualScape, Inc. 15.0000 83.300 1,249.50
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 15.0000 35.000 525.00
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Tabulation Of Bids For Event # 386: Turf Grass Maintenance SW

Item: ADDT'L WEED & TRASH SVC-SEE NOTE

Description: SW 2 St medians

Unit of EA Quantity: 11.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 11.0000 35.000 385.00
VisualScape, Inc. 11.0000 18.500 203.50
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 11.0000 20.000 220.00
Item: PRE-EMERGENT SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: SW 2 St medians
Unit of EA Quantity: 1.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 1.0000 144.000 144.00
VisualScape, Inc. 1.0000 45.000 45.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 1.0000 45.000 45.00
Item: FERTILIZER SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: SW 2 St medians
Unit of EA Quantity: 2.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 2.0000 144.000 288.00
VisualScape, Inc. 2.0000 45.000 90.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
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Tabulation Of Bids For Event # 386: Turf Grass Maintenance SW

Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 2.0000 117.000 234.00
Item: MULCHING SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: SW 2 St medians
Unit of EA Quantity: 2.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 2.0000 4.250 8.50
VisualScape, Inc. 2.0000 714.000 1,428.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 2.0000 35.000 70.00
Item: MOW SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: SW 11 Court medians
Unit of EA Quantity: 26.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 26.0000 432.000 11,232.00
VisualScape, Inc. 26.0000 86.000 2,236.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 26.0000 45.000 1,170.00
Item: HEDGE SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: SW 11 Court medians
Unit of EA Quantity: 15.0000
Measure:
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Tabulation Of Bids For Event # 386: Turf Grass Maintenance SW

Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 15.0000 18.000 270.00
VisualScape, Inc. 15.0000 20.830 312.45
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 15.0000 1.000 15.00

Item: ADDT'L WEED & TRASH SVC-SEE NOTE

Description: SW 11 Court medians

Unit of EA Quantity: 11.0000
Measure:

Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 11.0000 35.000 385.00
VisualScape, Inc. 11.0000 111.000 1,221.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 11.0000 20.000 220.00

Item: PRE-EMERGENT SERVICE - SEE NOTES

Description: SW 11 Court medians

Unit of EA Quantity: 1.0000
Measure:

Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 1.0000 288.000 288.00
VisualScape, Inc. 1.0000 90.000 90.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 1.0000 87.000 87.00

Item: FERTILIZER SERVICE - SEE NOTES

Description: SW 11 Court medians
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Tabulation Of Bids For Event # 386: Turf Grass Maintenance SW

Unit of EA Quantity: 2.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 2.0000 288.000 576.00
VisualScape, Inc. 2.0000 90.000 180.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 2.0000 234.000 468.00
Item: MULCHING SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: SW 11 Court medians
Unit of EA Quantity: 2.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 2.0000 595.000 1,190.00
VisualScape, Inc. 2.0000 1,428.000 2,856.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 2.0000 130.000 260.00
Item: MOW SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: West Park Drive medians
Unit of EA Quantity: 26.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 26.0000 432.000 11,232.00
VisualScape, Inc. 26.0000 43.000 1,118.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 26.0000 20.000 520.00
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Tabulation Of Bids For Event # 386: Turf Grass Maintenance SW

Item: HEDGE SERVICE - SEE NOTES

Description: West Park Drive medians

Unit of EA Quantity: 15.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 15.0000 18.000 270.00
VisualScape, Inc. 15.0000 24.990 374.85
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 15.0000 1.000 15.00
Item: ADDT'L WEED & TRASH SVC-SEE NOTE
Description: West Park Drive medians
Unit of EA Quantity: 11.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 11.0000 35.000 385.00
VisualScape, Inc. 11.0000 18.500 203.50
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 11.0000 20.000 220.00
Item: PRE-EMERGENT SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: West Park Drive medians
Unit of EA Quantity: 1.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 1.0000 192.000 192.00
VisualScape, Inc. 1.0000 90.000 90.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
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Tabulation Of Bids For Event # 386: Turf Grass Maintenance SW

Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 1.0000 88.000 88.00
Item: FERTILIZER SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: West Park Drive medians
Unit of EA Quantity: 2.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 2.0000 192.000 384.00
VisualScape, Inc. 2.0000 90.000 180.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 2.0000 234.000 468.00
Item: MULCHING SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: West Park Drive medians
Unit of EA Quantity: 2.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 2.0000 212.500 425.00
VisualScape, Inc. 2.0000 357.000 714.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 2.0000 127.000 254.00
Item: MOW SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: SW 15 Ave medians
Unit of EA Quantity: 26.0000
Measure:
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Tabulation Of Bids For Event # 386: Turf Grass Maintenance SW

Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 26.0000 288.000 7,488.00
VisualScape, Inc. 26.0000 86.000 2,236.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 26.0000 45.000 1,170.00
Item: HEDGE SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: SW 15 Ave medians
Unit of EA Quantity: 15.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 15.0000 36.000 540.00
VisualScape, Inc. 15.0000 20.830 312.45
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 15.0000 15.000 225.00
Item: ADDT'L WEED & TRASH SVC-SEE NOTE
Description: SW 15 Ave medians
Unit of EA Quantity: 11.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 11.0000 35.000 385.00
VisualScape, Inc. 11.0000 74.000 814.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 11.0000 24.000 264.00
Item: PRE-EMERGENT SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: SW 15 Ave medians
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Tabulation Of Bids For Event # 386: Turf Grass Maintenance SW

Unit of EA Quantity: 1.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 1.0000 240.000 240.00
VisualScape, Inc. 1.0000 45.000 45.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 1.0000 45.000 45.00
Item: FERTILIZER SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: SW 15 Ave medians
Unit of EA Quantity: 2.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 2.0000 240.000 480.00
VisualScape, Inc. 2.0000 45.000 90.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 2.0000 117.000 234.00
Item: MULCHING SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: SW 15 Ave medians
Unit of EA Quantity: 2.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 2.0000 595.000 1,190.00
VisualScape, Inc. 2.0000 714.000 1,428.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 2.0000 65.000 130.00
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Tabulation Of Bids For Event # 386: Turf Grass Maintenance SW

Item: MOW SERVICE - SEE NOTES

Description: SW 36 Terrace medians from SW 16 St to SW 17 St

Unit of EA Quantity: 26.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 26.0000 144.000 3,744.00
VisualScape, Inc. 26.0000 43.000 1,118.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 26.0000 20.000 520.00
Item: HEDGE SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: SW 36 Terrace medians from SW 16 St to SW 17 St
Unit of EA Quantity: 15.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 15.0000 72.000 1,080.00
VisualScape, Inc. 15.0000 20.830 312.45
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 15.0000 15.000 225.00
Item: ADDT'L WEED & TRASH SVC-SEE NOTE
Description: SW 36 Terrace medians from SW 16 St to SW 17 St
Unit of EA Quantity: 11.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 11.0000 35.000 385.00
VisualScape, Inc. 11.0000 9.250 101.75
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
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Tabulation Of Bids For Event # 386: Turf Grass Maintenance SW

Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 11.0000 15.000 165.00
Item: PRE-EMERGENT SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: SW 36 Terrace medians from SW 16 St to SW 17 St
Unit of EA Quantity: 1.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 1.0000 192.000 192.00
VisualScape, Inc. 1.0000 45.000 45.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 1.0000 45.000 45.00
Item: FERTILIZER SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: SW 36 Terrace medians from SW 16 St to SW 17 St
Unit of EA Quantity: 2.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 2.0000 192.000 384.00
VisualScape, Inc. 2.0000 22.500 45.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 2.0000 65.000 130.00
Item: MULCHING SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: SW 36 Terrace medians from SW 16 St to SW 17 St
Unit of EA Quantity: 2.0000
Measure:
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Tabulation Of Bids For Event # 386: Turf Grass Maintenance SW

Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 2.0000 212.500 425.00
VisualScape, Inc. 2.0000 178.500 357.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 2.0000 65.000 130.00
Item: MOW SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: 220 SW 14 Ave - Parks Compound
Unit of EA Quantity: 26.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 26.0000 1,296.000 33,696.00
VisualScape, Inc. 26.0000 1,376.000 35,776.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 26.0000 615.000 15,990.00
Item: HEDGE SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: 220 SW 14 Ave - Parks Compound
Unit of EA Quantity: 15.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 15.0000 576.000 8,640.00
VisualScape, Inc. 15.0000 666.400 9,996.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 15.0000 310.000 4,650.00
Item: ADDT'L WEED & TRASH SVC-SEE NOTE
Description: 220 SW 14 Ave - Parks Compound
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Tabulation Of Bids For Event # 386: Turf Grass Maintenance SW

Unit of EA Quantity: 11.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 11.0000 105.000 1,155.00
VisualScape, Inc. 11.0000 111.000 1,221.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 11.0000 75.000 825.00
Item: PRE-EMERGENT SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: 220 SW 14 Ave - Parks Compound
Unit of EA Quantity: 1.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 1.0000 144.000 144.00
VisualScape, Inc. 1.0000 360.000 360.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 1.0000 350.000 350.00
Item: FERTILIZER SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: 220 SW 14 Ave - Parks Compound
Unit of EA Quantity: 2.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 2.0000 1,461.000 2,922.00
VisualScape, Inc. 2.0000 90.000 180.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 2.0000 468.000 936.00
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Tabulation Of Bids For Event # 386: Turf Grass Maintenance SW

Item: MULCHING SERVICE - SEE NOTES

Description: 220 SW 14 Ave - Parks Compound

Unit of EA Quantity: 2.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 2.0000 595.000 1,190.00
VisualScape, Inc. 2.0000 1,428.000 2,856.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 2.0000 940.000 1,880.00
Item: MOW SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: 1350 W Broward Blvd - City Admin Lot
Unit of EA Quantity: 26.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 26.0000 504.000 13,104.00
VisualScape, Inc. 26.0000 688.000 17,888.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 26.0000 310.000 8,060.00
Item: HEDGE SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: 1350 W Broward Blvd - City Admin Lot
Unit of EA Quantity: 15.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 15.0000 288.000 4,320.00
VisualScape, Inc. 15.0000 333.200 4,998.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
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Tabulation Of Bids For Event # 386: Turf Grass Maintenance SW

Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 15.0000 150.000 2,250.00
Item: ADDT'L WEED & TRASH SVC-SEE NOTE
Description: 1350 W Broward Blvd - City Admin Lot
Unit of EA Quantity: 11.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 11.0000 35.000 385.00
VisualScape, Inc. 11.0000 74.000 814.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 11.0000 45.000 495.00
Item: PRE-EMERGENT SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: 1350 W Broward Blvd - City Admin Lot
Unit of EA Quantity: 1.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 1.0000 192.000 192.00
VisualScape, Inc. 1.0000 360.000 360.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 1.0000 350.000 350.00
Item: FERTILIZER SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: 1350 W Broward Blvd - City Admin Lot
Unit of EA Quantity: 2.0000
Measure:
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Tabulation Of Bids For Event # 386: Turf Grass Maintenance SW

Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 2.0000 192.000 384.00
VisualScape, Inc. 2.0000 135.000 270.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 2.0000 350.000 700.00

Item: MULCHING SERVICE - SEE NOTES

Description: 1350 W Broward Blvd - City Admin Lot

Unit of EA Quantity: 2.0000
Measure:

Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 2.0000 297.500 595.00
VisualScape, Inc. 2.0000 714.000 1,428.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 2.0000 135.000 270.00

Item: MOW SERVICE - SEE NOTES

Description: 1300 W Broward Blvd - Police Department including tower

Unit of EA Quantity: 26.0000
Measure:

Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 26.0000 792.000 20,592.00
VisualScape, Inc. 26.0000 1,720.000 44,720.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 26.0000 772.000 20,072.00

Item: HEDGE SERVICE - SEE NOTES

Description: 1300 W Broward Blvd - Police Department including tower
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Tabulation Of Bids For Event # 386: Turf Grass Maintenance SW

Unit of EA Quantity: 15.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 15.0000 36.000 540.00
VisualScape, Inc. 15.0000 1,332.800 19,992.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 15.0000 590.000 8,850.00
Item: ADDT'L WEED & TRASH SVC-SEE NOTE
Description: 1300 W Broward Blvd - Police Department including tower
Unit of EA Quantity: 11.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 11.0000 70.000 770.00
VisualScape, Inc. 11.0000 111.000 1,221.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 11.0000 75.000 825.00
Item: PRE-EMERGENT SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: 1300 W Broward Blvd - Police Department including tower
Unit of EA Quantity: 1.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 1.0000 240.000 240.00
VisualScape, Inc. 1.0000 540.000 540.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 1.0000 520.000 520.00
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Tabulation Of Bids For Event # 386: Turf Grass Maintenance SW

Item: FERTILIZER SERVICE - SEE NOTES

Description: 1300 W Broward Blvd - Police Department including tower

Unit of EA Quantity: 2.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 2.0000 240.000 480.00
VisualScape, Inc. 2.0000 112.500 225.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 2.0000 575.000 1,150.00
Item: MULCHING SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: 1300 W Broward Blvd - Police Department including tower
Unit of EA Quantity: 2.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 2.0000 595.000 1,190.00
VisualScape, Inc. 2.0000 357.000 714.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 2.0000 1,925.000 3,850.00
Item: MOW SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: SW 14 Ave swale on west side from SW 3 Ct to 425 SW 14 Ave
Unit of EA Quantity: 26.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 26.0000 144.000 3,744.00
VisualScape, Inc. 26.0000 21.500 559.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
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Tabulation Of Bids For Event # 386: Turf Grass Maintenance SW

Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 26.0000 12.000 312.00
Item: HEDGE SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: SW 14 Ave swale on west side from SW 3 Ct to 425 SW 14 Ave
Unit of EA Quantity: 15.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 15.0000 72.000 1,080.00
VisualScape, Inc. 15.0000 24.990 374.85
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 15.0000 1.000 15.00
Item: ADDT'L WEED & TRASH SVC-SEE NOTE
Description: SW 14 Ave swale on west side from SW 3 Ct to 425 SW 14 Ave
Unit of EA Quantity: 11.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 11.0000 35.000 385.00
VisualScape, Inc. 11.0000 3.700 40.70
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 11.0000 12.000 132.00
Item: PRE-EMERGENT SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: SW 14 Ave swale on west side from SW 3 Ct to 425 SW 14 Ave
Unit of EA Quantity: 1.0000
Measure:
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Tabulation Of Bids For Event # 386: Turf Grass Maintenance SW

Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 1.0000 144.000 144.00
VisualScape, Inc. 1.0000 45.000 45.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 1.0000 50.000 50.00
Item: FERTILIZER SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: SW 14 Ave swale on west side from SW 3 Ct to 425 SW 14 Ave
Unit of EA Quantity: 2.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 2.0000 144.000 288.00
VisualScape, Inc. 2.0000 11.250 22.50
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 2.0000 30.000 60.00
Item: MULCHING SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: SW 14 Ave swale on west side from SW 3 Ct to 425 SW 14 Ave
Unit of EA Quantity: 2.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 2.0000 212.500 425.00
VisualScape, Inc. 2.0000 35.700 71.40
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 2.0000 1.000 2.00
Item: MOW SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: SW 37 Ave and SW 14 St street-end
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Tabulation Of Bids For Event # 386: Turf Grass Maintenance SW

Unit of EA Quantity: 26.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 26.0000 36.000 936.00
VisualScape, Inc. 26.0000 21.500 559.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 26.0000 10.000 260.00
Item: ADDT'L WEED & TRASH SVC-SEE NOTE
Description: SW 37 Ave and SW 14 St street-end
Unit of EA Quantity: 11.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 11.0000 35.000 385.00
VisualScape, Inc. 11.0000 18.500 203.50
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 11.0000 10.000 110.00
Item: PRE-EMERGENT SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: SW 37 Ave and SW 14 St street-end
Unit of EA Quantity: 1.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 1.0000 48.000 48.00
VisualScape, Inc. 1.0000 45.000 45.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 1.0000 45.000 45.00
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Tabulation Of Bids For Event # 386: Turf Grass Maintenance SW

Item: FERTILIZER SERVICE - SEE NOTES

Description: SW 37 Ave and SW 14 St street-end

Unit of EA Quantity: 2.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 2.0000 48.000 96.00
VisualScape, Inc. 2.0000 22.500 45.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 2.0000 1.000 2.00
Item: MULCHING SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: SW 37 Ave and SW 14 St street-end
Unit of EA Quantity: 2.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 2.0000 25.500 51.00
VisualScape, Inc. 2.0000 71.400 142.80
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 2.0000 1.000 2.00
Item: MOW SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: SW 38 Ave and SW 14 St street-end
Unit of EA Quantity: 26.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 26.0000 36.000 936.00
VisualScape, Inc. 26.0000 21.500 559.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
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Tabulation Of Bids For Event # 386: Turf Grass Maintenance SW

Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 26.0000 10.000 260.00
Item: ADDT'L WEED & TRASH SVC-SEE NOTE
Description: SW 38 Ave and SW 14 St street-end
Unit of EA Quantity: 11.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 11.0000 35.000 385.00
VisualScape, Inc. 11.0000 18.500 203.50
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 11.0000 10.000 110.00
Item: PRE-EMERGENT SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: SW 38 Ave and SW 14 St street-end
Unit of EA Quantity: 1.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 1.0000 48.000 48.00
VisualScape, Inc. 1.0000 45.000 45.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 1.0000 45.000 45.00
Item: FERTILIZER SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: SW 38 Ave and SW 14 St street-end
Unit of EA Quantity: 2.0000
Measure:
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Tabulation Of Bids For Event # 386: Turf Grass Maintenance SW

Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 2.0000 48.000 96.00
VisualScape, Inc. 2.0000 22.500 45.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 2.0000 1.000 2.00

Item: MULCHING SERVICE - SEE NOTES

Description: SW 38 Ave and SW 14 St street-end

Unit of EA Quantity: 2.0000
Measure:

Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 2.0000 4.250 8.50
VisualScape, Inc. 2.0000 71.400 142.80
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 2.0000 1.000 2.00

Item: MOW SERVICE - SEE NOTES

Description: SW 6 Ave ROW, between SW 10 St - 11 St

Unit of EA Quantity: 26.0000
Measure:

Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 26.0000 504.000 13,104.00
VisualScape, Inc. 26.0000 86.000 2,236.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 26.0000 45.000 1,170.00

Item: HEDGE SERVICE - SEE NOTES

Description: SW 6 Ave ROW, between SW 10 St - 11 St
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Tabulation Of Bids For Event # 386: Turf Grass Maintenance SW

Unit of EA Quantity: 15.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 15.0000 144.000 2,160.00
VisualScape, Inc. 15.0000 83.300 1,249.50
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 15.0000 45.000 675.00
Item: ADDT'L WEED & TRASH SVC-SEE NOTE
Description: SW 6 Ave ROW, between SW 10 St - 11 St
Unit of EA Quantity: 11.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 11.0000 35.000 385.00
VisualScape, Inc. 11.0000 37.000 407.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 11.0000 25.000 275.00
Item: PRE-EMERGENT SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: SW 6 Ave ROW, between SW 10 St - 11 St
Unit of EA Quantity: 1.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 1.0000 288.000 288.00
VisualScape, Inc. 1.0000 45.000 45.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 1.0000 45.000 45.00
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Item: FERTILIZER SERVICE - SEE NOTES

Description: SW 6 Ave ROW, between SW 10 St - 11 St

Unit of EA Quantity: 2.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 2.0000 288.000 576.00
VisualScape, Inc. 2.0000 45.000 90.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 2.0000 230.000 460.00
Item: MULCHING SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: SW 6 Ave ROW, between SW 10 St - 11 St
Unit of EA Quantity: 2.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 2.0000 595.000 1,190.00
VisualScape, Inc. 2.0000 35.700 71.40
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 2.0000 225.000 450.00
Item: MOW SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: Coconut Dr swale/seawall hedge service at SW 9 St street-end
Unit of EA Quantity: 26.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 26.0000 72.000 1,872.00
VisualScape, Inc. 26.0000 43.000 1,118.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
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Tabulation Of Bids For Event # 386: Turf Grass Maintenance SW

Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 26.0000 20.000 520.00
Item: ADDT'L WEED & TRASH SVC-SEE NOTE
Description: Coconut Dr swale/seawall hedge service at SW 9 St street-end
Unit of EA Quantity: 11.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 11.0000 35.000 385.00
VisualScape, Inc. 11.0000 37.000 407.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 11.0000 10.000 110.00
Item: PRE-EMERGENT SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: Coconut Dr swale/seawall hedge service at SW 9 St street-end
Unit of EA Quantity: 1.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 1.0000 96.000 96.00
VisualScape, Inc. 1.0000 45.000 45.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 1.0000 45.000 45.00
Item: FERTILIZER SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: Coconut Dr swale/seawall hedge service at SW 9 St street-end
Unit of EA Quantity: 2.0000
Measure:
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Tabulation Of Bids For Event # 386: Turf Grass Maintenance SW

Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 2.0000 96.000 192.00
VisualScape, Inc. 2.0000 22.500 45.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 2.0000 60.000 120.00

Item: MULCHING SERVICE - SEE NOTES

Description: Coconut Dr swale/seawall hedge service at SW 9 St street-end

Unit of EA Quantity: 2.0000
Measure:

Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 2.0000 255.000 510.00
VisualScape, Inc. 2.0000 71.400 142.80
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 2.0000 65.000 130.00

Item: MOW SERVICE - SEE NOTES

Description: 415 SW 9 St and 4 Ave Pump Station A-40

Unit of EA Quantity: 26.0000
Measure:

Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 26.0000 36.000 936.00
VisualScape, Inc. 26.0000 21.500 559.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 26.0000 12.000 312.00

Item: MOW SERVICE - SEE NOTES

Description: 626 SW 3 Ave Pump Station A-42
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Tabulation Of Bids For Event # 386: Turf Grass Maintenance SW

Unit of EA Quantity: 26.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 26.0000 36.000 936.00
VisualScape, Inc. 26.0000 21.500 559.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 26.0000 12.000 312.00
Item: MOW SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: SW 26 St and SW 6 Ave Pump Station A-39
Unit of EA Quantity: 26.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 26.0000 36.000 936.00
VisualScape, Inc. 26.0000 21.500 559.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 26.0000 12.000 312.00
Item: MOW SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: 2301 Okeechobee Lane Pump Station C-1
Unit of EA Quantity: 26.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 26.0000 36.000 936.00
VisualScape, Inc. 26.0000 21.500 559.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 26.0000 12.000 312.00
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