Vendor

Procurement Services Department
CITY OF FORT LAUDERDALE BID TABULATION

EVENT 584-3- Fireworks

Starfire Corporation

Island Outdoor
Management DBA North
Florida Pyrotechnics

Pyro Productions Inc

My Three Sons Fireworks Company LLC

City, State St. Benedict, PA Orange Park, FL Dothan, AL 36301 Boynton Beach, FL
P-Card Visa MC/Visa MC/Visa Visa
Local Busi Preference N/A N/A N/A N/A
Di: ged Busi Preference N/A N/A N/A N/A
Item # Description
1 2026 4TH OF JULY FIREWORKS No bid $139,500.00 $140,000.00 $177,000.00
2 2027 4TH OF JULY FIREWORKS No bid $144,075.00 $147,000.00 $187,620.00
3 2028 4TH OF JULY FIREWORKS No bid $148,878.75 $154,350.00 $198,878.00
4 2029 4TH OF JULY FIREWORKS No bid $153,922.68 $162,067.50 $210,810.00
5 2030 4TH OF JULY FIREWORKS No bid $159,262.81 $170,170.88 $223,459.00
Total for 4th of July Fireworks No Bid $745,639.24 $773,588.38 $997,767.00
1 2026 NYE FIREWORKS $23,200.00 $20,000.00 $18,000.00 No bid
2 2027 NYE FIREWORKS $24,360.00 $21,000.00 $19,000.00 No bid
3 2028 NYE FIREWORKS $25,578.00 $21,050.00 $20,000.00 No bid
4 2029 NYE FIREWORKS $26,856.00 $22,000.00 $21,000.00 No bid
5 2030 NYE FIREWORKS $28,198.00 $22,000.00 $22,000.00 No bid
Total for NYE Fireworks $128,192.00 $106,050.00 $100,000.00 No bid
Combined total for 4th of July and NYE Fireworks N/A $851, 689.24 $873,588.38 N/A
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