
Vendor:
ABM Building Solutions Airmatic Controls, Inc

RGEN Enterprises LLC 
dba Cool Water Air 

Conditioning

S&R Engineering Group LLC 
dba Air Changes Mechanical

Thermo Air Inc.  

Pompano Beach, FL Davie, FL Coral Gables, FL Doral, FL Hollywood, FL

DBE: N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
Item # Item Qty Unit Price Price Price Price Price

1
Maintenance, Cleaning, Sanitizing of HVAC Units - Hourly Rate, After Hours

1
HR $180.00 $142.50 No Bid $135.00 $112.50

2 Maintenance, Cleaning, Sanitizing of HVAC Units - Hourly Rate, Regular 
Hours

1
HR $120.00 $95.00 No Bid $90.00 $75.00

3 Repair, Replace, Install - Hourly Rate, Regular Hours 1 HR $120.00 $115.00 No Bid $100.00 $122.00
4 Repair, Replace, Install - Hourly Rate, After Hours 1 HR $180.00 $172.50 No Bid $150.00 $183.00
9 TOTAL $600.00 $525.00 $475.00 $492.50

10 TOTAL + $750,000 YEARLY BID ALLOWANCE $750,600.00 $750,525.00 No Bid 750,475.00 $750,492.50
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