

Item #	Item	Qty	Unit	A&B PIPE & SUPPLY INC.			HD Supply Waterworks Ltd.					Fortiline		Utility Supply Associates						
				Price	Total	Notes	Make Off	Model Off	Price	Total	Make Off	Model Offered	Price	Total	Make Offered	Model Off	Price	Total	Make Off	Model Offered
472-11941-01	3/4" Stop Curb	300	each	36.25	10875		MUELLER	25172	36.69	11007	Mueller	025172	250N	39.73	11919	AY McDonald	3/4" Stop	40.7	12210	76102Q 3/4" A.Y. McDonald
472-11941-02	1" Stop Curb	800	each	55.5	44400		MUELLER	25172	56.31	45048	Mueller	025172	330N	61.01	48808	AY McDonald	1" Stop Cu	61.97	49576	76102Q 1" A.Y. McDonald
472-11941-03	3/4" Stop Curb	350	each	32.05	11217.5		MUELLER	20283	32.44	11354	Mueller	020283	250N	35.16	12306	AY McDonald	3/4" Stop	36.07	12624.5	76101 3/4" A.Y. McDonald
472-11941-04	1" Stop Curb.	125	each	49.79	6223.75		MUELLER	20283	50.4	6300	Mueller	020283	330N	54.64	6830	AY McDonald	1" Stop Cu	56.06	7007.5	76101 1" A.Y. McDonald
472-11941-05	1 1/2" Valves Curb	150	each	102.49	15373.5		MUELLER	20283	104	15600	Mueller	020283	500N	111.9	16785	AY McDonald	1 1/2" Valv	114.8	17220	76101 1-1/2" A.Y. McDonald
472-11941-06	2" Valves Curb	125	each	150.15	18768.75		MUELLER	20283	152.16	19020	Mueller	020283	550N	163.64	20455	AY McDonald	2" Valves C	167.86	20982.5	76101 2" A.Y. McDonald
472-11941-07	1 1/2" Valve Ball Ci	500	each	139.97	69985		MUELLER	25209	142.95	71475	Mueller	025209	500N	162.77	81385	AY McDonald	1 1/2" Valv	164.62	82310	76100Q 1-1/2" A.Y. McDonald
472-11941-08	2" Valve Ball Curb	100	each	208.5	20850		MUELLER	25209	212.72	21272	Mueller	025209	550N	228.82	22882	AY McDonald	2" Valve B	231.97	23197	76100Q 2" A.Y. McDonald
472-11941-09	1 1/4" Valve Curb	50	each	0	0	MUELLER	no bid	no bid	0	0	Mueller	NO BID		89.05	4452.5	AY McDonald	1 1/4" Valv	91.48	4574	76101 1-1/4" A.Y. McDonald
472-11941-10	3/4" Corporation S	30	each	20.05	601.5		MUELLER	15008	20.4	612	Mueller	015008	250N	22.36	670.8	AY McDonald	3/4" Corpor	22.98	689.4	74701Q 3/4" A.Y. McDonald
472-11941-11	1" Corporation Sto	25	each	30.27	756.75		MUELLER	15008	30.9	772.5	Mueller	015008	330N	33.82	845.5	AY McDonald	1" Corpora	34.72	868	74701Q 1" A.Y. McDonald
472-11941-12	2" Corporation Sto	15	each	208.79	3131.85		MUELLER	15008	211.62	3174.3	Mueller	015008	550N	161.23	2418.45	AY McDonald	2" Corpora	166.17	2492.55	74701BQ 2" A.Y. McDonald
472-11941-13	1 1/2" Corporation	700	each	86.6	60620		MUELLER	25028	87.58	61306	Mueller	025028	500N	97.48	68236	AY McDonald	1 1/2" Cor	98.84	69188	74704BQ 1 1/2" A.Y. McDonald
472-11941-14	2" Corporation Sto	200	each	141.5	28300		MUELLER	25028	144.84	28968	Mueller	025028	550N	161.23	32246	AY McDonald	2" Corpora	163.43	32686	74704BQ 2" A.Y. McDonald
472-11941-15	1" Corporation Sto	1000	each	30.25	30250		MUELLER	10046	30.9	30900	Mueller	015028	330N	33.82	33820	AY McDonald	1" Corpora	34.32	34320	74704Q 1" A.Y. McDonald
472-11941-16	1" Corporation Sto	150	each	29.35	4402.5		MUELLER	10046	29.72	4458	Mueller	010046	330N	33.88	5082	AY McDonald	1" Corpora	34.24	5136	731491 1" A.Y. McDonald
472-11941-17	1-1/2" Corporation	20	each	94	1880		MUELLER	10046	95.05	1901	Mueller	010046	500N	94.32	1886.4	AY McDonald	1-1/2" Cor	96.74	1934.8	73149B 1-1/2" A.Y. McDonald
472-11941-18	2" Corporation Sto	30	each	135.5	4065		MUELLER	10046	137	4110	Mueller	010046	500N	153.55	4606.5	AY McDonald	2" Corpora	156.47	4694.1	73149B 2" A.Y. McDonald
Grand Total				\$331,701.10			\$337,277.80					\$375,634.15		\$381,710.35						

Per phone conversation with Mueller they do not make a H10283 N 1/1/4" Curb Valve. You specify no substitutions so we NO Bid this line item.