MULLINGS ENGINEERING SERVICES, LLC ODUM'S SOD, INC. SOUTH FLORIDA GRASSING, INC. SUNSET SOD, INC.
GROUP 1 ST. AUGUSTINE "FLORATAM" ST. AUGUSTINE "FLORATAM" ST. AUGUSTINE "FLORATAM" ST. AUGUSTINE “FLORATAM" ST. AUGUSTINE "FLORATAM"
NORTH CENTRAL SOUTH NORTH CENTRAL SOUTH NORTH CENTRAL  SOUTH NORTH CENTRAL  SOUTH NORTH CENTRAL  SOUTH
1.0 Under 2,000 SF, picked up by agency $0.225 $0.225 $0.225 $0.24 $0.24 $0.24 NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.21 $0.20 $0.20 $0.22 $0.22 $0.22
2.0 Under 2,000 SF, delivered & unloaded $0.225 $0.225 $0.225 $0.25 $0.26 $0.27 $2.60 $2.60 $2.60 $0.31 $0.25 $0.25 $0.24 $0.24 $0.24
2,000 SF or more - but less than truckload,
3.0 delivered& unioaded $0.225 $0.225 $0.225 $0.25 $0.26 $0.27 $0.70 $0.70 $0.70 $0.30 $0.22 $0.22 $0.22
Sod Installation - for sod provided by
40  others $0.05 $0.05 $0.05 $0.08 $0.09 $0.10 NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.5 $0.04 $0.04 $0.04
50  Sod Installation only - at time of delivery $0.05 $0.05 $0.05 $0.08 $0.09 $0.10 NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.06 $0.05 $0.05 $0.05 $0.05 $0.05
GROUP 2 ST. AUGUSTINE "PALMETTO" ST. AUGUSTINE "PALMETTO" ST. AUGUSTINE "PALMETTO" ST. AUGUSTINE "PALMETTO" ST. AUGUSTINE "PALMETTO"
NORTH CENTRAL SOUTH NORTH CENTRAL SOUTH NORTH CENTRAL  SOUTH NORTH CENTRAL SOUTH NORTH CENTRAL  SOUTH
6.0  Under 2,000 SF, picked up by agency $0.24 $0.24 $0.24 $0.25 $0.25 $0.25 NOBID NO BID NO BID $0.22 $0.22 $0.22 $0.22 $0.22 $0.22
7.0  Under 2,000 SF, delivered & unloaded $0.24 $0.24 $0.24 $0.26 $0.27 $0.28 $2.65 $2.65 $2.65 $0.32 $0.26 $0.26 $0.24 $0.24 $0.24
2,000 SF or more - but less than truckload,
8.0  delivered& unloaded $0.24 $0.24 $0.24 $0.26 $0.27 $0.28 $0.75 $0.75 $0.75 $0.31 $0.25 $0.24 $0.23 $0.23 $0.23
Sod Installation - for sod provided by
9.0  others $0.05 $0.05 $0.05 $0.08 $0.09 $0.10 NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.055 $0.035 $0.035 $0.04 $0.04 $0.04
10.0  Sod Installation only - at time of delivery $0.05 $0.05 $0.05 $0.08 $0.09 $0.10 NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.06 $0.05 $0.05 $0.05 $0.05 $0.05
GROUP 3 BAHIA "ARGENTINE" BAHIA "ARGENTINE" BAHIA "ARGENTINE" BAHIA "ARGENTINE" BAHIA "ARGENTINE"
NORTH CENTRAL SOUTH NORTH CENTRAL SOUTH NORTH CENTRAL  SOUTH NORTH CENTRAL SOUTH NORTH CENTRAL SOUTH
11.0  Under 2,000 SF, picked up by agency $0.16 $0.16 $0.16 $0.17 $0.17 $0.17 NO BID NO BID NOBID $0.15 $0.14 $0.14 $0.15 $0.15 $0.15
12.0  Under 2,000 SF, delivered & unloaded $0.16 $0.16 $0.16 $0.18 $0.19 $0.20 NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.30 $0.23 $0.22 $0.15 $0.15 $0.15
2,000 SF or more - but less than truckload,
13.0  delivered& unloaded $0.16 $0.16 $0.16 $0.18 $0.19 $0.20 NOBID NO BID NO BID $0.25 $0.22 $0.21 $0.15 $0.15 $0.15
Sod Installation - for sod provided by
14.0  others $0.05 $0.05 $0.05 $0.08 $0.09 $0.10 NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.08 $0.035 $0.035 $0.04 $0.04 $0.04
15.0  Sod Installation only - at time of delivery $0.05 $0.05 $0.05 $0.08 $0.09 $0.10 NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.07 $0.05 $0.05 $0.05 $0.05 $0.05
GROUP 4 BAHIA "PENSACOLA" BAHIA "PENSACOLA" BAHIA "PENSACOLA" BAHIA "PENSACOLA" BAHIA "PENSACOLA"
NORTH CENTRAL SOUTH NORTH CENTRAL SOUTH NORTH CENTRAL  SOUTH NORTH CENTRAL SOUTH NORTH CENTRAL SOUTH
16.0  Under 2,000 SF, picked up by agency $0.16 $0.16 $0.16 NO BID NO BID NG BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.15 $0.14 $0.14 $0.15 $0.15 $0.15
17.0  Under 2,000 SF, delivered & unloaded $0.16 $0.16 $0.16 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.30 $0.23 $0.22 $0.15 $0.15 $0.15
2,000 SF or more - but less than truckload,
18.0  delivered& unloaded $0.16 $0.16 $0.16 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.25 $0.22 $0.21 $0.15 $0.15 $0.15
Sod Installation - for sod provided by
19.0 others $0.05 $0.05 $0.05 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.07 $0.035 $0.035 $0.04 $0.04 $0.04
20.0  Sod Installation only - at time of delivery $0.05 $0.05 $0.05 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.06 $0.05 $0.05 $0.05 $0.05 $0.05
GROUP § BERMUDA TIFWAY 419 "CERTIFIED" BERMUDA TIFWAY 419 "CERTIFIED" BERMUDA TIFWAY 419 "CERTIFIED" BERMUDA TIFWAY 419 “"CERTIFIED" BERMUDA TIFWAY 419 "CERTIFIED"
NORTH CENTRAL SOUTH NORTH CENTRAL SOUTH NORTH CENTRAL  SOUTH NORTH CENTRAL  SOUTH NORTH CENTRAL  SOUTH
21.0  Under 2,000 SF, picked up by agency $0.27 $0.27 $0.27 $0.29 $0.29 $0.29 NO BID NO BID NOBID $0.26 $0.25 $0.25 $0.24 $0.24 $0.24
220 Under 2,000 SF, delivered & unloaded $0.27 $0.27 $0.27 $0.30 $0.31 $0.32 $2.60 $2.60 $2.60 $0.34 $0.32 $0.32 $0.25 $0.25 $0.25
2,000 SF or more - but less than truckload,
23.0  delivered& unloaded $0.27 $0.27 $0.27 $0.30 $0.31 $0.32 $0.73 $0.76 $0.76 $0.33 $0.31 $0.31 $0.25 $0.25 $0.25
Sod Installation - for sod provided by
240 others $0.05 $0.05 $0.05 $0.08 $0.09 $0.10 NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.05 © $0.035 $0.035 $0.04 $0.04 $0.04
25.0  Sod Installation only - at time of delivery $0.05 $0.05 $0.05 $0.08 $0.09 $0.10 NO BID NOBID NO BID $0.05 $0.05 $0.05 $0.05 $0.05 $0.05
42" Wide Rolls, delivered, unloaded,
installed (NOTE: Estimate quantity 20,000
260  SF/Year) $0.33 $0.33 $0.33 $0.35 $0.36 $0.37 $8.90 $8.90 $8.90 $0.42 $0.42 $0.42 $0.30 $0.30 $0.30
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CENTRAL
$0.27
$0.27

$0.27

$0.05
$0.05

CENTRAL
NQ BID
NO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

CENTRAL
$0.28
$0.28

$0.28
$0.05
$0.05

CENTRAL
$1.35
$1.35

$1.35
$0.05
$0.05

CENTRAL
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID

NO BID
NO BID

GROUP & BERMUDA TIFWAY 419 "UNCERTIFIED"
NORTH
27.0  Under 2,000 SF, picked up by agency $0.27
28.0  Under 2,000 SF, delivered & unloaded $0.27
2,000 SF or more - but less than truckload,
29.0  delivered& unloaded $0.27
Sod Installation - for sod provided by
30.0 others $0.05
31.0  Sod Installation only - at time of delivery $0.05
GROUP 7 BERMUDA TIFGREEN 328
NORTH
32.0 Under 2,000 SF, picked up by agency NO BID
33.0 Under 2,000 SF, delivered & unloaded NO BID
2,000 SF or more - but iess than truckload,
340 delivered& unloaded NOBID
Sod Installation - for sod provided by
350 others NO BID
36.0 Sod Installation only - at time of delivery NO BID
GROUP 8 BERMUDA CELEBRATION
NORTH
37.0  Under 2,000 SF, picked up by agency $0.28
38.0  Under 2,000 SF, delivered & unloaded $0.28
2,000 SF or more - but less than truckload,
38.0 delivered& unloaded $0.28
Sod Installation - for sod provided by
40.0 others $0.05
41.0  Sod Installation only - at time of delivery $0.05
GROUP 9 BERMUDA TIF DWARF
NORTH
42.0  Under 2,000 SF, picked up by agency $1.35
430  Under 2,000 SF, delivered & unloaded $1.35
2,000 SF or more - but less than truckload,
44.0  delivered& unloaded $1.35
Sod Instaltation - for sod provided by
45.0 others $0.05
46.0  Sod Installation only - at time of delivery $0.05
GROUP 1 PASPALUM SEA DWARF
NORTH
47.0  Under 2,000 SF, picked up by agency NO BID
48.0  Under 2,000 SF, delivered & unloaded NO BID
2,000 SF or more - but less than truckload,
49.0  delivered& unloaded NO BID
Sod Installation - for sod provided by
50.0 others NO BID
51.0  Sod Installation only - at time of delivery NO BID

SOUTH
$0.27
$0.27

$0.27

$0.05
$0.05

SOUTH
NO BID
NGO BID

NO BID
NO BID
NO BID

SOUTH
$0.28
$0.28

$0.28
$0.05
$0.05

SQUTH
$1.35
$1.35

$1.35
$0.05
$0.05

SOUTH
NO BID
NO BID

NO BID

NO BID
NO BID

BERMUDA TIFWAY 419 "UNCERTIFIED"

BERMUDA TIFWAY 419 "UNCERTIFIED"

BERMUDA TIFWAY 419 "UNCERTIFIED"

NORTH CENTRAL SOUTH
$0.29 $0.29 $0.29
$0.30 $0.31 $0.32
$0.30 $0.31 $0.32
$0.08 $0.09 $0.10
$0.08 $0.09 $0.10

BERMUDA TIFGREEN 328

NORTH CENTRAL SOUTH

NOBID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NOBID NO BID

BERMUDA CELEBRATION

NORTH CENTRAL  SOUTH
$0.29 $0.29 $0.29
$0.30 $0.31 $0.32
$0.30 $0.31 $0.32
$0.08 $0.08 $0.10
$0.08 $0.09 $0.10

BERMUDA TIF DWARF

NORTH CENTRAL  SOUTH

NOBID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NOBID NO BID

NO BID NOBID NO BID

PASPALUM SEA DWARF

NORTH CENTRAL SOUTH

NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NOBID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID

NOBID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID

NORTH CENTRAL  SOUTH
NO BID NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID NO BID
$0.73 $0.76 $0.76
NO BID NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID NO BID
BERMUDA TIFGREEN 328
NORTH CENTRAL  SOUTH
NO BID NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID NO BID
NOBID NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID NO BID
BERMUDA CELEBRATION
NORTH CENTRAL  SOUTH
NO BID NO BID NO BID
$2.60 $2.60 $2.60
$0.78 $0.81 $0.81
NOBID NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID NO BID
BERMUDA TIF DWARF
NORTH CENTRAL  SOUTH
NO BID NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID NO BID
NOBID NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID NO BID
PASPALUM SEA DWARF
NORTH CENTRAL  SOUTH
NO BID NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID NO BID
NOBID NO BID NO BID
NOBID NO BID NO BID

NORTH CENTRAL  SOUTH
$0.26 $0.25 $0.25
$0.33 $0.32 $0.32
$0.32 $0.31 $0.31
$0.05 $0.035 $0.035
$0.05 $0.05 $0.05

BERMUDA TIFGREEN 328

NORTH CENTRAL  SOUTH
$0.65 $0.65 $0.65
$0.69 $0.68 $0.68
$0.68 $0.67 $0.67
$0.05 $0.035 $0.035
$0.05 $0.05 $0.05

BERMUDA CELEBRATION

NORTH CENTRAL SOUTH
$0.27 $0.26 $0.26
$0.35 $0.32 $0.32
$0.34 $0.305 $0.305
$0.05 $0.035 $0.035
$0.05 $0.05 $0.05

BERMUDA TIF DWARF

NORTH CENTRAL  SOUTH
$1.45 $1.45 $1.45
$1.50 $1.50 $1.50
$1.48 $1.47 $1.45
$0.05 $0.035 $0.035
$0.05 $0.05 $0.05

PASPALUM SEA DWARF

NORTH CENTRAL  SOUTH
$0.85 $0.85 $0.85
$0.90 $0.90 $0.90
$0.89 $0.89 $0.89
$0.05 $0.035 $0.035
$0.05 $0.05 $0.05

BERMUDA TIFWAY 419 "UNCERTIFIED"

NORTH CENTRAL  SOUTH
$0.23 $0.23 $0.23
$0.24 $0.24 $0.24
$0.24 $0.24 $0.24
$0.04 $0.04 $0.04
$0.05 $0.05 $0.05

BERMUDA TIFGREEN 328

NORTH CENTRAL SOUTH
$0.45 $0.45 $0.45
$0.45 $0.45 $0.45
$0.45 $0.45 $0.45
$0.04 $0.04 $0.04
$0.05 $0.05 $0.05

BERMUDA CELEBRATION

NORTH CENTRAL SOUTH
$0.24 $0.24 $0.24
$0.25 $0.25 $0.25
$0.25 $0.25 $0.25
$0.04 $0.04 $0.04
$0.05 $0.05 $0.05

BERMUDA TIF DWARF

NORTH CENTRAL  SOUTH
$1.25 $1.25 $1.25
$1.45 $1.45 $1.45
$1.45 $1.45 $1.45
$0.04 $0.04 $0.04
$0.05 $0.05 $0.05

PASPALUM SEA DWARF

NORTH CENTRAL  SOUTH
$1.39 $1.39 $1.39
$1.39 $1.39 $1.39
$1.39 $1.39 $1.39
$0.04 $0.04 $0.04
$0.05 $0.05 $0.05
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SEALSLE SUPREME PASPALUM

SEALSLE SUPREME PASPALUM

SEALSLE SUPREME PASPALUM

SEALSLE SUPREME PASPALUM

IGROUP 11 SEALSLE SUPREME PASPALUM CERTIFIED CERTIFIED CERTIFIED CERTIFIED CERTIFIED
NORTH CENTRAL SOUTH NORTH CENTRAL SOUTH NORTH CENTRAL SOUTH NORTH CENTRAL SOUTH NORTH CENTRAL SOUTH
52.0  Under 2,000 SF, picked up by agency $0.52 $0.52 $0.52 NO BID NO BiD NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $1.35 $1.35 $1.35 $1.30 $1.30 $1.30
53.0  Under 2,000 SF, delivered & unloaded $0.52 $0.52 $0.52 NO BID NO BID NO BID $2.60 $2.60 $2.60 $1.50 $1.45 $1.42 $1.35 $1.35 $1.35
2,000 SF or more - but less than truckload,
54.0  delivered& unloaded $0.52 $0.52 $0.52 NOBID NO BID NO BID $0.72 $0.75 $0.75 $0.75 $0.74 $0.74 $0.65 $0.65 $0.65
Sod Installation - for sod provided by
550 others $0.05 $0.05 $0.05 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.05 $0.04 $0.04 $0.04 $0.04 $0.04
56.0  Sod Installation only - at time of delivery $0.05 $0.05 $0.05 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.08 $0.08 $0.08 $0.05 $0.05 $0.05
GROUP 12 ULTIMATE FLORA® ZOYSIA ULTIMATE FLORA® ZOYSIA ULTIMATE FLORA® ZOYSIA ULTIMATE FLORA® ZOYSIA ULTIMATE FLORA® ZOYSIA
NORTH CENTRAL SOUTH NORTH CENTRAL SOUTH NORTH CENTRAL  SOUTH NORTH CENTRAL  SOUTH NORTH CENTRAL SOUTH
57.0  Under 2,000 SF, picked up by agency $0.40 $0.40 $0.40 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.45 $0.45 $0.45 $0.65 $0.65 $0.65
58.0  Under 2,000 SF, delivered & unloaded $0.40 $0.40 $0.40 NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID NGO BID NO BID $0.49 $0.48 $0.48 $0.65 $0.65 $0.65
2,000 SF or more - but less than truckload,
59.0 delivered& unioaded $0.40 $0.40 $0.40 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.48 $0.47 $0.47 $0.65 $0.65 $0.65
Sod Installation - for sod provided by
60.0 others $0.05 $0.05 $0.05 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.05 $0.04 $0.04 $0.04 $0.04 $0.04
61.0  Sod Installation only - at time of delivery $0.05 $0.05 $0.05 NO BID NO BID NOBID NO BID NOBID NO BID $0.05 $0.05 $0.05 $0.05 $0.05 $0.05
GROUP 12 HAMMOCK® CENTIPEDE HAMMOCK® CENTIPEDE HAMMOCK® CENTIPEDE HAMMOCK® CENTIPEDE HAMMOCK® CENTIPEDE
NORTH CENTRAL SOUTH NORTH CENTRAL SOUTH NORTH CENTRAL  SOUTH NORTH CENTRAL  SOUTH NORTH CENTRAL SOUTH
62.0  Under 2,000 SF, picked up by agency NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID $1.00 $1.00 $1.00 $0.35 $0.35 $0.35
63.0  Under 2,000 SF, delivered & unloaded NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $1.10 $1.10 $1.10 $0.35 $0.35 $0.35
2,000 SF or more - but less than truckload,
64.0  delivered& unloaded NO BID NOBID NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $1.05 $1.05 $1.05 $0.35 $0.35 $0.35
Sod Installation - for sod provided by R
650 others NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.05 $0.04 $0.04 $0.04 $0.04 $0.04
66,0  Sod Installation only - at time of delivery NO BID NO BID NO BID NG BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.05 $0.05 $0.05 $0.05 $0.05 $0.05
IGROUP 14 WILDFLOWER SOD WILDFLOWER SOD WILDFLOWER SOD WILDFLOWER SOD WILDFLOWER SOD
NORTH CENTRAL SOUTH NORTH CENTRAL SOUTH NORTH CENTRAL  SOUTH NORTH CENTRAL  SOUTH NORTH CENTRAL  SOUTH
67.0  Under 2,000 SF, picked up by agency NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
68.0  Under 2,000 SF, delivered & unloaded NO BID NOBID NO BID NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
2,000 SF or more - but less than truckload,
69.0 delivered& unloaded NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Sod Installation - for sod provided by
70.0 others NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID NO BID NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
71.0  Sod Installation only - at time of delivery NO BID NO BID NQO BID NO BID NO BID NO BIiD NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
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MULLINGS ENGINEERING SERVICES, LLC

ODUM'S SOD, INC.

SOUTH FLORIDA GRASSING, INC.

SUNSET SOD, INC.

GROUP 15
ST. AUGUSTINE FLORATAM
ITEM 72 NORTH CENTRAL  SOUTH
Truckload Rate per SF $0.275 $0.275 $0.275
Truckload Price $2,475.00 $2,475.00 $2,475.00

ITEM 73

ITEM 74

ITEM 75

ITEM 76

ITEM 77

ITEM 78

ITEM 79

Number of pallets per truckload/SF per

18 PALLETS/ 500 SF PER PALLET
pallet

ST. AUGUSTINE PALMETTO

NORTH CENTRAL SOUTH
Truckload Rate per SF $0.29 $0.29 $0.29
Truckload Price $2,610.00 $2,610.00 $2,610.00

Number of pallets per truckload/SF per 18 PALLETS/ 500 SF PER PALLET

pallet
BAHIA ARGENTINE
NORTH CENTRAL SOUTH
Truckload Rate per SF $0.21 $0.21 $0.21
Truckload Price $1,344.00 $1,344.00 $1,344.00

Number of pallets per truckload/SF per 16 PALLETS/ 400 SF PER PALLET

pallet
BAHIA PENSACOLA
NORTH CENTRAL  SOUTH
Truckload Rate per SF $0.21 $0.21 $0.21
Truckload Price $1,344.00 $1,344.00 $1,344.00

Number of pallets per truckload/SF per

16 PALLETS/ 400 SF PER PALLET
pallet

BERMUDA TIFWAY 419 "CERTIFIED"

NORTH CENTRAL SOUTH
Truckload Rate per SF $0.32 . $0.32 $0.32
Truckload Price $2,592.00 $2,592.00 $2,592.00

Number of pallets per truckload/SF per

18 PALLETS/ 450 SF PER PALLET
pallet

BERMUDA TIFWAY 419 "UNCERTIFIED"

NORTH CENTRAL SOUTH
Truckload Rate per SF $0.32 $0.32 $0.32
Truckload Price $2,592.00 $2,592.00 $2,592.00

Number of pallets per truckload/SF per 18 PALLETS/ 450 SF PER PALLET

pallet
BERMUDA TIFGREEN 328
NORTH CENTRAL SOUTH
Truckload Rate per SF NO BID NO BID NO BID
Truckload Price NO BID NO BiD NO BID
Number of pallets per truckload/SF per NO BID
pallet
BERMUDA CELEBRATION
NORTH CENTRAL SOUTH
Truckload Rate per SF $0.33 $0.33 $0.33
Truckload Price $2,673.00 $2,673.00 $2,673.00

Number of pallets per truckload/SF per

18 PALLETS/450 SF PER PALLET
pallet

ST. AUGUSTINE FLORATAM

NORTH CENTRAL.  SOUTH
$0.27 $0.28 $0.29
$2,430.00 $2,520.00 $2,610.00

18 PALLETS/ 9,000 SF PER PALLET

ST. AUGUSTINE PALMETTO

NORTH CENTRAL SOUTH
$0.28 $0.29 $0.30
$2,520.00 $2,610.00 $2,700.00

18 PALLETS/ 9,000 SF PER PALLET

BAHIA ARGENTINE
NORTH CENTRAL SOUTH
$0.20 $0.21 $0.22
$1,440.00 $1,512.00 $1,584.00

16 PALLETS/ 7,200 SF PER PALLET

BAHIA PENSACOLA
NORTH CENTRAL SOUTH
NO BID NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID NO BID
NO BID

BERMUDA TIFWAY 418 "CERTIFIED"

NORTH CENTRAL SOUTH
$0.32 $0.33 $0.34
$2,560.00 $2,640.00 $2,720.00

16 PALLETS/ 8,000 SF PER PALLET

BERMUDA TIFWAY 419 "UNCERTIFIED"

NORTH CENTRAL SOUTH
$0.32 $0.33 $0.34
$2,560.00 $2,640.00 $2,720.00

16 PALLETS/ 8,000 SF PER PALLET

BERMUDA TIFGREEN 328
NORTH CENTRAL SOUTH
NOBID NO BID NOBID
NOBID NO BID NO BID
NO BID

BERMUDA CELEBRATION
NORTH CENTRAL  SOUTH

$0.32 $0.33 $0.34
$2,560.00 $2,640.00 $2,720.00

16 PALLETS/8,000 SF PER PALLET

ST. AUGUSTINE FLORATAM

NORTH CENTRAL SOUTH
$0.404 $0.404 $0.414
$3,232.00 $3,232.00  $3,312.00

16 PALLETS/ 500 SF PER PALLET

ST. AUGUSTINE PALMETTO

NORTH CENTRAL  SOUTH
$0.434 $0.434 $0.444
$3,472.00 $3,472.00  $3,552.00

16 PALLETS/ 500 SF PER PALLET

BAHIA ARGENTINE
NORTH CENTRAL SOUTH
NO BID NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID NO BID
NOBID

BAHIA PENSACOLA
NORTH CENTRAL SOUTH
NO BID NOBID NO BID
NO BID NO BID NO BID
NOBID

BERMUDA TIFWAY 419 "CERTIFIED"

NORTH CENTRAL SOUTH
$0.424 $0.424 $0.424
$3,392.00 $3,392.00  $3,392.00

16 PALLETS/ 500 SF PER PALLET

BERMUDA TIFWAY 419 "UNCERTIFIED"

NORTH CENTRAL SOUTH
$0.424 $0.424 $0.424
$3,392.00 $3,392.00  $3,392.00

16 PALLETS/ 500 SF PER PALLET

BERMUDA TIFGREEN 328

NORTH CENTRAL SOUTH
NO BID NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID NO BID
NO BID
BERMUDA CELEBRATION
NORTH CENTRAL SOUTH
$0.414 $0.414 $0.414
$3,312.00 $3,312.00  $3,312.00

16 PALLETS/500 SF PER PALLET

ST. AUGUSTINE FLORATAM

NORTH CENTRAL  SOUTH
$0.26 $0.249 $0.248
$2,340.00 $2,241.00  $2,232.00

18 PALLETS/ 500 SF PER PALLET

ST. AUGUSTINE PALMETTO

NORTH CENTRAL  SOUTH
$0.27 $0.259 $0.258
$2,430.00 $2,331.00  $2,322.00

| LANDSCAPING,

ST. AUGUSTINE "FLORATAM"

NORTH CENTRAL  SOUTH
$0.2596 $0.2596 $0.2596
$2,336.40 $2,336.40  $2,336.40

18 PALLETS/ 500 SF PER PALLET

ST. AUGUSTINE "PALMETTO"

18 PALLETS/ 500 SF PER PALLET 18 PALLETS/ 500 SF PER PALLET

BAHIA ARGENTINE
NORTH CENTRAL  SOUTH
$0.22 $0.199 $0.198
$1,584.00 1 0! $1.425.60

18 PALLETS/400 SF PER PALLET

BAHIA PENSACOLA
NORTH CENTRAL  SOUTH
$0.22 $0.199 $0.198
$1,584.00 $1,432.80  $1,425.60

18 PALLETS/400 SF PER PALLET

BERMUDA TIFWAY 419 "CERTIFIED"

NORTH CENTRAL  SOUTH
$0.41 $0.40 $0.40
$2,952.00 $2,880.00 $2,880.00

18 PALLETS/ 400 SF PER PALLET

BERMUDA TIFWAY 418 "UNCERTIFIED"

NORTH CENTRAL  SOUTH
$0.41 $0.40 $0.40
$2,952.00 $2,880.00 $2,880.00

18 PALLETS/ 400 SF PER PALLET

BERMUDA TIFGREEN 328
NORTH CENTRAL  SOUTH
$0.90 $0.85 $0.85
$6,480.00 $6,120.00  $6,120.00

18 PALLETS/400 SF PER PALLET

BERMUDA CELEBRATION
NORTH CENTRAL  SOUTH
$0.41 $0.40 $0.40
$2,952.00 $2,880.00 $2,880.00

18 PALLETS/400 SF PER PALLET

NORTH CENTRAL  SOUTH
$0.2596 $0.2596 $0.2596
$2,336.40 $2,336.40  $2,336.40

BAHIA ARGENTINE
NORTH CENTRAL  SOUTH
$0.177 $0.177 $0.177
$1,433.70 $1,433.70  $1,433.70

18 PALLETS/450 SF PER PALLET

BAHIA PENSACOLA
NORTH CENTRAL  SOUTH
$0.177 $0.177 $0.177
$1,433.70 $1,433.70  $1,433.70

18 PALLETS/450 SF PER PALLET

BERMUDA TIFWAY 419 "CERTIFIED"

NORTH CENTRAL  SOUTH
$0.25 $0.25 $0.25
$2,025.00 $2,025.00 $2,025.00

18 PALLETS/ 450 SF PER PALLET

BERMUDA TIFWAY 419 "UNCERTIFIED"

NORTH CENTRAL  SOUTH
$0.24 $0.24 $0.24
$1,944.00 $1,944.00  $1,944.00

18 PALLETS/450 SF PER PALLET

BERMUDA TIFGREEN 328
NORTH CENTRAL  SOUTH
$0.60 $0.60 $0.60
$4,860.00 $4,860.00  $4,860.00

18 PALLETS/450 SF PER PALLET

BERMUDA CELEBRATION
NORTH CENTRAL  SOUTH
$0.28 $0.28 $0.28
$2,268.00 $2,268.00 $2,268.00

18 PALLETS/450 SF PER PALLET
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ITEM 80

ITEM 81

ITEM 82

ITEM 83

ITEM 84

ITEM 85

GROUP

BERMUDA TIF DWARF
NORTH CENTRAL SOUTH
$1.40 $1.40 $1.40
$11,340.00 $11,340.00 $11,340.00

18 PALLETS/450 SF PER PALLET

Truckload Rate per SF
Truckload Price
Number of pallets per truckload/SF per

pallet
PASPALUM SEA DWARF

NORTH CENTRAL  SOUTH
Truckload Rate per SF NO BID NO BID NO BID
Truckload Price NO BID NO BID NO BID
Number of pallets per truckload/SF per NO BID
pallet

SEALSLE SUPREME PASPALUM CERTIFIED

NORTH CENTRAL SOUTH
Truckload Rate per SF $0.57 $0.57 $0.57
Truckload Price $4,617.00 $4,617.00 $4,617.00

Number of pallets per truckload/SF per 18 PALLETS/450 SF PER PALLET

pallet
ULTIMATE FLORA® ZOYSIA
NORTH CENTRAL SOUTH
Truckload Rate per SF $0.45 $0.45 $0.45
Truckload Price $3,645.00 $3,645.00 $3,645.00

Number of pallets per truckload/SF per 18 PALLETS/450 SF PER PALLET

pallet
HAMMOCK® CENTIPEDE

NORTH CENTRAL  SOUTH
Truckload Rate per SF NO BID NO BID NO BID
Truckload Price NO BID NOBID NO BID
Number of pallets per truckload/SF per NO BID
pallet

WILDFLOWER SOD

NORTH CENTRAL  SOUTH
Truckload Rate per SF NO BID NO BID NOBID
Truckload Price NO BID NO BID NO BID
Number of pallets per truckload/SF per NO BID

pallet

ADDITIONAL DISCOUNT - [F AWARDED ENTIRE BID - NONE

BERMUDA TiF DWARF

NORTH CENTRAL SOUTH
NOBID NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID NO BID
NO BID
PASPALUM SEA DWARF

NORTH CENTRAL SOUTH
NOBID NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID NOBID
NO BID

SEALSLE SUPREME PASPALUM

NORTH CENTRAL SOUTH
NO BID NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID NO BID
NG BID
ULTIMATE FLORA® ZOYSIA
NORTH CENTRAL SOUTH
NO BID NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID NO BID
NO BID
HAMMOCK® CENTIPEDE
NORTH CENTRAL SOUTH
NOBID NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID NO BID
NO BID
WILDFLOWER SOD

NORTH CENTRAL.  SOUTH
NO BID NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID NO BID
NO BID

ADDITIONAL DISCOUNT - IF AWARDED
ENTIRE BID - NONE_

BERMUDA TIF DWARF

NORTH CENTRAL SOUTH
NO BID NO BID NOBID
NO BID NOBID NOBID
NO BID
PASPALUM SEA DWARF

NORTH CENTRAL SOUTH
NO BID NO BID NO BID
NOBID NO BID NO BID
NO BID

SEALSLE SUPREME PASPALUM

NORTH CENTRAL  SOUTH
$0.468 $0.47 $0.478
$3,744.00 $3,760.00  $3,824.00

16 PALLETS/500 SF PER PALLET

ULTIMATE FLORA® ZOYSIA

NORTH CENTRAL SOUTH
NO BID NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID NO BID
NOBID
HAMMOCK® CENTIPEDE
NORTH CENTRAL SOUTH
NO BID NO BID NOBID
NO BID NO BID NO BID
NO BID
WILDFLOWER SOD

NORTH CENTRAL SOUTH
NO BID NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID NO BID
NO BID

ADDITIONAL DISCOUNT - IF AWARDED
ENTIRE BID - NONE

BERMUDA TIF DWARF

NORTH CENTRAL  SOUTH
$0.90 $0.86 $0.86
$6,480.00 $6,192.00  $6,192.00

18 PALLETS/400 SF PER PALLET

PASPALUM SEA DWARF
NORTH CENTRAL  SOUTH
$0.65 $0.64 $0.64
$4,680.00 $4,608.00  $4,608.00

18 PALLETS/400 SF PER PALLET

SEALSLE SUPREME PASPALUM

NORTH CENTRAL  SOUTH
$0.61 $0.59 $0.59
$4,392.00 $4,248.00  $4,248.00

18 PALLETS/400 SF PER PALLET

ULTIMATE FLORA® ZOYSIA
NORTH CENTRAL  SOUTH
$0.50 $0.49 $0.49
$3,600.00 $3,528.00  $3,528.00

18 PALLETS/400 SF PER PALLET

HAMMOCK® CENTIPEDE
NORTH CENTRAL  SOUTH
$0.51 $0.499 $0.499
$3,672.00 $3,592.80  $3,592.80

18 PALLETS/400 SF PER PALLET

WILDFLOWER SOD
NORTH CENTRAL  SOUTH
NO BID NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID NO BID
NO BID

ADDITIONAL DISCOUNT - IF AWARDED
ENTIRE BID - NONE_

BERMUDA TIF DWARF

NORTH CENTRAL.  SOUTH
$0.76 $0.76 $0.76
$6,080.00 $6,080.00  $6,080.00

16 PALLETS/500 SF PER PALLET

PASPALUM SEA DWARF
NORTH CENTRAL  SOUTH
$0.65 $0.65 $0.65
$4,680.00 $4,680.00 $4,680.00

18 PALLETS/400 SF PER PALLET

SEALSLE SUPREME PASPALUM

NORTH CENTRAL  SOUTH
$0.50 $0.50 $0.50
$3,600.00 $3,600.00  $3,600.00

18 PALLETS/400 SF PER PALLET

ULTIMATE FLORA® ZOYSIA

NORTH CENTRAL  SOUTH
$0.65 $0.65 $0.65
$4,680.00 $4,680.00 $4,680.00

18 PALLETS/400 SF PER PALLET

HAMMOCK® GENTIPEDE
NORTH CENTRAL  SOUTH
$0.65 $0.65 $0.65
$4,680.00 $4,680.00 $4,680.00

18 PALLETS/400 SF PER PALLET

WILDFLOWER SOD
NORTH CENTRAL  SOUTH
NO BID NO BID NO BID
NO BID NO BID NO BID
NO BID

ADDITIONAL DISCOUNT - IF AWARDED
ENTIRE BID - NONE

EXHIBIT 1
12-2494
Page 5 of 5




