CITY OF FORT LAUDERDALE BID TABULATION
Event No. 176
Title: Janitorial Services Citywide

Comet Cleaning | Amer Plus *Carine Simon LLC c'f::;;:::( s Clean Space EcoBrite GCE Maintenance, Grupo Marsden South,
Systems Inc. Janitorial A Inc. Services, LLC LLC Eulen/USSI LLC
Vendor Service
. Boca Raton, FL Fort Lehigh Acres, FL | FomPpano |Coral Springs,| 1.\ Miami, FL Columbia, Mp |FOMPano Beach,
Location Lauderdale, FL Beach, FL FL FL
P-Card Visa MC MC/Visa MC/Visa MC/Visa MC/Visa Visa MC
Local Vendor X
Disadvantaged Business Enterprise (DBE) X X
uom UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
Executive Airport - 6000 NW 21st Ave - Mon-Fri 9:30-11:30 am Weekly $515.60 $489.66 NO BID $157.66 $374.00 $268.99 $300.00 $198.04 $289.60
U.S. Customs Office - 1601 NW 56 St - Sun-Sat 9:30AM-11:30AM Weekly $103.12 $193.15 NO BID $78.16 $143.75 $108.71 $250.00 $140.09 $29.14
Helistop - 201 SE 2 Ave (6th Floor Parking Garage) M-F 8a-5p Weekly $1,160.10 $57.83 $10,000.00 $115.68 $96.87 $108.71 $320.00 $101.45 $64.20
Radio Shop/Comm. - 220 SW 14 Ave Bldg. 5 - Tue & Fri 5p-9p Weekly $206.24 $30.96 $2,400.00 $50.79 $81.60 $108.71 $240.00 $44.21 $30.49
Facilities Maint. - 220 SW 14 Ave, Bldg 3 & 7 - Tues-F 5p-9p Weekly $412.48 $193.68 NO BID $104.74 $182.21 $108.96 $400.00 $82.85 $54.18
Parks Compound (restrooms)- 220 SW 14 Ave - M-F 4pm-9pm Weekly $644.50 $70.36 $7,500.00 $78.16 $75.92 $108.71 $200.00 $102.17 $60.42
Parks Operations - 220 SW 14 Ave Bldg 2 & 4A - Tue&Fri 5p-9p Weekly $206.24 $143.38 $2,800.00 $46.17 $136.96 $111.10 $400.00 $102.17 $57.52
Fleet Serv. Office - 220 SW 14 Ave Bldg 8 - Tues & Fri 5p-8p Weekly $309.36 $34.31 NO BID $30.71 $72.10 $108.71 $400.00 $42.21 $31.00
Solid Waste Office - 220 SW 14 Ave, Bldg 4B - M,W,F 5pm-8pm Weekly $232.02 $172.54 NO BID $76.75 $151.48 $109.94 $400.00 $92.51 $72.29
Sustainable Development Dept - 700 NW 18 Ave -Day Porter Svc Weekly $2,449.10 $225.83 NO BID $812.82 $1,716.65 $1,745.72 $1,300.00 $971.50 $977.56
Safety Training Center - 1901 NW 6th St - M-F 4pm-7pm Weekly $386.70 $161.94 NO BID $175.24 $101.46 $108.71 $215.00 $150.46 $64.05
City Prosecutor's Off - 600 S Andrews Ave # 503 - M,W,F 5 pm Weekly $232.02 $127.40 $3,000.00 $105.39 $116.08 $108.71 $275.00 $92.51 $192.02
Public Works Admin - 949 NW 38th St - M-F 6p-11p Weekly $1,933.50 $833.52 $7,500.00 $335.52 $608.65 $431.51 $500.00 $391.94 $459.09
Survey Trailer - 949 NW 38th St - Wed & Fri 6p-11p Weekly $515.60 $53.65 $3,000.00 $49.21 $110.23 $108.71 $500.00 $82.85 $52.31
Central Maint Shop, 4250 NW 10 Ave - M-F 6p-11p Weekly $644.50 $191.90 $7,500.00 $115.68 $189.49 $110.90 $530.00 $150.46 $62.34
Transport. and Mobility Dept - 290 NE 3rd Ave - M-F 6p-11p Weekly $644.50 $501.61 $7,500.00 $171.94 $430.18 $293.24 $625.00 $295.35 $310.08
Lauderdale Memorial Cemetery - 2001 SW 4th Ave - M-F 6-10p Weekly $1,353.45 $201.58 $15,750.00 $279.33 $179.18 $108.71 $750.00 $295.35 $89.33
Sunset Memorial Cemetery - 3201 NW 19th St - M-F 6P-10PM Weekly $1,353.45 $151.23 $15,750.00 $279.33 $125.92 $108.71 $750.00 $295.35 $59.49
DSD Satellite Building - 521 NE 4th Ave - M-F10:30a-12:30p+ Weekly $1,031.20 $407.44 NO BID $469.65 $952.86 $950.72 $400.00 $295.35 $432.63
GTL Wastewater Treatment Plant -1765 SE 18 St - M-F 7:30a-3p Weekly $966.75 $304.79 $11,250.00 $417.00 $352.22 $652.27 $900.73 $472.94 $75.58
Wellness Center - 4750 N Federal Hwy Suite 300 - M-F 6p-8p Weekly $257.80 $185.23 NO BID $267.67 $155.30 $108.71 $205.00 $150.46 $73.17
Fire Administration/FS 2 - 528 NW 2 Street - M-F 4:30p-9p Weekly $580.05 $407.56 NO BID $284.42 $371.63 $247.88 $570.00 $295.35 $183.69
Fire Station 53 - 2200 Executive Airport Way - M,W,F 2p-5p Weekly $309.36 $529.54 NO BID $142.07 $591.34 $360.46 $530.00 $237.40 $273.84
Fire Logistics - 1300 SW 1st St - Tues & Fri 2p-4p Weekly $103.12 $55.17 NO BID $99.33 $64.56 $108.71 $200.00 $82.85 $25.90
AES Maintenance - 220 Executive Airport Way - M-F 9:30-11:30 Weekly $257.80 $169.24 NO BID $157.27 $114.15 $108.71 $325.00 $102.17 $69.92
Community Redevelopment Agency-914 NW 6th Suite 100 & 200 Weekly $580.05 $290.17 $8,250.00 $249.77 $282.97 $179.19 $400.00 $198.76 $56.66
Housing and Community Development - 914 NW 6th Suite 103 Weekly $580.05 $157.53 $6,750.00 $209.33 $165.79 $108.71 $400.00 $102.17 $84.42
Nighttime Economy-150 SE 2nd St Suite 128-Mon & Thurs 9a-5p Weekly $412.48 $121.37 $20,000.00 $245.63 $67.11 $108.71 $250.00 $82.85 $32.49
Steam Cleaning of Carpeted Area, Per Square Yard 3% $1.05 $2.25 $20,000.00 $17.32 $0.28 $2.46 $5.00 $0.03 $0.30
Steam cleaning of chairs, cost per unit cleaned. EA $7.00 $10.00 $20,000.00 $5.77 $15.00 $7.48 $15.00 $2.50 $2.00
Steam cleaning of sofas, cost per unit cleaned. EA $200.00 $45.00 $20,000.00 $17.32 $25.00 $12.46 $25.00 $10.00 $5.00
Electrostatic disinfecting spraying cost per square foot SF $0.45 $0.50 $20,000.00 $0.17 $0.30 $0.75 $0.15 $10.00 $0.05
Total $18,589.64 $6,520.32 *Non-responsive. $5,646.00 $8,051.24 $7,224.68 $12,580.88 $5,674.30 $4,270.76
Per Section, 2.29
Vendor failed to bid
on all line items
Total with DBE/ Local Vendor $18,217.84 $5,868.28 $5,363.70
Comments: Claimed: Local Claimed: Local Claimed: Local Claimed: Local Claimed: Local Note- $4,270 x 52
Preference- Class C; |Preference- Class Preference- Class |Preference- Class Preference- Class C; DBE weeks= $221,676
DBE Class 3 A; DBE Class 1 C A/Class C; DBE Class 4 (Weekly Line Items);
Class 3/Class 4 Remaing Balance
($28,324) for Non-
Weekly Line Items
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