Return recorded document to:
Gabrielle Bush, Esq.

Assistant City Attorney

City of Fort Lauderdale

1 East Broward Blvd., Suite 1320
Fort Lauderdale, FL 33301

This instrument was prepared by:
Gabrielle Bush, Esq.

Assistant City Attorney

City of Fort Lauderdale

1 East Broward Blvd., Suite 1320
Fort Lauderdale, FL 33301

REVOCABLE LICENSE

THIS IS A REVOCABLE LICENSE granted this day of , 2025, by and

between:

CITY OF FORT LAUDERDALE, a Florida municipal
corporation, 1 East Broward Blvd., Suite 444, Fort Lauderdale, FL
33301 (hereinafter “CITY™)

and

ANDREWS APARTMENTS, LLC, a Florida limited liability
company, FEI/EIN Number 88-3432129, whose mailing address is
613 NW 3" Avenue, Suite 104, Fort Lauderdale, FL 33311, its
successors and assigns (hereinafter, “LICENSEE”).

WHEREAS, LICENSEE, is the fee simple owner of the Property, located at 2125 South
Andrews Avenue in the City of Fort Lauderdale, Florida as more particularly described in Exhibit
“A” attached hereto and made a part hereof (hereinafter, “Property’); and

Revocable License

Licensee: Andrews Apartments, LLC

Page 1
CAM 25-0725
Exhibit 4
Page 1 of 36



WHEREAS, the Property is the real property upon which LICENSEE proposes to develop
a mixed-use residential development project known as “The Era”, approved by the City on
December 20, 2023, pursuant to DRC Case No. UDP-S23015, as may be amended from time to
time (the “Development Project”); and

WHEREAS, in order to construct the Development Project, LICENSEE indicates it is
necessary that certain limited construction activities and precautions take place, in part, within the
public right-of-way abutting the Property; and

WHEREAS, LICENSEE indicates that to best ensure the public’s safety during the
construction period and to control construction access to the Property, it is necessary to temporarily
close the pedestrian and vehicle portions of the rights-of-way adjacent to the project which are
more particularly described in Exhibit “B” attached hereto and incorporated herein; and

WHEREAS, LICENSEE is desirous of securing a Revocable License for the temporary
closure of such portions of rights of way (more particularly described herein) with appropriate
traffic control plans, emergency access, pavement markings, signage, warning lights, temporary
barrier fences, restoration of pavement, construction of underground utilities, subject to certain
terms and conditions; and

WHEREAS, on November 20, 2024, under Case No. PLN-PROW-24070004, the CITYs
Property and Right of Way Committee considered and recommended approval of LICENSEE’s
application for a Revocable License and Maintenance of Traffic Plan involving temporary closures
of the License Areas which are more particularly described in Exhibit “B” hereto; and

WHEREAS, the City Commission of the City of Fort Lauderdale, by Motion on August
19, 2025, authorized the execution of this Revocable License by the proper CITY officials.

NOW, THEREFORE, in consideration of the mutual covenants and conditions contained
in this Revocable License, and other good and valuable considerations, the adequacy and receipt
of which are hereby acknowledged, the parties agree as follows:

1. Recitals. The foregoing recitals are true and correct and are hereby ratified and
confirmed and incorporated herein.

2. Defined Terms. The following terms, as used and referred to herein, shall have
the meanings set forth below, unless the context indicates otherwise.

Building means the building located on the Property.

City Code or Code means the Code of Ordinances of the City of Fort Lauderdale as
amended from time to time.

City Engineer shall mean the CITY’S Land Development Manager, Development Services
Department.

Revocable License
Licensee: Andrews Apartments, LLC
Page 2
CAM 25-0725

Exhibit 4
Page 2 of 36



City Manager means CITY’s Chief Executive Officer, its City Manager, or his or her
designee.

Contract Administrator means the City Engineer, or his or her designee. In the
administration of this Revocable License, as contrasted with matters of policy, all parties may rely
upon instructions or determinations made by the Contract Administrator.

Day(s) means in computing any period of time expressed in day(s) in this Revocable
License, the day of the act, event, or default from which the designated period of time begins to
run shall not be included. The last day of the period so computed shall be included unless it is a
Saturday, Sunday, or legal holiday, in which event the period shall run until the end of the next
day which is neither a Saturday, Sunday, or legal holiday. When the period of time prescribed or
allowed is less than seven (7) days, intermediate Saturdays, Sundays, and legal holidays shall be
excluded in the computation.

Development Project means the construction of a mixed-use residential development
consisting of a 400 multifamily residential units, 3,650 square feet of ground floor restaurant use
with structured parking for 549 parking spaces, contained in an 8-story (75 feet high) building with
602,410 square feet of total gross floor area, approved on December 20, 2023, pursuant to DRC
Case No. UDP-S23015. As approved, the Development Project includes the installation and
construction of on-street parallel parking stall pavers, concrete driveway paving, concrete curb &
gutter, curb, and valley gutters, bike racks, bench seating, landscaping, irrigation, utilities,
sidewalks, lighting, and any other improvements shown on the approved site plan for the
Development Project. The Development Project is known by the name “The Era” and has a street
address of 2125 South Andrews Avenue.

Effective Date means the date upon which both (i) the Maintenance of Traffic (MOT)
Permit is issued and (ii) the fully executed version of the Revocable License is recorded in the
Public Records of Broward County, Florida. No work can commence under the Revocable License
until the Effective Date.

Florida Building Code means The Florida Building Code adopted pursuant to Chapter 553,
Florida Statutes and includes any amendments thereto.

License Areas means the areas depicted within the Sketch and Legal Descriptions set forth
in Exhibit “B” attached hereto.

LICENSEE means Andrews Apartments, LLC, a Florida limited liability company,
whose mailing address is 613 NW 3™ Avenue, Suite 104, Fort Lauderdale, FL 33311 and its
successors and assigns.

M.O.T. means the Maintenance of Traffic Plan approved by the Office of the City Engineer
under MOT Permit No. ROW-MOT-25070013, associated with Revocable License Permit No.
ENG-RL-25050001 and DRC Case No. UDP-S23015.

Permit means either the Building Permit No. PXA2-BLD-23120011 issued on March 18,
2025 by the Building Official pursuant to The Florida Building Code, as amended for Broward

Revocable License
Licensee: Andrews Apartments, LLC
Page 3
CAM 25-0725

Exhibit 4
Page 3 of 36



County thereto or an Engineering Permit issued by the Office of the City Engineer, or both,
whichever the case may be.

Person means any individual, firm, partnership (general or limited), corporation, company,
association, joint venture, joint stock association, estate, trust, business trust, cooperative, limited
liability corporation, limited liability partnership, limited liability company or association, or body
politic, including any heir, executor, administrator, trustee, receiver, successor or assignee or other
Person acting in a similar representative capacity for or on behalf of such Person.

Plans and Specifications means the plans, specifications, drawings, details, and survey for
the Project Improvements to be installed, constructed, operated, maintained, repaired, and removed
within the License Area during the term of the Revocable License, which such plans,
specifications, drawings, details, etc. are on file in the Office of the City Engineer.

Project means the temporary closure of the public rights-of-way within the License Area
and the construction, installation, operation, maintenance, repair, and reconstruction, from time to
time, of the Project Improvements within the License Area in conjunction with the construction
activities for the Development Project. The term Project also includes the ongoing obligation of
maintenance and repair of the License Area, including reconstruction of Project Improvements,
from time to time and when necessary, during the term of the Revocable License. The term Project
shall not include the possession, use, or occupancy of the License Area for any other purpose,
except as expressly authorized in this Revocable License. The term Project includes any portion
thereof.

Project Improvements means the improvements to be constructed, installed, operated,
maintained, repaired, and reconstructed from time to time within the License Area, including
construction and installation of underground utility facilities, street resurfacing, signage and
pavement markings, temporary mounted signs, temporary barrier fences and gates and dust screen,
construction, and installation of utility facilities within License Area. The term Project
Improvements includes, without limitation, the installation of streetscape improvements, parallel
parking, landscaping, irrigation, pedestrian lighting, pavers, sidewalks, installation of
utilities/infrastructure, and resurfacing of the License Area.

Project Site means the area within the Property and License Area.

Property means the real property owned by the LICENSEE and as described in Exhibit
“A” attached hereto and made a part hereof.

Staging of Materials or Equipment means the placement of materials or equipment or
parking of vehicles within the License Areas in any manner other than (a) temporarily and (b) for
the purpose of and while actually engaged in the act of loading or off-loading materials or
equipment from a vehicle. Staging of Materials or Equipment shall include equipment or materials
off-loaded from a vehicle and placed within the License Area when not being removed from the
License Area to LICENSEE’s Property within two (2) hours.

Storage is synonymous with Staging of Materials or Equipment during the assembling or
construction of the Project Improvements and shall mean the placement of materials or equipment

Revocable License
Licensee: Andrews Apartments, LLC
Page 4
CAM 25-0725

Exhibit 4
Page 4 of 36



within the License Area or any public right of way in such a manner as would constitute Staging
of Materials or Equipment if the materials or equipment were within the License Area.

ULDR means the City of Fort Lauderdale’s Unified Land Development Regulations.

3. Revocable License. From the Effective Date hereof, the CITY grants unto the
LICENSEE a revocable license (“Revocable License”) for the nonexclusive possession, use,
construction, installation, occupancy of the Project Improvements within the License Areas during
the term of the Revocable License at LICENSEE’S sole cost and expense, subject to the terms and
conditions contained in this Revocable License. Except for the staging of the construction crane,
this Revocable License does not permit the Staging of Materials or Equipment within the License
Areas relative to the construction of the Development Project. This Revocable License does permit
the Staging of Materials or Equipment within the License Area for improvements to the existing
rights-of-way including, but not limited to, water and sewer facilities, storm drainage, street and
sidewalk improvements, including curb and gutter, fiberoptic cable installations, and on-street
parking. The granting of this Revocable License is intended to ensure the public safety and to
enable the Project Improvements in an area inaccessible to the public and in a manner that will
enhance the public safety.

4. Term: This Revocable License shall automatically terminate twenty-four (24)
months after the effective date unless terminated sooner, suspended, or extended in accordance
with the terms of this Revocable License.

4.1 This closure period shall commence upon the Effective Date. The City
Manager shall have the authority, upon written request by LICENSEE, to extend the term
of this closure by not more than four (4) thirty (30) day periods beyond the period set forth
in Section 4. Requests for extensions must be made at least two (2) weeks prior to the
expiration date of this closure.

4.2  The City Manager shall have the authority, upon written request by
LICENSEE, to extend the term of this Revocable License for delays beyond the reasonable
control of the LICENSEE, including and without limitation, Force Majeure events, Section
37. The LICENSEE must give notice of the Force Majeure event to the Contract
Administrator promptly thereafter but no later than five (5) days after its occurrence, in
which written explanation shall describe circumstances of the Force Majeure event and
resulting hardship.

5. Closure: Partial Right-of-Way of SW 215 Street and SW 22"¢ Street

5.1 Purpose: The purpose of this closure is for the use of construction vehicles
to access the Project Site to deliver and haul off materials, in accordance with the approved
site plan’s requirements, and promote public safety. The proposed closure is described
below and graphically shown in the License Areas, attached as Exhibit “B” and the Detour
Plans, attached as Exhibit “C”. The proposed MOT plan does not appear to present any
conflicts with the other construction projects in this area.

Revocable License
Licensee: Andrews Apartments, LLC
Page 5
CAM 25-0725

Exhibit 4
Page 5 of 36



5.2 Boundary of Closure: The outside (south) approximate 13-feet paved
shoulder and unpaved swale areas of SW 21 Street, and the outside (north) approximate
13-feet paved shoulder and unpaved swale areas of SW 22" Street, each starting from
South Andrews Avenue and stopping 425 feet west from South Andrews Avenue, as more
particularly shown and described in Exhibit “B” (License Areas). Two-way vehicular
travel will be maintained on SW 21 Street and SW 22" Street via the existing travel lanes
as shown in Exhibit “C” (Detour Plans).

53  As to the extent and duration of the closure and notwithstanding the
foregoing, the City Engineer, in his or her sole discretion, will determine the duration of
the closure after consideration of such matters as site conditions, construction operations,
pedestrian and vehicular circulation, feasibility of alternative means of pedestrian and
vehicular access, pathways, and such other aspects of this Project as the City Engineer
deems necessary and appropriate.

5.4  Therights-of-way or sidewalk shall not be closed prior to the Effective Date
of this Revocable License.

6. Revocation, Suspension, and Termination.

6.1 In the event the City Manager reasonably determines that the (a)
LICENSEE is in violation of any material term or condition of this Revocable License, or
(b) the Revocable License granted herein or the actions of LICENSEE or any of its agents,
servants, employees, guests, or invitees or the actions of any of the agents, servants,
employees, guests, or invitees of the LICENSEE’s contractors, subcontractors, or
independent contractors conflict with a municipal interest of the CITY or the public, or (c)
CITY requires the use of the License Area or adjacent publicly dedicated thoroughfare(s)
for a conflicting municipal purpose, or (d) continuation of the Revocable License granted
herein, as to the respective License Area, is no longer in the best interest of the public, then,
upon advance written notice to LICENSEE of not less than seventy-two (72) hours, where
LICENSEE is given an opportunity to be heard on the matter by the City Manager, the
authority granted by this Revocable License as to the respective License Area may be
temporarily revoked or suspended by the City Manager for a period not exceeding fourteen
(14) days, at the end of which period the City Commission shall consider termination of
the Revocable License granted herein.

6.2 In the event that the City Commission determines that the (a) Revocable
License for the License Area granted herein or the actions of the LICENSEE or any of its
agents, servants, employees, guests, or invitees or any of the agents, servants, employees,
guests, or invitees of the LICENSEE’s contractors, subcontractors, or independent
contractors conflict with a municipal interest of the CITY or public, (b) CITY requires the
use of the above-mentioned License Area or publicly dedicated thoroughfare for a
conflicting municipal purpose, or (c) continuation of the Revocable License for any of the
License Area granted herein is no longer in the best interest of the public, then, in that
event, the Revocable License granted herein for the respective License Area shall be

Revocable License
Licensee: Andrews Apartments, LLC
Page 6
CAM 25-0725

Exhibit 4
Page 6 of 36



terminable, in whole or in part, at the will of the City Commission upon fifteen (15) days
advanced written notice to the LICENSEE.

6.3 In the event that emergent conditions arise within any of the License Areas
that present an imminent threat to the health, safety, or welfare of Persons or property, the
City Manager may temporarily suspend this Revocable License, in whole or in part, for a
period not to exceed fourteen (14) days. In the event the Revocable License must be
temporarily suspended for a period longer than fourteen (14) days, City Commission
approval is required.

6.4 In the event of an emergency, either party may cancel this Revocable
License during the term hereof upon twenty-four (24) hours written notice to the other
party of its desire to terminate this Revocable License.

6.5  This Revocable License as to the License Area may also be revoked or
terminated pursuant to the terms of Section 22.2.1.

7. Conditions. The Revocable License granted herein is subject to compliance with
the following conditions:

7.1 To the extent required by law, no placement, installation or construction of
Project Improvements within the License Areas shall be commenced prior to issuance of a
Building Permit, where applicable, by the Building Official or issuance of an Engineering
Permit, where applicable, by the City Engineer or designee.

7.2 LICENSEE shall submit Plans and Specifications for the Improvements, to
the Office of the City Engineer, where required, and to the Building Official, where
required, for review and approval prior to commencing construction of the Project
Improvements.

7.3 For the License Areas, where the Project Improvements are to be placed,
installed or constructed, prior to construction and installation of Project Improvements
within the License Areas, LICENSEE, at the discretion of the City Engineer or designee,
shall perform, at its sole cost and expense, a sub-surface utility investigation before and
after the construction of the Project Improvements and provide videos, reports, and any
other required documentation to the CITY.

7.3.1 In the event defects to any of the subterranean utilities are detected
as a result of sub-surface utility investigation, CITY shall cause to be repaired such
defects prior to construction and installation of the Project Improvements.

7.3.2 In the event no defects to any of the subterranean utilities are
identified as a result of the sub-surface utility investigation under Section 7.3.1., or
in the event LICENSEE has failed to document conditions prior to starting
construction, LICENSEE, at the discretion of the City Engineer, shall perform at
its sole cost and expense, a second sub-surface utility investigation one (1) year

Revocable License
Licensee: Andrews Apartments, LLC
Page 7
CAM 25-0725

Exhibit 4
Page 7 of 36



after receiving a Certificate of Completion from the City Engineer, and bear the
cost of any repairs to the satisfaction of the City Engineer, in the event defects to
any of the subterranean utilities are detected as a result of the second sub-surface
utility investigation, provided that such repairs only be limited to any work installed
or performed by LICENSEE.

7.4  LICENSEE shall provide the Office of the City Engineer as-built plans,
specifications, details and surveys after construction of the Project Improvements.

7.5  Any necessary or required signage and pavement markings are to be placed
in accordance with the latest edition of the Federal Highway Administration’s Manual on
Uniform Traffic Control Devices, the Florida Department of Transportation’s Standard
Specifications for Road and Bridge Construction and their Design Standards and the
Development Project’s Plans and Specifications. In the event of conflict, the Contract
Administrator shall proscribe which standard, specification or detail shall supersede or
prevail.

7.6 For sign details, use the Manual on Uniform Traffic Control Devices, 11%
edition.

7.7 LICENSEE shall exercise caution in the construction access and staging and
installation of post mounted signs in order to prevent possible damage to underground
utilities.

7.8 For nighttime closures, LICENSEE shall use Type “A” Flashing Warning
Lights on barricades supporting signs and closing sidewalks and Type “C” steady-burn
lights on channelizing devices separating the work area from vehicular traffic shall be used,
as required by the Office of the City Engineer.

7.9 Post mounted signs located near or adjacent to a sidewalk shall have a seven
foot (7") minimum clearance from the bottom of the sign to the sidewalk, as required by
the Office of the City Engineer.

7.10 Traffic control shall be in accordance with all relevant indices for traffic
control through work zones FDOT Index 600 through 670.

7.11 LICENSEE shall be responsible for conducting due diligence to identify
potential utility conflicts, performing field verifications, making all utility notifications and
obtaining all utility locations and clearances prior to performing any excavation work,
including for the installation of signs and fence posts.

7.12  Any damage to existing pavement or to any publicly owned property or
rights-of-way, including public sidewalk areas within License Area, caused by the
installation, movement or removal of Project Improvements including temporary barrier
fencing shall be repaired by LICENSEE to the satisfaction of the Office of City Engineer
and the cost of such repairs shall be borne by LICENSEE.

Revocable License
Licensee: Andrews Apartments, LLC
Page 8
CAM 25-0725

Exhibit 4
Page 8 of 36



7.13 At the conclusion of the Development Project, LICENSEE shall mill and
surface the roadway within License Area, if any, as provided in Section 12.1.3 hereof. If
the roadway is damaged, the roadway must be repaired and restored to a condition equal
or better than that existing prior to commencement of construction of the Development
Project.

7.14 At the conclusion of the construction and installation phase of the
Development Project, all damage caused by LICENSEE or its contractors or subcontractors
to any elements or publicly owned property such as pavement, curbs, sidewalks, signs,
markings, landscaping, trees, irrigation, parking meters, light poles, and any other Project
Improvements located within the public rights of way or License Area shall be repaired or
restored by LICENSEE at its sole cost and expense to a condition equal to or better than
that existing prior to commencement of construction of the Development Project.

7.15  LICENSEE shall utilize off-duty City of Fort Lauderdale police officers for
traffic control as required by the City Manager.

7.16  Except as to the Staging of Materials and Equipment in conjunction with
the construction and installation of utility facilities or streetscape improvements within the
License Areas, storage of construction materials or equipment shall not be permitted within
the License Areas or any of the public rights-of-way, unless such offsite area is approved
as a construction staging area by the CITY.

7.17  Storage of dumpsters and debris shall be limited to the Property and shall
not be stored, placed or collected within the License Areas or any of the public rights-of-
way.

7.18  When vehicles in a parking zone block the line of sight to TCZ (Traffic
Control Through Work Zone) signs or when TCZ signs encroach on a normal pedestrian

walkway, the signs shall be barricade mounted and located in accordance with Index No.
17302.

7.19  The M.O.T. Plan for the Project shall be on file in the Office of the City
Engineer and LICENSEE shall proceed with the Project in accordance with the M.O.T Plan
for the Project after the Effective Date hereof has been attained. The terms and conditions
of this Revocable License are hereby incorporated into the M.O.T. Plan and the Master
Permit.

7.19.1 LICENSEE shall provide CITY with twenty-four (24) hour access
to the Property and License Areas. Access shall be provided via Knox box(es)
located as approved by the Contract Administrator.

7.20  LICENSEE shall use its best efforts to ensure that structural concrete pours,
if any, do not interfere with rush hour traffic during the hours of 8:00AM to 9:30AM and
4:00PM to 6:30PM, Monday through Friday, except for legal holidays observed by the
CITY.

Revocable License
Licensee: Andrews Apartments, LLC
Page 9
CAM 25-0725

Exhibit 4
Page 9 of 36



7.21 It shall be the responsibility of LICENSEE to employ flagmen on high
activity days to direct traffic in and out of the Project Site to avoid disruption of traffic and
to promote public safety. Flagmen may also be required to be employed by LICENSEE as
determined by Contract Administrator.

7.22 A full time site clerk will be in the Development Project office to receive
and direct inquiries to the correct party for a response.

7.23 A truck wash/street cleaner will be employed when needed, as determined
by the Contract Administrator, to maintain the streets utilized by construction vehicles.

7.24  If needed, as determined by the Contract Administrator, LICENSEE shall
provide labor to clean surrounding streets of dirt and debris.

7.25 Except as provided in Section 7.16, all material or equipment deliveries
shall be placed within the boundaries of the Property, inside the perimeter fencing for the
Property, for off-loading to avoid conflicts with pedestrian or vehicular traffic.

7.26  All signage will be set up in accordance with TA20 (Typical Application
20) of the MUTCD (Manual of Uniform Traffic Control Devices) and continuously
monitored through the day to ensure compliance.

7.27  Violation of any of the conditions of this Revocable License, Staging/Dust
Control Plan or M.O.T. Plan may result in a suspension of building or engineering
inspections under the Building Permits or Engineering Permits issued in conjunction with
this Development Project and the development of the Property until such violations have
been brought into compliance. LICENSEE waives all right, title, and interest in
continuation

7.28  of building and engineering inspections while such violations continue to
exist.

7.28.1 A fine of $1,000.00 per day may be imposed for violations of any of
the terms or conditions hereof in accordance with Section 22.1, et seq. hereof.

7.28.2 LICENSEE shall provide on-site parking for all personnel working
on the Project Site. However, in the event LICENSEE is unable to supply on-site
parking sufficient to park all the vehicles of all personnel working the Project Site
during the construction of the Development Project, then LICENSEE shall
establish remote off-site parking facilities sufficient to park the vehicles of all
personnel working the Project Site during the construction of the Development
Project, which such off-site parking facilities shall be approved by the Development
Services Department in the event the off-site parking facility is a public parking
facility owned or operated by the City of Fort Lauderdale, who shall consult with
the Director of Transportation and Mobility. All personnel working the
Development Project shall park their vehicles in either the on-site or off-site
parking facilities supplied pursuant to this Revocable License.

Revocable License
Licensee: Andrews Apartments, LLC

Page 10
CAM 25-0725
Exhibit 4
Page 10 of 36



7.28.3 Inthe event it is necessary for LICENSEE to establish remote offsite
parking facilities and that facility is outside a three (3) block radius from the
Property, then LICENSEE shall supply a tram, jitney, or other transportation
service to transport the personnel working the Project Site from the remote off-site
parking facility or facilities to the Property.

7.29  LICENSEE shall mail written notice of any closures at least ten (10) days
in advance of the closures to the Condominium Associations and residential neighborhood
associations, officially recognized by the CITY, within a five hundred (500) foot radius of
the License Area. Written notification from LICENSEE shall include a weblink to the
City’s GIS ‘LauderStreet Map’ webpage for Maintenance of Traffic Plans, which features
location-specific information on each closure such as purpose, duration of the closure and
in many cases, detour information: https://gis.fortlauderdale.gov/lauderstreet/. Each
written notification to the Condominium Associations and residential neighborhood
associations, officially recognized by the CITY, must be sent via certified mail and the
LICENSEE must obtain a USPS Certified Mail Receipt, a copy of which shall be forwarded
by the LICENSEE as proof of mailing to the Contract Administrator promptly thereafter,
but no later than five (5) days in advance of the closures.

7.30  LICENSEE shall send written notice by regular U.S. Mail of the closures at
least ten (10) days in advance of the closures to all business owners and residential property
owners' within a five hundred (500) foot radius of the License Area. Written notification
from LICENSEE shall include a weblink to the City’s GIS ‘LauderStreet Map’ webpage
for Maintenance of Traffic Plans, which features location-specific information on each
closure such as purpose, duration of the closure and in many cases, detour
information: https://gis.fortlauderdale.gov/lauderstreet/. LICENSEE shall provide a
notarized affidavit to the Contract Administrator as evidence that regular mail was sent to
the business owners and residential property owners.

8. ADA. Reserved.

0. Condition of License Areas. LICENSEE accepts the License Areas in an “AS 1S”

condition as of the Effective Date of this Revocable License. If LICENSEE finds any conditions
altered after an initial inspection of License Areas, which have a material adverse effect on the
Project, CITY should be notified immediately.

10. Compliance with Regulations of Public Bodies. LICENSEE shall, at its sole cost

and expense, possess, use, construct, operate, maintain, repair, and replace, from time to time, the
Project Improvements within the License Areas and the Project and perform such acts and do such
things as shall be lawfully required by any public body having jurisdiction over the License Areas,
Project Improvements, and the Project in order to comply with health, safety, and sanitary
requirements, fire hazard requirements, zoning requirements, building code requirements, City of
Fort Lauderdale Engineering Standards, Americans With Disabilities Act requirements,
environmental requirements, and other similar regulatory requirements.

! As such “property owners” are found on the most recent Broward County Property Appraiser’s records.

Revocable License
Licensee: Andrews Apartments, LLC

Page 11
CAM 25-0725
Exhibit 4
Page 11 of 36


https://gis.fortlauderdale.gov/lauderstreet/
https://gis.fortlauderdale.gov/lauderstreet/

11. No Property or Contract Right. LICENSEE expressly acknowledges that
pursuant to the terms hereof, it gains no property or contract right through this Revocable License
to the continued possession, use, operation, and maintenance of the Project within the License
Areas.

12. Repairs and Maintenance. LICENSEE shall not damage the Project
Improvements or License Areas. LICENSEE shall, at its own cost and expense, safely and
securely maintain the Project Improvements and the License Areas and keep the License Areas
clean and in good condition, make repairs, and keep the License Areas free of rubbish and other
hazards. LICENSEE further covenants and agrees, to make or cause to be made any and all repairs
or replacements, ordinary, or extraordinary, structural or otherwise, necessary to maintain the
License Areas in its original condition at the time of the commencement of the License Term and
to similarly maintain the Project Improvements as originally installed or constructed during the
term of this Revocable License. The City Engineer shall approve all repairs and replacements
within the License Area. When making such repairs, replacements, and maintenance, LICENSEE
shall comply with all laws, ordinances, codes, regulations, and State and City Engineering
standards then in effect; provided, however, that LICENSEE shall only be responsible to make
such repairs and replacements necessary to return the License Areas to the original condition at
the time of commencement of the License Term. The License Areas shall be maintained in a neat
and orderly appearance at all times.

12.1 Restoration of Road Right-of-Way.

12.1.1 LICENSEE shall submit evidence to the City Engineer, which such
evidence shall be reasonably satisfactory to the City Engineer, to document
conditions that existed prior to construction of the Development Project within the
public rights-of-way adjacent to the Development Project. Such evidence may
include pictures, video, signed and sealed topographic surveys, other methods
acceptable to the City Engineer, or any combination thereof. Topographic features
such as roadway surface, striping, signs, sidewalks, swale areas, driveways,
curbing, parking meters, drainage inlets, valve covers, water meters, fire hydrants,
utility access manholes/covers, landscaping, etc. shall be shown in sufficient detail
such that the existing location and condition of each feature is clearly discernable.

12.1.2 LICENSEE shall schedule a site visit with the City’s Engineering
Inspector to verify that said documentation adequately reflects the site conditions.
Said documentation will remain on file with the Office of the City Engineer.

12.1.3 Upon completion of the Development Project, LICENSEE shall:

(a) Conduct a site review with the City’s Engineering Inspector
to determine if any disruption or damage has occurred to features within the
public right-of-way surrounding the Development Project.

(b) Immediately restore any damage in those areas that is
identified by the City’s Engineering Inspector.

Revocable License
Licensee: Andrews Apartments, LLC

Page 12
CAM 25-0725
Exhibit 4
Page 12 of 36



(©) Mill and resurface the asphalt roadway surface of and adjust
any at-grade utilities within the License Area. The resurfacing shall be done
regardless of whether any other repair work is required.

12.1.4 Pursuant to Chapter 25, Streets and Rights of Way, Article III,
Rights of Way Administration, City Code of Ordinances, including, but not limited
to the following:

§ 25-108 Rights of Way Restoration

§ 25-109 Protection of Facilities

§ 25-110 General obligations of permittees
§ 25-111 Enforcement of permit obligations
§ 25-112 Construction bond

LICENSEE shall obtain a separate permit from the City’s Development Service
Department prior to starting construction of the Project or any improvements or any
repairs in the public right-of-way. A bond in the amount of 100% of the
construction value will be required for a period of one year.

12.1.5 An as-built survey signed and sealed by a professional surveyor and
mapper shall be provided to the City Engineer at the completion of the
Development Project to document all existing and new features within the public
right-of-way.

13. Emergencies. If an emergency situation arises where the License Areas or any
condition thereof presents an imminent threat to the health or safety of Persons or property, the
CITY shall make reasonable efforts to provide notice to the LICENSEE’s Contact Person via email
and telephone. If, following that notice, LICENSEE fails to take timely action to correct the
emergency situation, and allows the emergency situation to continue that would pose an imminent
threat to the health or safety of Persons or property. CITY may undertake such limited actions as
are necessary to eliminate the emergency; and CITY shall be entitled to recover its reasonable
costs of cure from LICENSEE in accordance with provisions hereof. For the purposes of this
Paragraph, LICENSEE’s Contact Person shall be Michael Joffe, VP of Development; cell phone
number: 732-547-4982; e-mail address: mjoffe@affiliateddevelopment.com; and address: 613
NW 314 Avenue, Suite 104, Fort Lauderdale, FL 33311. In the event the LICENSEE’s Contact
Person or any other information pertaining to the LICENSEE’s Contact Person shall change, such
change shall be provided to the City Engineer in writing within seven days of that change.

14.  Damage to Public Property. In the event the use, operation, construction,
demolition, or reconstruction of the Project or Project Improvements or License Area cause(s) any
damage whatsoever to any other public property, then LICENSEE shall be responsible for the cost
of repair and shall, at CITY’s option, make said repairs or reimburse CITY for the cost of same.

Revocable License
Licensee: Andrews Apartments, LLC

Page 13
CAM 25-0725
Exhibit 4
Page 13 of 36



15. Liens Against the License Areas. LICENSEE shall have no power or authority
to incur any indebtedness giving a right to a lien of any kind or character upon the right, title, or
interest of CITY in and to the License Areas, and no Person shall ever be entitled to any lien,
directly or indirectly derived through or under the LICENSEE, or its agents, servants, employees,
contractors, or officers or on account of any act or omission of said LICENSEE as to the License
Area. All Persons contracting with the LICENSEE, or furnishing materials, labor or services to
said LICENSEE, or to its agents or servants, as well as all Persons shall be bound by this provision
of the Revocable License. Should any such lien be filed, LICENSEE shall discharge the same
within thirty (30) days thereafter, by paying the same or by filing a bond, or otherwise, as permitted
by law. LICENSEE shall not be deemed to be the agent of CITY, so as to confer upon a laborer
bestowing labor upon or within any of the License Areas, or upon materialmen who furnish
material incorporated in the construction and improvements upon the foregoing, a construction
lien pursuant to Chapter 713, Florida Statutes (2024) or an equitable lien upon the CITYs right,
title or interest in and to the Property or License Areas. These provisions shall be deemed a notice
under Section 713.10(1), Florida Statutes (2024) of the “non-liability” of the CITY.

16.  Removal. Except as may otherwise be expressly provided herein, LICENSEE shall
remove all Project Improvements constructed or Project materials, rubbish, or equipment within
the License Areas and any components thereof, exclusive of utilities facilities constructed and
installed, upon revocation or termination of this Revocable License and upon demand of CITY for
removal of such Project Improvements or Project materials, rubbish, or equipment, and
LICENSEE shall restore the License Areas to the condition(s) that existed prior to LICENSEE’s
installation of any such Project or Project Improvements within the License Areas. Such removal
shall be at LICENSEE’s sole cost and expense. In the event LICENSEE fails to remove all or any
part of the Project Improvements or Project materials, rubbish, or equipment within the License
Area, exclusive of utilities facilities constructed and installed, contemplated herein within fifteen
(15) days after written demand by the CITY to do so, the CITY is hereby authorized to remove
such Project Improvements or Project materials, rubbish, or equipment and restore License Area
to the condition that existed prior to the LICENSEE’s construction or installation of the
improvements in the License Areas, and all reasonable costs associated with the removal and
restoration thereof shall be fully reimbursed to CITY by LICENSEE. Notwithstanding the
foregoing, LICENSEE shall have the obligation of immediately removing any equipment or
materials or temporary fencing within the License Areas upon termination of this Revocable
License, in the event LICENSEE fails to do so, CITY shall have the right to remove same,
recouping the reasonable cost thereof from LICENSEE in the manner set forth herein.

17.  Damage and Destruction. LICENSEE shall not by its possession, use, occupancy,
operation, maintenance, or repair of the License Areas, cause damage to the License Areas or to
the adjacent real property or public rights-of-way. If during the term of this Revocable License
the structures, Project Improvements, fixtures or personal property within the License Areas or
adjacent public rights-of-way shall be damaged, destroyed or deteriorated in whole or in part by
fire, casualty, obsolescence, failure to maintain, or any other cause, and whether or not such
destruction or damage is covered by any insurance policy on the Project, LICENSEE shall give to
CITY immediate notice thereof, and LICENSEE shall:

Revocable License
Licensee: Andrews Apartments, LLC

Page 14
CAM 25-0725
Exhibit 4
Page 14 of 36



17.1 seek the necessary permits and approvals from CITY and any other
regulatory agency with jurisdiction over the License Areas or adjacent real property or
adjacent public rights-of-way to repair, replace, and rebuild the same or cause the same to
be repaired, replaced, or rebuilt as nearly as possible to their original condition; or

17.2  to the extent that such destruction or damage affected the structures and
improvements within the License Areas or real property or public rights-of-way adjacent
thereto, or any part thereof, if LICENSEE elects to remove such structures and Project
Improvements (exclusive of utilities facilities constructed and installed), or any part
thereof, LICENSEE shall seek the necessary permits and approvals from CITY and any
other regulatory agency with jurisdiction over the subject matter to promptly remove or
demolish said structures and improvements and restore the License Areas as nearly as
possible to its original condition.

All such repairs, restructuring and replacements shall be hereafter referred to as "Restoration."
The cost of Restoration shall be paid solely by LICENSEE.

18.  License, not Lease. It is acknowledged and stipulated by and between the parties
hereto that this Revocable License shall not be deemed a lease of the License Areas by CITY but
rather a license granted to LICENSEE by CITY for the nonexclusive possession, use, occupancy,
operation, maintenance, and repair of the License Areas in order to conduct the Project under the
terms and conditions stated herein, such terms and conditions including termination of the
Revocable License in the manner set forth herein. LICENSEE acknowledges and understands the
provisions of § 8.05 and 8.09 of the CITY Charter with respect to leases.

19. Indemnity.

19.1 LICENSEE agrees to indemnify and hold harmless the CITY, its officers,
employees, volunteers, and agents from and against any and all causes of action, demands,
claims, losses, liabilities, and expenditures of any kind, including attorneys' fees, court
costs, and expenses (collectively, a "Claim"), raised or asserted by any Person or entity not
a party to this Revocable License, which Claim is caused or alleged to be caused in whole
or in part, by any intentional, reckless, or negligent act or omission of LICENSEE,
LICENSEE’s contractors and subcontracts, its officers, employees, volunteers, agents or
assigns, arising from, relating to, or in connection with this Revocable License. If any
Claim 1is brought against CITY, LICENSEE and LICENSEE’s contractors and
subcontracts shall, at their own expense, upon written notice from CITY defend CITY
against each such Claim by counsel satisfactory CITY, or, at the option of CITY, pay for
an attorney selected by the City Attorney to defend the CITY.

19.2 CITY is subject to Section 768.28, Florida Statutes, as may be amended
from time to time. Nothing herein is intended to serve as a waiver of sovereign immunity
by the CITY to which sovereign immunity may be applicable. Nothing herein shall be
construed as consent by the CITY to be sued by third parties in any matter arising out of
this Revocable License or any other contract.

Revocable License
Licensee: Andrews Apartments, LLC

Page 15
CAM 25-0725
Exhibit 4
Page 15 of 36



19.3  The provisions of this Section 19 shall survive the expiration or earlier
termination of this Revocable License.

20. Insurance.

As a condition precedent to the effectiveness of this Revocable License, during the term of this
Revocable License and during any renewal or extension term of this Revocable License,
LICENSEE shall, at its sole expense, provide insurance of such types and with such terms and
limits as noted below. Providing proof of and maintaining adequate insurance coverage are
material obligations of LICENSEE. LICENSEE shall provide the CITY a certificate of insurance
evidencing such coverage. LICENSEE’s insurance coverage shall be primary insurance for all
applicable policies, in respect to the CITY’s interests for this Revocable License. The limits of
coverage under each policy maintained by LICENSEE shall not be interpreted as limiting
LICENSEE’s liability and obligations under this Revocable License. All insurance policies shall
be through insurers authorized or eligible to write policies in the State of Florida and possess an
A .M. Best rating of A-, VII or better, subject to approval by the CITY’s Risk Manager.

The coverages, limits, and/or endorsements required herein protect the interests of the CITY, and
these coverages, limits, and/or endorsements shall in no way be relied upon by LICENSEE for
assessing the extent or determining appropriate types and limits of coverage to protect LICENSEE
against any loss exposures, whether as a result of this Revocable License or otherwise. The
requirements contained herein, as well as the CITY’s review or acknowledgement, are not intended
to and shall not in any manner limit or qualify the liabilities and obligations assumed by
LICENSEE under this Revocable License.

The following insurance policies and coverages are required:

Commercial General Liability
Coverage must be afforded under a Commercial General Liability policy with limits not less than:
e $2,000,000 each occurrence and $2,000,000 aggregate for Bodily Injury, Property
Damage, and Personal and Advertising Injury
e $2,000,000 each occurrence and $2,000,000 aggregate for Products and Completed
Operations

Policy must include coverage for contractual liability and independent contractors.

The CITY, a Florida municipality, its officials, employees, and volunteers are to be included as an
additional insured with a CG 20 26 04 13 Additional Insured — Designated Person or Organization
Endorsement or similar endorsement providing equal or broader Additional Insured Coverage with
respect to liability arising out of activities performed by or on behalf of LICENSEE. The coverage
shall contain no special limitation on the scope of protection afforded to the CITY, its officials,
employees, and volunteers.

Revocable License
Licensee: Andrews Apartments, LLC

Page 16
CAM 25-0725
Exhibit 4
Page 16 of 36



Business Automobile Liability

Coverage must be afforded for all Owned, Hired, Scheduled, and Non-Owned vehicles for Bodily
Injury and Property Damage in an amount not less than $1,000,000 combined single limit each
accident.

If LICENSEE does not own vehicles, LICENSEE shall maintain coverage for Hired and Non-
Owned Auto Liability, which may be satisfied by way of endorsement to the Commercial General
Liability policy or separate Business Auto Liability policy.

Crane and Rigging Liability
Coverage must be afforded for any crane operations under the Commercial General or Business
Automobile Liability policy as necessary, in line with the limits of the associated policy.

Workers” Compensation and Employer’s Liability

Coverage must be afforded per Chapter 440, Florida Statutes. Any person or entity performing
work for or on behalf of the CITY must provide Workers’ Compensation insurance. Exceptions
and exemptions will be allowed by the CITY’s Risk Manager, if they are in accordance with
Florida Statute.

LICENSEE waives, and LICENSEE shall ensure that LICENSEE’s insurance carrier waives, all
subrogation rights against the CITY, its officials, employees, and volunteers for all losses or
damages. The CITY requires the policy to be endorsed with WC 00 03 13 Waiver of our Right to
Recover from Others or equivalent.

LICENSEE must be in compliance with all applicable State and federal workers’ compensation
laws, including the U.S. Longshore and Harbor Workers” Compensation Act and the Jones Act, if
applicable.

Insurance Certificate Requirements

a. LICENSEE shall provide the CITY with valid Certificates of Insurance (binders are
unacceptable) no later than ten (10) days prior to the start of work contemplated in this
Revocable License.

b. LICENSEE shall provide to the CITY a Certificate of Insurance having a thirty (30) day
notice of cancellation; ten (10) days’ notice if cancellation is for nonpayment of premium.

c. In the event that the insurer is unable to accommodate the cancellation notice requirement,
it shall be the responsibility of LICENSEE to provide the proper notice. Such notification
will be in writing by registered mail, return receipt requested, and addressed to the
certificate holder.

d. In the event the Revocable License term or any surviving obligation of LICENSEE
following expiration or early termination of the Revocable License goes beyond the
expiration date of the insurance policy, LICENSEE shall provide the CITY with an updated
Certificate of Insurance no later than ten (10) days prior to the expiration of the insurance
currently in effect. The CITY reserves the right to suspend the Revocable License until this
requirement is met.

e. The Certificate of Insurance shall indicate whether coverage is provided under a claims-
made or occurrence form. If any coverage is provided on a claims-made form, the

Revocable License
Licensee: Andrews Apartments, LLC

Page 17
CAM 25-0725
Exhibit 4
Page 17 of 36



Certificate of Insurance must show a retroactive date, which shall be the effective date of
the initial contract or prior.

f. The CITY shall be included as an Additional Insured on all liability policies, with the
exception of Workers” Compensation.

g. The CITY shall be granted a Waiver of Subrogation on LICENSEE’s Workers’
Compensation insurance policy.

h. The title of the Revocable License, Bid/Contract number, or other identifying reference
must be listed on the Certificate of Insurance.

The Certificate Holder should read as follows:
City of Fort Lauderdale

Development Services Department

401 SE 21* Street

Fort Lauderdale, FL 33316

LICENSEE has the sole responsibility for all insurance premiums and shall be fully and solely
responsible for any costs or expenses as a result of a coverage deductible, co-insurance penalty, or
self-insured retention; including any loss not covered because of the application of such deductible,
co-insurance penalty, self-insured retention, or coverage exclusion or limitation. Any costs for
including the CITY as an Additional Insured shall be at LICENSEE’s expense.

If LICENSEE’s primary insurance policy/policies do not meet the minimum requirements as set
forth in this Revocable License, LICENSEE may provide evidence of an Umbrella/Excess
insurance policy to comply with this requirement.

LICENSEE’s insurance coverage shall be primary insurance in respect to the CITY s interests for
this Revocable License, its officials, employees, and volunteers. Any insurance or self-insurance
maintained by the CITY shall be non-contributory.

Any exclusion or provision in any insurance policy maintained by LICENSEE that excludes
coverage required in this Revocable License shall be deemed unacceptable and shall be considered
breach of contract.

All required insurance policies must be maintained until the Revocable License work has been
accepted by the CITY, or until this Revocable License is terminated, whichever is later. Any lapse
in coverage may be considered breach of contract. In addition, LICENSEE must provide to the
CITY confirmation of coverage renewal via an updated certificate of insurance should any policies
expire prior to the expiration of this Revocable License. The CITY reserves the right to review,
at any time, coverage forms and limits of LICENSEE’s insurance policies.

LICENSEE shall provide notice of any and all claims, accidents, and any other occurrences
associated with this Revocable License to LICENSEE’s insurance company or companies and the
CITY’s Risk Management office as soon as practical.

It is LICENSEE’s responsibility to ensure that any and all of LICENSEE’s independent contractors
and subcontractors comply with these insurance requirements. All coverages for independent

Revocable License
Licensee: Andrews Apartments, LLC

Page 18
CAM 25-0725
Exhibit 4
Page 18 of 36



contractors and subcontractors shall be subject to all of the applicable requirements stated herein.
Any and all deficiencies are the responsibility of LICENSEE. The CITY reserves the right to
adjust insurance limits from time to time at its discretion with notice to LICENSEE.

21. Special Exception. It is agreed that this Revocable License is granted to
LICENSEE for LICENSEE’s benefit, is a special exception to the CITY’s general policy and it is
stipulated between the parties that this Revocable License shall be construed most strictly in favor
of the CITY and against LICENSEE.

22. Remedies of CITY.

22.1  In the event the LICENSEE fails to perform or violates any of the terms or
conditions of this Revocable License or defaults or breaches any term or condition hereof,
CITY shall provide notice thereof to LICENSEE and LICENSEE shall cure such violation
within twenty (20) days of such Notice.

22.1.1 In the event the Contract Administrator finds that the LICENSEE
has failed to timely cure such violation, the Contract Administrator shall provide
Notice thereof to LICENSEE and impose or assess a fine of $1,000.00 per day for
every day the violation continues beyond the date set in the Notice under Section
22.1.

22.1.2 LICENSEE shall provide written Notice to CITY when the violation
has been cured. In the event the Contract Administrator finds the violation was not
cured on the date alleged by LICENSEE, Contract Administrator shall provide
LICENSEE with Notice thereof. Contract Administrator shall provide Notice to
LICENSEE when Contract Administrator finds that the violation has been cured.

22.1.3 Inthe event LICENSEE disagrees with the Contract Administrator’s
(a) finding that a violation exists or continues to exist, or (b) imposition or
assessment of a per diem fine, or (c) determination of the date of compliance or
noncompliance, LICENSEE shall file a written Notice of Appeal to the City
Manager within five (5) days of receiving notice of (a), (b) or (c) above.

22.1.4 Within ten (10) days of receiving a Notice of Appeal under
Subsection 22.1.3, the City Manager shall hear presentations thereon and render a
written Final Order thereon, serving a copy thereof upon LICENSEE. In deciding
an Appeal filed under Subsection 22.1.3, the City Manager may affirm, reverse or
modify, in whole or in part, the findings of the Contract Administrator. The City
Manager may equitably adjust any fines in the interests of justice.

22.1.5 In the event LICENSEE contests the Final Order of the City
Manager under Subsection 22.1.4, LICENSEE may file a Notice of Appeal with
the City Clerk including all written arguments in support of contesting the Final
Order. The City Commission shall review the Notice of Appeal and the written
arguments in support of contesting the Final Order as soon as a hearing thereon

Revocable License
Licensee: Andrews Apartments, LLC

Page 19
CAM 25-0725
Exhibit 4
Page 19 of 36



may be reasonably scheduled. At the hearing on the Appeal, the City Commission
shall hear presentations by the LICENSEE and City Manager and shall render an
Order (“Order on Appeal”) thereon affirming, reversing, or modifying the Final
Order in whole or in part.

22.1.6 Any fines resulting from the process set forth in Subsections 22.1.1
through 22.1.5 shall be paid to CITY within sixty (60) days from the final
adjudication resulting from that process.

22.1.7 LICENSEE acknowledges and agrees that the issuance of any
temporary, partial, or final Certificate of Occupancy for the Development Project
may be delayed during the period where any violations of the terms or conditions
of this Revocable License still exist.

22.1.8 LICENSEE acknowledges and agrees that the issuance of any
temporary, partial, or final Certificate of Occupancy for the Development Project
may be delayed during the period where any fines imposed have not been paid.

22.1.9 LICENSEE hereby waives all right, title, and interest in and to any
further building or engineering Inspections during the period where any violations
of the terms or conditions of this Revocable License still exist.

22.2  Inthe event the LICENSEE fails to timely cure the violation within the time
specified in Subsection 22.1, the CITY, as an alternative to the procedures set forth in
Subsections 22.1.1 through 22.1.9, may:

22.2.1 revoke or terminate this Revocable License; or

22.2.2 take any equitable action to enforce the terms and conditions of this
Revocable License, it being stipulated by the parties that since this Revocable
License deals with the right to use a public right-of-way, a violation or breach of
any term or condition of the Revocable License constitutes an irreparable injury to
the public and CITY for which there is no adequate remedy at law; or

22.2.3 take such curative action that was required to be taken by the
LICENSEE under the Revocable License and the cost and expense incurred in
CITY’s curative actions shall be passed on to and owed by LICENSEE, in which
case LICENSEE shall be liable for payment to CITY for all reasonable and
necessary costs and expenses incurred by CITY in connection with the performance
of the action or inactions. LICENSEE shall reimburse CITY within thirty (30) days
following written demand for payment thereof. Interest shall accrue on the unpaid
amount at the rate of twelve percent (12%) per annum, compounded monthly, but
in no event shall interest exceed the highest amount allowed by Florida law. The
demand shall include reasonable documentation supporting the expenses incurred
by CITY. If a dispute arises as to the need for, or amount due to the CITY for
repairs, maintenance, or removal undertaken by CITY in accordance with this

Revocable License
Licensee: Andrews Apartments, LLC

Page 20
CAM 25-0725
Exhibit 4
Page 20 of 36



Revocable License, and such dispute is not resolved within forty-five (45) days
after the date that CITY makes the original written demand for payment, the
LICENSEE shall pay to CITY the undisputed amount and shall provide CITY with
a bond or other security acceptable to CITY for the disputed amount pending a
resolution of the dispute by negotiation or litigation. In addition to any other
remedies available to CITY, in the event of litigation between the parties, CITY
shall be entitled to recover from LICENSEE all costs of collection, including
reasonable attorneys’ fees and court costs incurred at all tribunal and appellate
levels, provided CITY ultimately prevails in such proceedings.

22.2.4 Intentionally deleted.

22.3  The remedies found within Section 22, including all subsections thereof, are
cumulative. The exercise of one does not preclude the exercise of any other remedy.

23. Requirement for Notice. LICENSEE shall give CITY prompt written notice of
any accidents on, in, over, within, under, and above the License Areas in which damage to property
or injury to a Person occurs.

24. Notices.

24.1 Except as provided in Subsection 24.3 below, whenever it is provided herein
that notice, demand, request, or other communication shall or may be given to, or served
upon, either of the parties by the other, or either of the parties shall desire to give or serve
upon the other any notice, demand, request, or other communication with respect hereto or
with respect to any matter set forth in this Revocable License, each such notice, demand,
request, or other communication shall be in writing and any law or statute to the contrary
notwithstanding shall not be effective for any purpose unless the same shall be given by
mailing the same by (i) registered or certified mail, postage prepaid, return receipt
requested, addressed, or (ii) an overnight air mail service such as Federal Express, UPS, or
similar carrier addressed to the party at the address set forth below, or at such other address
or addresses and to such other Person or firm as CITY may from time to time designate by
notice as herein provided.

24.2  All notices, demands, requests, or other communications hereunder shall be
deemed to have been given or served for all purposes hereunder forty-eight (48) hours after
the time that the same shall be deposited in the United States mail, postage prepaid; in the
manner aforesaid, provided, however, that for any distance in excess of five hundred (500)
miles, air mail service or Federal Express or similar carrier shall be utilized, if available.

AS TO CITY: City Manager
City of Fort Lauderdale
101 NE 3rd Avenue, Suite 2100
Fort Lauderdale, FL 33301

Revocable License
Licensee: Andrews Apartments, LLC

Page 21
CAM 25-0725
Exhibit 4
Page 21 of 36



With copy to: City Attorney
City of Fort Lauderdale

1 East Broward Blvd., Suite 1320
Fort Lauderdale, FL 33301

AS TO LICENSEE: Michael Joffe
VP of Development
613 NW 3rd Avenue, Suite 104
Fort Lauderdale, FL 33311

With copy to: Andrew J. Schein, Esq.
Lochrie & Chakas, P.A.
699 North Federal Highway, Suite 400
Fort Lauderdale, FL 33304
ASchein@Lochrielaw.com

24.3  Asto activities under Section 13, Emergencies, notice need not be given in
accordance with subparagraph (a) above, but notice shall be sufficient if given to the
Contact Person pursuant to Section 13, Emergencies.

25.  Assignment, Pledge, Security Interest. LICENSEE shall not voluntarily,
involuntarily, or by operation of law, assign, sell, pledge, grant a security interest, or in any manner
transfer the Revocable License or any interest therein or grant any right to the License Areas
without prior written consent of CITY, which such consent may be granted or withheld in its sole
discretion. Notwithstanding the foregoing, CITY hereby consents to LICENSEE’s assignment of
all of its rights and interests under this Revocable License to any lender(s) or financier(s) providing
it with financing for all or any portion of the Development Project.

26. No Third Party Beneficiaries. The parties expressly acknowledge that it is not
their intent to create or confer any rights or obligations in or upon any third Person or entity under
this Revocable License. None of the parties intend to directly or substantially benefit a third party
by this Revocable License. The parties agree that there are no third-party beneficiaries to this
Revocable License and that no third party shall be entitled to assert a claim against any of the
parties based on this Revocable License. Nothing herein shall be construed as consent by any
agency or political subdivision of the State of Florida to be sued by third parties in any manner
arising out of any contract.

27.  Entire Revocable License. This document incorporates and includes all prior
negotiations, correspondence, conversations, agreements, and understandings applicable to the
matters contained herein and the parties agree that there are no commitments, agreements, or
understandings concerning the subject matter of this Revocable License that are not contained in
this document. Accordingly, the parties agree that no deviation from the terms hereof shall be
predicated upon any prior representations or agreements, whether oral or written. This Revocable
License may be amended, supplemented, modified, or discharged only upon an amendment in
writing executed by all of the parties hereto. This Revocable License shall inure to the benefit of

Revocable License
Licensee: Andrews Apartments, LLC
Page 22
CAM 25-0725

Exhibit 4
Page 22 of 36



and shall be binding upon the parties hereto and their respective successors and assigns, subject,
however, to the limitations contained herein.

28. Interpretation of Revocable License; Severability. This Revocable License shall
be construed in accordance with the laws of the State of Florida. If any provision hereof, or its
application to any Person or situation, is deemed invalid or unenforceable for any reason and to
any extent, the remainder of this Revocable License, or the application of the remainder of the
provisions, shall not be affected. Rather, this Revocable License is to be enforced to the extent
permitted by law. The captions, headings and title of this Revocable License are solely for
convenience of reference and are not to affect its interpretation. Each covenant, term, condition,
obligation or other provision of the Revocable License is to be construed as a separate and
independent covenant of the party who is bound by or who undertakes it, and each is independent
of any other provision of this Revocable License, unless otherwise expressly provided. The terms
and words used in this Revocable License, regardless of the number or gender in which they are
used, are deemed to include any other number and other gender as the context requires.

29. Successors. This Revocable License shall be binding on and inure to the benefit
of the parties, their successors and assigns.

30.  No Waiver of Sovereign Immunity. Nothing contained in this Revocable License
is intended to serve as a waiver of sovereign immunity by any agency to which sovereign immunity
may be applicable.

31. Non-Discrimination. LICENSEE shall not discriminate against any Person in the
performance of duties, responsibilities, and obligations under this Revocable License because of
race, age, religion, color, gender, national origin, marital status, disability, or sexual orientation.

32.  Records. Each party shall maintain its own respective records and documents
associated with this Revocable License in accordance with the records retention requirements
applicable to public records. Each party shall be responsible for compliance with any public
documents request served upon it pursuant to Section 119.07, Florida Statutes (2024), and any
resultant award of attorney’s fees of non-compliance with that law.

33. Preparation of Revocable License. The parties acknowledge that they have
sought and obtained whatever competent advice and counsel as was necessary for them to form a
full and complete understanding of all rights and obligations herein and that the preparation of this
Revocable License has been their joint effort.

34, Waiver. The parties agree that each requirement, duty, and obligation set forth
herein is substantial and important to the formation of this Revocable License and, therefore, is a
material term hereof. Any party’s failure to enforce any provision of this Revocable License shall
not be deemed a waiver of such provision or modification of this Revocable License. A waiver of
any breach of a provision of this Revocable License shall not be deemed a waiver of any
subsequent breach and shall not be construed to be a modification of the terms of this Revocable
License.

Revocable License
Licensee: Andrews Apartments, LLC

Page 23
CAM 25-0725
Exhibit 4
Page 23 of 36



35. Governing Law. This Revocable License shall be interpreted and construed in
accordance with and governed by the laws of the State of Florida. Any controversies or legal
problems arising out of this Revocable License and any action involving the enforcement or
interpretation of any rights hereunder shall be submitted to the jurisdiction of the State courts of
the Seventeenth Judicial Circuit of Broward County, Florida. To that end, LICENSEE expressly
waives whatever other privilege to venue it may otherwise have.

36. Compliance with Laws and Regulations. LICENSEE shall comply with all
applicable statutes, laws, ordinances, rules, regulations, and lawful orders of the United States of
America, State of Florida, City of Fort Lauderdale, and of any other public authority that may be
applicable to this Revocable License and the possession, use, occupancy, and maintenance of the
License Areas and the conduct of the Project permitted herein.

37.  Force Majeure. Neither party shall be obligated to perform any duty, requirement
or obligation under this Revocable License if such performance is prevented by fire, hurricane,
earthquake, explosion, wars, sabotage, accident, flood, epidemics, state of emergency, act of
Government Authority, pandemics, acts of God, strikes, or other labor disputes, riot or civil
commotions, or by reason of any other matter or condition beyond the control of either party, and
which cannot be overcome by reasonable diligence and without unusual expense (“Force
Majeure”). In no event shall a lack of funds alone, on the part of LICENSEE, be deemed Force
Majeure.

38.  E-Verify. As acondition precedent to the effectiveness of this Revocable License,
pursuant to Section 448.095, Florida Statutes (2024), as may be amended or revised, the
LICENSEE and its contractors and subcontractors shall register with and use the E-Verify system
to electronically verify the employment eligibility of newly hired employees.

38.1 The LICENSEE shall require each of its contractors and subcontractors, if
any, to provide the LICENSEE with an affidavit stating that the contractor and
subcontractor do not employ, contract with, or subcontract with an unauthorized alien.
The LICENSEE shall maintain a copy of the contractor’s and subcontractor’s affidavit for
the duration of this Revocable License and in accordance with the public records
requirements of this Revocable License.

38.2 The CITY, the LICENSEE, the contractor, or any subcontractor who has a
good faith belief that a Person or entity with which it is contracting has knowingly violated
Subsection 448.09(1), Florida Statutes (2024), as may be amended or revised, shall
terminate the contract with the Person or entity.

38.3 The CITY, upon good faith belief that the LICENSEE, a contractor, or any
subcontractor knowingly violated the provisions of Subsection 448.095(5), Florida
Statutes (2024), as may be amended or revised, but that the LICENSEE otherwise
complied with Subsection 448.095(5), Florida Statutes (2024), as may be amended or
revised, shall promptly notify LICENSEE and order LICENSEE to immediately terminate
the contract with the contractor or subcontractor, and the LICENSEE shall comply with
such order.

Revocable License
Licensee: Andrews Apartments, LLC

Page 24
CAM 25-0725
Exhibit 4
Page 24 of 36



38.4 A contract terminated under Subparagraph 448.095(5)(c)1. or 2., Florida
Statutes (2024), as may be amended or revised, is not a breach of contract and may not be
considered as such. If the CITY terminates this contract under Paragraph 448.095(5)(c),
Florida Statutes (2024), as may be amended or revised, the LICENSEE may not be
awarded a public contract for at least one year after the date on which the contract was
terminated. The LICENSEE is liable for any additional costs incurred by the CITY as a
result of termination of this Revocable License.

38.5 LICENSEE shall include in each of its contracts or subcontracts, if any, the
requirements set forth in this Section 38, including this subparagraph, requiring any and
all contractors and subcontractors, as defined in Subsection 448.095(1)(e), Florida
Statutes (2024), as may be amended or revised, to include all of the requirements of this
Section 38 in their contracts and subcontracts. LICENSEE shall be responsible for
compliance by any and all contractors and subcontractors, as defined in Subsection
448.095(1)(e), Florida Statutes (2024), as may be amended or revised, with the
requirements of Section 448.095, Florida Statutes (2024), as may be amended or revised.

39.  Anti-Human Trafficking. As a condition precedent to the effectiveness of this
Revocable License, the LICENSEE shall provide the CITY with an affidavit signed by an officer
or a representative of the LICENSEE under penalty of perjury attesting that the LICENSEE does
not use coercion for labor or services as defined in Section 787.06, Florida Statutes (2024), as may
be amended or revised.

40.  Recording. This Revocable License shall be conditioned upon recordation of the
Revocable License in the Public Records of Broward County, Florida. LICENSEE shall record at
its own expense the Revocable License, including all Exhibits thereto in the Public Records of
Broward County, Florida. LICENSEE shall provide within seven (7) days of recording a copy of
the fully executed recorded Revocable License to the City Clerk’s Office of the City of Fort
Lauderdale and the Contract Administrator, and E-mail a recorded copy to
dengineeringadmin@fortlauderdale.gov.

41. Scrutinized Companies. The LICENSEE certifies that it is not on the Scrutinized
Companies that Boycott Israel List created pursuant to Section 215.4725, Florida Statutes (2024),
and that it is not engaged in a boycott of Israel. The CITY may terminate this Revocable License
at the CITY’s option if the LICENSEE is found to have submitted a false certification as provided
under subsection (5) of Section 287.135, Florida Statutes (2024), as may be amended or revised,
or been placed on the Scrutinized Companies that Boycott Israel List created pursuant to Section
215.4725, Florida Statutes (2024), as may be amended or revised, or is engaged in a boycott of
Israel.

[THE BALANCE OF THIS PAGE REMAINS INTENTIONALLY BLANK.]

Revocable License
Licensee: Andrews Apartments, LLC

Page 25
CAM 25-0725
Exhibit 4
Page 25 of 36


mailto:dengineeringadmin@fortlauderdale.gov

IN WITNESS OF THE FOREGOING, the parties have set their hands and seals the day
and year first written above.

WITNESSES: CITY OF FORT LAUDERDALE

By:

Dean J. Trantalis, Mayor

[Witness type or print name]

By:

Rickelle Williams, City Manager

[Witness type or print name]
ATTEST:

(CORPORATE SEAL)

David Soloman, City Clerk

Approved as to form and correctness:

Gabrielle Bush
Assistant City Attorney

STATE OF FLORIDA:
COUNTY OF BROWARD:

The foregoing instrument was acknowledged before me, by means of [ physical presence

or [ online notarization, this day of , 2025, by Dean J. Trantalis as Mayor
for the City of Fort Lauderdale, a municipal corporation of Florida.

[SEAL]

Signature of Notary Public — State of Florida

Print, Type or Stamp Commissioned Name of Notary
Public

0 Personally Known OR [ Produced Identification
Type of Identification Produced

Revocable License
Licensee: Andrews Apartments, LLC
Page 26
CAM 25-0725

Exhibit 4
Page 26 of 36



STATE OF FLORIDA:
COUNTY OF BROWARD:

The foregoing instrument was acknowledged before me, by means of [1 physical presence

or L] online notarization this day of , 2025, by Rickelle Williams as City
Manager for the City of Fort Lauderdale, a municipal corporation of Florida.

[SEAL]

Signature of Notary Public — State of Florida

Print, Type or Stamp Commissioned Name of Notary
Public

0] Personally Known OR [ Produced Identification
Type of Identification Produced

Revocable License
Licensee: Andrews Apartments, LLC

Page 27
CAM 25-0725
Exhibit 4
Page 27 of 36



LICENSEE

WITNESSES: ANDREWS APARTMENTS, LLC, a
Florida limited liability company

By: ERA FTL HOLDINGS, LLC, a

Witness Signature Delaware limited liability company
Print Name:
Address:

By:

Michael Joffe, VP of Development

Witness Signature
Print Name:
Address:

[CORPORATE SEAL]

STATE OF
COUNTY OF

The foregoing instrument was acknowledged before me by means of o physical presence
or O online notarization this  day of , 2025, by Michael Joffe as VP of
Development for ERA FTL HOLDINGS, LLC, a Delaware limited liability company, as Manager
for ANDREWS APARTMENTS, LLC, a Florida limited liability company, who freely and
voluntarily executed this instrument on behalf of said limited liability company.

[SEAL]

Signature of Notary Public — State of

Print, Type or Stamp Commissioned Name of Notary
Public

[ Personally Known OR [ Produced Identification
Type of Identification Produced

Revocable License
Licensee: Andrews Apartments, LLC

Page 28
CAM 25-0725
Exhibit 4
Page 28 of 36



Exhibit “A”
The Property

[see attached survey]

CAM 25-0725
Exhibit 4
Page 29 of 36



i

BLOCK 85 1 \ i BLOCK 64
'I "CROISSANT }PARK ‘ \ "CROISSANT PARK”
| PLAT BOOK 4, PAGE 28 PLAT BOOK 4, PAGE 28

LEGAL DESCRIPTION:
TREE TABLE '
o o 71 L0T 6. LOT 5 ’ LEGEND & ABBREVIATIONS PARCEL 1: ) )
loroilor 8 Lot 7,01 e -T2 CONCRETE Tree DBH | Height | Canopy LOTS 16 AND 17, BLOCK 66, OF "RESUBDIVISION OF BLOCK 66 CROISSANT PARK”, ACCORDING TO THE PLAT
EET LB LICENSED BUSINESS Number Common Name (inches) | (feet) | (reet] THEREOF, AS RECORDED IN PLAT BOOK 7, PAGE 21, OF THE PUBLIC RECORDS OF BROWARD COUNTY. FLORIDA.
SW 21st STR o [ ]  ASPHALT PAVEMENT M.D.C.R. MIAMI—DADE COUNTY RECORDS A AT P AT e o " ARCEL o
{ i l‘ ll - \0_00’ ELEVATION O.R.B. OFFICIAL RECORDS BOOK 2 UNIDENTIFIED PALM 10" 15' 19' LOT 18, BLOCK 66, OF "RESUBDIVISION OF BLOCK 66 CROISSANT PARK”, ACCORDING TO THE PLAT THEREOF,
(O ; ; ; AS RECORDED IN PLAT BOOK 7, PAGE 21, OF THE PUBLIC RECORDS OF BROWAR NTY. FLORIDA.
} } '| } L — oW — OVERHEAD WIRES (9) TITLE COMMITMENT NUMBER 3 UNIDENTIFIED PALM 10 15 18 > RECORDED TN PLAT BOO OF 21 OF THE PUBHC RECORDS OF BROWARD €OV HORD
: l | I P VR 4 CABBAGE PALM 10" 15' 19' .
! ! . L — UNDERGROUND STORM SEWER LINE oo TREE NUMBER PARCEL 3: , ,
Lo | Lo o | LOT | ‘-%T % Y‘ o o 5 CABBAGE PALM 10" 15 19 LOT 19, BLOCK 66, OF "RESUBDIVISION OF BLOCK 66 CROISSANT PARK”, ACCORDING TO THE PLAT THEREOF,
17 718 ;19 1 20 1 ?%\ \ 5= —san— UNDERGROUND SANITARY SEWER LINE TP TRAVERSE POINT (FOR FIELD - AP AL o > = AS RECORDED IN PLAT BOOK 7, PAGE 21, OF THE PUBLIC RECORDS OF BROWARD COUNTY. FLORIDA.
| | | I —3
RS T PARK % L2 20, I UNDERGROUND TELEPHONE LINE MAHOGANY TREE 2 UNIDENTIFIED TREE T 3 7 LOTS 1, 2, 20 AND 21, BLOCK 66, OF "RESUBDIVISION OF BLOCK 66 CROISSANT PARK”, ACCORDING TO THE
oL RUISTR 7. ‘PAGE 21 > L2 oe A - . . PLAT THEREOF, AS RECORDED IN PLAT BOOK 7, PAGE 21, OF THE PUBLIC RECORDS OF BROWARD COUNTY.
‘ ; [ ! r<\'\ \ 772 —F0 — UNDERGROUND FIBER OPTIC LINE () OAK TREE 9 UNIDENTIFIED TREE 6 19 10 FLORIDA.
! ! ‘ ‘ | Z Voz2 J 10 UNIDENTIFIED TREE 12" 30’ 25'
| | 55 w UNDERGROUND WATER LINE PALM TREE .
L105T i L1O4T | L1O3T ! L102T ' L1O1T c | "= 11 OAK 12" 20 25 LOTS 3, 4 AND 5, BLOCK 66, OF "RESUBDIVISION OF BLOCK 66 CROISSANT PARK". ACCORDING TO THE PLAT
| | | ! m \ —u — UNKNOWN SURVEY LINE UNIDENTIFIED TREE - : : » 7 ’ ’
| | | | 12 UNIDENTIFIED PALM 10 15 19 THEREOF, AS RECORDED IN PLAT BOOK 7, PAGE 21, OF THE PUBLIC RECORDS OF BROWARD COUNTY. FLORIDA.
II : : ‘l ¢ CENTERLINE 13 UNIDENTIFIED PALM 10" 15' 18' PARCEL 6
: ' : ' R= RADIUS 14 UNIDENTIFIED PALM 10" 15' 18' LOTS 6 THROUGH 15, BLOCK 66, OF "RESUBDIVISION OF BLOCK 66 CROISSANT PARK”, ACCORDING TO THE
SW 22nd STREET CA= CENTRAL ANGLE 15 UNIDENTIFIED TREE 10" 16' 19 PLAT THEREOF, AS RECORDED IN PLAT BOOK 7, PAGE 21, OF THE PUBLIC RECORDS OF BROWARD COUNTY.
——ee— T T T \ A= ARC LENGTH 16 UNIDENTIFIED TREE 10" 20° 22 FLORIDA.
( "PLAT OF LAUDERDALE" \ 5 T SAID LANDS LYING AND BEING IN THE CITY OF FORT LAUDERDALE, BROWARD COUNTY, FLORIDA AND
\ PLAT BOOK 2, PAGE 9, M.D.CR. \ A/C AIR CONDITIONING CONTAINING A TOTAL OF 117,249 SQUARE FEET (2.6917 ACRES), MORE OR LESS.
VICINITY MAP FPL FLORIDA POWER & LIGHT COMPANY
NOT TO SCALE
' ' \ \ ! 2,
% . (=1.s)
\ \ ’ \ ! Do
m =
\ BLOCK 65 %o 2
\ \ "CROISSANT PARK =5 B
\ PLAT BOOK 4, PAGE 28 % 9 ;;:%
5 > %
0T 7 LOT 6 Lot w2 S
LOT 9 LOT 8 L = NOTES:
\ LoT 10 ‘ METAL FENCE \ I. THIS SURVEY MAP AND REPORT OR THE COPIES THEREOF ARE NOT VALID WITHOUT THE ORIGINAL
\ AWK : o . ° - - B CroRM MANHOLE. B SIGNATURE AND SEAL OR AN ELECTRONIC SIGNATURE AND ELECTRONIC SEAL OF A FLORIDA LICENSED
\ 2 METAL FENCE - 5 0 o \'\% | - — RIM ELEVATI0N17‘52'\b 1168 SURVEYOR AND MAPPER.
\ \é - - - . o ~ e~ L — - - * T ey 2. ELEVATIONS ARE BASED ON NORTH AMERICAN VERTICAL DATUM OF 1988. CITY OF FORT LAUDERDALE
e, S = = — RIGHT—OF - 777 2 cONCRETE BENCHMARK #SW330; ELEVATION: 7.649 FEET.
’ 79 SIGN ’ NCHMARK SANITARY MANHOLE, # ;
\ L~ _tgon. o 3"40. SET NAL & DISK LB3870 o s Ni‘fa&&;gﬂ;:a; EELEVSAEQ%TLA%;K \ Wi 3. FLOOD ZONE: X; BASE FLOOD ELEVATION: NONE; PANEL #12011C0557H; COMMUNITY #125105; MAP DATE:
o o POLE 680 67 A& da7 : . o o L TP2993 g’ o 7 - 0 DISK LB3870 AN SAN 8/18/14.
= L) g 58 ARy AN G-’“bf.»fj s O o —7 1 oROPERTY D #5542_15_10_@95150 o] o e 1T e B0 — = —C - 4. THIS 'SITE LIES IN SECTION 15, TOWNSHIP 50 SOUTH, RANGE 42 EAST, BROWARD COUNTY, FLORIDA.
0 o5 concrere cure ) | 60 R elevamonczos O R R RO T O G s sN— s S = — , - > 5. GRID BEARINGS SHOWN HEREON ARE BASED ON FIELD OBSERVATIONS AND ARE RELATIVE TO THE NORTH
5 N L (TPICALY™ } o78  Zar f NVERT ELEVATRN D st M%T:E&ﬁ’j [ 21st STREET., 7>~ | | | ' ‘ AMERICAN DATUM OF 1983 WITH THE 2011 ADJUSTMENT, FL—E ZONE, WITH THE NORTH LINE OF BLOCK 66
o o BENCHMARK " _575' WATER 50’ PUBLIC RIGHT—OF—WAY @b RIGHT—OFiAYJPRWOPERTY IDW#5042—1 W_,’E'——/W\. W’//J BEING N88°25'50"E
2 7T EEvATON: 602 |8 e L A VY =0826% L 87 o |LOWATR METER . —— 6. REASONABLE EFFORTS WERE MADE REGARDING THE EXISTENCE AND THE LOCATION OF UNDERGROUND
\ z SET NAIL & DISK 3 | o 2ot O~z 7| v e Y Y T T——T- \ , AL _ A 3 UTILITIES. THIS FIRM, HOWEVER, DOES NOT ACCEPT RESPONSIBILITY FOR THIS INFORMATION. BEFORE
\ S L= 2 HYORANT/ el ASPHALT, wooo__ [ o T oo TET- 2 el X - - EXCAVATION OR CONSTRUCTION CONTACT THE APPROPRIATE UTILITY COMPANIES FOR FIELD VERIFICATION.
° 1 GUY ANCHOR(3)3; ® POLE/ (LW or ——zon VR PG e oL Y= onw 7t ‘ - SHANDHOLE|| ’ N <\ 7. THE HORIZONTAL POSITIONAL ACCURACY OF WELL DEFINED IMPROVEMENTS ON THIS SURVEY IS +0.07". THE
2 l‘ ~ =2 ‘ e R —— | O ] NORTHLWNE LT | Loﬁ 1 VERTICAL ACCURACY OF ELEVATIONS OF WELL DEFINED IMPROVEMENTS ON THIS SURVEY IS +0.07’,
3 oo 57" RONS s ol N GATE o 'L\ ioop pover ‘ 8. THIS SITE CONTAINS 78 TOTAL CLEARLY IDENTIFIABLE PARKING SPACES (77 REGULAR & 1 DISABLED).
N R NG D, \ = o 0 2H |1 \CoRRER  rence couER /15 L I 9. THIS SURVEY WAS PREPARED WITH BENEFIT OF A COMMITMENT FOR TITLE INSURANCE, COMMITMENT NUMBER
5 - S REE L E CHAN LINK FENCE  TSH(F L L - PEDESTAL pu 10816727, PREPARED BY CHICAGO TITLE INSURANCE COMPANY, DATED 1/10/2023 AT 8:00 AM. REVISION
.‘ w& %{ =ik IT ‘ ‘ 2 - - _ ] : , NUMBER: ”5” JANUARY 13, 2023. THE FOLLOWING ITEMS ARE EXCEPTIONS IN SCHEDULE B PART Il OF SAID
: | : ' N B 2\ ) | 2=\ COMMITMENT:
\ @ TP < —~ § —L : .
, . © | DN - | B ek B o S S S X T ~ , ITEMS 1, 2, 3, 4 & 5: STANDARD EXCEPTIONS, NOT ADDRESSED.
500 . LOT{/’/ || 5 S[ l B SN RO AT ‘ ~ ITEM 6: ORDINANCE NO. 1999—31 IN O.R.B. 29643, PAGE 1495 APPLIES TO THIS SITE BUT CANNOT BE
g A g T (N b PLOTTED. (ALL PARCELS)
T S 19 504 o e 2 : . 1999- R.B. :
oo g | LOT Lo 1 6oy 147 1 X 77 ITEM 7: ORDINANCE NO. 1999—30 IN O.R.B. 29643, PAGE 1541 APPLIES TO THIS SITE BUT CANNOT BE
Lo | o &5 [ eRotrrv o g0tz 15 15 G071 £F T o1 | 57 , ,B.UlLDI.NG, /LQT 2 H 1\ PLOTTED. (ALL PARCELS).
\ CORNER W5 1 =Rl U0 sgx =) LOT 21 | (e N ATl £ 38,67 B\ "% ITEM 8: DEDICATIONS OF STREETS IN PLAT BOOK 7, PAGE 21 APPLY TO THIS SITE. THERE ARE NO
\ 1577 T //// ¥ R IR e P 4 AREA 3887, 50, FT, A\ B\ S A _ 'PLATTED EASEMENTS. (ALL PARCELS).
| FENcE g5 7 3 E%En = g E.g T SN ° 1001 ALl B ITEM 9: RESTRICTIONS IN DEED BOOK 204, PAGE 379, AS AMENDED IN DEED BOOK 207, PAGE 47
X(E%REER TORY €5 Eolg ONE STORY, Br o B | | 7 =S g APPLY TO THIS SITE AS DEPICTED HEREON. (PARCEL 2).
! ONE S lo8x 8 T | BUILDING R & 1 == 657 ASPHALT PAVEMENT 1 it ITEM 10: INTENTIONALLY DELETED.
\*’“( BUILDING | 858K 2 2% |  NISHED FLOOR ELEVATION: 7.62' g PIPE >~ | L h ; LOT 3 T NAL &  CLEANOUT~\ | 2. ITEM 11: EASEMENT IN O.R.B. 11149, PAGE 700 APPLIES TO THIS SITE AS DEPICTED HEREON. (PARCEL
P L A T g I B B P s I gEEE g b oy RAA LBT%%%] oveeiSSE \| A Y
e (A AREA 5465 SQ. FT. rheedos | o2 2 DD 2 L \%x Disk 183870+ & 5 ATl ITEM 12: INTENTIONALLY DELETED.
\ 2 @ s . IRt . w BEDEE [ — TS e — e LI ITEM 13: RESTRICTIONS IN WARRANTY DEED IN DEED BOOK 44, PAGE 331 APPLY TO THIS SITE BUT
a p , o | A= a|2<868 = |u WOOD POWER T / BRI CQLIMN: At
3. (57 17 2 , . o &) sseRe PO AT A e s S OR ) CANNOT BE PLOTTED. (PARCEL 6).
\ \ A s // | el N msos PROPERTY 1D #5042 15 15 0020 15" 23] NN e ITEM 14: RESTRICTIONS IN WARRANTY DEED IN DEED BOOK 207, PAGE 393 APPLY TO THIS SITE BUT
g 7 3 PROPERTY 1D 45042 {5 15 0060 N & %3' —| 7% wEdd —— ] O.R.B. 29517, PAGE g%iffs 9 7.90) 8 CANNOT BE PLOTTED. (PARCEL 6).
Of.8, 3005, PAGE FPARCEL 2 ) PARCEL 3 Bk wel | LOT 4 ¥ - ITEM 15: RESTRICTIONS IN WARRANTY DEED IN DEED BOOK 207, PAGE 47 APPLY TO THIS SITE AS
L " N L 252 5| P " L ) DEPICTED HEREON. (PARCEL 6).
S | 8 23 A B g — CEL 5— || I R ITEM 16: RESOLUTION NO. A—66—46 IN O.R.B. 3290, PAGE 689 APPLIES TO THIS SITE BUT CANNOT BE
& o ©® == N i 1 e L g PARCEL o>~ ) ) PLOTTED. (PARCEL 6).
5 2 BN ARCEq'4 ‘ z 21 - — " ITEM 17: INTENTIONALLY DELETED.
\‘,2, ™1 57 aP(9) N[ i), 7£5 15 = S Uy ANCHOR ITEM 18: INTENTIONALLY DELETED.
< WOOD S B ' ITEM 19: NOT ADDRESSED.
f TION SERVATION LA A 6! — :
F Befs GOk 207, PAGE 47 207, PAGE 47_| , CONCRTTE MM P%Wﬁ\/ —T oo ST 10. ALL RECORDED DOCUMENTS ARE PER BROWARD COUNTY PUBLIC RECORDS.
618 L £ L &t 6 80.2 s e e ¢ BULDING SR\ Ay 11. ZONING REPORT NOT PROVIDED BY CLIENT.
OO 12 BLOCK 66 P Wop POWER POLE7 ‘ S\ 12. THE TREE SYMBOLS DEPICTED HEREON ARE NOT SCALED TO TREE CANOPY.
SET NAIL & "RE—SUBDIVISION_OF BLOCK 66 ] = 13. THERE WAS NO FIELD DELINEATION OF WETLANDS OBSERVED IN THE PROCESS OF CONDUCTING THE
NP Disk 183870 | g CROISSANT PAAEK P ! FIELDWORK.
\ - PLAT BOOK 7, PAGE 21 ; 14. NO PLOTTABLE OFFSITE EASEMENTS WERE PROVIDED BY THE CLIENT.
: 54>
\ .. | 7.50' 7.48y § - U\)‘Q‘ i\
ik o PG T I L6777 2l
R - ence 1 ’H:LM ' 2 T\
;L % | - %
|| . >|< 718 Y
SIS | 1T ONE STOR
1 o Lot 0 B DING
\ - | T LOT 13 .h/msng'%%fc!c'ﬁ 2 enc 750”4\ CERTIFICATION:
\ - LOT 15 g | LOT 14 T 0 =/ RO se T S TO ANDREWS APARTMENTS LLC; A FLORIDA LIMITED LIABILITY COMPANY; CHICAGO TITLE INSURANCE COMPANY;
YO B ; | Tﬂ- > CHICAGO TITLE INSURANCE COMPANY; TRIPP SCOTT, P.A.:
14} L“% 18 7.45 1k
\ B8 i PARCEL 6 THIS IS TO CERTIFY THAT THIS MAP OR PLAT AND THE SURVEY ON WHICH IT IS BASED WERE MADE IN
e, @‘éﬁ‘mQ ASPHALT PAVEMENT X ‘ ACCORDANCE WITH THE 2021 MINIMUM STANDARD DETAIL REQUIREMENTS FOR ALTA/NSPS LAND TITLE SURVEYS,
3 &H<z | PROPERTY ID #5042 15 15 0050 SET NAIL & LOT 9
Ok i GRB. 45137, PAGE 55 ok L3870 JOINTLY ESTABLISHED AND ADOPTED BY ALTA AND NSPS, AND INCLUDES ITEMS 1, 2, 3, 4, 6(a), 6(b), 7(a),
~ ‘ s 20 ‘ 7(6)(1), 7(c) 8, 9, 13, & 18 OF TABLE A THEREOF. THE FIELDWORK WAS COMPLETED ON 11/28/22.
6. 7
‘ x 6d
L 12 | \ DATE OF PLAT OR MAP: 3/23/23
a ]’ T
>|< ,6_93’ ‘ r: - - 516 BACKF?V }REVENTE :
‘ o 528 | L (L , O JOHN F. PULICE, PROFESSIONAL SURVEYOR AND MAPPER LS2691
v | 68 ‘ ‘ / / BUILDING CF 8 S\ WAL, O VICTOR R. GILBERT, PROFESSIONAL SURVEYOR AND MAPPER LS6274
‘ 2. Lol < VA FOUND N > 310 P /1, O DONNA C. WEST, PROFESSIONAL SURVEYOR AND MAPPER LS4290
RAILROAD my CHAIN LINK FENCE SOUTH LINE BOLLARD\Q o \‘ e )w / L 829\_ NN ; N . STATE OF FLORIDA
CROSSING ARM / WALL END ‘ [ jorelockes \ l T " ST’fW R T CATCH BASN GATCH BASIN
CONCRETE Sl e, : ——— 2 ROOF_J SIGN Ak CRATE ELEVATION:6,61', | GRATE ELEVATION:6. T,
REJE~ : o °55'50"W 386.95 CATCH BASIN ST™ ST™ Q OVERHANG CLEANOUT } 47 INVERT ELEVATION: 4.16'( i
k - WALL N 66 S88°25 5 : GRATE ELEVATION: 6,44~ 4 2y W A
FOUND B NG . QL\EW CONCRETE ~son AN i) SN Ja0 W S8 W - W W W W s \ WATER VALVE- \ ANDREWS APARTMENTS
T ot R g BN O | VAL DN ATy (o , _OF—WAY . : =2, _ 2101, 2107, 2125 SOUTH ANDREWS AVENUE
-77973 7,2 % z HYDRANT QS v " z;ﬁ' 7-4“W 1367 90K 3&“"&?\%1’48”?7%5’ , i =0 PXE#L?AFT‘GEXVEEE:XVT SW 2nd TRsz%;!- % - 1 — A SR—— SA— L 5A SAN— WN_SAN—:*—_ 1 104. 1 W 21ST STREET
oIF o § \5\2 770 WATER_ O~ : INVERT Etgmggmg;e%) T 4 RIGHT—OF —WAY PROPERTY;ADN #5042'§EN o =, T = SN \ N 00, 104, 108 S STS
' . Bk e . —_—  — == “SAl A ~o-
;| n > | [REERRE wrer  f n—m mt N DT — : CITY OF FORT LAUDERDALE, BROWARD COUNTY
ol A — 2 SAf—— SAN——SANT——— o g § . 0 ok gk 97 WATER METER o TPaod 2 g % NVERT F'ELLEE\\//Aﬂ%%}zz’.aT((E INVERT ELEVATION: 4.55'(N) —— REVISIONS ( ; )
BENCHMARK . 13 A% g3 aPal 12 287 1287 ‘ 5 N WwooD POWER GUY \ CURB & GUTTER
O3 " E 128 747 WooD 707 4 ‘L 6% \ATER METER POLE™\ ANCHOR 5 -
2 9 [Te] ol 5 e ) <
s°DiSk LB387) B g (SS%EEETEN [WATER METER(2) _ ¢ RIGHT—OF—WAY LINE PONER . o ons—— ouy = ow — o oHW Oty OH¥ _Z-”l;HW = — o, - BOUNDARY AND TOPOGRAPHIC SURVEY
' Py d [ PoLE %WOHW O ors B - P T — — CONCRETE -
\ a T ko O Vi W /ONE STORY aacin "~~ileNE STORY \ ‘/ ONE STORY . %@‘\ LERPOLEY ALTA/NSPS LAND TITLE SURVEY
» ’ : , \ o o \VEOUR R 528 // BUILDING BUILDING // BUILDING ' )
0 30 60 90 ., //////// < PULICE LAND SURVEYORS, INC.
E;!;:d "BLAT %I?OE}XUBgRDALE" \ \ 5381 NOB HILL ROAD
.C.R. \
GRAPHIC SCALE PLAT BOOK 2, PAGE 9, M.D
» ) ~ ~ \
1"=30 N, e N

SUNRISE, FLORIDA 33351
TELEPHONE: (954) 572—-1777
FAX: (954) 572—-1778
E—MAIL: surveys@pulicelandsurveyors.com

WEBSITE: www.pulicelandsurveyors.com
CERTIFICATE OF AUTHORIZATION LB#3870

DRAWN BY: L.H. SCALE: 1" =30’ CLIENT: ANDREWS APARTMENTS LLC
CHECKED BY: J.F.P. SURVEY DATE: 11/28/22 ORDER NO.: 70711

AN/ -0
Exhibit 4
Page 30 of 36

\ T

PLS




Exhibit “B”
License Areas

[see attached sketch and legal description]

CAM 25-0725
Exhibit 4
Page 31 of 36



SKETCH AND LEGAL DESCRIPTION

PULICE LAND SBIEIRVEYORS, INC.

5381 NOB HILL ROAD
SUNRISE, FLORIDA 33351
TELEPHONE: (954) 572-1777 » E-MAIL: surveys@pulicelandsurveyors.com
CERTIFICATE OF AUTHORIZATION LB#3870

LEGAL DESCRIPTION: (PHASE | REVOCABLE LICENSE AGREEMENT AREA)

A PORTION OF THE S.W. 21ST STREET RIGHT-OF-WAY, AS SHOWN ON "RESUBDIVISION OF BLOCK 66 CROISSANT
PARK", ACCORDING TO THE PLAT THEREOF, AS RECORDED IN PLAT BOOK 7, PAGE 21, OF THE PUBLIC RECORDS
OF BROWARD COUNTY. FLORIDA, BEING MORE PARTICULARLY DESCRIBED AS FOLLOWS:

COMMENCING AT THE NORTHERLY MOST NORTHEAST CORNER OF LOT 1, BLOCK 66, OF SAID PLAT; THENCE
WESTERLY ALONG THE NORTH LINE OF SAID BLOCK 66 AND ALONG THE SOUTH RIGHT-OF-WAY LINE OF SAID S.W.
21ST STREET THE FOLLOWING TWO (2) DESCRIBED COURSES AND DISTANCES: (1) SOUTH 88° 25'60" WEST 11.50
FEET TO POINT OF BEGINNING # 1; (2) SOUTH 88°25'50" WEST 382.19 FEET TO A POINT OF INTERSECTION WITH
THE EASTERLY RIGHT-OF-WAY LINE OF THE FLORIDA EAST COAST RAILWAY; THENCE NORTH 11°08'08" WEST
ALONG SAID EASTERLY RIGHT-OF-WAY LINE 13.19 FEET TO A POINT ON A LINE LYING 13.00 FEET NORTH OF AND
PARALLEL WITH SAID NORTH AND SOUTH LINES; THENCE NORTH 88°25'50" EAST ALONG SAID PARALLEL LINE
383.43 FEET; THENCE SOUTH 05°46'02" EAST 13.04 FEET TO POINT OF BEGINNING 1.

TOGETHER WITH

A PORTION OF THE S.W. 22ND STREET RIGHT-OF-WAY AS SHOWN ON "RESUBDIVISION OF BLOCK 66 CROISSANT
PARK", ACCORDING TO THE PLAT THEREOF, AS RECORDED IN PLAT BOOK 7, PAGE 21, OF THE PUBLIC RECORDS
OF BROWARD COUNTY. FLORIDA, BEING MORE PARTICULARLY DESCRIBED AS FOLLOWS:

BEGINNING (POINT OF BEGINNING # 2) AT THE S.W. CORNER OF SAID LOT 15; THENCE NORTH 88°25'50" EAST
ALONG THE SOUTH LINE OF LOTS 10 THROUGH 15, BLOCK 66 AS SHOWN ON SAID PLAT AND ALONG THE NORTH
RIGHT-OF-WAY LINE OF S.W. 22ND STREET 372.08 FEET; THENCE SOUTH 44°45'68" EAST 17.84 FEET TO A POINT ON
A LINE LYING 13.00 FEET SOUTH OF AND PARALLEL WITH THE SOUTH LINE OF SAID LOTS 10 THROUGH 15 AND
13.00 FEET SOUTH OF AND PARALLEL WITH THE NORTH RIGHT-OF-WAY LINE OF S.W. 22ND STREET; THENCE
SOUTH 88°25'50" WEST ALONG SAID PARALLEL LINE 382.10 FEET TO A POINT OF INTERSECTION WITH THE
EASTERLY RIGHT-OF-WAY LINE OF THE FLORIDA EAST COAST RAILWAY; THENCE NORTH 11°08'08" WEST ALONG
SAID EASTERLY RIGHT-OF-WAY LINE 13.19 FEET TO POINT OF BEGINNING 2.

SAID LANDS LYING AND BEING IN CITY OF FORT LAUDERDALE BROWARD COUNTY, FLORIDA, AND CONTAINING A
TOTAL OF 9,881 SQUARE FEET, MORE OR LESS.

NOTES:

THIS SKETCH IS NOT VALID WITHOUT THE ORIGINAL SIGNATURE AND SEAL OR AN ELECTRONIC SIGNATURE
AND ELECTRONIC SEAL OF A FLORIDA LICENSED SURVEYOR AND MAPPER.

BEARINGS ARE BASED ON STATE PLANE COORDINATES AND ARE RELATIVE TO THE NORTH AMERICAN
DATUM OF 1983 WITH THE 2011 ADJUSTMENT, FL-E ZONE, WITH THE NORTH LINE OF BLOCK 66 BEING
S$88°25'50"W

THIS IS NOT A SKETCH OF SURVEY AND DOES NOT REPRESENT A FIELD SURVEY.

ALL RECORDED DOCUMENTS ARE PER BROWARD COUNTY PUBLIC RECORDS, UNLESS OTHERWISE NOTED.

CLIENT: ANDREWS APARTMENTS LLC SHEET 1 OF 2 THIS DOCUMENT IS NEITHER FULL NOR COMPLETE
WITHOUT  SHEETS 1. AND 2, INCLUSIVE
SCALE: N/A DRAWN: M.M.M. John F Digitally signed by John

ORDER NO.: 73703 F Pulice
DATE: 2/7/25: REV: 2/13/25: 4/9/25 Pu | ice Date: 2025.08.01

09:30:15 -04'00'
PHASE | REVOCABLE LICENSE AGREEMENT AREA
O JOHN F. PULICE, PROFESSIONAL SURVEYOR AND MAPPER LS2691

FORT LAUDERDALE, BROWARD COUNTY, FLORIDA O VICTOR R. GILBERT, PROFESSIONAL SURVEYOR AND MAPPER LS6274
O MICHAEL M. MOSSEY, PROFESSIONAL SURVEYOR AND MAPPER PSM5660

FOR: THE ERA STATE OF FLORIDA CAM 25-0725

Page 32 of 36



Mo oK
SKETCH AND LEGAL DESCRIPTION

PULICE LAND SURVEYORS, INC.

5381 NOB HILL ROAD
SUNRISE, FLORIDA 33351

TELERFHONE: (954) 572-1777 « E-MAIL: surveys@pulicelandsurveyars.com
CERTIFICATE OF AUTHORIZATIONMN LE#3870

BLOCK_&4

| | ecreS are
FLAT BOOK 4, PAGE 28
LaT 10 \ LaT 4 | wors | wor7 | LwTe

__L | __||_ _ 1 |

sW 21ST STREET i

BLEL MBOBO:LEN—

PCROISSANT PARK"
\"PLAT BOCK 4,
- PAGE 28

\

- 505°46'02"E

\l] 13.04'

‘ - o Al 1
588°25'50"W 11.50'

!
K
— NE8°2550"E 363.43' T |

- T i

POINT OF
COMMENCEMENT ——

' NORTHERLY MOST [
E BLOCK o wor NE CORNER LOT 1 (
\ B6/5 R/ LINE POINT OF

BEGINNING #1 |

!
\ .
| R -
|

LOT 18 LOT 19 LGT 20 | LaT 2

S88°2550"W 382.19' L 1
(BEARING BASIS) norTH U

lloT 16, LOT 7

2 BLOCK 66

= "RE-SUBDIVISION_ OF BLOCK 66
> - CROISSANT PARK™

m LAT BOOK 7, PAGE 21
F = _in .
@

o

lor1s | Lot 14 | o3 \ LOT 12

\ POINT OF

0
2
@
\ BEGINNING #2 S0UTH LINE LOTS 10
"_E_ SOUTHWEST
=
=

THROUGH 15 BLOCK~
1 CORMER BE-IN Rl.-"“"ll'lI LINE

ST s 4,

| |
> ' | ©}  N88°25'50"E 372.08'|
L

' PSS
(_/.r_'ﬂ:/ — {ﬁf/{/ 53%5‘5%_ 38210 11
25z | SW 22ND STREET 1 It

_ — —_ — r _—

BLOCK 117,
"BLAT OF LAUDERDALE
PLAT BOOK 2, PAGE 9, D.CR,

CLIENT: ANDREWS APARTMENTS LLC
SCALE: 1" = 80’

ORDER NO.: 73703

SHEET 2 OF 2 THIS DOCUMENT IS MEITHER FULL MOR COMPLETE
WITHCUT SHEETS 1 AND 2, INCLUSIVE

LEGEND & ABBREVIATIONS:
¢
DATE: 2/7/25; REV; 2/13/25; 4/9/25 CENTERLINE

0.C.R. OADE CCOUNTY RECCRDS
PHASE | REVOCABLE LICENSE AGREEMENT AREA

FORT LAUDERDALE, BROWARD COUNTY, FLORIDA
FOR: THE ERA

DRAWN: M.M.M.

CAM 25-0725

Page 33 of 36



Exhibit “C”
Detour Plans

[see attached MOT plan]

CAM 25-0725
Exhibit 4
Page 34 of 36



‘, To be stup in acrda
with Standard Plans 102-602

Max. Spacing (feet)
Cones or Type I Barricades,
Temporary Type II Barricades,
Tubular_Markers |vertical Panels, or Drumd TABLE 4

Tangent

2 | 5 —|BUFFER LENGTH *

Work Zone
Speed (mph)

This Certifies that
ANTHONY BRITTEN SR

Has Completed a Florida Department of Transportation Approved
Temporary Traffic Control (TTC) Advanced (Refresher) Course.

Date Expires: 03/252
Instructor: Messier

Certificate # 83590
hrist FDOT Provider # 140

Metro Florida Safety Council

Phone: 954-603-1900

Tri-County

Dade, Broward,Palm Beach, FL 33441
metrofloridasafetycouncil.com
miyons@metrofioridasatetycouncil.com

f DRAWN BY:
Q Tony Britten

TABLE 2
TAPER LENGTH %
Min, 1

Worl e
Speed (mph) | Length (fe

631 NE 45 Street

Oakland Park. 34
054) §

SPEED LIMIT = 35 MPH
4 LANE DIVIDED HIGHWAY

(SU VEHICLE)

SW 17TH ST

CROSSWALK
PLACEMENT
LOCATION

S ANDREWS AVE

(%]
>
=
g
x
m
=
(%)
z
m

JOBSITE

WATERWALL WITH FENCE

SITE FENCE




License Area - Phase |

ROW Closure

o0" RO\

N

;/ RIGHT-OF-WAY

‘ / EXISTING PERVIOUS [ ASPHALT PARKING

‘ 7.99

SW 21st STREET

CENTERLINE x
|

WEST BOUND LANE
/ (ASPHALT)

EAST BOUND LANE
/ (ASPHALT)

RLA Width Appx. 13 |
l
l

RIGHT-OF-WAY _\ I
|

N
A\

ASPHALT DRIVEWAY

Shoulder Width Varies |

i | 10.00' 10.00' Appx. 10'-15' |
0 O 10 10 20 29 50 30 40 45 o0 Sle 60 0o
SECTION F-F
SW 21st STREET LOOKING EAST
o0" RO\
RLA Width Appx. 13’
| [
| BUILDING I
/ RIGHT-OF-WAY !
1
!/ 25.00 ASPHALT DRIVEWAY/PARKING e i
WEST BOUND LANE e
: /7 ASPHALT PARKING /_ I(EA/-\SSJHI?ACEEI_J)ND LANE f (ASPHALT) E
o e B : ;
| 14.51' 11.50' I e — — 7 7 i
| WIDTH VARIES J Shoulder Width Varies i
I < 100 - 12.5' Appx. 9'-11.%5' I
| a .
0 O 10 10 20 29 50 30 40 45 o0 Sle

SECTION C-C

SW 22nd STREET LOOKING WEST

9-27-2024

EXHIBIT - SW 21st STREET AND

THE ERA

SW 22nd STREET SECTIONS

BTE PROJECT NO. 22-1002

m
7S

CAM 25-0725

EXnibit 4
Page 36 of 36



aschein
Typewritten Text
10' - 12.5'

aschein
Typewritten Text
Shoulder Width Varies
   Appx. 10'-15'

aschein
Line

aschein
Line

aschein
Typewritten Text
50' ROW

aschein
Line

aschein
Line

aschein
Typewritten Text
50' ROW

aschein
Line

aschein
Typewritten Text
RLA Width Appx. 13'

aschein
Typewritten Text

aschein
Typewritten Text

aschein
Typewritten Text
RLA Width Appx. 13'

aschein
Typewritten Text

aschein
Rectangle

aschein
Rectangle

aschein
Line

aschein
Line

aschein
Typewritten Text
RIGHT-OF-WAY

aschein
Line

aschein
Line

aschein
Typewritten Text
ASPHALT DRIVEWAY/PARKING

aschein
Typewritten Text

aschein
Line

aschein
Line

aschein
Line

aschein
Line

aschein
Polygon

aschein
Line

aschein
Line

aschein
Line

aschein
Typewritten Text
RIGHT-OF-WAY

aschein
Line

aschein
Line

aschein
Polygon

aschein
Line

aschein
Line

aschein
Typewritten Text
Shoulder Width Varies
    Appx. 9'-11.5'

aschein
Typewritten Text
WIDTH VARIES


	Exhibit 4 - Revocable License - The Era
	Exhibit 'A' - Property Survey
	Sheets and Views
	SHEET 1


	Exhibit 'B' - License Area
	Exhibit 'C' - Detour Plan



