Tabulation Of Bids

Event # :
Version:

Name:

384
6

Turf Grass Maintenance NW

Description: The City of Fort Lauderdale, Florida (City) is seeking bids from qualified, experienced, and licensed firm(s),

Open Date:

Event Currency:

hereinafter referred to as the Contractor or Bidder, to provide turf grass maintenance services for the

northwest quadrant for the City, in accordance with the terms, conditions, and specifications contained in

this Invitation to Bid (ITB).

To be considered for award, Contractor must bid on all lines for the full quantity of each line. Contractor

must bid on all items. Partial bids will not be considered.

IN THE EVENT OF ANY CONFLICT OR DISCREPANCY BETWEEN BID/PROPOSAL PRICE(S) SUBMITTED BY
BIDDER/PROPOSER ELECTRONICALLY INTO THE CITY'S ON-LINE STRATEGIC SOURCING PLATFORM UNIT PRICE
FIELD(S), ANY OTHER FORMS OR ATTACHMENTS (WHETHER PART OF THE CITY'S SOLICITATION DOCUMENTS
OR DOCUMENTS CREATED AND UPLOADED BY THE BIDDER/PROPOSER), OR ANOTHER SECTION/FIELD OF

THE SYSTEM, THE ONLINE UNIT PRICE(S) INPUTTED ELECTRONICALLY INTO THE SYSTEM BY

BIDDER/PROPOSER SHALL GOVERN.

10/21/2024 10:00:00 AM

usb

Close Date: 11/05/2024 02:00:00 PM

Supplier

Bid Amount

November 5, 2024

SFM Landscape
Services, LLC.

7500 NW 74 Avenue
Medley, FL 33166

VisualScape, Inc.

17801 NW 137th Ave
Miami, FL 33018

AR Maintenance
Solutions

2718 NW 30th Way
Lauderdale Lakes, FL 33311

NJ&S Pressure
Washing and

380,504.75

489,624.30

266,170.00

0.00
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Tabulation Of Bids For Event # 384: Turf Grass Maintenance NW

Painting, LLC

3564NW 39th Street
Lauderdale Lakes, FL 33309-4843

** Supplier has responses with a no bid

Rock & Rose Lawn 220,851.00
Care LLC

26251 sw 187th ave
homestead, FL 33031

Items

Item: MOW SERVICE - SEE NOTES

Description: Sistrunk Blvd medians & ROWs from Andrews Ave to NW 27 Ave

Unit of EA Quantity: 26.0000
Measure:

Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 26.0000 1,617.000 42,042.00
VisualScape, Inc. 26.0000 252.000 6,552.00
AR Maintenance Solutions 26.0000 150.000 3,900.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 26.0000 110.000 2,860.00

Item: HEDGE SERVICE - SEE NOTES

Description: Sistrunk Blvd medians & ROWs from Andrews Ave to NW 27 Ave

Unit of EA Quantity: 15.0000
Measure:

Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 15.0000 38.500 577.50
VisualScape, Inc. 15.0000 1,077.120 16,156.80
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Tabulation Of Bids For Event # 384: Turf Grass Maintenance NW

Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
AR Maintenance Solutions 15.0000 900.000 13,500.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 15.0000 870.000 13,050.00
Item: ADDT'L WEED & TRASH SVC-SEE NOTE

Description: Sistrunk Blvd medians & ROWs from Andrews Ave to NW 27 Ave
Unit of EA Quantity: 11.0000
Measure:

Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 11.0000 280.000 3,080.00
VisualScape, Inc. 11.0000 296.000 3,256.00
AR Maintenance Solutions 11.0000 85.000 935.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 11.0000 80.000 880.00
Item: PRE-EMERGENT SERVIC - SEE NOTES

Description: Sistrunk Blvd medians & ROWs from Andrews Ave to NW 27 Ave
Unit of EA Quantity: 1.0000
Measure:

Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 1.0000 576.000 576.00
VisualScape, Inc. 1.0000 90.000 90.00
AR Maintenance Solutions 1.0000 85.000 85.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 1.0000 90.000 90.00
Item: FERTILIZER SERVICE - SEE NOTES
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Tabulation Of Bids For Event # 384: Turf Grass Maintenance NW

Description: Sistrunk Blvd medians & ROWs from Andrews Ave to NW 27 Ave

Unit of EA Quantity: 2.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 2.0000 576.000 1,152.00
VisualScape, Inc. 2.0000 180.000 360.00
AR Maintenance Solutions 2.0000 500.000 1,000.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 2.0000 468.000 936.00
Item: MULCHING SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: Sistrunk Blvd medians & ROWs from Andrews Ave to NW 27 Ave
Unit of EA Quantity: 2.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 2.0000 2,380.000 4,760.00
VisualScape, Inc. 2.0000 5,355.000 10,710.00
AR Maintenance Solutions 2.0000 3,000.000 6,000.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 2.0000 3,379.000 6,758.00
Item: MOW SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: Powerline Rd/NW 9 Ave medians from Sunrise Blvd to City Limi
Unit of EA Quantity: 26.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 26.0000 847.000 22,022.00
VisualScape, Inc. 26.0000 672.000 17,472.00
AR Maintenance Solutions 26.0000 300.000 7,800.00
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Tabulation Of Bids For Event # 384: Turf Grass Maintenance NW

Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 26.0000 285.000 7,410.00
Item: HEDGE SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: Powerline Rd/NW 9 Ave medians from Sunrise Blvd to City Limi
Unit of EA Quantity: 15.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 15.0000 38.500 577.50
VisualScape, Inc. 15.0000 44.880 673.20
AR Maintenance Solutions 15.0000 50.000 750.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 15.0000 45.000 675.00
Item: ADDT'L WEED & TRASH SVC-SEE NOTE
Description: Powerline Rd/NW 9 Ave medians from Sunrise Blvd to City Limi
Unit of EA Quantity: 11.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 11.0000 210.000 2,310.00
VisualScape, Inc. 11.0000 55.500 610.50
AR Maintenance Solutions 11.0000 50.000 550.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 11.0000 45.000 495.00
Item: PRE-EMERGENT SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: Powerline Rd/NW 9 Ave medians from Sunrise Blvd to City Limi
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Unit of EA Quantity: 1.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 1.0000 288.000 288.00
VisualScape, Inc. 1.0000 45.000 45.00
AR Maintenance Solutions 1.0000 50.000 50.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 1.0000 45.000 45.00
Item: FERTILIZER SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: Powerline Rd/NW 9 Ave medians from Sunrise Blvd to City Limi
Unit of EA Quantity: 2.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 2.0000 288.000 576.00
VisualScape, Inc. 2.0000 112.500 225.00
AR Maintenance Solutions 2.0000 400.000 800.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 2.0000 285.000 570.00
Item: MULCHING SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: Powerline Rd/NW 9 Ave medians from Sunrise Blvd to City Limi
Unit of EA Quantity: 2.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 2.0000 1,190.000 2,380.00
VisualScape, Inc. 2.0000 1,428.000 2,856.00
AR Maintenance Solutions 2.0000 400.000 800.00
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Tabulation Of Bids For Event # 384: Turf Grass Maintenance NW

Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 2.0000 190.000 380.00
Item: MOW SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: Powerline Rd medians from Commercial Blvd to McNab Rd
Unit of EA Quantity: 26.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 26.0000 539.000 14,014.00
VisualScape, Inc. 26.0000 504.000 13,104.00
AR Maintenance Solutions 26.0000 325.000 8,450.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 26.0000 220.000 5,720.00
Item: ADDT'L WEED & TRASH SVC-SEE NOTE
Description: Powerline Rd medians from Commercial Blvd to McNab Rd
Unit of EA Quantity: 11.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 11.0000 560.000 6,160.00
VisualScape, Inc. 11.0000 74.000 814.00
AR Maintenance Solutions 11.0000 50.000 550.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 11.0000 45.000 495.00
Item: PRE-EMERGENT SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: Powerline Rd medians from Commercial Blvd to McNab Rd
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Tabulation Of Bids For Event # 384: Turf Grass Maintenance NW

Unit of EA Quantity: 1.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 1.0000 192.000 192.00
VisualScape, Inc. 1.0000 90.000 90.00
AR Maintenance Solutions 1.0000 50.000 50.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 1.0000 95.000 95.00
Item: FERTILIZER SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: Powerline Rd medians from Commercial Blvd to McNab Rd
Unit of EA Quantity: 2.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 2.0000 192.000 384.00
VisualScape, Inc. 2.0000 135.000 270.00
AR Maintenance Solutions 2.0000 400.000 800.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 2.0000 354.000 708.00
Item: MULCHING SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: Powerline Rd medians from Commercial Blvd to McNab Rd
Unit of EA Quantity: 2.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 2.0000 85.000 170.00
VisualScape, Inc. 2.0000 1,428.000 2,856.00
AR Maintenance Solutions 2.0000 400.000 800.00
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Tabulation Of Bids For Event # 384: Turf Grass Maintenance NW

Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 2.0000 265.000 530.00
Item: MOW SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: Sunrise Blvd medians, swales & ROWs: NW 24 Av to Andrews Av
Unit of EA Quantity: 26.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 26.0000 847.000 22,022.00
VisualScape, Inc. 26.0000 336.000 8,736.00
AR Maintenance Solutions 26.0000 200.000 5,200.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 26.0000 140.000 3,640.00
Item: HEDGE SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: Sunrise Blvd medians, swales & ROWs: NW 24 Av to Andrews Av
Unit of EA Quantity: 15.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 15.0000 616.000 9,240.00
VisualScape, Inc. 15.0000 269.280 4,039.20
AR Maintenance Solutions 15.0000 200.000 3,000.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 15.0000 225.000 3,375.00
Item: ADDT'L WEED & TRASH SVC-SEE NOTE
Description: Sunrise Blvd medians, swales & ROWs: NW 24 Av to Andrews Av
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Tabulation Of Bids For Event # 384: Turf Grass Maintenance NW

Unit of EA Quantity: 11.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 11.0000 140.000 1,540.00
VisualScape, Inc. 11.0000 148.000 1,628.00
AR Maintenance Solutions 11.0000 50.000 550.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 11.0000 45.000 495.00
Item: PRE-EMERGENT SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: Sunrise Blvd medians, swales & ROWs: NW 24 Av to Andrews Av
Unit of EA Quantity: 1.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 1.0000 384.000 384.00
VisualScape, Inc. 1.0000 45.000 45.00
AR Maintenance Solutions 1.0000 50.000 50.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 1.0000 45.000 45.00
Item: FERTILIZER SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: Sunrise Blvd medians, swales & ROWs: NW 24 Av to Andrews Av
Unit of EA Quantity: 2.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 2.0000 384.000 768.00
VisualScape, Inc. 2.0000 90.000 180.00
AR Maintenance Solutions 2.0000 300.000 600.00
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Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 2.0000 264.000 528.00
Item: MULCHING SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: Sunrise Blvd medians, swales & ROWs: NW 24 Av to Andrews Av
Unit of EA Quantity: 2.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 2.0000 4.250 8.50
VisualScape, Inc. 2.0000 714.000 1,428.00
AR Maintenance Solutions 2.0000 500.000 1,000.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 2.0000 515.000 1,030.00
Item: MOW SERVICE
Description: NW 62 St medians and ROWs from NW 31 Ave to Hawkins Rd
Unit of EA Quantity: 26.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 26.0000 154.000 4,004.00
VisualScape, Inc. 26.0000 84.000 2,184.00
AR Maintenance Solutions 26.0000 50.000 1,300.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 26.0000 45.000 1,170.00
Item: HEDGE SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: NW 62 St medians and ROWs from NW 31 Ave to Hawkins Rd
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Unit of EA Quantity: 15.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 15.0000 3.900 58.50
VisualScape, Inc. 15.0000 2,692.800 40,392.00
AR Maintenance Solutions 15.0000 40.000 600.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 15.0000 20.000 300.00
Item: ADDT'L WEED & TRASH SVC-SEE NOTE
Description: NW 62 St medians and ROWSs from NW 31 Ave to Hawkins Rd
Unit of EA Quantity: 11.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 11.0000 35.000 385.00
VisualScape, Inc. 11.0000 222.000 2,442.00
AR Maintenance Solutions 11.0000 50.000 550.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 11.0000 45.000 495.00
Item: PRE-EMERGENT SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: NW 62 St medians and ROWs from NW 31 Ave to Hawkins Rd
Unit of EA Quantity: 1.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 1.0000 144.000 144.00
VisualScape, Inc. 1.0000 45.000 45.00
AR Maintenance Solutions 1.0000 40.000 40.00
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Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 1.0000 117.000 117.00
Item: FERTILIZER SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: NW 62 St medians and ROWs from NW 31 Ave to Hawkins Rd
Unit of EA Quantity: 2.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 2.0000 144.000 288.00
VisualScape, Inc. 2.0000 45.000 90.00
AR Maintenance Solutions 2.0000 200.000 400.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 2.0000 150.000 300.00
Item: MULCHING SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: NW 62 St medians and ROWs from NW 31 Ave to Hawkins Rd
Unit of EA Quantity: 2.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 2.0000 42.500 85.00
VisualScape, Inc. 2.0000 1,785.000 3,570.00
AR Maintenance Solutions 2.0000 250.000 500.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 2.0000 200.000 400.00
Item: MOW SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: Cypress Creek Rd medians from Powerlilne Rd to NW 31 Ave
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Unit of EA Quantity: 26.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 26.0000 385.000 10,010.00
VisualScape, Inc. 26.0000 1,008.000 26,208.00
AR Maintenance Solutions 26.0000 400.000 10,400.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 26.0000 435.000 11,310.00
Item: ADDT'L WEED & TRASH SVC-SEE NOTE
Description: Cypress Creek Rd medians from Powerlilne Rd to NW 31 Ave
Unit of EA Quantity: 11.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 11.0000 70.000 770.00
VisualScape, Inc. 11.0000 222.000 2,442.00
AR Maintenance Solutions 11.0000 100.000 1,100.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 11.0000 75.000 825.00
Item: PRE-EMERGENT SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: Cypress Creek Rd medians from Powerlilne Rd to NW 31 Ave
Unit of EA Quantity: 1.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 1.0000 192.000 192.00
VisualScape, Inc. 1.0000 180.000 180.00
AR Maintenance Solutions 1.0000 175.000 175.00
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Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 1.0000 45.000 45.00
Item: FERTILIZER SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: Cypress Creek Rd medians from Powerlilne Rd to NW 31 Ave
Unit of EA Quantity: 2.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 2.0000 192.000 384.00
VisualScape, Inc. 2.0000 90.000 180.00
AR Maintenance Solutions 2.0000 300.000 600.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 2.0000 180.000 360.00
Item: MULCHING SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: Cypress Creek Rd medians from Powerlilne Rd to NW 31 Ave
Unit of EA Quantity: 2.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 2.0000 255.000 510.00
VisualScape, Inc. 2.0000 1,785.000 3,570.00
AR Maintenance Solutions 2.0000 400.000 800.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 2.0000 234.000 468.00
Item: MOW SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: NW 31st Ave from NW 62 St to NW 69 Ct
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Unit of EA Quantity: 26.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 26.0000 38.500 1,001.00
VisualScape, Inc. 26.0000 168.000 4,368.00
AR Maintenance Solutions 26.0000 500.000 13,000.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 26.0000 125.000 3,250.00
Item: HEDGE SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: NW 31st Ave from NW 62 St to NW 69 Ct %E2%80%93 Palm Aire we
Unit of EA Quantity: 15.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 15.0000 770.000 11,550.00
VisualScape, Inc. 15.0000 2,468.400 37,026.00
AR Maintenance Solutions 15.0000 400.000 6,000.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 15.0000 1.000 15.00
Item: ADDT'L WEED & TRASH SVC-SEE NOTE
Description: NW 31st Ave from NW 62 St to NW 69 Ct
Unit of EA Quantity: 15.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 15.0000 175.000 2,625.00
VisualScape, Inc. 15.0000 296.000 4,440.00
AR Maintenance Solutions 15.0000 400.000 6,000.00
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Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 15.0000 25.000 375.00
Item: PRE-EMERGENT SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: NW 31st Ave from NW 62 St to NW 69 Ct
Unit of EA Quantity: 1.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 1.0000 144.000 144.00
VisualScape, Inc. 1.0000 36.000 36.00
AR Maintenance Solutions 1.0000 400.000 400.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 1.0000 89.000 89.00
Item: FERTILIZER SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: NW 31st Ave from NW 62 St to NW 69 Ct
Unit of EA Quantity: 2.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 2.0000 144.000 288.00
VisualScape, Inc. 2.0000 45.000 90.00
AR Maintenance Solutions 2.0000 500.000 1,000.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 2.0000 585.000 1,170.00
Item: MULCHING SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: NW 31st Ave from NW 62 St to NW 69 Ct
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Unit of EA Quantity: 2.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 2.0000 637.500 1,275.00
VisualScape, Inc. 2.0000 1,428.000 2,856.00
AR Maintenance Solutions 2.0000 500.000 1,000.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 2.0000 250.000 500.00
Item: MOW SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: Commercial Blvd medians, from west of I-95 west to Prospect
Unit of EA Quantity: 26.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 26.0000 616.000 16,016.00
VisualScape, Inc. 26.0000 672.000 17,472.00
AR Maintenance Solutions 26.0000 325.000 8,450.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 26.0000 290.000 7,540.00
Item: HEDGE SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: Commercial Blvd medians, from west of I-95 west to Prospect
Unit of EA Quantity: 15.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 15.0000 308.000 4,620.00
VisualScape, Inc. 15.0000 538.560 8,078.40
AR Maintenance Solutions 15.0000 400.000 6,000.00
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Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 15.0000 435.000 6,525.00
Item: ADDT'L WEED & TRASH SVC-SEE NOTE
Description: Commercial Blvd medians, from west of I-95 west to Prospect
Unit of EA Quantity: 11.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 11.0000 70.000 770.00
VisualScape, Inc. 11.0000 296.000 3,256.00
AR Maintenance Solutions 11.0000 100.000 1,100.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 11.0000 75.000 825.00
Item: PRE-EMERGENT SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: Commercial Blvd medians, from west of I-95 west to Prospect
Unit of EA Quantity: 1.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 1.0000 384.000 384.00
VisualScape, Inc. 1.0000 180.000 180.00
AR Maintenance Solutions 1.0000 175.000 175.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 1.0000 177.000 177.00
Item: FERTILIZER SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: Commercial Blvd medians, from west of I-95 west to Prospect
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Tabulation Of Bids For Event # 384: Turf Grass Maintenance NW

Unit of EA Quantity: 2.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 2.0000 384.000 768.00
VisualScape, Inc. 2.0000 225.000 450.00
AR Maintenance Solutions 2.0000 700.000 1,400.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 2.0000 585.000 1,170.00
Item: MULCHING SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: Commercial Blvd medians, from west of I-95 west to Prospect
Unit of EA Quantity: 2.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 2.0000 17.000 34.00
VisualScape, Inc. 2.0000 3,213.000 6,426.00
AR Maintenance Solutions 2.0000 3,500.000 7,000.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 2.0000 3,861.000 7,722.00
Item: MOW SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: 301 N Andrews Ave City Hall Annex lot
Unit of EA Quantity: 26.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 26.0000 385.000 10,010.00
VisualScape, Inc. 26.0000 1,008.000 26,208.00
AR Maintenance Solutions 26.0000 400.000 10,400.00
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Tabulation Of Bids For Event # 384: Turf Grass Maintenance NW

Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 26.0000 435.000 11,310.00
Item: HEDGE SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: 301 N Andrews Ave City Hall Annex lot
Unit of EA Quantity: 15.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 15.0000 192.500 2,887.50
VisualScape, Inc. 15.0000 89.760 1,346.40
AR Maintenance Solutions 15.0000 100.000 1,500.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 15.0000 75.000 1,125.00
Item: ADDT'L WEED & TRASH SVC-SEE NOTE
Description: 301 N Andrews Ave City Hall Annex lot
Unit of EA Quantity: 11.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 11.0000 105.000 1,155.00
VisualScape, Inc. 11.0000 296.000 3,256.00
AR Maintenance Solutions 11.0000 100.000 1,100.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 11.0000 45.000 495.00
Item: PRE-EMERGENT SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: 301 N Andrews Ave City Hall Annex lot
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Tabulation Of Bids For Event # 384: Turf Grass Maintenance NW

Unit of EA Quantity: 1.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 1.0000 144.000 144.00
VisualScape, Inc. 1.0000 360.000 360.00
AR Maintenance Solutions 1.0000 400.000 400.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 1.0000 354.000 354.00
Item: FERTILIZER SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: 301 N Andrews Ave City Hall Annex lot
Unit of EA Quantity: 2.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 2.0000 144.000 288.00
VisualScape, Inc. 2.0000 112.500 225.00
AR Maintenance Solutions 2.0000 350.000 700.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 2.0000 315.000 630.00
Item: MULCHING SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: 301 N Andrews Ave City Hall Annex lot
Unit of EA Quantity: 2.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 2.0000 212.500 425.00
VisualScape, Inc. 2.0000 1,428.000 2,856.00
AR Maintenance Solutions 2.0000 350.000 700.00
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Tabulation Of Bids For Event # 384: Turf Grass Maintenance NW

Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 2.0000 325.000 650.00
Item: MOW SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: NW 19 St medians from NW 31 Ave to NW 3400 Blk
Unit of EA Quantity: 26.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 26.0000 77.000 2,002.00
VisualScape, Inc. 26.0000 84.000 2,184.00
AR Maintenance Solutions 26.0000 75.000 1,950.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 26.0000 45.000 1,170.00
Item: ADDT'L WEED & TRASH SVC-SEE NOTE
Description: NW 19 St medians from NW 31 Ave to NW 3400 Blk
Unit of EA Quantity: 11.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 11.0000 35.000 385.00
VisualScape, Inc. 11.0000 18.500 203.50
AR Maintenance Solutions 11.0000 50.000 550.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 11.0000 20.000 220.00
Item: PRE-EMERGENT SERVICE
Description: NW 19 St medians from NW 31 Ave to NW 3400 Blk
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Tabulation Of Bids For Event # 384: Turf Grass Maintenance NW

Unit of EA Quantity: 1.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 1.0000 96.000 96.00
VisualScape, Inc. 1.0000 54.000 54.00
AR Maintenance Solutions 1.0000 50.000 50.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 1.0000 65.000 65.00
Item: FERTILIZER SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: NW 19 St medians from NW 31 Ave to NW 3400 Blk
Unit of EA Quantity: 2.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 2.0000 96.000 192.00
VisualScape, Inc. 2.0000 112.500 225.00
AR Maintenance Solutions 2.0000 350.000 700.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 2.0000 293.000 586.00
Item: MULCHING SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: NW 19 St medians from NW 31 Ave to NW 3400 Blk
Unit of EA Quantity: 2.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 2.0000 34.000 68.00
VisualScape, Inc. 2.0000 71.400 142.80
AR Maintenance Solutions 2.0000 150.000 300.00
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Tabulation Of Bids For Event # 384: Turf Grass Maintenance NW

Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 2.0000 70.000 140.00
Item: HEDGE SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: NW 13th Street medians from Powerline Rd to Andrews Ave
Unit of EA Quantity: 15.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 15.0000 308.000 4,620.00
VisualScape, Inc. 15.0000 8.980 134.70
AR Maintenance Solutions 15.0000 100.000 1,500.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 15.0000 75.000 1,125.00
Item: ADDT'L WEED & TRASH SVE-SEE NOTE
Description: NW 13th Street medians from Powerline Rd to Andrews Ave
Unit of EA Quantity: 11.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 11.0000 35.000 385.00
VisualScape, Inc. 11.0000 18.500 203.50
AR Maintenance Solutions 11.0000 50.000 550.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 11.0000 20.000 220.00
Item: PRE-EMERGENT SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: NW 13th Street medians from Powerline Rd to Andrews Ave
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Tabulation Of Bids For Event # 384: Turf Grass Maintenance NW

Unit of EA Quantity: 1.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 1.0000 144.000 144.00
VisualScape, Inc. 1.0000 45.000 45.00
AR Maintenance Solutions 1.0000 50.000 50.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 1.0000 45.000 45.00
Item: FERTILIZER SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: NW 13th Street medians from Powerline Rd to Andrews Ave
Unit of EA Quantity: 2.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 2.0000 144.000 288.00
VisualScape, Inc. 2.0000 112.500 225.00
AR Maintenance Solutions 2.0000 250.000 500.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 2.0000 293.000 586.00
Item: MULCHING SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: NW 13th Street medians from Powerline Rd to Andrews Ave
Unit of EA Quantity: 2.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 2.0000 170.000 340.00
VisualScape, Inc. 2.0000 178.500 357.00
AR Maintenance Solutions 2.0000 300.000 600.00
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Tabulation Of Bids For Event # 384: Turf Grass Maintenance NW

Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 2.0000 200.000 400.00
Item: MOW SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: Palm Aire Village Entranceways
Unit of EA Quantity: 26.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 26.0000 308.000 8,008.00
VisualScape, Inc. 26.0000 252.000 6,552.00
AR Maintenance Solutions 26.0000 100.000 2,600.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 26.0000 117.000 3,042.00
Item: HEDGE SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: Palm Aire Village Entranceways
Unit of EA Quantity: 15.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 15.0000 308.000 4,620.00
VisualScape, Inc. 15.0000 44.880 673.20
AR Maintenance Solutions 15.0000 50.000 750.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 15.0000 45.000 675.00
Item: ADDT'L WEED & TRASH SVC-SEE NOTE
Description: Palm Aire Village Entranceways
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Tabulation Of Bids For Event # 384: Turf Grass Maintenance NW

Unit of EA Quantity: 11.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 11.0000 35.000 385.00
VisualScape, Inc. 11.0000 18.500 203.50
AR Maintenance Solutions 11.0000 50.000 550.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 11.0000 20.000 220.00
Item: PRE-EMERGENT SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: Palm Aire Village Entranceways
Unit of EA Quantity: 1.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 1.0000 96.000 96.00
VisualScape, Inc. 1.0000 45.000 45.00
AR Maintenance Solutions 1.0000 50.000 50.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 1.0000 45.000 45.00
Item: FERTILIZER SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: Palm Aire Village Entranceways
Unit of EA Quantity: 2.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 2.0000 96.000 192.00
VisualScape, Inc. 2.0000 45.000 90.00
AR Maintenance Solutions 2.0000 200.000 400.00
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Tabulation Of Bids For Event # 384: Turf Grass Maintenance NW

Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 2.0000 117.000 234.00
Item: MULCHING SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: Palm Aire Village Entranceways
Unit of EA Quantity: 2.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 2.0000 212.500 425.00
VisualScape, Inc. 2.0000 357.000 714.00
AR Maintenance Solutions 2.0000 100.000 200.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 2.0000 65.000 130.00
Item: MOW SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: Palm Aire Village Canal Ends
Unit of EA Quantity: 26.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 26.0000 154.000 4,004.00
VisualScape, Inc. 26.0000 84.000 2,184.00
AR Maintenance Solutions 26.0000 50.000 1,300.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 26.0000 45.000 1,170.00
Item: HEDGE SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: Palm Aire Village Canal Ends
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Tabulation Of Bids For Event # 384: Turf Grass Maintenance NW

Unit of EA Quantity: 15.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 15.0000 77.000 1,155.00
VisualScape, Inc. 15.0000 22.440 336.60
AR Maintenance Solutions 15.0000 40.000 600.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 15.0000 20.000 300.00
Item: ADDT'L WEED & TRASH SVC-SEE NOTE
Description: Palm Aire Village Canal Ends
Unit of EA Quantity: 11.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 11.0000 35.000 385.00
VisualScape, Inc. 11.0000 18.500 203.50
AR Maintenance Solutions 11.0000 40.000 440.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 11.0000 20.000 220.00
Item: PRE-EMERGENT SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: Palm Aire Village Canal Ends
Unit of EA Quantity: 1.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 1.0000 144.000 144.00
VisualScape, Inc. 1.0000 45.000 45.00
AR Maintenance Solutions 1.0000 40.000 40.00
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Tabulation Of Bids For Event # 384: Turf Grass Maintenance NW

Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 1.0000 45.000 45.00
Item: FERTILIZER SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: Palm Aire Village Canal Ends
Unit of EA Quantity: 2.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 2.0000 144.000 288.00
VisualScape, Inc. 2.0000 45.000 90.00
AR Maintenance Solutions 2.0000 100.000 200.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 2.0000 117.000 234.00
Item: MULCHING SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: Palm Aire Village Canal Ends
Unit of EA Quantity: 2.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 2.0000 127.500 255.00
VisualScape, Inc. 2.0000 357.000 714.00
AR Maintenance Solutions 2.0000 75.000 150.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 2.0000 50.000 100.00
Item: MOW SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: Palm Aire Entrance
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Tabulation Of Bids For Event # 384: Turf Grass Maintenance NW

Unit of EA Quantity: 26.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 26.0000 770.000 20,020.00
VisualScape, Inc. 26.0000 672.000 17,472.00
AR Maintenance Solutions 26.0000 350.000 9,100.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 26.0000 292.000 7,592.00
Item: HEDGE SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: Palm Aire Entrance
Unit of EA Quantity: 15.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 15.0000 1,232.000 18,480.00
VisualScape, Inc. 15.0000 1,436.160 21,542.40
AR Maintenance Solutions 15.0000 1,200.000 18,000.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 15.0000 1,150.000 17,250.00
Item: ADDT'L WEED & TRASH SVC-SEE NOTE
Description: Palm Aire Entrance
Unit of EA Quantity: 11.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 11.0000 70.000 770.00
VisualScape, Inc. 11.0000 222.000 2,442.00
AR Maintenance Solutions 11.0000 75.000 825.00
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Tabulation Of Bids For Event # 384: Turf Grass Maintenance NW

Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 11.0000 75.000 825.00
Item: PRE-EMERGENT SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: Palm Aire Entrance
Unit of EA Quantity: 1.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 1.0000 288.000 288.00
VisualScape, Inc. 1.0000 180.000 180.00
AR Maintenance Solutions 1.0000 200.000 200.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 1.0000 192.000 192.00
Item: FERTILIZER SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: Palm Aire Entrance
Unit of EA Quantity: 2.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 2.0000 288.000 576.00
VisualScape, Inc. 2.0000 225.000 450.00
AR Maintenance Solutions 2.0000 600.000 1,200.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 2.0000 585.000 1,170.00
Item: MULCHING SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: Palm Aire Entrance
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Tabulation Of Bids For Event # 384: Turf Grass Maintenance NW

Unit of EA Quantity: 2.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 2.0000 595.000 1,190.00
VisualScape, Inc. 2.0000 4,641.000 9,282.00
AR Maintenance Solutions 2.0000 600.000 1,200.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 2.0000 515.000 1,030.00
Item: MOW SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: NW 12 Av/Orioles Blvd medians from NW 56 St to NW 62 St
Unit of EA Quantity: 26.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 26.0000 154.000 4,004.00
VisualScape, Inc. 26.0000 84.000 2,184.00
AR Maintenance Solutions 26.0000 50.000 1,300.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 26.0000 45.000 1,170.00
Item: ADDT'L WEED & TRASH SVC-SEE NOTE
Description: NW 12 Av/Orioles Blvd medians from NW 56 St to NW 62 St
Unit of EA Quantity: 11.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 11.0000 35.000 385.00
VisualScape, Inc. 11.0000 18.500 203.50
AR Maintenance Solutions 11.0000 40.000 440.00
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Tabulation Of Bids For Event # 384: Turf Grass Maintenance NW

Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 11.0000 20.000 220.00
Item: PRE-EMERGENT SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: NW 12 Av/Orioles Blvd medians from NW 56 St to NW 62 St
Unit of EA Quantity: 1.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 1.0000 144.000 144.00
VisualScape, Inc. 1.0000 45.000 45.00
AR Maintenance Solutions 1.0000 40.000 40.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 1.0000 45.000 45.00
Item: FERTILIZER SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: NW 12 Av/Orioles Blvd medians from NW 56 St to NW 62 St
Unit of EA Quantity: 2.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 2.0000 144.000 288.00
VisualScape, Inc. 2.0000 45.000 90.00
AR Maintenance Solutions 2.0000 200.000 400.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 2.0000 117.000 234.00
Item: MULCHING SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: NW 12 Av/Orioles Blvd medians from NW 56 St to NW 62 St
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Tabulation Of Bids For Event # 384: Turf Grass Maintenance NW

Unit of EA Quantity: 2.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 2.0000 25.500 51.00
VisualScape, Inc. 2.0000 71.400 142.80
AR Maintenance Solutions 2.0000 200.000 400.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 2.0000 500.000 1,000.00
Item: MOW SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: NW 31 Ave medians from Commercial Blvd to McNab Rd
Unit of EA Quantity: 26.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 26.0000 462.000 12,012.00
VisualScape, Inc. 26.0000 1,344.000 34,944.00
AR Maintenance Solutions 26.0000 600.000 15,600.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 26.0000 585.000 15,210.00
Item: ADDT'L WEED & TRASH SVC-SEE NOTE
Description: NW 31 Ave medians from Commercial Blvd to McNab Rd
Unit of EA Quantity: 11.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 11.0000 70.000 770.00
VisualScape, Inc. 11.0000 222.000 2,442.00
AR Maintenance Solutions 11.0000 75.000 825.00
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Tabulation Of Bids For Event # 384: Turf Grass Maintenance NW

Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 11.0000 75.000 825.00
Item: PRE-EMERGENT SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: NW 31 Ave medians from Commercial Blvd to McNab Rd
Unit of EA Quantity: 1.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 1.0000 384.000 384.00
VisualScape, Inc. 1.0000 180.000 180.00
AR Maintenance Solutions 1.0000 150.000 150.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 1.0000 175.000 175.00
Item: FERTILIZER SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: NW 31 Ave medians from Commercial Blvd to McNab Rd
Unit of EA Quantity: 2.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 2.0000 384.000 768.00
VisualScape, Inc. 2.0000 180.000 360.00
AR Maintenance Solutions 2.0000 450.000 900.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 2.0000 468.000 936.00
Item: MULCHING SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: NW 31 Ave medians from Commercial Blvd to McNab Rd
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Tabulation Of Bids For Event # 384: Turf Grass Maintenance NW

Unit of EA Quantity: 2.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 2.0000 212.500 425.00
VisualScape, Inc. 2.0000 357.000 714.00
AR Maintenance Solutions 2.0000 500.000 1,000.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 2.0000 360.000 720.00
Item: MOW SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: McNab Road medians from NW 31 Ave to NW 21 Ave
Unit of EA Quantity: 26.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 26.0000 462.000 12,012.00
VisualScape, Inc. 26.0000 1,008.000 26,208.00
AR Maintenance Solutions 26.0000 500.000 13,000.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 26.0000 439.000 11,414.00
Item: ADDT'L WEED & TRASH SVC-SEE NOTE
Description: McNab Road medians from NW 31 Ave to NW 21 Ave
Unit of EA Quantity: 11.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 11.0000 70.000 770.00
VisualScape, Inc. 11.0000 222.000 2,442.00
AR Maintenance Solutions 11.0000 900.000 9,900.00
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Tabulation Of Bids For Event # 384: Turf Grass Maintenance NW

Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 11.0000 872.000 9,592.00
Item: PRE-EMERGENT SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: McNab Road medians from NW 31 Ave to NW 21 Ave
Unit of EA Quantity: 1.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 1.0000 192.000 192.00
VisualScape, Inc. 1.0000 90.000 90.00
AR Maintenance Solutions 1.0000 100.000 100.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 1.0000 90.000 90.00
Item: FERTILIZER SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: McNab Road medians from NW 31 Ave to NW 21 Ave
Unit of EA Quantity: 2.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 2.0000 192.000 384.00
VisualScape, Inc. 2.0000 787.500 1,575.00
AR Maintenance Solutions 2.0000 2,000.000 4,000.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 2.0000 1,767.000 3,534.00
Item: MULCHING SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: McNab Road medians from NW 31 Ave to NW 21 Ave
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Tabulation Of Bids For Event # 384: Turf Grass Maintenance NW

Unit of EA Quantity: 2.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 2.0000 297.500 595.00
VisualScape, Inc. 2.0000 714.000 1,428.00
AR Maintenance Solutions 2.0000 500.000 1,000.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 2.0000 350.000 700.00
Item: MOW SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: NW 21 Ave from Cypress Creek Rd to McNab Rd, west swale only
Unit of EA Quantity: 26.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 26.0000 770.000 20,020.00
VisualScape, Inc. 26.0000 84.000 2,184.00
AR Maintenance Solutions 26.0000 100.000 2,600.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 26.0000 45.000 1,170.00
Item: HEDGE SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: NW 21 Ave from Cypress Creek Rd to McNab Rd, west swale only
Unit of EA Quantity: 15.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 15.0000 308.000 4,620.00
VisualScape, Inc. 15.0000 718.080 10,771.20
AR Maintenance Solutions 15.0000 175.000 2,625.00
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Tabulation Of Bids For Event # 384: Turf Grass Maintenance NW

Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 15.0000 140.000 2,100.00
Item: ADDT'L WEED & TRASH SVC-SEE NOTE
Description: NW 21 Ave from Cypress Creek Rd to McNab Rd, west swale only
Unit of EA Quantity: 11.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 11.0000 70.000 770.00
VisualScape, Inc. 11.0000 148.000 1,628.00
AR Maintenance Solutions 11.0000 50.000 550.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 11.0000 20.000 220.00
Item: PRE-EMERGENT SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: NW 21 Ave from Cypress Creek Rd to McNab Rd, west swale only
Unit of EA Quantity: 1.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 1.0000 192.000 192.00
VisualScape, Inc. 1.0000 45.000 45.00
AR Maintenance Solutions 1.0000 50.000 50.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 1.0000 45.000 45.00
Item: FERTILIZER SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: NW 21 Ave from Cypress Creek Rd to McNab Rd, west swale only
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Tabulation Of Bids For Event # 384: Turf Grass Maintenance NW

Unit of EA Quantity: 2.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 2.0000 192.000 384.00
VisualScape, Inc. 2.0000 112.500 225.00
AR Maintenance Solutions 2.0000 400.000 800.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 2.0000 293.000 586.00
Item: MULCHING SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: NW 21 Ave from Cypress Creek Rd to McNab Rd, west swale only
Unit of EA Quantity: 2.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 2.0000 212.500 425.00
VisualScape, Inc. 2.0000 2,142.000 4,284.00
AR Maintenance Solutions 2.0000 300.000 600.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 2.0000 190.000 380.00
Item: MOW SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: 625 NW 2 Ave Water Tower
Unit of EA Quantity: 26.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 26.0000 231.000 6,006.00
VisualScape, Inc. 26.0000 168.000 4,368.00
AR Maintenance Solutions 26.0000 100.000 2,600.00
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Tabulation Of Bids For Event # 384: Turf Grass Maintenance NW

Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 26.0000 75.000 1,950.00
Item: HEDGE SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: 625 NW 2 Ave Water Tower
Unit of EA Quantity: 15.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 15.0000 19.250 288.75
VisualScape, Inc. 15.0000 44.880 673.20
AR Maintenance Solutions 15.0000 75.000 1,125.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 15.0000 45.000 675.00
Item: ADDT'L WEED & TRASH SVC-SEE NOTE
Description: 625 NW 2 Ave Water Tower
Unit of EA Quantity: 11.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 11.0000 35.000 385.00
VisualScape, Inc. 11.0000 18.500 203.50
AR Maintenance Solutions 11.0000 50.000 550.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 11.0000 20.000 220.00
Item: PRE-EMERGENT SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: 625 NW 2 Ave Water Tower
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Tabulation Of Bids For Event # 384: Turf Grass Maintenance NW

Unit of EA Quantity: 1.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 1.0000 96.000 96.00
VisualScape, Inc. 1.0000 90.000 90.00
AR Maintenance Solutions 1.0000 75.000 75.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 1.0000 100.000 100.00
Item: FERTILIZER SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: 625 NW 2 Ave Water Tower
Unit of EA Quantity: 2.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 2.0000 96.000 192.00
VisualScape, Inc. 2.0000 112.500 225.00
AR Maintenance Solutions 2.0000 350.000 700.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 2.0000 310.000 620.00
Item: MULCHING SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: 625 NW 2 Ave Water Tower
Unit of EA Quantity: 2.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 2.0000 17.000 34.00
VisualScape, Inc. 2.0000 357.000 714.00
AR Maintenance Solutions 2.0000 150.000 300.00
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Tabulation Of Bids For Event # 384: Turf Grass Maintenance NW

Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 2.0000 50.000 100.00
Item: MOW SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: Mobility Hub
Unit of EA Quantity: 26.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 26.0000 423.500 11,011.00
VisualScape, Inc. 26.0000 672.000 17,472.00
AR Maintenance Solutions 26.0000 350.000 9,100.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 26.0000 290.000 7,540.00
Item: HEDGE SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: Mobility Hub
Unit of EA Quantity: 15.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 15.0000 616.000 9,240.00
VisualScape, Inc. 15.0000 89.760 1,346.40
AR Maintenance Solutions 15.0000 100.000 1,500.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 15.0000 75.000 1,125.00
Item: ADDT'L WEED & TRASH SVC-SEE NOTE
Description: Mobility Hub
November 5, 2024 Page 45

CAM #25-0023

Exhibit 2

Page 45 of 49




Tabulation Of Bids For Event # 384: Turf Grass Maintenance NW

Unit of EA Quantity: 11.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 11.0000 140.000 1,540.00
VisualScape, Inc. 11.0000 111.000 1,221.00
AR Maintenance Solutions 11.0000 50.000 550.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 11.0000 45.000 495.00
Item: PRE-EMERGENT SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: Mobility Hub
Unit of EA Quantity: 1.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 1.0000 384.000 384.00
VisualScape, Inc. 1.0000 180.000 180.00
AR Maintenance Solutions 1.0000 150.000 150.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 1.0000 180.000 180.00
Item: FERTILIZER SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: Mobility Hub
Unit of EA Quantity: 2.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 2.0000 384.000 768.00
VisualScape, Inc. 2.0000 180.000 360.00
AR Maintenance Solutions 2.0000 500.000 1,000.00
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Tabulation Of Bids For Event # 384: Turf Grass Maintenance NW

Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 2.0000 480.000 960.00
Item: MULCHING SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: Mobility Hub
Unit of EA Quantity: 2.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 2.0000 2,380.000 4,760.00
VisualScape, Inc. 2.0000 714.000 1,428.00
AR Maintenance Solutions 2.0000 550.000 1,100.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 2.0000 525.000 1,050.00
Item: MOW SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: NW 12 Ave Median from NW 20 St to dead end at 2200 Blk
Unit of EA Quantity: 26.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 26.0000 346.500 9,009.00
VisualScape, Inc. 26.0000 336.000 8,736.00
AR Maintenance Solutions 26.0000 150.000 3,900.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 26.0000 190.000 4,940.00
Item: ADDT'L WEED & TRASH SVC-SEE NOTE
Description: NW 12 Ave Median from NW 20 St to dead end at 2200 Blk
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Tabulation Of Bids For Event # 384: Turf Grass Maintenance NW

Unit of EA Quantity: 11.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 11.0000 70.000 770.00
VisualScape, Inc. 11.0000 18.500 203.50
AR Maintenance Solutions 11.0000 150.000 1,650.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 11.0000 75.000 825.00
Item: PRE-EMERGENT SERVIC - SEE NOTES
Description: NW 12 Ave Median from NW 20 St to dead end at 2200 Blk
Unit of EA Quantity: 1.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 1.0000 48.000 48.00
VisualScape, Inc. 1.0000 36.000 36.00
AR Maintenance Solutions 1.0000 125.000 125.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 1.0000 50.000 50.00
Item: FERTILIZER SERVICE - SEE NOTES
Description: NW 12 Ave Median from NW 20 St to dead end at 2200 Blk
Unit of EA Quantity: 2.0000
Measure:
Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 2.0000 48.000 96.00
VisualScape, Inc. 2.0000 22.500 45.00
AR Maintenance Solutions 2.0000 200.000 400.00
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Tabulation Of Bids For Event # 384: Turf Grass Maintenance NW

Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 2.0000 50.000 100.00
Item: MULCHING SERVICE - SEE NOTES

Description: NW 12 Ave Median from NW 20 St to dead end at 2200 Blk
Unit of EA Quantity: 2.0000
Measure:

Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount
SFM Landscape Services, LLC. 2.0000 21.250 42.50
VisualScape, Inc. 2.0000 357.000 714.00
AR Maintenance Solutions 2.0000 250.000 500.00
NJ&S Pressure Washing and Painting, 0.0000 0.000 0.00
LLC (No bid)
Rock & Rose Lawn Care LLC 2.0000 1.000 2.00
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