RFP Event 191

George T. Lohmeyer WWTP Deep Injection Well Cleaning

Bid Opening Date: 12/29/23 Layne Christensen Company All Webb's Enterprises, Inc. A.C. Schultes of Florida, Inc.
5741 Zip Drive 309 Commerce Way 11865 US Hwy 41 South
Fort Myers, Florida 33905 Jupier, FL 33458 Gibsonton, FL 33534
tim.cechini@gcinc.com allwebbs@allwebbs.com ADMIN.ACSFL@ACSCHULTES.COM
MBE/SBE/WBE: N/A MBE/SBE/WBE: N/A MBE/SBE/WBE: N/A
Line Item
No Line Description Quantity uom Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price Unit Price Extended Price
Kill the Well 5 ea $ 13,521.03 [ $  67,605.15 | $ 25,000.00 [ $  125,000.00 No Bid No Bid
Brush the Casing 5 ea S 29,919.91 [ $ 149,599.55 | $ 50,000.00 [ $  250,000.00 No Bid No Bid
Pressure Test the
3 Casing 5 ea S 15,668.20 | $ 78,341.00| $ 50,000.00 | $ 250,000.00 No Bid No Bid
Radioactive Tracer
4 Survey 5 ea S 20,156.75 | $ 100,783.75] $ 25,000.00 | $ 125,000.00 No Bid No Bid
5 Video Survey 10 ea S 19,019.37 | S 190,193.70 | $ 10,000.00 | $ 100,000.00 No Bid No Bid
6 Painting 1 ea $ 299,097.84 | $ 299,097.84 | $ 300,000.00 | $  300,000.00 No Bid No Bid
7 Pipe Replacement 1 ea S 90,869.85 | $ 90,869.85 | S 120,000.00 | $ 120,000.00 No Bid No Bid
Mobilization / ] ]
8 Demobilization 1 ea S 17,167.87 | $ 17,167.87 ] $ 100,000.00 | $ 100,000.00 No Bid No Bid
|  BidSubtotal: $ 993,658.71]  Bid Subtotal: $ 1,370,000.00 |  Bid Subtotal: $ -
Allowances
Additional Equipment $ 20,000.00 20,000.00 | $ 20,000.00
Rental Allowance
Additional Labor S 10,000.00 | S 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00
Additional Material $ 10,000.00 | 10,000.00 | $ 10,000.00
Allowance
Crane Rental Allowance S 20,000.00 | $ 20,000.00 | S 20,000.00
FPL, AT&T Allowance S 20,000.00 | $ 20,000.00 | $ 20,000.00
P itF & Testi
ermit Fees & Testing $ 100,000.00 | $ 100,000.00 | $ 100,000.00
Allowance
Owner’s Contingency S 20,000.00 | $ 20,000.00 | $ 20,000.00
Allowance Allowance Allowance
Subtotal: % 200,000.00 Subtotal: 3 200,000.00 Subtotal: )

Grand Total:

$ 1,193,658.71

Grand Total:

$ 1,570,000.00

Grand Total:

No Bid
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