
Bid Opening Date: 6/24/2024

 MBE:  N/A  MBE:  Yes  MBE/SBE/WBE:  N/A 

Line Item 
No

 Quantity UOM  Unit Price  Unit Price  Extended Price  Unit Price  Extended Price 

1
All Work Associated with the 
Mobilization & Demobilization Storm Station 1 1 LS 125,000.00$          125,000.00$       120,000.00$          120,000.00$       N/A No Bid

2
Maintenance of Safe Pedestrian 
Traffic Storm Station 1 1 LS 75,000.00$            75,000.00$         163,500.00$          163,500.00$       N/A No Bid

3
All Work Associated with the GIS 
Database Additions Storm Station 1 1 LS 9,500.00$              9,500.00$           10,000.00$            10,000.00$         N/A No Bid

4
All Work Associated with the As-
Built/Record Drawings Storm Station 1 1 LS 12,500.00$            12,500.00$         14,000.00$            14,000.00$         N/A No Bid

5 Prevention Control and Abatement of 
Erosion and Water Pollut

Storm Station 1 1 LS 30,000.00$            30,000.00$         1,500.00$              1,500.00$           N/A No Bid

6
Clearing and Grubbing Storm Station 1 1 LS 55,000.00$            55,000.00$         255,500.00$          255,500.00$       N/A No Bid

7
Furnish & Install Reinforced  Concete 
Base Slab Storm Station 1 1 LS 15,000.00$            15,000.00$         16,000.00$            16,000.00$         N/A No Bid

8
Furnish & Install Generator Storm Station 1 1 LS 628,000.00$          628,000.00$       733,500.00$          733,500.00$       N/A No Bid

9
Furnish & Install Masonry Retaining 
Wall Storm Station 1 70 LF 1,200.00$              84,000.00$         483.00$                 33,810.00$         N/A No Bid

10
Excavate 12" Soil at Generator Pad Storm Station 1 5 CY 500.00$                 2,500.00$           100.00$                 500.00$              N/A No Bid

11
Furnish & Install Helical Piles Storm Station 1 4 EA 8,500.00$              34,000.00$         3,200.00$              12,800.00$         N/A No Bid

12
Furnish and Place Stabilized Subgrade Storm Station 1 35 CY 500.00$                 17,500.00$         60.00$  2,100.00$           N/A No Bid

13
Furnish and Install 8-foot White Vinyl 
PVC Fence Storm Station 1 90 LF 300.00$                 27,000.00$         177.50$                 15,975.00$         N/A No Bid

14
Furnish & Install Electrical Equipment Storm Station 1 1 LS 295,000.00$          295,000.00$       261,000.00$          261,000.00$       N/A No Bid

15
Restoration of Paver Walkways Storm Station 1 30 SY 900.00$                 27,000.00$         168.00$                 5,040.00$           N/A No Bid

16
Restoration of Existing Irrigation 
System Storm Station 1 1 LS 10,500.00$            10,500.00$         1,100.00$              1,100.00$           N/A No Bid

17
Furnish and Install Planting Storm Station 1 75 EA 250.00$                 18,750.00$         60.00$  4,500.00$           N/A No Bid

18
Furnish and Install Sod Storm Station 1 10 SY 400.00$                 4,000.00$           20.00$  200.00$              N/A No Bid

21
All Work Associated with the 
Mobilization & Demobilization Storm Station 1 1 LS 125,000.00$          125,000.00$       120,000.00$          120,000.00$       N/A No Bid

22
 Maintenance of Safe Pedestrian 
Traffic Storm Station 1 1 LS 75,000.00$            75,000.00$         158,500.00$          158,500.00$       N/A No Bid

23
All Work Associated with the GIS 
Database Additions Storm Station 2 1 LS 9,500.00$              9,500.00$           10,000.00$            10,000.00$         N/A No Bid

24
All Work Associated with the As-
Built/Record Drawings Storm Station 2 1 LS 12,500.00$            12,500.00$         14,000.00$            14,000.00$         N/A No Bid

25  Prevention Control and Abatement of 
Erosion and Water Pollu

Storm Station 2 1 LS 25,000.00$            25,000.00$         3,500.00$              3,500.00$           N/A No Bid

26
Clearing and Grubbing Storm Station 2 1 EA 45,000.00$            45,000.00$         262,000.00$          262,000.00$       N/A No Bid

27
Furnish & Install Reinforced Concrete 
Base Slab Storm Station 2 1 LS 12,000.00$            12,000.00$         15,000.00$            15,000.00$         N/A No Bid

28
Excavate 12" Soil at Generator Pad Storm Station 2 5 CY 500.00$                 2,500.00$           100.00$                 500.00$              N/A No Bid

29
Furnish & Install Reinforced Concrete 
Base Slab Storm Station 2 4 EA 8,500.00$              34,000.00$         3,200.00$              12,800.00$         N/A No Bid

30
Furnish & Install Masonry Retaining 
Wall Storm Station 2 70 LF 1,200.00$              84,000.00$         483.00$                 33,810.00$         N/A No Bid

31
Furnish and Place Stabilized Subgrade Storm Station 2 10 CY 500.00$                 5,000.00$           60.00$  600.00$              N/A No Bid

32
Furnish & Install 8-foot White Vinyl 
PVC Fence Storm Station 2 90 LF 300.00$                 27,000.00$         177.50$                 15,975.00$         N/A No Bid

33
Furnish & Install Generator Storm Station 2 1 LS 552,000.00$          552,000.00$       607,000.00$          607,000.00$       N/A No Bid

34
Furnish & Install Electrical Equipment Storm Station 2 1 LS 285,000.00$          285,000.00$       475,000.00$          475,000.00$       N/A No Bid

35
Restoration of Paver Walkways Storm Station 2 20 SY 900.00$                 18,000.00$         178.00$                 3,560.00$           N/A No Bid

36
Restoration of Existing Irrigation 
System Storm Station 2 1 LS 9,500.00$              9,500.00$           1,100.00$              1,100.00$           N/A No Bid

37
Furnish and Install Planting Storm Station 2 20 EA 250.00$                 5,000.00$           60.00$  1,200.00$           N/A No Bid

38
Furnish and Install Sod Storm Station 2 40 SY 400.00$                 16,000.00$         21.00$  840.00$              N/A No Bid

Bid Subtotal: 2,812,250.00$   Bid Subtotal: 3,386,410.00$   Bid Subtotal: No Bid
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Bid Opening Date: 6/24/2024

 MBE:  N/A  MBE:  Yes  MBE/SBE/WBE:  N/A 

Line Item 
No

 Quantity UOM  Unit Price  Unit Price  Extended Price  Unit Price  Extended Price 

Stormstation 1 and 2 Fixed Emergency Generators

 2601 Wiles Road
Pompano Beach, FL 33073 

 bids@dmsi.co 

 Horsepower Electric, Inc. 
 8105 W 20th Avenue

Hialeah, FL 33014 
 mike@horsepowerelectric.com 

Event 283

 David Mancini and Sons, Inc.  Zabatt Engine Services 

Line Description

 Allowance 
Subtotal: 

130,000.00$        Allowance 
Subtotal: 

130,000.00$        Allowance 
Subtotal: 

No Bid

Grand Total: 2,942,250.00$   Grand Total: 3,516,410.00$   Grand Total: No Bid

30,000.00$   Permit, Licenses & Fees 
Allowance 

 Natural Gas Connection 
Allowance 

Allowances

30,000.00$  No Bid

100,000.00$  No Bid100,000.00$  
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