
Tabulation Of Bids
Event # : 274

Version: 5

Name: Peele Dixie WTP Variable Frequency Drive Modernization

Description: The City of Fort Lauderdale is seeking to contract the services of a variable frequency drive manufacturer
with experience and expertise in the area of design, fabrication and installation of VFD modernization
projects, within the scope of this IFB.

Open Date: 03/25/2024 03:00:00 PM Close Date: 05/03/2024 02:00:00 PM

Event Currency: USD

Supplier Bid Amount

JST Power
Equipment

0.00

30 Skyline Drive
Lake Mary, FL 32746

* * Supplier has responses with a no bid

Graybar Electric 485,412.48

1255 NW 21st Street
Pompano Beach, FL 33069

Rexel USA, Inc. 802,550.00

3625 SW 30th Ave.
Fort Lauderdale, FL 33312

Revere Control
Systems, Inc.

933,094.00

5201 Princeton Way
Hoover, AL 35226

Items
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Item: 250HP VARIABLE FREQUENCY DRIVE
Description: 250HP Variable Frequency Drive

Long Item
Description:

Delivery and Installation included

Unit of
Measure:

EA Quantity: 2.0000

Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount

JST Power Equipment (No bid) 0.0000 0.00000000 0.00

Graybar Electric 2.0000 61,170.56000000 122,341.12

Rexel USA, Inc. 2.0000 40,125.00000000 80,250.00

Revere Control Systems, Inc. 2.0000 126,928.00000000 253,856.00

Item: 300HP VARIABLE FREQUENCY DRIVES
Description: 300HP Variable Frequency Drives

Long Item
Description:

Delivery and Installation Included

Unit of
Measure:

EA Quantity: 4.0000

Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount

JST Power Equipment (No bid) 0.0000 0.00000000 0.00

Graybar Electric 4.0000 60,278.48000000 241,113.92

Rexel USA, Inc. 4.0000 93,302.00000000 373,208.00

Revere Control Systems, Inc. 4.0000 112,583.00000000 450,332.00

Item: 50HP VARIABLE FREQUENCY DRIVES
Description: 50HP Variable Frequency Drives

Long Item
Description:

Delivery and Installation included

Unit of
Measure:

EA Quantity: 3.0000
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Quantity Unit Price Extended Amount

JST Power Equipment (No bid) 0.0000 0.00000000 0.00

Graybar Electric 3.0000 40,652.48000000 121,957.44

Rexel USA, Inc. 3.0000 116,364.00000000 349,092.00

Revere Control Systems, Inc. 3.0000 76,302.00000000 228,906.00
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