

### Bid #752-11464 - Cut Paper and Printed Envelopes

Creation Date Jul 3, 2014

End Date Jul 29, 2014 2:00:00 PM EDT

Start Date Jul 7, 2014 2:14:46 PM EDT

Awarded Date Not Yet Awarded

752-11464--01-01 8.5 x 11 60# PRESSURE SENSITIVE OFFSET FLORESCENT RED PAPER					
Supplier	Unit Price	Qty/Unit	Total Price	Attch.	Docs
Mac Paper Converters	First Offer - \$0.00	3 / M	\$0.00		Y
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier Product Code: Supplier Notes: Minimum shipping unit (if applicable): N/A NO BID			
Accurate Forms & Supplies	First Offer - \$0.00	3 / M	\$0.00		Y
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier Product Code: Supplier Notes: Minimum shipping unit (if applicable): 0			
Tampa Envelope [Ad]	First Offer - \$0.00	3 / M	\$0.00		Y
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier Product Code: Supplier Notes: Minimum shipping unit (if applicable): 0 We are a no bid on this item			
Mac Papers, Inc.	First Offer - \$138.52	3 / M	\$415.56	Y	Y
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier Product Code: 092481 Supplier Notes: Minimum shipping unit (if applicable): 1 carton			

752-11464--01-02 8.5 x 11 24# 25% COTTON BOND WHITE					
Supplier	Unit Price	Qty/Unit	Total Price	Attch.	Docs
Mac Paper Converters	First Offer - \$0.00	5 / M	\$0.00		Y
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier Product Code: Supplier Notes: Minimum shipping unit (if applicable): N/A Post Consumer Recycled Content %: N/A NO BID			
Accurate Forms & Supplies	First Offer - \$0.00	5 / M	\$0.00		Y
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier Product Code: Supplier Notes: Minimum shipping unit (if applicable): 0 Post Consumer Recycled Content %: 0			
Tampa Envelope [Ad]	First Offer - \$0.00	5 / M	\$0.00		Y
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier Product Code: Supplier Notes: Minimum shipping unit (if applicable): 0 Post Consumer Recycled Content %: 0 We are a no bid on this item.			
Mac Papers, Inc.	First Offer - \$25.97	5 / M	\$129.85		Y
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier Product Code: 063041 Supplier Notes: Minimum shipping unit (if applicable): 1 carton Post Consumer Recycled Content %: 0			

752-11464--01-03 #10 REGULAR ENVELOPE 24# 25% COTTON WHITE					
Supplier	Unit Price	Qty/Unit	Total Price	Attch.	Docs
Mac Paper Converters	First Offer - \$0.00	5 / M	\$0.00		Y
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier Product Code: Supplier Notes: Minimum shipping unit (if applicable): N/A Post Consumer Recycled Content %: N/A NO BID			
Accurate Forms & Supplies	First Offer - \$0.00	5 / M	\$0.00		Y

Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier Product Code: Supplier Notes: Minimum shipping unit (if applicable) : 0 Post Consumer Recycled Content % : 0			
Tampa Envelope [Ad]	First Offer - \$0.00	5 / M	\$0.00		Y
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier Product Code: Supplier Notes: Minimum shipping unit (if applicable) : 0 Post Consumer Recycled Content % : 0 We are a no bid on this item.			
Mac Papers, Inc.	First Offer - \$71.02	5 / M	\$355.10		Y
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier Product Code: 083881 Supplier Notes: Minimum shipping unit (if applicable) : 1 carton Post Consumer Recycled Content % : 0			

752-11464--01-04 8.5 X 11 60# WHITE SMOOTH OPAQUE OFFSET					
Supplier	Unit Price	Qty/Unit	Total Price	Attch.	Docs
Mac Paper Converters	First Offer - \$0.00	30 / M	\$0.00		Y
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier Product Code: Supplier Notes: Minimum shipping unit (if applicable) : N/A Post Consumer Recycled Content % : N/A NO BID			
Accurate Forms & Supplies	First Offer - \$0.00	30 / M	\$0.00		Y
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier Product Code: Supplier Notes: Minimum shipping unit (if applicable) : 0 Post Consumer Recycled Content % : 0			
Tampa Envelope [Ad]	First Offer - \$0.00	30 / M	\$0.00		Y
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier Product Code: Supplier Notes: Minimum shipping unit (if applicable) : 0 Post Consumer Recycled Content % : 0 We are a no bid on this item.			
Mac Papers, Inc.	First Offer - \$12.51	30 / M	\$375.30		Y
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier Product Code: 067432 Supplier Notes: Minimum shipping unit (if applicable) : 1 carton Post Consumer Recycled Content % : 10			

752-11464--01-05 11 X 17 60# WHITE SMOOTH OPAQUE OFFSET					
Supplier	Unit Price	Qty/Unit	Total Price	Attch.	Docs
Mac Paper Converters	First Offer - \$0.00	150 / M	\$0.00		Y
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier Product Code: Supplier Notes: Minimum shipping unit (if applicable) : N/A Post Consumer Recycled Content % : N/A NO BID			
Tampa Envelope [Ad]	First Offer - \$0.00	150 / M	\$0.00		Y
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier Product Code: Supplier Notes: Minimum shipping unit (if applicable) : 0 Post Consumer Recycled Content % : 0 We are a no bid on this item.			
Accurate Forms & Supplies	First Offer - \$0.00	150 / M	\$0.00		Y
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier Product Code: Supplier Notes: Minimum shipping unit (if applicable) : 0 Post Consumer Recycled Content % : 0			
Mac Papers, Inc.	First Offer - \$26.40	150 / M	\$3,960.00		Y
Product Code:		Supplier Product Code: 067441			

<b>Agency Notes:</b>	<b>Supplier Notes: Minimum shipping unit (if applicable): 1 carton</b> <b>Post Consumer Recycled Content %: 10</b>
----------------------	---

<b>752-11464--01-06 11 X 17 65# COVER WHITE</b>					
Supplier	Unit Price	Qty/Unit	Total Price	Attch.	Docs
Mac Paper Converters	First Offer - \$0.00	10 / M	\$0.00		Y
<b>Product Code:</b> <b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code:</b> <b>Supplier Notes: Minimum shipping unit (if applicable): N/A</b> <b>Post Consumer Recycled Content %: N/A</b> <b>NO BID</b>			
Tampa Envelope [Ad]	First Offer - \$0.00	10 / M	\$0.00		Y
<b>Product Code:</b> <b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code:</b> <b>Supplier Notes: Minimum shipping unit (if applicable): 0</b> <b>Post Consumer Recycled Content %: 0</b> <b>we are a no bid on this item.</b>			
Accurate Forms & Supplies	First Offer - \$0.00	10 / M	\$0.00		Y
<b>Product Code:</b> <b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code:</b> <b>Supplier Notes: Minimum shipping unit (if applicable): 0</b> <b>Post Consumer Recycled Content %: 0</b>			
Mac Papers, Inc.	First Offer - \$52.82	10 / M	\$528.20		Y
<b>Product Code:</b> <b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code: N67465</b> <b>Supplier Notes: Minimum shipping unit (if applicable): 1 carton</b> <b>Post Consumer Recycled Content %: 10</b>			

<b>752-11464--01-07 11 X 17 60# OFFSET PASTEL COLORS</b>					
Supplier	Unit Price	Qty/Unit	Total Price	Attch.	Docs
Mac Paper Converters	First Offer - \$0.00	20 / M	\$0.00		Y
<b>Product Code:</b> <b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code:</b> <b>Supplier Notes: Minimum shipping unit (if applicable): N/A</b> <b>Post Consumer Recycled Content %: N/A</b> <b>NO BID</b>			
Tampa Envelope [Ad]	First Offer - \$0.00	20 / M	\$0.00		Y
<b>Product Code:</b> <b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code:</b> <b>Supplier Notes: Minimum shipping unit (if applicable): 0</b> <b>Post Consumer Recycled Content %: 0</b> <b>we are a no bid on this item.</b>			
Accurate Forms & Supplies	First Offer - \$0.00	20 / M	\$0.00		Y
<b>Product Code:</b> <b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code:</b> <b>Supplier Notes: Minimum shipping unit (if applicable): 0</b> <b>Post Consumer Recycled Content %: 00</b>			
Mac Papers, Inc.	First Offer - \$25.90	20 / M	\$518.00		Y
<b>Product Code:</b> <b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code: MULTIPLE</b> <b>Supplier Notes: Minimum shipping unit (if applicable): 1 carton</b> <b>Post Consumer Recycled Content %: 0</b>			

<b>752-11464--01-08 8.5 X 11 20# 2-PART REVERSE NCR</b>					
Supplier	Unit Price	Qty/Unit	Total Price	Attch.	Docs
Mac Paper Converters	First Offer - \$0.00	50 / M	\$0.00		Y
<b>Product Code:</b> <b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code:</b> <b>Supplier Notes: Minimum shipping unit (if applicable): N/A</b> <b>Post Consumer Recycled Content %: N/A</b> <b>NO BID</b>			

Tampa Envelope [Ad]	First Offer - \$0.00	50 / M	\$0.00		Y
<b>Product Code:</b> <b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code:</b> <b>Supplier Notes:</b> Minimum shipping unit (if applicable) : 0 Post Consumer Recycled Content % : 0 we are a no bid on this item.			
Accurate Forms & Supplies	First Offer - \$0.00	50 / M	\$0.00		Y
<b>Product Code:</b> <b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code:</b> <b>Supplier Notes:</b> Minimum shipping unit (if applicable) : 0 Post Consumer Recycled Content % : 0			
Mac Papers, Inc.	First Offer - \$12.45	50 / M	\$622.50		Y
<b>Product Code:</b> <b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code:</b> 050801 <b>Supplier Notes:</b> Minimum shipping unit (if applicable) : 1 carton Post Consumer Recycled Content % : 0			

752-11464--01-09 8.5 X 11 20# 3-PART REVERSE NCR					
Supplier	Unit Price	Qty/Unit	Total Price	Attch.	Docs
Mac Paper Converters	First Offer - \$0.00	40 / M	\$0.00		Y
<b>Product Code:</b> <b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code:</b> <b>Supplier Notes:</b> Minimum shipping unit (if applicable) : N/A NO BID			
Tampa Envelope [Ad]	First Offer - \$0.00	40 / M	\$0.00		Y
<b>Product Code:</b> <b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code:</b> <b>Supplier Notes:</b> Minimum shipping unit (if applicable) : 0 we are a no bid on this item.			
Accurate Forms & Supplies	First Offer - \$0.00	40 / M	\$0.00		Y
<b>Product Code:</b> <b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code:</b> <b>Supplier Notes:</b> Minimum shipping unit (if applicable) : 0			
Mac Papers, Inc.	First Offer - \$14.05	40 / M	\$562.00		Y
<b>Product Code:</b> <b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code:</b> 050716 <b>Supplier Notes:</b> Minimum shipping unit (if applicable) : 1 carton			

752-11464--01-10 8.5 X 11 20# 4-PART REVERSE NCR					
Supplier	Unit Price	Qty/Unit	Total Price	Attch.	Docs
Mac Paper Converters	First Offer - \$0.00	10 / M	\$0.00		Y
<b>Product Code:</b> <b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code:</b> <b>Supplier Notes:</b> Minimum shipping unit (if applicable) : N/A NO BID			
Tampa Envelope [Ad]	First Offer - \$0.00	10 / M	\$0.00		Y
<b>Product Code:</b> <b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code:</b> <b>Supplier Notes:</b> Minimum shipping unit (if applicable) : 0 we are a no bid on this item.			
Accurate Forms & Supplies	First Offer - \$0.00	10 / M	\$0.00		Y
<b>Product Code:</b> <b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code:</b> <b>Supplier Notes:</b> Minimum shipping unit (if applicable) : 0			
Mac Papers, Inc.	First Offer - \$15.03	10 / M	\$150.30		Y
<b>Product Code:</b> <b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code:</b> 050838 <b>Supplier Notes:</b> Minimum shipping unit (if applicable) : 1 carton			

752-11464--01-11 8.5 X 14 20# 3-PART REVERSE NCR					
--	--	--	--	--	--

Supplier	Unit Price	Qty/Unit	Total Price	Attch.	Docs
Mac Paper Converters	First Offer - \$0.00	10 / M	\$0.00		Y
<b>Product Code:</b> <b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code:</b> <b>Supplier Notes: Minimum shipping unit (if applicable):</b> N/A NO BID			
Tampa Envelope [Ad]	First Offer - \$0.00	10 / M	\$0.00		Y
<b>Product Code:</b> <b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code:</b> <b>Supplier Notes: Minimum shipping unit (if applicable):</b> 0 we are a no bid on this item.			
Accurate Forms & Supplies	First Offer - \$0.00	10 / M	\$0.00		Y
<b>Product Code:</b> <b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code:</b> <b>Supplier Notes: Minimum shipping unit (if applicable):</b> 0			
Mac Papers, Inc.	First Offer - \$18.25	10 / M	\$182.50		Y
<b>Product Code:</b> <b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code:</b> 050817 <b>Supplier Notes: Minimum shipping unit (if applicable):</b> 1 carton			

752-11464--01-12 11 X 17 20# 3-PART REVERSE NCR					
Supplier	Unit Price	Qty/Unit	Total Price	Attch.	Docs
Mac Paper Converters	First Offer - \$0.00	10 / M	\$0.00		Y
<b>Product Code:</b> <b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code:</b> <b>Supplier Notes: Minimum shipping unit (if applicable):</b> N/A NO BID			
Tampa Envelope [Ad]	First Offer - \$0.00	10 / M	\$0.00		Y
<b>Product Code:</b> <b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code:</b> <b>Supplier Notes: Minimum shipping unit (if applicable):</b> 0 we are a no bid on this item.			
Accurate Forms & Supplies	First Offer - \$0.00	10 / M	\$0.00		Y
<b>Product Code:</b> <b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code:</b> <b>Supplier Notes: Minimum shipping unit (if applicable):</b> 0			
Mac Papers, Inc.	First Offer - \$28.20	10 / M	\$282.00		Y
<b>Product Code:</b> <b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code:</b> 050827 <b>Supplier Notes: Minimum shipping unit (if applicable):</b> 1 carton			

752-11464--01-13 11 X 17 20# 4-PART REVERSE NCR					
Supplier	Unit Price	Qty/Unit	Total Price	Attch.	Docs
Mac Paper Converters	First Offer - \$0.00	50 / M	\$0.00		Y
<b>Product Code:</b> <b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code:</b> <b>Supplier Notes: Minimum shipping unit (if applicable):</b> N/A NO BID			
Tampa Envelope [Ad]	First Offer - \$0.00	50 / M	\$0.00		Y
<b>Product Code:</b> <b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code:</b> <b>Supplier Notes: Minimum shipping unit (if applicable):</b> 0 we are a no bid on this item.			
Accurate Forms & Supplies	First Offer - \$0.00	50 / M	\$0.00		Y
<b>Product Code:</b> <b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code:</b> <b>Supplier Notes: Minimum shipping unit (if applicable):</b> 0			
Mac Papers, Inc.	First Offer - \$30.20	50 / M	\$1,510.00		Y
<b>Product Code:</b> <b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code:</b> 050872 <b>Supplier Notes: Minimum shipping unit (if applicable):</b> 1 carton			

752-11464--01-14 8.5 X 11 20# CB WHITE NCR					
Supplier	Unit Price	Qty/Unit	Total Price	Attch.	Docs
Mac Paper Converters	First Offer - \$0.00	15 / M	\$0.00		Y
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier Product Code: Supplier Notes: Minimum shipping unit (if applicable): N/A NO BID			
Tampa Envelope [Ad]	First Offer - \$0.00	15 / M	\$0.00		Y
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier Product Code: Supplier Notes: Minimum shipping unit (if applicable): 0 we are a no bid on this item.			
Accurate Forms & Supplies	First Offer - \$0.00	15 / M	\$0.00		Y
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier Product Code: Supplier Notes: Minimum shipping unit (if applicable): 0			
Mac Papers, Inc.	First Offer - \$14.03	15 / M	\$210.45		Y
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier Product Code: 059780 Supplier Notes: Minimum shipping unit (if applicable): 1 carton			

752-11464--01-15 8.5 X 11 20# CB COLORS NCR					
Supplier	Unit Price	Qty/Unit	Total Price	Attch.	Docs
Mac Paper Converters	First Offer - \$0.00	20 / M	\$0.00		Y
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier Product Code: Supplier Notes: Minimum shipping unit (if applicable): N/A NO BID			
Tampa Envelope [Ad]	First Offer - \$0.00	20 / M	\$0.00		Y
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier Product Code: Supplier Notes: Minimum shipping unit (if applicable): 0 we are a no bid on this item.			
Accurate Forms & Supplies	First Offer - \$0.00	20 / M	\$0.00		Y
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier Product Code: Supplier Notes: Minimum shipping unit (if applicable): 00			
Mac Papers, Inc.	First Offer - \$14.20	20 / M	\$284.00		Y
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier Product Code: multiple Supplier Notes: Minimum shipping unit (if applicable): 1 carton			

752-11464--01-16 8.5 X 11 20# CFB COLORS NCR					
Supplier	Unit Price	Qty/Unit	Total Price	Attch.	Docs
Mac Paper Converters	First Offer - \$0.00	10 / M	\$0.00		Y
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier Product Code: Supplier Notes: Minimum shipping unit (if applicable): N/A NO BID			
Tampa Envelope [Ad]	First Offer - \$0.00	10 / M	\$0.00		Y
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier Product Code: Supplier Notes: Minimum shipping unit (if applicable): 0 we are a no bid on this item.			
Accurate Forms & Supplies	First Offer - \$0.00	10 / M	\$0.00		Y
Product Code: Agency Notes:		Supplier Product Code: Supplier Notes: Minimum shipping unit (if applicable): 0			
Mac Papers, Inc.	First Offer - \$17.30	10 / M	\$173.00		Y

<b>Product Code:</b> <b>Agency Notes:</b>	<b>Supplier Product Code:</b> multiple <b>Supplier Notes:</b> Minimum shipping unit (if applicable): 1 carton
--	--

<b>752-11464--01-17 8.5 X 11 20# CF COLORS NCR</b>					
Supplier	Unit Price	Qty/Unit	Total Price	Attch.	Docs
Mac Paper Converters	First Offer - \$0.00	20 / M	\$0.00		Y
<b>Product Code:</b> <b>Agency Notes:</b>	<b>Supplier Product Code:</b> <b>Supplier Notes:</b> Minimum shipping unit (if applicable): N/A NO BID				
Tampa Envelope [Ad]	First Offer - \$0.00	20 / M	\$0.00		Y
<b>Product Code:</b> <b>Agency Notes:</b>	<b>Supplier Product Code:</b> <b>Supplier Notes:</b> Minimum shipping unit (if applicable): 0 we are a no bid on this item.				
Accurate Forms & Supplies	First Offer - \$0.00	20 / M	\$0.00		Y
<b>Product Code:</b> <b>Agency Notes:</b>	<b>Supplier Product Code:</b> <b>Supplier Notes:</b> Minimum shipping unit (if applicable): 00				
Mac Papers, Inc.	First Offer - \$10.22	20 / M	\$204.40		Y
<b>Product Code:</b> <b>Agency Notes:</b>	<b>Supplier Product Code:</b> multiple <b>Supplier Notes:</b> Minimum shipping unit (if applicable): 1 carton				

<b>752-11464--01-18 8.5 X 11 7.5 POINT TAG WHITE</b>					
Supplier	Unit Price	Qty/Unit	Total Price	Attch.	Docs
Mac Paper Converters	First Offer - \$0.00	10 / M	\$0.00		Y
<b>Product Code:</b> <b>Agency Notes:</b>	<b>Supplier Product Code:</b> <b>Supplier Notes:</b> Minimum shipping unit (if applicable): N/A NO BID				
Tampa Envelope [Ad]	First Offer - \$0.00	10 / M	\$0.00		Y
<b>Product Code:</b> <b>Agency Notes:</b>	<b>Supplier Product Code:</b> <b>Supplier Notes:</b> Minimum shipping unit (if applicable): 0 we are a no bid on this item.				
Accurate Forms & Supplies	First Offer - \$0.00	10 / M	\$0.00		Y
<b>Product Code:</b> <b>Agency Notes:</b>	<b>Supplier Product Code:</b> <b>Supplier Notes:</b> Minimum shipping unit (if applicable): 0				
Mac Papers, Inc.	First Offer - \$30.25	10 / M	\$302.50		Y
<b>Product Code:</b> <b>Agency Notes:</b>	<b>Supplier Product Code:</b> 016718 <b>Supplier Notes:</b> Minimum shipping unit (if applicable): 1 carton				

<b>752-11464--01-19 12 X 18 100# GLOSS TEXT</b>					
Supplier	Unit Price	Qty/Unit	Total Price	Attch.	Docs
Mac Paper Converters	First Offer - \$0.00	30 / M	\$0.00		Y
<b>Product Code:</b> <b>Agency Notes:</b>	<b>Supplier Product Code:</b> <b>Supplier Notes:</b> Minimum shipping unit (if applicable): N/A Post Consumer Recycled Content %: N/A NO BID				
Tampa Envelope [Ad]	First Offer - \$0.00	30 / M	\$0.00		Y
<b>Product Code:</b> <b>Agency Notes:</b>	<b>Supplier Product Code:</b> <b>Supplier Notes:</b> Minimum shipping unit (if applicable): 0 Post Consumer Recycled Content %: 0 we are a no bid on this item.				
Accurate Forms & Supplies	First Offer - \$0.00	30 / M	\$0.00		Y

<b>Product Code:</b> <b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code:</b> <b>Supplier Notes: Minimum shipping unit (if applicable): 0</b> <b>Post Consumer Recycled Content %: 0</b>			
Mac Papers, Inc.	First Offer - \$39.99	30 / M	\$1,199.70		Y
<b>Product Code:</b> <b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code: 069676</b> <b>Supplier Notes: Minimum shipping unit (if applicable): 1 carton</b> <b>Post Consumer Recycled Content %: 10</b>			

<b>752-11464--01-20 11 X 17 100# GLOSS TEXT</b>					
Supplier	Unit Price	Qty/Unit	Total Price	Attch.	Docs
Mac Paper Converters	First Offer - \$0.00	15 / M	\$0.00		Y
<b>Product Code:</b> <b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code:</b> <b>Supplier Notes: Minimum shipping unit (if applicable): N/A</b> <b>Post Consumer Recycled Content %: N/A</b> <b>NO BID</b>			
Tampa Envelope [Ad]	First Offer - \$0.00	15 / M	\$0.00		Y
<b>Product Code:</b> <b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code:</b> <b>Supplier Notes: Minimum shipping unit (if applicable): 0</b> <b>Post Consumer Recycled Content %: 0</b> <b>we are a no bid on this item.</b>			
Accurate Forms & Supplies	First Offer - \$0.00	15 / M	\$0.00		Y
<b>Product Code:</b> <b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code:</b> <b>Supplier Notes: Minimum shipping unit (if applicable): 0</b> <b>Post Consumer Recycled Content %: 0</b>			
Mac Papers, Inc.	First Offer - \$34.66	15 / M	\$519.90		Y
<b>Product Code:</b> <b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code: 069705</b> <b>Supplier Notes: Minimum shipping unit (if applicable): 1 carton</b> <b>Post Consumer Recycled Content %: 10</b>			

<b>752-11464--01-21 #7 COIN 24# WHITE WOVE ENVELOPES</b>					
Supplier	Unit Price	Qty/Unit	Total Price	Attch.	Docs
Mac Paper Converters	First Offer - \$0.00	30 / M	\$0.00		Y
<b>Product Code:</b> <b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code:</b> <b>Supplier Notes: Minimum shipping unit (if applicable): N/A</b> <b>Post Consumer Recycled Content %: N/A</b> <b>NO BID</b>			
Accurate Forms & Supplies	First Offer - \$0.00	30 / M	\$0.00		Y
<b>Product Code:</b> <b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code:</b> <b>Supplier Notes: Minimum shipping unit (if applicable): 0</b> <b>Post Consumer Recycled Content %: 0</b>			
Tampa Envelope [Ad]	First Offer - \$22.25	30 / M	\$667.50		Y
<b>Product Code:</b> <b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code: 7 COINWH</b> <b>Supplier Notes: Minimum shipping unit (if applicable): 5M</b> <b>Post Consumer Recycled Content %: 0</b>			
Mac Papers, Inc.	First Offer - \$24.80	30 / M	\$744.00		Y
<b>Product Code:</b> <b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code: 081860</b> <b>Supplier Notes: Minimum shipping unit (if applicable): 1 carton</b> <b>Post Consumer Recycled Content %: 0</b>			
Cenveo	First Offer - \$26.00	30 / M	\$780.00		Y
<b>Product Code:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code: 95083</b>			



<b>Agency Notes:</b>	<b>Supplier Notes: Minimum shipping unit (if applicable): 30,000</b> <b>Post Consumer Recycled Content %: 10</b>
----------------------	---

<b>752-11464--01-22 32" X 40" SELF-ADHESIVE 3/16" FOAM CORE BOARDS</b>					
Supplier	Unit Price	Qty/Unit	Total Price	Attch.	Docs
Mac Paper Converters	First Offer - \$0.00	150 / each	\$0.00		Y
<b>Product Code:</b> <b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code:</b> <b>Supplier Notes: Minimum shipping unit (if applicable): N/A</b> <b>Post Consumer Recycled Content %: N/A</b> <b>NO BID</b>			
Tampa Envelope [Ad]	First Offer - \$0.00	150 / each	\$0.00		Y
<b>Product Code:</b> <b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code:</b> <b>Supplier Notes: Minimum shipping unit (if applicable): 0</b> <b>Post Consumer Recycled Content %: 0</b> <b>we are a no bid on this item.</b>			
Accurate Forms & Supplies	First Offer - \$0.00	150 / each	\$0.00		Y
<b>Product Code:</b> <b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code:</b> <b>Supplier Notes: Minimum shipping unit (if applicable): 0</b> <b>Post Consumer Recycled Content %: 0</b>			
Mac Papers, Inc.	First Offer - \$14.06	150 / each	\$2,109.00		Y
<b>Product Code:</b> <b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code: 071330</b> <b>Supplier Notes: Minimum shipping unit (if applicable): 1 carton</b> <b>Post Consumer Recycled Content %: 0</b>			

<b>752-11464--01-23 24" X 36" SELF-ADHESIVE 3/16" FOAM CORE BOARDS</b>					
Supplier	Unit Price	Qty/Unit	Total Price	Attch.	Docs
Mac Paper Converters	First Offer - \$0.00	150 / each	\$0.00		Y
<b>Product Code:</b> <b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code:</b> <b>Supplier Notes: Minimum shipping unit (if applicable): N/A</b> <b>Post Consumer Recycled Content %: N/A</b> <b>NO BID</b>			
Tampa Envelope [Ad]	First Offer - \$0.00	150 / each	\$0.00		Y
<b>Product Code:</b> <b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code:</b> <b>Supplier Notes: Minimum shipping unit (if applicable): 0</b> <b>Post Consumer Recycled Content %: 0</b> <b>we are a no bid on this item.</b>			
Accurate Forms & Supplies	First Offer - \$0.00	150 / each	\$0.00		Y
<b>Product Code:</b> <b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code:</b> <b>Supplier Notes: Minimum shipping unit (if applicable): 0</b> <b>Post Consumer Recycled Content %: 0</b>			
Mac Papers, Inc.	First Offer - \$6.14	150 / each	\$921.00		Y
<b>Product Code:</b> <b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code: 071637</b> <b>Supplier Notes: Minimum shipping unit (if applicable): 1 carton</b> <b>Post Consumer Recycled Content %: 0</b>			

<b>752-11464--01-24 23 x 35 60# WHITE SMOOTH OPAQUE OFFSET WITH MIN 10% RECYCLED CONTENT</b>					
Supplier	Unit Price	Qty/Unit	Total Price	Attch.	Docs
Mac Paper Converters	First Offer - \$0.00	15 / M	\$0.00		Y
<b>Product Code:</b> <b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code:</b> <b>Supplier Notes: Minimum shipping unit (if applicable): N/A</b> <b>Post Consumer Recycled Content %: N/A</b> <b>NO BID</b>			

Tampa Envelope [Ad]	First Offer - \$0.00	15 / M	\$0.00		Y
<b>Product Code:</b> <b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code:</b> <b>Supplier Notes:</b> Minimum shipping unit (if applicable): 0 <b>Post Consumer Recycled Content %:</b> 0 we are a no bid on this item.			
Accurate Forms & Supplies	First Offer - \$0.00	15 / M	\$0.00		Y
<b>Product Code:</b> <b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code:</b> <b>Supplier Notes:</b> Minimum shipping unit (if applicable): 0 <b>Post Consumer Recycled Content %:</b> 0			
Mac Papers, Inc.	First Offer - \$109.39	15 / M	\$1,640.85		Y
<b>Product Code:</b> <b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code:</b> 012869 <b>Supplier Notes:</b> Minimum shipping unit (if applicable): 1 carton <b>Post Consumer Recycled Content %:</b> 10			

<b>752-11464--01-25 11 X 17 67# COVER ASSORTED PASTEL COLORS</b>					
Supplier	Unit Price	Qty/Unit	Total Price	Attch.	Docs
Mac Paper Converters	First Offer - \$0.00	10 / M	\$0.00		Y
<b>Product Code:</b> <b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code:</b> <b>Supplier Notes:</b> Minimum shipping unit (if applicable): N/A <b>Post Consumer Recycled Content %:</b> N/A NO BID			
Tampa Envelope [Ad]	First Offer - \$0.00	10 / M	\$0.00		Y
<b>Product Code:</b> <b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code:</b> <b>Supplier Notes:</b> Minimum shipping unit (if applicable): 0 <b>Post Consumer Recycled Content %:</b> 0 we are a no bid on this item.			
Accurate Forms & Supplies	First Offer - \$0.00	10 / M	\$0.00		Y
<b>Product Code:</b> <b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code:</b> <b>Supplier Notes:</b> Minimum shipping unit (if applicable): 0 <b>Post Consumer Recycled Content %:</b> 0			
Mac Papers, Inc.	First Offer - \$40.57	10 / M	\$405.70		Y
<b>Product Code:</b> <b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code:</b> multiple <b>Supplier Notes:</b> Minimum shipping unit (if applicable): 1 carton <b>Post Consumer Recycled Content %:</b> 10			

<b>752-11464--01-26 17 X 11 100# GLOSS TEXT</b>					
Supplier	Unit Price	Qty/Unit	Total Price	Attch.	Docs
Mac Paper Converters	First Offer - \$0.00	15 / M	\$0.00		Y
<b>Product Code:</b> <b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code:</b> <b>Supplier Notes:</b> Minimum shipping unit (if applicable): N/A <b>Post Consumer Recycled Content %:</b> N/A NO BID			
Tampa Envelope [Ad]	First Offer - \$0.00	15 / M	\$0.00		Y
<b>Product Code:</b> <b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code:</b> <b>Supplier Notes:</b> Minimum shipping unit (if applicable): 0 <b>Post Consumer Recycled Content %:</b> 0 we are a no bid on this item.			
Accurate Forms & Supplies	First Offer - \$0.00	15 / M	\$0.00		Y
<b>Product Code:</b> <b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code:</b> <b>Supplier Notes:</b> Minimum shipping unit (if applicable): 0 <b>Post Consumer Recycled Content %:</b> 0			
Mac Papers, Inc.	First Offer - \$47.63	15 / M	\$714.45		Y

Product Code: Agency Notes:	Supplier Product Code: 064652 Supplier Notes: Minimum shipping unit (if applicable): 1 carton Post Consumer Recycled Content %: 0
--------------------------------	---

752-11464--01-27 18 X 12 100# GLOSS TEXT					
Supplier	Unit Price	Qty/Unit	Total Price	Attch.	Docs
Mac Paper Converters	First Offer - \$0.00	35 / M	\$0.00		Y
Product Code: Agency Notes:	Supplier Product Code: Supplier Notes: Minimum shipping unit (if applicable): N/A Post Consumer Recycled Content %: N/A NO BID				
Tampa Envelope [Ad]	First Offer - \$0.00	35 / M	\$0.00		Y
Product Code: Agency Notes:	Supplier Product Code: Supplier Notes: Minimum shipping unit (if applicable): 0 Post Consumer Recycled Content %: 0 we are a no bid on this item.				
Accurate Forms & Supplies	First Offer - \$0.00	35 / M	\$0.00		Y
Product Code: Agency Notes:	Supplier Product Code: Supplier Notes: Minimum shipping unit (if applicable): 00 Post Consumer Recycled Content %: 0				
Mac Papers, Inc.	First Offer - \$54.95	35 / M	\$1,923.25		Y
Product Code: Agency Notes:	Supplier Product Code: 065319 Supplier Notes: Minimum shipping unit (if applicable): 1 carton Post Consumer Recycled Content %: 0				

752-11464--01-28 9" X 12" 24# WW, WINDOW CATALOG ENVELOPES					
Supplier	Unit Price	Qty/Unit	Total Price	Attch.	Docs
Mac Paper Converters	First Offer - \$0.00	8 / M	\$0.00		Y
Product Code: Agency Notes:	Supplier Product Code: Supplier Notes: Minimum shipping unit (if applicable): N/A Post Consumer Recycled Content %: N/A NO BID				
Tampa Envelope [Ad]	First Offer - \$0.00	8 / M	\$0.00		Y
Product Code: Agency Notes:	Supplier Product Code: Supplier Notes: Minimum shipping unit (if applicable): 0 Post Consumer Recycled Content %: 0 we are a no bid on this item.				
Accurate Forms & Supplies	First Offer - \$0.00	8 / M	\$0.00		Y
Product Code: Agency Notes:	Supplier Product Code: Supplier Notes: Minimum shipping unit (if applicable): 0 Post Consumer Recycled Content %: 0				
Cenveo	First Offer - \$50.30	8 / M	\$402.40		Y
Product Code: Agency Notes:	Supplier Product Code: 04131 Supplier Notes: Minimum shipping unit (if applicable): 8,000 Post Consumer Recycled Content %: 10				
Mac Papers, Inc.	First Offer - \$68.32	8 / M	\$546.56		Y
Product Code: Agency Notes:	Supplier Product Code: 083149 Supplier Notes: Minimum shipping unit (if applicable): 1 carton Post Consumer Recycled Content %: 0				

752-11464--01-29 #10 24# WW, DIAGONAL WINDOW ENVELOPES					
--	--	--	--	--	--

Supplier	Unit Price	Qty/Unit	Total Price	Attch.	Docs
Mac Paper Converters	First Offer - \$0.00	320 / M	\$0.00		Y
<b>Product Code:</b> <b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code:</b> <b>Supplier Notes: Minimum shipping unit (if applicable):</b> N/A <b>Post Consumer Recycled Content %:</b> N/A NO BID			
Accurate Forms & Supplies	First Offer - \$0.00	320 / M	\$0.00		Y
<b>Product Code:</b> <b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code:</b> <b>Supplier Notes: Minimum shipping unit (if applicable):</b> 0 <b>Post Consumer Recycled Content %:</b> 0			
Tampa Envelope [Ad]	First Offer - \$15.50	320 / M	\$4,960.00		Y
<b>Product Code:</b> <b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code:</b> 10 REGWH <b>Supplier Notes: Minimum shipping unit (if applicable):</b> 105M <b>Post Consumer Recycled Content %:</b> 0			
Mac Papers, Inc.	First Offer - \$16.98	320 / M	\$5,433.60		Y
<b>Product Code:</b> <b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code:</b> 083670 <b>Supplier Notes: Minimum shipping unit (if applicable):</b> 1 carton <b>Post Consumer Recycled Content %:</b> 0			
Cenveo	First Offer - \$18.30	320 / M	\$5,856.00		Y
<b>Product Code:</b> <b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code:</b> 28461 <b>Supplier Notes: Minimum shipping unit (if applicable):</b> 320,000 <b>Post Consumer Recycled Content %:</b> 10			

<b>752-11464--01-30 #10 24# WW, DIAGONAL REGULAR ENVELOPES</b>					
Supplier	Unit Price	Qty/Unit	Total Price	Attch.	Docs
Mac Paper Converters	First Offer - \$0.00	50 / M	\$0.00		Y
<b>Product Code:</b> <b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code:</b> <b>Supplier Notes: Minimum shipping unit (if applicable):</b> N/A <b>Post Consumer Recycled Content %:</b> N/A NO BID			
Accurate Forms & Supplies	First Offer - \$0.00	50 / M	\$0.00		Y
<b>Product Code:</b> <b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code:</b> <b>Supplier Notes: Minimum shipping unit (if applicable):</b> 0 <b>Post Consumer Recycled Content %:</b> 0			
Mac Papers, Inc.	First Offer - \$15.06	50 / M	\$753.00		Y
<b>Product Code:</b> <b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code:</b> 083440 <b>Supplier Notes: Minimum shipping unit (if applicable):</b> 1 carton <b>Post Consumer Recycled Content %:</b> 0			
Cenveo	First Offer - \$16.10	50 / M	\$805.00		Y
<b>Product Code:</b> <b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code:</b> 28439 <b>Supplier Notes: Minimum shipping unit (if applicable):</b> 50,000 <b>Post Consumer Recycled Content %:</b> 10			
Tampa Envelope [Ad]	First Offer - \$18.50	50 / M	\$925.00		Y
<b>Product Code:</b> <b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code:</b> 10 SWWH <b>Supplier Notes: Minimum shipping unit (if applicable):</b> 50M <b>Post Consumer Recycled Content %:</b> 0			

<b>752-11464--01-31 4.25" x 11" , 67# WHITE, 2-UP DOOR HANGERS</b>					
Supplier	Unit Price	Qty/Unit	Total Price	Attch.	Docs

Mac Paper Converters	First Offer - \$0.00	10 / M	\$0.00		Y
<b>Product Code:</b> <b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code:</b> <b>Supplier Notes:</b> Minimum shipping unit (if applicable): N/A <b>Post Consumer Recycled Content %:</b> N/A NO BID			
Tampa Envelope [Ad]	First Offer - \$0.00	10 / M	\$0.00		Y
<b>Product Code:</b> <b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code:</b> <b>Supplier Notes:</b> Minimum shipping unit (if applicable): 0 <b>Post Consumer Recycled Content %:</b> 0 we are a no bid on this item.			
Accurate Forms & Supplies	First Offer - \$0.00	10 / M	\$0.00		Y
<b>Product Code:</b> <b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code:</b> <b>Supplier Notes:</b> Minimum shipping unit (if applicable): 0 <b>Post Consumer Recycled Content %:</b> 0			
Mac Papers, Inc.	First Offer - \$40.32	10 / M	\$403.20		Y
<b>Product Code:</b> <b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code:</b> 101916 <b>Supplier Notes:</b> Minimum shipping unit (if applicable): 1 carton <b>Post Consumer Recycled Content %:</b> 0 Delivery could be 1-10 days for this item			

752-11464--01-32 4.25" x 11", 67# ASSORTED PASTEL COLORS, 2-UP DOOR HANGERS					
Supplier	Unit Price	Qty/Unit	Total Price	Attch.	Docs
Mac Paper Converters	First Offer - \$0.00	10 / M	\$0.00		Y
<b>Product Code:</b> <b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code:</b> <b>Supplier Notes:</b> Minimum shipping unit (if applicable): N/A <b>Post Consumer Recycled Content %:</b> N/A NO BID			
Tampa Envelope [Ad]	First Offer - \$0.00	10 / M	\$0.00		Y
<b>Product Code:</b> <b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code:</b> <b>Supplier Notes:</b> Minimum shipping unit (if applicable): 0 <b>Post Consumer Recycled Content %:</b> 0 we are a no bid on this item.			
Accurate Forms & Supplies	First Offer - \$0.00	10 / M	\$0.00		Y
<b>Product Code:</b> <b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code:</b> <b>Supplier Notes:</b> Minimum shipping unit (if applicable): 0 <b>Post Consumer Recycled Content %:</b> 0			
Mac Papers, Inc.	First Offer - \$40.32	10 / M	\$403.20		Y
<b>Product Code:</b> <b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code:</b> multiple <b>Supplier Notes:</b> Minimum shipping unit (if applicable): 1 carton <b>Post Consumer Recycled Content %:</b> 0 Delivery could be 1-10 days for this item			

752-11464--01-33 25" X 38" 10 POINT C1S COVER, MIN. 94 BRIGHTNESS					
Supplier	Unit Price	Qty/Unit	Total Price	Attch.	Docs
Mac Paper Converters	First Offer - \$0.00	2 / M	\$0.00		Y
<b>Product Code:</b> <b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code:</b> <b>Supplier Notes:</b> Minimum shipping unit (if applicable): N/A <b>Post Consumer Recycled Content %:</b> N/A NO BID			
Tampa Envelope [Ad]	First Offer - \$0.00	2 / M	\$0.00		Y
<b>Product Code:</b> <b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code:</b> <b>Supplier Notes:</b> Minimum shipping unit (if applicable): 0 <b>Post Consumer Recycled Content %:</b> 0 we are a no bid on this item.			
Accurate Forms & Supplies	First Offer - \$0.00	2 / M	\$0.00		Y

<b>Product Code:</b> <b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code:</b> <b>Supplier Notes: Minimum shipping unit (if applicable): 0</b> <b>Post Consumer Recycled Content %: 0</b>			
Mac Papers, Inc.	First Offer - \$257.34	2 / M	\$514.68		Y
<b>Product Code:</b> <b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code: 442170</b> <b>Supplier Notes: Minimum shipping unit (if applicable): 1 carton</b> <b>Post Consumer Recycled Content %: 0</b>			

<b>752-11464--01-34 25" X 38" 10 POINT C2S COVER, MIN. 94 BRIGHTNESS</b>					
Supplier	Unit Price	Qty/Unit	Total Price	Attch.	Docs
Mac Paper Converters	First Offer - \$0.00	5 / M	\$0.00		Y
<b>Product Code:</b> <b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code:</b> <b>Supplier Notes: Minimum shipping unit (if applicable): N/A</b> <b>Post Consumer Recycled Content %: N/A</b> <b>NO BID</b>			
Tampa Envelope [Ad]	First Offer - \$0.00	5 / M	\$0.00		Y
<b>Product Code:</b> <b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code:</b> <b>Supplier Notes: Minimum shipping unit (if applicable): 0</b> <b>Post Consumer Recycled Content %: 0</b> we are a no bid on this item.			
Accurate Forms & Supplies	First Offer - \$0.00	5 / M	\$0.00		Y
<b>Product Code:</b> <b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code:</b> <b>Supplier Notes: Minimum shipping unit (if applicable): 0</b> <b>Post Consumer Recycled Content %: 0</b>			
Mac Papers, Inc.	First Offer - \$322.41	5 / M	\$1,612.05		Y
<b>Product Code:</b> <b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code: 442007</b> <b>Supplier Notes: Minimum shipping unit (if applicable): 1 carton</b> <b>Post Consumer Recycled Content %: 0</b>			

<b>752-11464--01-35 25" X 38" 10 POINT C1S CAST COVER, MIN. 94 BRIGHTNESS</b>					
Supplier	Unit Price	Qty/Unit	Total Price	Attch.	Docs
Mac Paper Converters	First Offer - \$0.00	2 / M	\$0.00		Y
<b>Product Code:</b> <b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code:</b> <b>Supplier Notes: Minimum shipping unit (if applicable): N/A</b> <b>Post Consumer Recycled Content %: N/A</b> <b>NO BID</b>			
Tampa Envelope [Ad]	First Offer - \$0.00	2 / M	\$0.00		Y
<b>Product Code:</b> <b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code:</b> <b>Supplier Notes: Minimum shipping unit (if applicable): 0</b> <b>Post Consumer Recycled Content %: 0</b> we are a no bid on this item.			
Accurate Forms & Supplies	First Offer - \$0.00	2 / M	\$0.00		Y
<b>Product Code:</b> <b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code:</b> <b>Supplier Notes: Minimum shipping unit (if applicable): 0</b> <b>Post Consumer Recycled Content %: 0</b>			
Mac Papers, Inc.	First Offer - \$609.00	2 / M	\$1,218.00		Y
<b>Product Code:</b> <b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code: NS-K11038F</b> <b>Supplier Notes: Minimum shipping unit (if applicable): 1 carton</b> <b>Post Consumer Recycled Content %: 0</b> 92 Bright Delivery could be 1-10 days for this item			

<b>752-11464--01-36 25" X 38" 10 POINT C2S CAST COVER, MIN. 94 BRIGHTNESS</b>					
Supplier	Unit Price	Qty/Unit	Total Price	Attch.	Docs
Mac Paper Converters	First Offer - \$0.00	5 / M	\$0.00		Y
<b>Product Code:</b> <b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code:</b> Supplier Notes: Minimum shipping unit (if applicable) : N/A Post Consumer Recycled Content % : N/A NO BID			
Mac Papers, Inc.	First Offer - \$0.00	5 / M	\$0.00		Y
<b>Product Code:</b> <b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code:</b> 0 Supplier Notes: Minimum shipping unit (if applicable) : 0 Post Consumer Recycled Content % : 0 25 x 38 C2S is no longer available			
Tampa Envelope [Ad]	First Offer - \$0.00	5 / M	\$0.00		Y
<b>Product Code:</b> <b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code:</b> Supplier Notes: Minimum shipping unit (if applicable) : 0 Post Consumer Recycled Content % : 0 we are a no bid on this item.			
Accurate Forms & Supplies	First Offer - \$0.00	5 / M	\$0.00		Y
<b>Product Code:</b> <b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code:</b> Supplier Notes: Minimum shipping unit (if applicable) : 0 Post Consumer Recycled Content % : 0			

<b>752-11464--01-37 Printed #10 Window Envelopes</b>					
Supplier	Unit Price	Qty/Unit	Total Price	Attch.	Docs
Mac Papers, Inc.	First Offer - \$0.00	660 / thousand	\$0.00		Y
<b>Product Code:</b> <b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code:</b> No Quote Supplier Notes: Minimum shipping unit (if applicable) : 0 Post Consumer Recycled Content % : 0 No Quote			
Tampa Envelope [Ad]	First Offer - \$17.50	660 / thousand	\$11,550.00		Y
<b>Product Code:</b> <b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code:</b> 10 SWWHPTD Supplier Notes: Minimum shipping unit (if applicable) : 110M Post Consumer Recycled Content % : 0			
Mac Paper Converters	First Offer - \$19.25	660 / thousand	\$12,705.00		Y
<b>Product Code:</b> <b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code:</b> Supplier Notes: Minimum shipping unit (if applicable) : 110000 Post Consumer Recycled Content % : 10			
Cenveo	First Offer - \$19.39	660 / thousand	\$12,797.40		Y
<b>Product Code:</b> <b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code:</b> 706162 Supplier Notes: Minimum shipping unit (if applicable) : 660,000 Post Consumer Recycled Content % : 10			
Accurate Forms & Supplies	First Offer - \$27.15	660 / thousand	\$17,919.00		Y
<b>Product Code:</b> <b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code:</b> Supplier Notes: Minimum shipping unit (if applicable) : 110,000 Post Consumer Recycled Content % : 30			

<b>752-11464--01-38 Proof Charges</b>					
Supplier	Unit Price	Qty/Unit	Total Price	Attch.	Docs
Mac Paper Converters	First Offer - \$0.00	1 / lot	\$0.00		Y
<b>Product Code:</b> <b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code:</b> Supplier Notes: No charge for PDF proofs			
Mac Papers, Inc.	First Offer - \$0.00	1 / lot	\$0.00		Y

<b>Product Code:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code: No Quote</b>			
<b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Notes: No Quote</b>			
Tampa Envelope [Ad]	First Offer - \$0.00	1 / lot	\$0.00		Y
<b>Product Code:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code:</b>			
<b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Notes:</b>			
Accurate Forms & Supplies	First Offer - \$0.00	1 / lot	\$0.00		Y
<b>Product Code:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code:</b>			
<b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Notes:</b>			
Cenveo	First Offer - \$25.00	1 / lot	\$25.00		Y
<b>Product Code:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code:</b>			
<b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Notes:</b>			

<b>752-11464--01-39 Composition Charges</b>					
Supplier	Unit Price	Qty/Unit	Total Price	Attch.	Docs
Mac Paper Converters	First Offer - \$0.00	1 / lot	\$0.00		Y
<b>Product Code:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code:</b>			
<b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Notes: No charge</b>			
Mac Papers, Inc.	First Offer - \$0.00	1 / lot	\$0.00		Y
<b>Product Code:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code: No Quote</b>			
<b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Notes: No Quote</b>			
Tampa Envelope [Ad]	First Offer - \$0.00	1 / lot	\$0.00		Y
<b>Product Code:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code:</b>			
<b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Notes:</b>			
Accurate Forms & Supplies	First Offer - \$50.00	1 / lot	\$50.00		Y
<b>Product Code:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code:</b>			
<b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Notes:</b>			
Cenveo	First Offer - \$100.00	1 / lot	\$100.00		Y
<b>Product Code:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code:</b>			
<b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Notes:</b>			

<b>752-11464--01-40 Set Up Charges</b>					
Supplier	Unit Price	Qty/Unit	Total Price	Attch.	Docs
Mac Paper Converters	First Offer - \$0.00	1 / lot	\$0.00		Y
<b>Product Code:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code:</b>			
<b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Notes: Post Consumer Recycled Content % : 10 No charge</b>			
Mac Papers, Inc.	First Offer - \$0.00	1 / lot	\$0.00		Y
<b>Product Code:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code: No Quote</b>			
<b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Notes: Post Consumer Recycled Content % : 0 No Quote</b>			
Tampa Envelope [Ad]	First Offer - \$0.00	1 / lot	\$0.00		Y
<b>Product Code:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code:</b>			
<b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Notes: Post Consumer Recycled Content % : 0</b>			
Accurate Forms & Supplies	First Offer - \$0.00	1 / lot	\$0.00		Y
<b>Product Code:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code:</b>			
<b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Notes: Post Consumer Recycled Content % : 0</b>			

<b>752-11464--01-41 Other Charges</b>					
Supplier	Unit Price	Qty/Unit	Total Price	Attch.	Docs
Mac Paper Converters	First Offer - \$0.00	1 / lot	\$0.00		Y
<b>Product Code:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code:</b>			
<b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Notes:</b>			
Mac Papers, Inc.	First Offer - \$0.00	1 / lot	\$0.00		Y
<b>Product Code:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code: No Quote</b>			
<b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Notes: No Quote</b>			
Tampa Envelope [Ad]	First Offer - \$0.00	1 / lot	\$0.00		Y
<b>Product Code:</b>		<b>Supplier Product Code:</b>			
<b>Agency Notes:</b>		<b>Supplier Notes:</b>			



Supplier Totals

<b>Mac Paper Converters</b>		<b>\$12,705.00 (41/41 items)</b>
Bid Contact	Jeff Henson jeff.henson@macpapers.com Ph 800-334-7026	Address 8370 Philips Hwy Jacksonville, FL 32256
Bid Notes	Quoting on the printed #10 envelopes only	
Agency Notes:	Supplier Notes: Quoting on the printed #10 envelopes only	
<b>Tampa Envelope [Ad]</b>		<b>\$18,102.50 (41/41 items)</b>
Bid Contact	Violetta Wolert vwolert@tampaenvelope.com Ph 813-621-2408 Fax 813-621-8889	Address 6502 North 54th Street Tampa, FL 33610
Agency Notes:	Supplier Notes:	
<b>Mac Papers, Inc.</b>		<b>\$31,827.80 (41/41 items)</b>
Bid Contact	Troy Youse troy.youse@macpapers.com Ph 904-348-3300 Fax 904-348-3340	Address P.O. Box 5369 32247 Jacksonville, FL 32207
Supplier Code	00009757	
Agency Notes:	Supplier Notes:	
<b>Cenveo</b>		<b>\$20,765.80 (7/41 items)</b>
Bid Contact	Aric Hopson aric.hopson@cenveo.com Ph 813-394-2629	Address 200 First Stamford Place Stamford, CT 06902
Agency Notes:	Supplier Notes:	
<b>Accurate Forms &amp; Supplies</b>		<b>\$17,969.00 (40/41 items)</b>
Bid Contact	Jim Kurtz jkurtz@accuratesupplies.com Ph 817-498-4840	Address 1550 Norwood Drive #412 Hurst, TX 76054
Qualifications	<b>SB</b>	
Bid Notes	Pricing on printed envelopes based on inside delivery	
Agency Notes:	Supplier Notes: Pricing on printed envelopes based on inside delivery	

\*\*

## No Bids

Tek Print & Promotions, LLC We are not able to bid on this quantity of envelopes at this time. Thank you for the opportunity to review this bid request.